
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14889 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 29, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of
AUTOMOTIVE FILTER ELEMENTS, for the ALOHA CUMMINS HAWTHORNE
twelve-month period beginning July 1, 2006 AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. PACIFIC CORP.
and ending June 30, 2007, to the City and DISTRIBUTING
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

GROUP I - Automotive Filters
No Substitution

1. Donaldson P550548
Bid Price Unit 24 each NO BID NO BID $24.72

Total 1 - 4 1 - 24 $593.28
2. Donaldson P553000

Bid Price Unit 2,000 each $17.52
Total $35,040.00

3. Donaldson P556915
Bid Price Unit 100 each $3.75

Total $375.00
4. Donaldson P556916

Bid Price Unit 24 each $3.75
Total $90.00

5. Ford YC3Z-7A098-BA
Bid Price Unit 1000 each $16.74 NO BID

Total $16,740.00 5 - 10
6. Ford 4C2Z-9N184-BA

Bid Price Unit 50 each $39.60
Total $1,980.00

7. Ford 3C3Z-6731-AA
Bid Price Unit 50 each $17.25

Total $862.50
8. Ford 6C2Z-9601-AA

Bid Price Unit 50 each $17.62
Total $881.00

9. Ford 3C3X-7B155-BA
Bid Price Unit 50 each $9.53

Total $476.50
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10. Ford 3C3Z-7A098-AA
Bid Price Unit 50 each $11.49

Total $574.50
11. Caterpillar 1R1808

Bid Price Unit 24 each NO BID $24.39
Total 11 - 21 $585.36

12. Caterpillar 1R0751
Bid Price Unit 24 each $12.38

Total $297.12
13. Caterpillar 9N6123

Bid Price Unit 12 each $17.37
Total $208.44

14. ATP B104
Bid Price Unit 3 each NO BID

Total 14 - 24
15. ATP B44

Bid Price Unit 5 each
Total

16. ATP B67
Bid Price Unit 5 each

Total
17. ATP B105

Bid Price Unit 5 each
Total

18. ATP B62
Bid Price Unit 10 each

Total
19. ATP B172

Bid Price Unit 15 each
Total

20. ATP B96
Bid Price Unit 30 each

Total
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21. ATP B72
Bid Price Unit 15 each

Total
22. WIX 49078

Bid Price Unit 10 each $72.33
Total $723.30

23. WIX 33296
Bid Price Unit 24 each $6.09

Total $146.16
24. Racor R12S

Bid Price Unit 10 each NO BID
Total

GROUP II - Automotive and Heavy 
Duty Filters

Air Filters
25. Onan 140-1907

Bid Price Unit 30 each $15.95 NO BID
Total $478.50

Brand Name and No.: ---

Coolant Filters
26. Perry PR 3908

Bid Price Unit 12 each $7.62 NO BID $5.08
Total $91.44 26 - 28 $60.96

Brand Name and No.: WIX 24071 Donaldson #P552071

Transmission Filters
27. Delco 24210956

Bid Price Unit 6 each $5.60 NO BID
Total $33.60

Brand Name and No.: WIX 58608
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28. Delco 24206433
Bid Price Unit 6 each $9.35 $21.04

Total $56.10 $126.24
Brand Name and No.: WIX 58918 Donaldson #X002325

Fuel Filters
29. Onan 149-2106

Bid Price Unit 25 each $13.94 $22.77 $29.08
Total $348.50 $569.25 $727.00

Brand Name and No.: WIX 33392 --- Donaldson #P552374

Oil Filters
30. AMSOIL SDF11

Bid Price Unit 25 each NO BID NO BID $2.68
Total $67.00

Brand Name and No.: Donaldson #P550965


