PROPOSAL NO. 14875
OPENED: June 21, 2006

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM

For the furnishing and delivery of

MEDICATIONS, DRUGS, INTRAVENOUS
ADMINISTRATION SUPPLIES AND PRELOADED/
PRE-FILLED SYRINGES WITH NEEDLES for the
twelve-month period beginning July 1, 2006 and
ending June 30, 2007 to the Department of Emergency
Services, Emergency Medical Services Division -
Ambulance Section, City and County of Honolulu.

NO. GROUP |

1.

3.

Lubafax Surgical Lubricant
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:
Packaging - packets/box:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

1,440 pk

Isopropyl Rubbing Alcohol
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:
Packaging - containers/case:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

240 cont.

Compound Benzoin Tincture

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - vials/case:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

400 vials

PHARMANUTRA, INC.

RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.

R. WEINSTEIN, INC.

Surgilube 0205-43
144
No

$
Aaron Industries 00395-1249-16
12x16 oz.
No

$
3M C1544
40/bx
No

$0.047
$67.68

$2.18
523.20

$0.95
380.00

$0.055
$79.20
Medline MDS 032273 (2.7 gram)
1728 ealcase
No

$1.20
$288.00

NO BID

Fougera #0205-43
144
No

Sunmark #M172-2628
12
No

3M #C1544
40
No

$0.043
$61.92

$1.35
$324.00

$0.720
$288.00
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PHARMANUTRA, INC.

RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.

R. WEINSTEIN, INC.

Povidone-lodine Solution

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - containers/case:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

60 cont.

Povidone-lodine Spray

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packing - containers/case:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

24 cont.

Povidone-lodine 10% Antiseptic

Microbicidal Pads

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - pads/box:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

10,000 pads

Hydrogen Peroxide Solution
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:
Packaging - containers/case:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

552 cont.

Myecitracin First Aid Ointment
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:
Packaging - tubes/package:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

300 tubes

$2.78
$166.80
Perrigo 45802-0052-55
12x8
No
NO BID
$0.045
$450.00
Triad 10-3201
100/bx
No
$1.14
$629.28

Aaron Industries 87701-0395-88
24x16 oz.
No

$1.75
$525.00
Fougera 00168-0012-35
12 per pack
No

$1.36
$81.60
Allegiance 29906-008

NO BID
5-8

NO BID

NO BID

PDI #B40600
100/bx
No

Sunmark #M172-2966
12
No

Fougera #0012-35
12
No

$0.038
$380.00

$0.65
$358.80

$1.85
$555.00
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PHARMANUTRA, INC.

RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.

R. WEINSTEIN,

INC.

10.

11.

12.

13.

Children's Acetaminophen Elixir

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - bottles/box:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

24 btl.

Ipecac Syrup

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - bottles/carton:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

12 btl.

Aspirin, Chewable

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packing - tablets/bottle, bottles/carton:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

160 btl

GROUP I

Atropine Sulfate Injection

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packing - syringes/box:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

2,500 each

Calcium Chloride Injection
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:
Packaging - syringes/box:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

375 each

Silarx 54838-0144-40
12/bx
No

Paddock 00574-0012-01
12
No

Advance 17714-0009-36
36
No

Hospira 4911 - 34
50
No

IMS 2004-00
25
No

$1.38
$33.12

$1.65
$19.80

$0.92
$147.20

$2.28
$5,700.00

$2.25
$843.75

$1.75
$42.00
Ivax 236-190
each 12/box
No
$2.66
$31.92
Brite Life Humco 396-002
12/ctn
No
NO BID
$2.48
$6,200.00
IMS 2039
25 syg/bx
No
$2.48
$930.00
IMS 2004
25 syg/bx
No

Ivax #M174-7435
12
No

Paddock #M116-0449
12
No

Ivax #M214-4798
12
No

IMS #0548-2039-00
25
No

IMS #0548-2004-00
25
No

$1.65
$39.60

$1.95
$23.40

$1.05
$168.00

$2.380
$5,950.00

$2.380
$892.50
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PHARMANUTRA, INC.

RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.

R. WEINSTEIN, INC.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

Dextrose Injection

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - syringes/box:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

Diphenhydramine

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - vials/box

Has Latex? - Yes/No

Epinephrine

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - syringes/box:

Has Latex? - Yes/No

Furosemide for injection L.V.

Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand Name and Number:

Packing - syringes/box:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

1,125 each

300 each

4,000 each

4,000 each

Furosemide for syringe injection L.V.

Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand Name and Number:

Packaging - syringes/box:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

250 each

IMS 2001-00
25
No

IMS 1390-00
25
No

IMS 2016-00
25
No

Hospira 9631-04 10 mg/ml;
4 ml; ansyr syringe

50

No

IMS 1431-00 10 mg/ml
10 ml minijet

25

No

$2.36
$2,655.00

$1.86
$558.00

$1.93
$7,720.00

$2.17
$8,680.00

$2.57
$642.50

IMS 2001
25 syg/bx
No

IMS 1390
25/bx

IMS 2016
25/bx
No

Hospira 9631-04

50/cs
No

IMS 1431

25/bx
No

$3.45
$3,881.25

$2.46
$738.00

$2.52
$10,080.00

$2.75
$11,000.00

$2.46
$615.00

IMS #0548-2001-00
25
No

IMS #0548-1390-00
25
No

IMS #0548-2016-00
25
No

NO BID

IMS #0548-1431-00

25
No

$3.11
$3,498.75

$2.22
$666.00

$2.27
$9,080.00

$2.22
$555.00
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19. Lidocaine HCI
Bid Price Unit 750 each $1.70 $2.37 $2.27
Total $1,275.00 $1,777.50 $1,702.50
Brand Name and Number: IMS 2190-00 IMS 2190 IMS #0548-2190-00
Packaging - syringes/box: 25 25/bx 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
20. Naloxone HCI
Bid Price Unit 750 each $9.50 $10.41 $10.00
Total $7,125.00 $7,807.50 $7,500.00
Brand Name and Number: IMS 1469 - 00 IMS 1469 IMS #0548-1469-00
Packaging - syringes/box: 25 25/box 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
21. Sodium Bicarbonate
Bid Price Unit 875 each $2.23 $3.24 $3.11
Total $1,951.25 $2,835.00 $2,721.25
Brand Name and Number: IMS 2052-00 IMS 2052 IMS #0548-2052-00
Packaging - syringes/box: 25 25/bx 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
GROUP 11l
22. Morphine Sulfate
Bid Price Unit 425 each $4.63 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,967.75
Brand Name and Number: IMS 2901 - 00
Packing - syringes/box: 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No
23. Valium (Diazepam)
Bid Price Unit 250 each $2.39 NO BID NO BID
Total $597.50

Brand Name and Number:
Packing - syringes/box:
Has Latex? - Yes/No
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GROUP IV
24. Amiodarone
Bid Price Unit 500 amp. $3.02 $2.99 $2.95
Total $1,510.00 $1,495.00 $1,475.00
Brand Name and Number: Hospira 4348-35 Hospira 683-577 Bedford #M221-0474, 3 ml
Packaging - vials/box: 50 10/box 10
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
25. Atropine
Bid Price Unit 50 each $0.47 $0.49 $0.49
Total $23.50 $24.50 $24.50
Brand Name and Number: American Regent 561-126 American Regent 561-126 A/R #M321-0242
Packaging - vials/box: 25 25/bx 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
26. Epinephrine
Bid Price Unit 400 each $0.41 NO BID $1.25
Total $164.00 $500.00
Brand Name and Number: Hospira 7241-01 Hospira #M278-3603
Packing (L Packaging- vials/box: 16x25 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
27. Glucagon Kit (Combination Package)
Bid Price Unit 200 each $70.35 NO BID $85.00
Total $14,070.00 $17,000.00
Brand Name and Number: Bedford 0004-01 NOVO #M175-3607
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
28. Levophed
Bid Price Unit 100 each $8.12 $11.21 $6.25
Total $812.00 $1,121.00 $625.00
Brand Name and Number: Hospira 1443-04 Hospira 1443-04 Hospira #M176-4208
Packaging - ampules/box: 10 10/bx 10
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
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29. Magnesium Sulfate
Bid Price Unit 400 each $0.65 $0.52 $0.59
Total $260.00 $208.00 $236.00
Brand Name and Number: American Regent 00517-2602-25 American Regent #559-054 A/R #M228-4529
Packaging - ampules/case: 25 25/box 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
30. Pitocin (Oxytocin)
Bid Price Unit 500 each $1.58 $1.69 $1.53
Total $790.00 $845.00 $765.00
Brand Name and Number: Monarch 61570-0416-05 Monarch 075-739 Monarch #M344-5699
Packaging - vials/box: 25 25/box 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
31. Promethazine HCI injection
Bid Price Unit 300 each $1.78 $2.63 $2.39
Total $534.00 $789.00 $717.00
Brand Name and Number: Watson 00591-3157-83 Baxter 535-567 Baxter #M144-9172
Packaging - ampules/box: 25 25/bx 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
32. Sodium Chloride
Bid Price Unit 400 each $0.37 NO BID $0.62
Total $148.00 $248.00
Brand Name and Number: Hospira 1966-04 Hospira #M180-7015
Packing - vials/box: 16x25 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
33. Sodium Chloride Updraft Solution
Bid Price Unit 400 each $0.148 NO BID $0.125
Total $59.20 $50.00
Brand Name and Number: Warrick 59930-1609-02 Warrick #M117-0497
Packaging - vials/box: 100 100
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
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34. Succinylcholine Chloride; injection

Bid Price Unit 1250 each $3.11 $2.72 $2.79
Total $3,887.50 $3,400.00 $3,487.50

Brand Name and Number: Hospira 6629-02 Hospira 6629-02 Sandoz #M163-4328

Packaging - vials/box: 50 10

Has Latex? - Yes/No no No No

35. Terbutaline Sulfate

Bid Price Unit 200 each $4.50 NO BID $22.49
Total $900.00 $4,498.00

Brand Name and Number: Sicor 00703-1271-04 APP #M136-2540

Packing - ampules/box: 25 25

Has Latex? - Yes/No No No

36. Compazine (Prochlorperazine)

Bid Price Unit 100 each $3.37 NO BID $9.56
Total $337.00 $956.00

Brand Name and Number: Bedford 55390-0077-10 Baxter #M111-7217

Packaging - vials/box: 10 25

Has Latex? - Yes/No No No

GROUP V

37. Ipratropium Bromide Inhalation Solution

Bid Price Unit 1500 each $0.18 $0.19 $0.24
Total $270.00 $285.00 $360.00

Brand Name and Number: Dey 0685-26 Dey #547-711 Dey #M129-1418

Packaging - vials/box: 25 25/box 25

Has Latex? - Yes/No No No

38. Lidocaine HCI

Bid Price Unit 360 each $4.43 $3.22 $3.25
Total $1,594.80 $1,159.20 $1,170.00

Brand Name and Number: Hospira 7931-32 Baxter 2B0972 Baxter #2B0972

Packaging - bags/case: 12 24/cs 24

Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
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39. Dopamine
Bid Price Unit 468 each $11.63 $7.75 $7.78
Total $5,442.84 $3,627.00 $3,641.04
Brand Name and Number: Hospira 7809-22 Baxter 2B0842 Baxter #2B0842
Packaging - bags/case: 12 18/cs 18
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
40. Lidocaine HCI Jelly
Bid Price Unit 500 each $4.59 $6.07 $5.83
Total $2,295.00 $3,035.00 $2,915.00
Brand Name and Number: IMS 3012-SP IMS 3012 IMS #0548-3012-00
Packaging - packs/case: 25 25/cs 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
41. Nitrolingual Spray
Bid Price Unit 500 each $72.12 $80.24 $74.50
Total $36,060.00 $40,120.00 $37,250.00
Brand Name and Number: First Horizon 124-453 First Horizon #M224-9316, 12 gm
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
42. Methyl Prednisone Sodium Succinate
Bid Price Unit 50 each $21.50 NO BID $20.63
Total $1,075.00 $1,031.50
Brand Name and Number: Pfizer 3389-01 Pfizer #M167-6667
Packing - vials/package: 1 1
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
43. Aqueous Epinephrine
Bid Price Unit 252 each $3.25 $3.06 $3.49
Total $819.00 $771.12 $879.48
Brand Name and Number: IMS 9061-00 IMS 9061 IMS #0548-9061-00
Packaging - vials/case: 1 each vial 12
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
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44. Activated Charcoal Aqueous Suspension
Bid Price Unit 60 each $13.90 $12.25 $13.75
Total $834.00 $735.00 $825.00
Brand Name and Number: Paddock 0120-04 Paddock 461-285 Paddock #M168-5726
Packaging - bottles/case: 12 12/cs 12
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
45. Ammonia Inhalants
Bid Price Unit 1500 each $0.23 NO BID $0.35
Total $345.00 $525.00
Brand Name and Number: X-Gen Pharmaceutical 39822-9900-01 XGEN #M110-6657
Packing - vials/box: 10 12
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
46. Adenosine
Bid Price Unit 750 each $15.430 NO BID $38.32
Total $11,572.50 $28,740.00
Brand Name and Number: American Pharm Partners 63323-0651-02 Astellas #M329-3230
Packing - vials/box: 10/bx; 48 bx/cs 1
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
47. Albterol Sulfate Inhalation Solution
Bid Price Unit 1800 each $0.136 $0.143 $0.20
Total $244.80 $257.40 $360.00
Brand Name and Number: Dey 0697-03 Dey 0697-24 Dey #M132-8608
Packaging - vials/box: 25 25/box 25
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
48. Pre-loaded Bacteriostatic Sodium
Chloride Injection
Bid Price Unit 7,000 each $0.71 NO BID $0.85
Total $4,970.00 $5,950.00
Brand Name and Number: Hospira 1918-32 Hospira #M179-9212
Packaging - syringes/box: 50/bx, 20 bx/cs, order by cs 50
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
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GROUP VI
49. Interlink System Cannula Needle
Bid Price Unit 200 each $0.29 $0.26 $0.24
Total $58.00 $52.00 $48.00
Brand Name and Number: BD 303345 BD #303345 BD #303345
Packing - needles/box: 100 100/bx 100
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
50. Interlink System Vial Access Cannula
Needle
Bid Price Unit 100 each $0.35 $0.32 NO BID
Total $35.00 $32.00
Brand Name and Number: BD 303367 BD 303367
Packing - needles/box: 100 100/bx
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No
51. Lever Lock Cannula
Bid Price Unit 1000 each $0.51 $0.49 $0.40
Total $510.00 $490.00 $400.00
Brand Name and Number: BD 303370 BD 303370 BD #303370
Packaging - needles/box, boxes/case: 100 100/bx 10X100
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
52. Intermittent Interlink Injection Cap
Bid Price Unit 6,000 each $2.74 $2.00 $2.038
Total $16,440.00 $12,000.00 $12,228.00
Brand Name and Number: Baxter 2N 3372 Baxter 2N3372 Baxter #2N3373
Packaging - units/case: 200 200/cs 200
Has Latex? - Yes/No No No No
53. Midazolam Hydrochloride
Bid Price Unit 200 each $2.88 NO BID $3.95
Total $576.00 $790.00

Brand Name and Number:
DEA License Number
Packaging - units/case:
Has Latex? - Yes/No

Hospira 2308-02
BP7078935

50

No

Bedford #M136-9339
RR0100456 ?

10

No




