
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14868 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 9, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of COOLANT,
BRAKE FLUID & BRAKE CLEANER for the BACON CSK AUTO, INC. HAWAIIAN ISLES PENNZOIL SEMI TRAILER 
six-month period beginning August 1, 2006 UNIVERSAL PETROLEUM, LLC DISTRIBUTORS OF SERVICES, INC.
and ending January 31, 2007 to the City and CO. INC. HAWAII, INC.
County of Honolulu.

ITEM
1. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,

1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 900 containers $13.32 $8.35 NO BID $7.40 $9.67

Total $11,988.00 $7,515.00 $6,660.00 $8,703.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2820 Flag #6-1 Honeywell/Prestone Prestone Prime

Service Pro Complete
Antifreeze, SPE16705

2. Ethylene Glycol Phosphate-Free, Heavy
Duty Coolant, Concentrate, 55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 40 drums $666.21 NO BID $547.80 NO BID $670.85

Total $26,648.40 ITEMS 2 AND 3 $21,912.00 ITEMS 2 - 5 $26,834.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2741 Old World Ind. - Fleet Prestone AF977HD

Charge SCA Pre-charged
Antifreeze (FCA-001)

3. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 mix
(pre-mix), phosphate-free, Heavy Duty
55-gallon drum
Bid Price Unit 12 containers $382.77 $239.48 NO BID

Total $4,593.24 $2,873.76
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2826 Old World Ind.  - Fleet

Charge SCA Precharge
50/50 Pre-mix Antifreeze
(FCA-W51)

4. Prestone 5/150 Extended Life Coolant
1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 54 containers NO BID $11.25 NO BID $11.82

Total $607.50 ITEMS 4 - 8 $638.28
Manufacturer and Part Number: Prestone #AF888 Prestone AF888
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5. Fleetguard DCA 75L, 5-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 24 containers $76.13 NO BID NO BID

Total $1,827.12
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard DCA 75L

6. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 12-oz. containers.
Bid Price Unit 276 containers NO BID $1.17 $1.47 $1.94

Total ITEMS 6 - 8 $322.92 $405.72 $535.44
Manufacturer and Part Number: Pyroil #BF12 Pennzoil DOT 3 Brake Radiator Specialty 

Fluid, p/n: 8568 M441212
7. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 1-gallon containers.

Bid Price Unit 26 containers $10.99 NO BID $15.89
Total $285.74 $413.14

Manufacturer and Part Number: Pyroil #BF1 Radiator Specialty
M4434

8. Non-Chlorinated Brake Cleaner, 15-18.oz.
net weight container.
Bid Price Unit 4188 containers $1.29 $1.50 $2.04

Total $5,402.52 $6,282.00 $8,543.52
Manufacturer and Part Number: Pyroil #NCBPC-13 Cyclo Industries, Cyclo Prestone AS305

Non Chlorinated Brake
Cleaner, CC111


