PROPOSAL NO. 14856
OPENED: MAY 17, 2006

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of RECYCLED

OFFICE PAPER SUPPLIES for the four-month CONRAD HAWAII OFFICEMAX PAPERSOURCE
period beginning June 1, 2006 and ending ENTERPRISES STATIONERY CONTRACT, INC. HAWAII, INC.
September-30, 2006 to the City and County of CO., LTD. DBA HOPACO
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
GROUP | - Paper, Bond
1. Substance 20; 8-1/2" x 11"
Bid Price:  Unit 50 reams $14.75 $10.16 NO BID NO BID
Total $737.50 $508.00 1-12
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Fox River Fox 3285 Mead MEA39706
GROUP Il - Paper, Other Bond
A. 8-1/2in. x 11 in.
2. Blue
Bid Price:  Unit 84 reams NO BID $3.97 $3.04
Total 2-15 $333.48 $255.36
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1120BBE Boise P1IMP2201BE
3. Buff
Bid Price: ~ Unit 8 reams $3.97 $3.04
Total $31.76 $24.32
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1120BBF Boise PIMP2201BF
4. Goldenrod
Bid Price:  Unit 48 reams $3.97 $3.04
Total $190.56 $145.92
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1120BGD Boise P1IMP2201GD
5. Green
Bid Price:  Unit 68 reams $3.97 $3.04
Total $269.96 $206.72

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Hammermill HSC1120BGN

Boise P1MP2201GN
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PAGE 2 CONRAD HAWAII OFFICEMAX PAPERSOURCE
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY CONTRACT, INC. HAWAII, INC.
CO., LTD. DBA HOPACO
ITEM
6. Pink
Bid Price:  Unit 72 reams $3.97 $3.04
Total $285.84 $218.88
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1120BPK Boise PIMP2201PK
7. Yellow
Bid Price:  Unit 52 reams $3.97 $3.04
Total $206.44 $158.08
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1120BCY Boise P1IMP2201CY
Packaging for Section Group Il.A. - Sheets/Ream: 500 500
Sub-Total for Group Il.A., Items 2 - 7: $1,318.04 $1,009.28
B. 8-1/2in. x 14 in.
8. Blue
Bid Price:  Unit 16 reams $5.30 $3.87
Total $84.80 $61.92
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1420BBE Boise P1MP2204BE
9. Goldenrod
Bid Price:  Unit 48 reams $5.30 $3.87
Total $254.40 $185.76
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1420BGD Boise P1MP2204GD
10. Green
Bid Price:  Unit 36 reams $5.30 $3.87
Total $190.80 $139.32
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1220BGN Boise P1IMP2204GN
11. Pink
Bid Price:  Unit 16 reams $5.30 $3.87
Total $84.80 $61.92

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Hammermill HSC1420BPK

Boise PIMP2204PK
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PAGE 3 CONRAD HAWAII OFFICEMAX PAPERSOURCE
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY CONTRACT, INC. HAWAII, INC.
CO., LTD. DBA HOPACO
ITEM
12. Yellow
Bid Price:  Unit 12 reams $5.30 $3.87
Total $63.60 $46.44
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Hammermill HSC1420BCY Boise P1IMP2204CY
Packaging for Section Group II.B. - Sheets/Ream: 500 500
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP I1.B, ITEM NOS. 2-12: $678.40 $495.36
TOTAL SUM FOR GROUP ILLA-B
ITEM NOS. 2 - 12: $1,996.44 $1,504.64
GROUP 11l - COPY (XEROGRAPHIC) PAPER
13. 8-1/2in.x11in.
Bid Price:  Unit 1,000 cartons $31.68 $28.03 $32.66
Total $0.00 $31,680.00 $28,030.00 $32,660.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific GCP99968692 |Boise Aspen P1054901 Boise Aspen 054901
Packaging - Sheets/Ream & Reams/Carton: 500 & 10 rms 500 & 10 500 & 10
14. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 50 cartons $42.60 $37.98 $43.91
Total $0.00 $2,130.00 $1,899.00 $2,195.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific GCP999687 [Boise Aspen P1-054904 Boise Aspen 054904
Packaging - Sheets/Ream & Reams/Carton: 500 & 10 rms 500 & 10 500 & 10
15. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 5 cartons $33.32 $29.80 $34.51
Total $0.00 $166.60 $149.00 $172.55
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific GCP Boise Aspen P1054907 Boise Aspen 054907
Packaging - Sheets/[Ream & Reams/Carton 500 &5 500 & 5 500 &5
Total Sum Bid for Group IlI, Items 13 - 15: $33,976.60 $30,078.00 $35,028.05
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ENTERPRISES STATIONERY CONTRACT, INC. HAWAII, INC.
CO., LTD. DBA HOPACO
ITEM
Group 1V - Paper Set, Carbonless
A. '2 Part: 250 sets/package
16. 8-1/2in.x11in.
Bid Price:  Unit 52 pkgs. $11.50 NO BID NO BID $12.66
Total $598.00 16 - 23 16 - 23 $658.32
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-16557 Recover 4711
17. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 28 pkgs. $14.75 $16.15
Total $413.00 $452.20
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-16558 Recover 4714
Packaging for Group IV.A. - Sets/Package: 250 250
Sub-Total for Group IV.A., Items 16 & 17: $1,011.00 $1,110.52
B. 3 Part: 167 sets/package
18. 8-1/2in.x 11 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 236 pkgs. $12.75 $14.17
Total $3,009.00 $3,344.12
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-16602 Recover 4712
Packaging for Group IV.A. - Sets/Package: 167 167
C. 4 Part: 125 sets/package
19. 8-1/2in.x11in.
Bid Price:  Unit 120 pkgs. $13.50 $15.42
Total $1,620.00 $1,850.40
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-16603 Recover 6183
Packaging for Group IV.A. - Sets/Package: 125 125
Total Sum Bid for Group IV, Items 16 - 19: $5,640.00 $6,305.04
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ENTERPRISES STATIONERY CONTRACT, INC. HAWAII, INC.
CO., LTD. DBA HOPACO
ITEM
GROUP V - ALTERNATE PAPER SET - CARBONLESS
A. 3 PART: 167 SETS/PACKAGE
20. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 50 cartons $16.00 $17.08
Total $800.00 $854.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-16604 Superior 1916
Packaging for Group V.A. - Sets/Package 167 167
B. 4 PART: 125 SETS/PACKAGE
21. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 50 cartons $17.00 $18.18
Total $850.00 $909.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-16605 Superior 1931
Packaging for Group V.B. - Sets/Package 125 125
C. 5 PART: 100 SETS/PACKAGE
22. 8-1/2in.x 11 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 50 cartons $15.00 $14.69
Total $750.00 $734.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-60371 Superior 1942
23. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price:  Unit 50 cartons $18.00 18.70
Total $900.00 $935.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Excel EXL-60452 Superior 1943
Packaging for Group V.C. - Sets/Package 100 100
Sub-total, Group V.C., Items 22 & 23: $1,650 $0 $0 $1,669.50
Total Sum Bid for Group V, Items 20 - 23: $3,300.00 $3,432.50
Delivery Time in Calendar Days From the Placing of
Orders: Calendar Days | 30 30 30




