
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14851 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MAY 10, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of
DISPOSABLE NON-LATEX (NITRILE)
GLOVES for a twelve-month period BOUND TREE RESCUE SAFETY SAFETY SYSTEMS W.W. GRAINGER
beginning May 15, 2006 and ending May 14, MEDICAL LLC PACIFIC, INC. HAWAII, INC.
2007 to the various agencies of the City and
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I - Nitrile Powder-free Examination

Gloves - Palm Thickness of min. 5.5 mils

1. Extra Small size
Bid Price Unit 44 boxes $7.33 $6.90 NO BID NO BID

Total $322.52 $303.60 1 - 10 1 - 10
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno SE Microflex SU690XS

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

2. Small size
Bid Price Unit 302 boxes $7.33 $6.90

Total $2,213.66 $2,083.80
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno SE Microflex SU690S

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

3. Medium size
Bid Price Unit 756 boxes $7.33 $6.90

Total $5,541.48 $5,216.40
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno SE Microflex SU690M

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100
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BOUND TREE RESCUE SAFETY SAFETY SYSTEMS W.W. GRAINGER
MEDICAL LLC PACIFIC, INC. HAWAII, INC.

ITEM

4. Large size
Bid Price Unit 1,345 boxes $7.33 $6.90

Total $9,858.85 $9,280.50
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno SE Microflex SU690L

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

5. Extra Large size
Bid Price Unit 1,457 boxes $7.33 $6.90

Total $10,679.81 $10,053.30
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno SE Microflex SU690XL

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

TOTAL SUM BID: $28,616.32 $26,937.60

GROUP II - Nitrile Powder-free Examination
Gloves - Palm Thickness of min. 3.9 mils

6. Extra Small size
Bid Price Unit 3 boxes $7.85 $7.09

Total $23.55 $21.27
Make and Model No.: Microflex Free Form SE Microflex FFS700XS

100
Packaging - gloves per box: 100
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ITEM
NO.

7. Small size
Bid Price Unit 442 boxes $7.85 $7.09

Total $3,469.70 $3,133.78
Make and Model No.: Microflex Free Form SE Microflex FFS700S

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

8. Medium size
Bid Price Unit 1085 boxes $7.85 $7.09

Total $8,517.25 $7,692.65
Make and Model No.: Microflex Free Form SE Microflex FFS700M

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

9. Large size
Bid Price Unit 1423 boxes $7.85 $7.09

Total $11,170.55 $10,089.07
Make and Model No.: Microflex Free Form SE Microflex FFS700L

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

10. Extra Large size
Bid Price Unit 1238 boxes $7.85 $7.09

Total $9,718.30 $8,777.42
Make and Model No.: Microflex Free Form SE Microflex FFS700XL

Packaging - gloves per box: 100 100

TOTAL SUM BID: $32,899.35 $29,714.19
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ITEM
NO.

GROUP III - Nitrole Lightly Powdered Gloves - 
Thickness of min. 8 mils.

11. Small size
Bid Price Unit 4 boxes NO BID NO BID $11.60 $10.47

Total ITEM NOS. 11 - 14 ITEM NOS. 11-14 $46.40 $41.88
Make and Model No.: N-Dex 8005 Best N-Dex Plus 8005S (1AG43)

Packaging - gloves per box: 50 50

12. Medium size
Bid Price Unit 110 boxes $11.60 $10.47

Total $1,276.00 $1,151.70
Make and Model No.: N-Dex 8005 Best N-Dex Plus 8005M (5AL66)

Packaging - gloves per box: 50 50

13. Large size
Bid Price Unit 217 boxes $11.60 $10.47

Total $2,517.20 $2,271.99
Make and Model No.: N-Dex 8005 Best N-Dex Plus 8005L (2AD93)

Packaging - gloves per box: 50 50



PROPOSAL NO. 14851
Page 5

BOUND TREE RESCUE SAFETY SAFETY SYSTEMS W.W. GRAINGER
MEDICAL LLC PACIFIC, INC. HAWAII, INC.

ITEM
NO.
14. Extra Large size

Bid Price Unit 128 boxes $11.60 $10.47
Total $1,484.80 $1,340.16

Make and Model No.: N-Dex 8005 Best N-Dex Plus 8005XL (1AV58)

Packaging - gloves per box: 50 50

TOTAL SUM BID: $5,324.40 $4,805.73

GROUP IV - Nitrile Powder-free Examination
Gloves - Palm Thickness of min. 5.9 mils

15. Small size
Bid Price Unit 102 boxes $5.58 $5.27 NO BID NO BID

Total $569.16 $537.54 15 - 19 15 -19
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno EC Microflex SEC375S

Packaging - gloves per box: 50 50

16. Medium size
Bid Price Unit 334 boxes $5.58 $5.27

Total $1,863.72 $1,760.18
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno EC Microflex SEC375M

Packaging - gloves per box: 50 50
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ITEM
NO.

17. Large size
Bid Price Unit 1122 boxes $5.58 $5.27

Total $6,260.76 $5,912.94
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno EC Microflex SEC375L

Packaging - Gloves/Box: 50 50

18. Extra Large size
Bid Price Unit 2797 boxes $5.58 $5.27

Total $15,607.26 $14,740.19
Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno EC Microflex SEC375XL
Packaging - Gloves/Box: 50 per box 

50
19. Extra Extra Large size

Bid Price Unit 1175 boxes $5.58 $5.27
Total $6,556.50 $6,192.25

Make and Model No.: Microflex Supreno EC Microflex SEC375XXL

Packaging - Gloves/Box: 50 50

TOTAL SUM BID: $30,857.40 $29,143.10


