
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14847 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MAY 9, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of
FERTILIZERS, for the twelve-month period PHOENIX V LLC PACIFIC UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.
beginning June 1, 2006 and ending dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL
May 31, 2007, to the City and County of SALES &
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO. FERTILIZERS

Controlled-Release Fertilizer:
1. Lesco 21-4-11 + S, Fe & Mn or equal;

In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 50 bags NO BID NO BID $28.90

Total 1 & 2 $1,445.00
Brand Name and Number: Lesco

2. Contec DG 8348, 18-9-18 + Fe + Mn or equal;
In 50-lb. bag "40-lb. bag"
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $40.25 NO BID

Total $8,050.00 2 & 3
Brand Name and Number: Andersons AGC 8348.2 

18-9-18 

3. Short-Kut 18-6-12 with Polyon or equal;
In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $24.87 NO BID

Total $4,974.00
Brand Name and Number: as specified

4. 24-4-16 + Fe or equal; In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $20.84 $22.37 $20.70

Total $6,252.00 $6,711.00 $6,210.00
Brand Name and Number: Gaviota as specified Wilbur Ellis 24-4-16 UHS
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PHOENIX V LLC PACIFIC UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.
dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
5. 22-5-12 or equal; In 50-lb. bag

Bid Price Unit 500 bags $24.27 NO BID NO BID
Total $12,135.00 5 - 15

Brand Name and Number: as specified

6. 19-3-19 or equal; In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 100 bags $37.58 $35.65

Total $3,758.00 $3,565.00
Brand Name and Number: as specified Simplot GreensKote 19-3-19 

7. Greens King 18-2-24 Micro with Nutralene
or equal; In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 150 bags $34.74 $33.20

Total $5,211.00 $4,980.00
Brand Name and Number: as specified Simplot GreensKing18-2-24 

8. 22-2-11 with Polyon and Trikote or equal;
In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $20.67 NO BID

Total $6,201.00
Brand Name and Number: as specified
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PHOENIX V LLC PACIFIC UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.
dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO. Controlled-Release Fertilizer with Pre-

Emergent Herbicide:
9. 21-0-20 + 1.38% Ronstar or equal; In 50-lb.

bag
Bid Price Unit 200 bags NO BID $55.35

Total $11,070.00
Brand Name and Number: Andersons AGC211R5 

21-0-20 + 1.38% Ronstar

10. 20-4-10 + 1.0% Ronstar or equal; In 50-lb.
bag
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $45.80 $44.15

Total $13,740.00 $13,245.00
Brand Name and Number: as specified Lebanon 20-4-10 

+1% Ronstar 

11. 22-0-10 + 1.0% Ronstar or equal; In 50-lb.
bag
Bid Price Unit 120 bags NO BID $48.15

Total $5,778.00
Brand Name and Number: Andersons AGC222R5 

22-0-10 + 1% Ronstar

12. 19-0-23 with 1.5% Ronstar or equal; In 50-
lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 50 bags $59.37 $58.99

Total $2,968.50 $2,949.50
Brand Name and Number: as specified Lebanon 19-0-23 

+1.5% Ronstar 
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PHOENIX V LLC PACIFIC UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.
dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
13. One Shot Turf Supreme 16-8-8 with Trimec

Herbicide and Dimension; In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 150 bags $38.40 $39.20

Total $5,760.00 $5,880.00
Brand Name and Number: as specified Simplot One Shot16-8-8 

Trimec/Dimension

Lawn Fertilizer:
14. Mini Turf 16-8-8 or equal; In 50-lb. bag

Bid Price Unit 100 bags $15.45 $14.55
Total $1,545.00 $1,455.00

Brand Name and Number: as specified Simplot Mini Turf 16-8-8 

15. Turf Gold 22-5-5 or equal; In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 250 bags $17.70 $17.55

Total $4,425.00 $4,387.50
Brand Name and Number: as specified Simplot TurfGold22-5-5 

16. Di-Ammonium Phosphate 18-46-0 or equal;
In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 100 bags $15.14 $15.62 $15.70

Total $1,514.00 $1,562.00 $1,570.00
Brand Name and Number: Gaviota as specified Simplot 18-46-0 Simplot

Organic Fertilizer:
17. Gro-Power 5-3-1 or equal; In 50-lb. bag

Bid Price Unit 100 bags NO BID $19.30 NO BID
Total 17 & 18 $1,930.00 17 & 18

Brand Name and Number: GroPower 5-3-1 
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dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
18. Gro-Power Premium Green 6-2-10 or equal;

In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $25.85

Total $5,170.00
Brand Name and Number: GroPower Premium Green 6-2-10 

Starter Fertilizer:
19. Analysis:  10-30-10; In 50-lb. bag

Bid Price Unit 200 bags $13.55 $15.22 $14.85
Total $2,710.00 $3,044.00 $2,970.00

Brand Name and Number: as specified Marion Ag  10-30-10 UHS


