PROPOSAL NO. 14846
OPENED: May 9, 2006

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASINC

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

ITEM
NO.

For the furnishing and delivery of
FUNGICIDES, HERBICIDES AND
INSECTICIDES, for the twelve-month
period beginning June 1, 2006 and ending
May 31, 2007, to the City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

GROUP | - FUNGICIDES

Pentathlon LF or equal;

Acceptable size: From 1.25 gallon to

2.5 gallon container

Bid Price Unit
Total

Package Size Offered:

75 gallons

Brand Name and Number:

Daconil Weather Stik or equal,

In 2.5 gallon container

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

50 containers

Insignia or equal,

In 2.4 Ib. container

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

15 containers

PHOENIX V LLC PACIFIC UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.
dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL
SALES &
SERVICES, INC.
NO BID $19.52 $18.00
$1,464.00 $1,350.00
2.5 gal 2.5 gallon
Griffin - Pentathlon SePro
LF
$185.73 $184.88 $178.78
$9,286.50 $9,244.00 $8,939.00
As specified Syngenta - Daconil Syngenta
Weatherstik
$341.25 $345.18 $340.70
$5,118.75 $5,177.70 $5,110.50
As specified BASF - Insignia BASF
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dba BEI HAWAII AGRICULTURAL
SALES &
SERVICES, INC.
ITEM
NO. GROUP Il - HERBICIDES
4.  Sencor 75 Turf or equal;
In 5-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 70 bags $204.33 $197.63 $193.50
Total $14,303.10 $13,834.10 $13,545.00
Brand Name and Number: As specified Bayer - Sencor Bayer
75 Turf
5. MSMA-6 Plus Surfactant or equal;
Acceptable size: From 1 gallon to 2-1/2
gallon container
Bid Price Unit 100 gallons $18.79 $17.052 $17.50
Total $1,879.00 $1,705.20 $1,750.00
Package Size Offered: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gal 2.5 gallon
Brand Name and Number: Drexel MSMA 6 plus Drexel - MSMA Drexel
6 Plus
6. Rodeo or AquaMaster;
In 2-1/2 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 100 containers $100.99 $93.75 $64.50
Total $10,099.00 $9,375.00 $6,450.00
Brand Name and Number: As specified Dow Agro Aquamaster
Sciences - Rodeo
7. Roundup Pro;
In 2-1/2 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 50 containers $100.47 $101.77 $94.00
Total $5,023.50 $5,088.50 $4,700.00
Brand Name and Number: As specified Monsanto - Monsanto

Roundup Pro
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SERVICES, INC.
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NO.
8. Glyphosate Plus (generic Roudup Pro)

10.

11.

In 2-1/2 gallon container

Bid Price Unit 200 containers
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Roundup ProDry or equal;

In 23.25 Ib. box

Bid Price Unit 10 boxes
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Dimension 0.15% Plus

Fertilizer 19-0-19 or equal;

In 50-Ib. bag

Bid Price Unit 150 bags
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Chipco Ronstar G or equal;

In 50-Ib. bag

Bid Price Unit 50 bags
Total

Brand Name and Number:

$40.67
$8,134.00
Monsanto Honcho Plus

$200.42
$2,004.20
As specified

NO BID

$73.75
$3,687.50
As specified

$50.71
$10,142.00
Monsanto -
Ranger Pro

$205.99
$2,059.90
Monsanto -
Roundup Pro Dry

NO BID

$71.39
$3,569.50
Bayer - Chipco
Ronstar G

$49.65
$9,930.00
Loveland
Mirage Plus

$200.88
$2,008.80
Monsanto

$30.65
$4,597.50
Lesco

$67.50
$3,375.00
Bayer
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NO.
12.  ProTurf or equal,
In 28.87-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 100 bags NO BID $85.00 NO BID
Total $8,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Andersons AGC 8656
Goosegrass/Crabgrass Control
13. Revolver or equal;
In quart container
Bid Price Unit 100 containers $171.03 $167.25 $173.00
Total $17,103.00 $16,725.00 $17,300.00
Brand Name and Number: As specified Bayer - Revolver Bayer
GROUP Il - INSCTICIDES
14. Dursban Pro or equal;
In 2-gallon container
Bid Price Unit 5 containers NO BID $94.96 $93.00
Total $474.80 $465.00
Brand Name and Number: Dow Agro Dow
Sciences - Dursban
Pro
GROUP 1V - MISCELLANEOUS
15.  Turf Mark or equal
In 2.5 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 120 containers $65.20 $58.77 $57.50
Total $7,824.00 $7,052.40 $6,900.00
Brand Name and Number: As specified Becker Underwood - UHS/Verdicon Turf Mark

Turf Mark




