
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14833 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MAY 2, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS for a twenty- GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
four (24) month period beginning July 1, PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS
2006 and ending June 30, 2008 to the City INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii LLC

ITEM
NO.

Hawaii General Excise Tax Rate: 4.16% 4.166% 4.166% 4.166% 4.166% 

THINNER, ACRYLIC LACQUER
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No

1. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 305 gals NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total 1 - 22 1 & 2 1 - 59 1 - 3

SOLVENTS
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Gold Sheild #325 

solvent 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X

2. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gals drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 110 gals $7.05

Total $775.50
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO. OIL

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Supreme 76 Guardol QLT 30 
30 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

3. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 336 gals $7.70 $8.34

Total $2,587.20 $2,802.24

OIL
SAE 80-W-90
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM 76 MP Gear Lube Pennzoil Longlife 

Universal 80w-90 80W/90 Heavy Duty Gear 
Oil 80W-90 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X

4. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 180 lbs $1.27 $1.15 $1.29

Total $228.60 $207.00 $232.20

SAE 85-W-140
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM 76 MP Gear Lube Pennzoil Longlife 

85W-140 85W/140 Heavy Duty Gear 
Oil 85W-140 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
5. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of

400 gals. in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City's tanks.
Bid Price Unit 27,400 lbs $0.92 $1.03 $1.19

Total $25,208.00 $28,222.00 $32,606.00
6. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 400 lb. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 6,000 lbs $0.95 $1.00 $1.19

Total $5,700.00 $6,000.00 $7,140.00
7. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 960 lbs $1.27 $1.15 $1.28

Total $1,219.20 $1,104.00 $1,228.80

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 4 - 7: $32,355.80 $35,533.00 $41,207.00

OIL
SAE 5W-20
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Supreme 76 Super SB 

5w-20 5W/20 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

8. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 220 gals $6.86 $8.06 NO BID

Total $1,509.20 $1,773.20 8 - 10
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

SAE 10W-40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Supreme 76 Super 10W/40 

10w-40 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

9. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 440 gals $6.96 $6.91

Total $3,062.40 $3,040.40
10. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 150 gals $7.32 $7.53

Total $1,098.00 $1,129.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 8 - 10: $5,669.60 $5,943.10

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: 76 Super SB Ford Motorcraft 

5W/20 Motor Oil SAE 
5W-20 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

11. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 1,430 gals NO BID $8.06 $8.86

Total $11,525.80 $12,669.80
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

OIL
SAE 10W-30
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM HDMO 76 Guardol QLT 

10w-30 drums 10W/30 
Chevron Delo 400 

Recycled product(s) being offered? 10w-30 cases 
Yes
No X X

12. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 110 gals $6.45 $7.11 NO BID

Total $709.50 $782.10 12 - 52
13. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 30 gals $8.39 $8.45

Total $251.70 $253.50

SAE 15W-40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM 76 Guardol QLT 

HDMO 15w-40 15W/40 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

14. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 2,250 gals $5.75 $7.05

Total $12,937.50 $15,862.50
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
15. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 30 gals $8.68 $8.34

Total $260.40 $250.20

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 12 - 15: $14,159.10 $17,148.30

OIL
SAE 10W-30
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM HDMO 76 Guardol QLT 

10w-30 Bulk & drums 10W/30 
Chevron Delo 400 

Recycled product(s) being offered? 10w-30 cases 
Yes
No X X

16. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
330 gals. in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City's tanks.
Bid Price Unit 1,650 gals $6.45 $6.61

Total $10,642.50 $10,906.50
17. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 465 gals $6.45 $7.11

Total $2,999.25 $3,306.15
18. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 520 gals $8.39 $8.45

Total $4,362.80 $4,394.00
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

SAE 15W-40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM HDMO 76 Guardol QLT 

15w-40 drums & case 15W/40 
Chevron Delo 400 

Recycled product(s) being offered? 15w-40 pails 
Yes
No X X

19. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
330 gals. in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City's tanks.
Bid Price Unit 6,600 gals $5.70 $5.75

Total $37,620.00 $37,950.00
20. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 5 gal. pails.  Minimum of one (1)
pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 150 gals $8.68 $8.13

Total $1,302.00 $1,219.50
21. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 900 gals $8.68 $8.34

Total $7,812.00 $7,506.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 16 - 21: $64,738.55 $65,282.15

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM 76 Guardol QLT 

HDMO 15w-40 15W/40 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
22. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 180 gals $8.84 $8.34

Total $1,591.20 $1,501.20

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Texaco Ursa Exxon XD-3 Extra 76 Guardol QLT 

Premium TDX 15W-40 Motor Oil 15W/40 
15w-40 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X

23. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
500 gals. in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City tanks.
Bid Price Unit 72,000 gals $5.71 $6.96 $5.75

Total $411,120.00 $501,120.00 $414,000.00
24. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 330 gals $5.90 $6.96 $7.05

Total $1,947.00 $2,296.80 $2,326.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 23 & 24: $413,067.00 $503,416.80 $416,326.50

OIL
SAE 10
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Delo Shell Rotella T10 

400-10 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
25. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 660 gals $7.80 NO BID $7.16

Total $5,148.00 25 - 31 $4,725.60

SAE-30
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Delo 76 Guardol QLT 30 

400-30 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

26. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 660 gals $7.65 $6.96

Total $5,049.00 $4,593.60
27. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 60 gals $8.92 $7.80

Total $535.20 $468.00
28. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 36 gals $8.55 $8.34

Total $307.80 $300.24
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

SAE-40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Delo 76 Guardol QLT 40 

400-40 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

29. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 60 gals $8.92 $8.36

Total $535.20 $501.60
30. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 36 gals $8.55 $7.97

Total $307.80 $286.92

SAE-50
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Delo Shell Rotella T 50 

400-50 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

31. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 60 gals $9.05 $8.40

Total $543.00 $504.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 25 - 31: $12,426.00 $11,379.96



PROPOSAL NO. 14833
Page 11

GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron RPM Exxon XD-3 SAE 40 76 Guardol QLT 40 

HDMO 40 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X

32. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
440 gals. in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City tanks.
Bid Price Unit 8,000 gals $5.80 $6.36 $6.13

Total $46,400.00 $50,880.00 $49,040.00
33. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 220 gals $5.80 $6.36 $6.74

Total $1,276.00 $1,399.20 $1,482.80

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 32 & 33: $47,676.00 $52,279.20 $50,522.80

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Cevron Sythetic Mobil Delvac 76 Triton Syn EP 

Gear Lube Tegra Sythetic Gear Oil 80W-140 
80W-140 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X

34. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 3,300 gals $27.60 $21.94 $8.94

Total $91,080.00 $72,402.00 $29,502.00
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

OIL
ISO 32
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Rykon 76 Unax AW 32 

AW 32 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

35. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 265 gals $7.13 NO BID $6.90

Total $1,889.45 35 - 68 $1,828.50

ISO 46
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Rykon 76 Unax AW 46 

AW 46 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

36. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 440 gals $4.91 $6.19

Total $2,160.40 $2,723.60
37. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 150 gals $7.13 $6.90

Total $1,069.50 $1,035.00
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

ISO 68
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Rykon 76 Unax AW 68 

AW 68 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

38. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
330 gals. in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City tanks.
Bid Price Unit 3,960 gals $4.80 $4.98

Total $19,008.00 $19,720.80
39. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 4,180 gals $4.80 $6.08

Total $20,064.00 $25,414.40
40. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 1,745 gals $7.13 $6.85

Total $12,441.85 $11,953.25

ISO 100
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron Machine Shell Tellus 100 

Oil AW 100 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
41. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 50 gals $8.95 $7.89

Total $447.50 $394.50
42. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 315 gals $7.27 $6.49

Total $2,290.05 $2,044.35

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 35 - 42: $59,370.75 $65,114.40

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No

43. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 35 lb. pails.  Minimum of one (1)
pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 240 lbs NO BID NO BID

Total 43 - 58 43 - 47
44. Bid price shall be based on deliveries of ten

(10) 14 oz. cartridge per case.  Minimum
of one (1) case per delivery
Bid Price Unit 30 cases

Total

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 43 & 44:
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No

45. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 1,800 lbs

Total
46. Bid price shall be based on deliveries of ten

(10) 14 oz. cartridge per case.  Minimum
of one (1) case per delivery
Bid Price Unit 60 cases

Total

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 45 & 46:

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No

47. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
non-returnable 5-gal. pails.  Minimum of
one pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 75 gals

Total



PROPOSAL NO. 14833
Page 16

GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

CHASSIS LUBE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Megaplex X03 #2 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X

48. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of
one (1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 240 lbs $1.59

Total $381.60

Lubriplate 1200-2
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No

49. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 400 lb. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 1,200 lbs NO BID

Total 49 - 51
50. Bid prices shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 360 lbs

Total
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
51. Bid price shall be based on deliveries of ten

(10) 14 oz. cartridge per case.  Minimum
of one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 15 cases

Total

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 49 - 51:

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Unoba EP2 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X

52. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 400 lb. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 800 lbs $1.30

Total $1,040.00

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Multiplex Red #2 Pennzoil Pennlith 

Ultra EP 2 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

53. Bid prices shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 1,080 lbs $1.67 $1.80

Total $1,803.60 $1,944.00
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
54. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in ten

(10) cartridges to a box, four (4) boxes to a
case.
Bid Price Unit 220 cases $63.70 $78.40

Total $14,014.00 $17,248.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 53 & 54: $15,817.60 $19,192.00

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Multiplex Red #2 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X

55. Bid prices shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 120 lb. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 3,000 lbs $1.67 NO BID

Total $5,010.00 55 - 58
56. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in ten

(10) cartridges to a box, four (4) boxes to a
case.
Bid Price Unit 25 cases $63.70

Total $1,592.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 55 & 56: $6,602.50
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.

GREASE
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Multiplex Red #1 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X

57. Bid prices shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 400 lb. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 6,000 lbs $1.71

Total $10,260.00
58. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 5 gal. pails.  Minimum of
one (1) pail per delivery
Bid Price Unit 50 gals $12.74

Total $637.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 57 & 58: $10,897.00

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron ATF 76 Super ATF ----- Pennzoil Dexron 

Dexron III Mercon III/Mercon ATF 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X

59. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
400 gallons in bulk per delivery.  The
Contractor shall fill the City's tanks.
Bid Price Unit 10,800 gals $5.37 $4.31 $6.21

Total $57,996.00 $46,548.00 $67,068.00
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GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLAND OIL MATT'S PENNZOIL
PETROLEUM ISLES AND SUPPLY TRANSMISSION DISTRIBUTORS

INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
60. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 2,805 gals $5.45 $6.73 $11.06 $6.76

Total $15,287.25 $18,877.65 $31,023.30 $18,961.80
61. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 96 gals $7.13 $7.80 NO BID $8.85

Total $684.48 $748.80 61 - 68 $849.60

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 59 - 61: $73,967.73 $66,174.45 ----- $86,879.40

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron ATF 76 Super ATF Pennzoil Dexron 

dexron III Mercon III/Mercon ATF 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X

62. Bid price shall be based on a minimum of
400 gals. in bulk delivery.  The Contractor
shall fill the City tanks.
Bid Price Unit 23,200 gals $5.37 $4.31 $6.08

Total $124,584.00 $99,992.00 $141,056.00

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: 76 Mercon V Ford Motorcraft 

Mercon V ATF 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X
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INC. PETROLEUM COMPANY INC. REPAIR INC. OF HAWAII INC.
LLC

ITEM
NO.
63. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 990 gals NO BID $9.84 $11.48

Total 63 - 65 $9,741.60 $11,365.20
64. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of
one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 36 gals $11.17 $12.87

Total $402.12 $463.32

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 63 & 64: $10,143.72 $11,828.52

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Kendall Versa Trans Pennzoil Multi- 

Vehicle ATF 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

65. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
cases of 12 qt. containers.  Minimum of one
(1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 90 gals $13.16 $12.80

Total $1,184.40 $1,152.00

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Chevron 1000 THF 76 Hydraulic Tractor Pennzoil Hydra- 

Fluid Trans Tractor Fluid 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X X
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ITEM
NO.
66. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 880 gals $7.96 $6.77 $7.60

Total $7,004.80 $5,957.60 $6,688.00
67. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 5 gal. pails.  Minimum of one
(1) pail per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 150 gals $8.80 $7.78 $8.66

Total $1,320.00 $1,167.00 $1,299.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 66 & 67: $8,324.80 $7,124.60 $7,987.00

OIL
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Shell Power Pennzoil 

Steering Fluid Powersteering Fluid 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

68. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
cases of 12/12 fluid oz. containers.
Minimum of one (1) case per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 420 cases NO BID $12.79 $16.56

Total 68 - 71 $5,371.80 $6,955.20
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ITEM
NO.

SYNTHETIC TRANSFLUID
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Mobil Delvac Triton HD ATF Transynd 

Synthetic ATF 

69. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 6,600 gals $27.49 $12.91 $34.23 NO BID

Total $181,434.00 $85,206.00 $225,918.00 69 - 71

SYNTHETIC TRANSFLUID
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Mobil Delvac Triton HD ATF 

Synthetic ATF 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No X X

70. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in
returnable 55 gal. drums.  Minimum of one
(1) drum per delivery.
Bid Price Unit 220 gals $27.49 $12.91 NO BID

Total $6,047.80 $2,840.20 70 & 71

JELLY
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
Yes
No

71. Bottles, 16 oz.
Bid Price Unit 72 btls NO BID NO BID

Total


