ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14830 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

OPENED: APRIL 21, 2006

Reqgn. No. G19036, G19033, G19038, G19039 & G19040

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
MOTOR VEHICLES, to the Honolulu
Emergency Services Department, City and
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM

NO.

1. One (1) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle,

Compact, 4-Door, 4-Wheel Drive
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

CUTTER
DODGE INC.

CUTTER
FORD INC.

HONOLULU
FORD INC.

ORCHID ISLE
AUTO CENTER

Jeep Liberty Sport

Ford Escape 4x4

Ford Escape U93

2007 Ford Escape

SUV 4x4 (KJJH74) (U93) (U03)

Year of production model: 2006 2007 2007 2007
Bid Price $22,498.81 $26,099.83 $25,150.32 $25,012.00
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
~_Applicable information available X X X X
~_Applicable information not available
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE COST
FOR THE APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE
VEHICLE
60,000 Miles x $2.50 = $8,823.53 $7,894.74 $7,894.74 $7,500.00

City EPA MPG 17 19 19 20
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $31,322.34 $33,994.57 $33,045.06 $32,512.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE
DODGE INC. FORD INC. FORD INC. AUTO CENTER
ITEM
NO.
2. Four (4) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Wheel
Drive
Manufacturer's amke and model no.: Jeep Grand| Ford Explorer 4x4 | Ford Explorer U73| 2006 Ford Explorer
Cherokee Laredo 4-Door (U73) (U73)
4x4 WKJIH74
Year of production model: 2006 2006 2006 2006
Bid Price Unit 4 units $27,022.74 $31,686.18 $30,949.09 $32,130.00
Total $108,090.96 $126,744.72 $123,796.36 $128,520.00
Manuals: (One Set of Five Manuals) $325.00 $1,223.95 $500.00 -0-
Sub-total for Item No. 2: $108,415.96 $127,968.67 $124,296.36 $128,520.00
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE COST
FOR THE APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE
VEHICLE
60,000 Miles x $2.50 = $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,714.29 $10,714.29
X 4 Units = $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $42,857.14 $42,857.14
City EPA MPG 15 15 14 14
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $148,415.96 $167,968.67 $167,153.50 $171,377.14

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE
DODGE INC. FORD INC. FORD INC. AUTO CENTER
ITEM
NO.
3. One (1) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door,

4-Wheel Drive
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
~_Applicable information available
~_Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE COST
FOR THE APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE
VEHICLE

60,000 Miles x $2.50 =
City EPA MPG

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Dodge Durango
SLT 4x4 HBSH74

2006
$30,441.47

$10,714.29
14

$41,155.76

Ford Expedition 4x4
4-Door (U16)

2007
$37,219.41

$10,714.29
14

$47,933.70

Ford Expedition U16

2006
$32,944.01

$10,714.29
14

$43,658.30

2006 Ford
Expedition (U14)

2006
$31,562.00

$10,714.29
14

$42,276.29
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE
DODGE INC. FORD INC. FORD INC. AUTO CENTER
ITEM
NO.
4. One (1) Only, 6,100 Lbs. GVWR Truck Cab

and Chassis with 6' Pickup Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE COST
FOR THE APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE
VEHICLE

60,000 Miles x $2.50 =
City EPA MPG

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Dodge Ram 1500
Reg Cab 4x2
DRIL62

2006

$23,014.44

$10,714.29
14

$33,728.73

Ford F150 4x2 RC
(F12)

2006
$23,772.69

$10,714.29
14

$34,486.98

Ford F150 F12

2006
$23,113.93

$10,714.29
14

$33,828.22

2006 Ford F150
(F12)

2006
$21,192.00

$10,000.00
15

$31,192.00
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE
DODGE INC. FORD INC. FORD INC. AUTO CENTER
ITEM
NO.
5. One (1) Only, 6,700 Lbs. GVWR Cargo Van
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford E150 Cargo Ford Econoline 2006 Ford F250
Van (F12) E150 E14 (S24)
Year of production model: 2006 2006 2006
Bid Price NO BID $22,747.77 $21,802.56 $23,435.00
5&6
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE COST
FOR THE APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE
VEHICLE
60,000 Miles x $2.50 = $10,714.29 $10,714.29 N/A
City EPA MPG 14 14 N/A
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $33,462.06 $32,516.85 $23,435.00
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
6. One (1) Only, 8,550 Lbs. GVWR Cargo Van
Manufacturer's make and model no.:
Year of produciton model:
Bid Price NO BID NO BID NO BID

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days




