
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14828 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  APRIL 5, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of
JANITORIAL CHEMICALS for a twelve- ACUITY CICO MALOLO NOVA TRIPLE F WW GRAINGER
month period beginning April 15, 2006 SPECIALTY ENTERPRISE BEVERAGES & CHEMICAL DISTRIBUTING
and ending April 14, 2007 to the City and PRODUCTS LTD. SUPPLIES LTD. CORPORATION INC.
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii dba SELIG IND. dba NOVA

ITEM DISTRIBUTORS
NO. GROUP I
1. Detergent, Dishwashing

Bid Price Unit 45,312 fluid NO BID $0.100 $0.09 NO BID $0.0885 NO BID
Total ounces 1 & 2 $4,531.20 $4,078.08 1 - 4 $4,010.112 1 & 2

Brand Name and Number: Colgate Palmolive Colgate Palmolive Palmolive 47430 
CP-47430 Ultra 47430 

2. Detergent, Dishwashing
Bid Price Unit 88 gallons $7.99 $10.54 $10.19

Total $703.12 $927.52 $896.72
Brand Name and Number: Colgate Palmolive Colgate Palmolive Palmolive 204910 

CP-04910 04910 

GROUP II
3. Cleaner/Polish, Furniture

Bid Price Unit 1,200 ounces $0.195 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1035
Total $234.00 3 - 5 3 - 8 $124.20

Brand Name and Number: Selig Good Stuff Ball Lemon Up 
Aerosol - 912501 3U021 

4. Cleaner, Stainless Steel
Bid Price Unit 1,200 ounces NO BID $0.20 $0.134

Total $240.00 $160.80
Brand Name and Number: Canberra Husky Ball Luster Sheen 

1210 Stainless 3U035 
Steel Polish 

5. Cleaner, Oven
Bid Price Unit 19,584 ounces $0.17 NO BID $0.27 NO BID

Total $3,329.28 $5,287.68
Brand Name and Number: Selig Oven Cleaner Easy Off Oven & 

Aerosol - 840801 Grill Cleaner 
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ACUITY CICO MALOLO NOVA TRIPLE F WW GRAINGER
SPECIALTY ENTERPRISE BEVERAGES & CHEMICAL DISTRIBUTING
PRODUCTS LTD. SUPPLIES LTD. CORPORATION INC.

dba SELIG IND. dba NOVA
ITEM DISTRIBUTORS
NO.
6. Sealer/Finisher, Floor

Bid Price Unit 84 gallons NO BID $8.49 $10.89 NO BID $9.73
Total $713.16 $914.76 6 - 21 $817.32

Brand Name and Number: Flo-Kem Mission Mirror Ball Time Off 
FL-140-04 Image Premium 2U044 

Floor Fishish 2001 
GROUP III

7. Cleaner, Glass
Bid Price Unit 6,144 fluid $0.079 $0.0528 $0.059 $0.054

Total ounces $485.38 $324.40 $362.50 $331.78
Brand Name and Number: Selig Glashine Flo-Kem 3M Glass & Ball Sun Up 

RTU J28011 FL-358-00 Surface Cleaner 2U099 

GROUP IV
8. Cleaner/General Purpose

Bid Price Unit 5,760 fluid $0.126 $0.047 NO BID $0.044
Total ounces $725.76 $270.72 $253.44

Brand Name and Number: Selig Gosh RTU Flo-Kem Bounty Hunter 
J27811 FL-3052-00 (Ball) 2U010 

GROUP V
9. Powder, Scouring

Bid Price Unit 82,530 ounces $0.099 $0.0435 $0.03 $0.0384 NO BID
Total $8,170.47 $3,590.06 $2,475.90 $3,169.152

Brand Name and Number: Selig Slick - 840301 Colgate Palmolive Ajax Chlorine Ajax Chlorine 
CP-4283 Cleanser 04283 Cleanser #4283 

10. Cleanser, Disinfectant Creme
Bid Price Unit 7,680 ounces NO BID $0.0794 $0.09 $0.0929 $0.07375

Total 10 - 13 $609.79 $691.20 $713.472 $566.40
Brand Name and Number: Colgate Palmolive Ajax Creme Ajax EPA Ball Double Time 

CP Cleanser Disinfectant 3U052 
Cleanser #14942 
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ACUITY CICO MALOLO NOVA TRIPLE F WW GRAINGER
SPECIALTY ENTERPRISE BEVERAGES & CHEMICAL DISTRIBUTING
PRODUCTS LTD. SUPPLIES LTD. CORPORATION INC.

dba SELIG IND. dba NOVA
ITEM DISTRIBUTORS
NO. GROUP VI
11. Bleach, Chlorine

Bid Price Unit 184,320 fluid $0.0177 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total ounce $3,262.46 11 - 13 11 - 21

Brand Name and Number: Pure Bright Bleach 
6 KI-21-CB 

GROUP VII
12. Cleaner, Toilet Bowl

Bid Price Unit 240 quarts $1.85 $1.46
Total $444.00 $350.40

Brand Name and Number: Flo-Kem Ball Anytime 
FL-362-00 3U045 

13. Remover, Toilet Ring
Bid Price Unit 36 quarts $3.31 NO BID

Total $119.16 13 - 15
Brand Name and Number: Mission Labs 

ML-1456 

GROUP VIII
14. Digestant, Enzyme

Bid Price Unit 19,968 fluid $0.148 $0.081 $0.10
Total ounces $2,955.26 $1,617.41 $1,996.80

Brand Name and Number: Selig Bioteam Flo-Kem Canberra Husky 
Probiotic Fresh FL-6328-00 400 Bacteria 

M16901 Digestant 
GROUP IX

15. Deodorant, Disinfectant
Bid Price Unit 5,580 ounces NO BID NO BID $0.24

Total 15 & 16 $1,339.20
Brand Name and Number: 3M TB Spray 

34770 
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ACUITY CICO MALOLO NOVA TRIPLE F WW GRAINGER
SPECIALTY ENTERPRISE BEVERAGES & CHEMICAL DISTRIBUTING
PRODUCTS LTD. SUPPLIES LTD. CORPORATION INC.

dba SELIG IND. dba NOVA
ITEM DISTRIBUTORS
NO.
16. Freshener, Air and Odor

Bid Price Unit 600 ounces $0.401 NO BID $0.1275
Total $240.60 16 - 19 $76.50

Brand Name and Number: Selig Fresh Air Ball 5MP26 New 
Aerosol - 913201 Blossom 

17. Santizer, Air
Bid Price Unit 1,176 ounces NO BID $0.568 NO BID

Total $667.97 17 - 21
Brand Name and Number: Waterbury 

WB-53017CWD 

GROUP X
18. Block, Urinal Deodorant

Bid Price Unit 1,728 ounces $0.812 $0.34
Total $1,403.14 $587.52

Brand Name and Number: Selig Bio-Cage Big D JS-BD680 
K64824 

19. Screen, Urinal with Deodorant
Bid Price Unit 564 each $2.01 $1.52

Total $1,133.64 $857.28
Brand Name and Number: Selig Bio Screen Continental 

K65012 CM-165-1CHER 

GROUP XI
20. Pine Oil

Bid Price Unit 248 gallons $16.34 $11.52 $9.44
Total $4,052.32 $2,856.96 $2,341.12

Brand Name and Number: Selig Pinetax 03 Flo-Kem Pine Oil Ajax Pine Forest 
M59024 FL-210-04 4209 
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ACUITY CICO MALOLO NOVA TRIPLE F WW GRAINGER
SPECIALTY ENTERPRISE BEVERAGES & CHEMICAL DISTRIBUTING
PRODUCTS LTD. SUPPLIES LTD. CORPORATION INC.

dba SELIG IND. dba NOVA
ITEM DISTRIBUTORS
NO. GROUP XII
21. Disinfectant

Bid Price Unit 269,312 fl. oz. NO BID $0.0488 NO BID
Total $13,142.43

Brand Name and Number: Flo-Kem FL-222-04 


