PROPOSAL NO. 14827

OPENED: MARCH 29, 2006
Regn. No. G38497

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM
NO.

For the furnishing and delivery of

DEFIBRILLATORS to the Honolulu Police
and Fire Departments, City and County

of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

Defibrillators
Bid Price

Electrodes
Bid Price

Batteries
Bid Price

Unit
Total

Unit
Total

Unit 5
Total

Software for downloads

Bid Price

Infrared Adapter
Bid Price

Unit 75
Total

Unit 75
Total

Computer Hardware Cable

Bid Price

Unit 75
Total

Information Database Managment

Bid Price

AED Trainer
Bid Price

Unit 5
Total

Unit 45
Total

Electrodes for Trainer

Bid Price

TOTAL SUM BID:

Unit 45
Total

416 each

50 pair

AED AIRGAS BECKER- CARDIAC MEDTRONIC PHILIPS SAFETY TRI-ANIM
INSTITUTE OF GASPRO PARKIN SCIENCE EMERGENCY MEDICAL SYSTEMS HEALTH
AMERICA, INC. INC. DENTAL CORPORATION| RESPONSE SYSTEMS HAWAII, INC. SERVICES

SUPPLY CO. SYSTEMS NORTH INC.
AMERICA CO.

$1,070.00 $1,495.00 $975.00 $995.00 $1,545.00 $1,027.17 $1,092.96 $1,400.00
$445,120.00 $621,920.00 $405,600.00 $413,920.00 $642,720.00 $427,302.72 $454,671.36 $582,400.00
NC $38.00 $27.00 $22.00 $23.75 $38.22 no charge-included $33.00

-0- $1,900.00 $1,350.00 $1,100.00 $1,187.50 $1,911.00 no charge-included $1,650.00

NC $120.00 $110.00 $199.00 $194.48 $113.10 no charge-included $125.00

-0- $600.00 $550.00 $995.00 $972.40 $565.50 no charge-included $625.00

note: 75 to 1 unit

NC $327.00 $48.00 incl. at n/c $179.00 $497.50 no charge-included free

-0- $24,525.00 $3,600.00 incl. at n/c $13,425.00 $497.50 no charge-included free

NC $98.00 $50.00 see line 6 see line #6 $67.60 no charge-included $20.00

-0- $7,350.00 $3,750.00 see line 6 see line #6 $5,070.00 no charge-included $1,500.00

NC -0- included incl. at n/c $40.00 No bid no charge-included not required

-0- -0- included incl. at n/c $3,000.00 No bid no charge-included not required

NC $1,074.85 no charge incl. at n/c $1,199.00 No bid no charge-included no bid

-0- $5,374.25 no charge incl. at n/c $5,995.00 No bid no charge-included no bid

NC $245.00 $265.00 $245.00 included $169.00 no charge-included $322.00

-0- $11,025.00 $11,925.00 $11,025.00 included $7,605.00 no charge-included $14,490.00

NC $57.00 $22.00 $18.00 included $15.60 no charge-included included

-0- $2,565.00 $990.00 $810.00 included $702.00 no charge-included included

Lump Sum $445,120.00 * Please see quote
tax 17,804|80

$462,924.80 $675,259.25 $427,765.00 $427,850.00 | * $693,991.4 $443,653.72 $454,671.36 $600,665.00
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Manufacturer's name and model no.:

Delivery in Calendar Days:

45 Days

AED AIRGAS BECKER- CARDIAC MEDTRONIC PHILIPS SAFETY TRI-ANIM
INSTITUTE OF GASPRO PARKIN SCIENCE EMERGENCY MEDICAL SYSTEMS HEALTH
AMERICA, INC. INC. DENTAL CORPORATION| RESPONSE SYSTEMS HAWAIL, INC. SERVICES

SUPPLY CO. SYSTEMS NORTH INC.
AMERICA CO.
Welch Allyn Philips FRX Defibtech | Cardiac Science Medtronic Philips HeartStartf 2011 Medical Defibtech
AED10 DDU-100 Corporation/ Emergency FRx Corp. DCF-100
Powerheart G3 Response| Model 861304 20100000302011
AED Semi- Systems 010 - Zoll AED
Automatic PN: LIFEPAK 500 Plus with
9300E-201 and AED Professional
accessories as Rescurer
described Graphics

30-45 Days




