ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14791 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: FEBRUARY 14, 2006
For the furnishing and delivery of
PNEUMATIC TIRES AND TUBES for the EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
twelve-month period beginning April 1, 2006 TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
and ending March 31, 2007 to the City and COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii COMPANY
ITEM
NO. MOTORCYCLE TIRES
1. 120/70ZR17 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlap 9900001122.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 75 NO BID NO BID $108.32
Total 1-4 1-4 $8,124.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Dunlap 120/70ZR17
99 00 0 001 122
Stock or Import: Import
2. 160/60ZR18 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlap Sportman.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 125 $126.66
Total $15,832.50
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Dunlap 160/60ZR18
99 00 0 001 123
Stock or Import: Import
3. 120/70ZR17 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlap D205F.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 75 $143.32
Total $10,749.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Dunlap 120/70ZR17
99 99 0 000 511
Stock or Import: Import
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
4. 170/60ZR17 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlap D205g.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 200 $154.99
Total $30,998.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Dunlap 170/60/ZR17
99 99 0 000 512
Stock or Import:
PASSENGER CAR TIRES
5. P175/70R13
Bid Price Unit 34 $29.51 $30.97 NO BID
Total $1,003.34 $1,052.98 5-130
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T7024 Rep. Horizon Metric
356-136-163
Stock or Import: S Stock
6. P165/80R13
Bid Price Unit 48 $27.36 $29.55
Total $1,313.28 $1,418.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T8024 Rep. Super Ride
356-672-265
Stock or Import: S Stock
7. P175/80R13
Bid Price Unit 49 $28.44 $30.42
Total $1,393.56 $1,490.58
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T8026 Rep. Super Ride
356-307-263
Stock or Import: S Stock




PROPOSAL NO. 14791

Page 3
EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
8. P185/80R13
Bid Price Unit 21 NO BID $31.78
Total $667.38
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Rep. Super Ride
3566-666-263
Stock or Import: Stock
9. P175/70R14
Bid Price Unit 24 $32.73 $35.90
Total $785.52 $861.60
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT A700 IGT7031 Goodyear Intrgrity
402-268-047
Stock or Import: S Stock
10. P185/70R14
Bid Price Unit 9 $32.26 $33.52
Total $290.34 $301.68
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T7032 Rep. Horizon Metric
356-102-163
Stock or Import: S Stock
11. P205/70R14, white wall
Bid Price Unit 6 $41.31 $43.52
Total $247.86 $261.12
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T7040 Goodyear Intregrity
402-211-436
Stock or Import: S Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
12. P185/75R14, black wall (on at least one
side)
Bid Price Unit 24 $34.33 $38.54
Total $823.92 $924.96
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT C6T7520 Goodyear Integrity
402-853-436
Stock or Import: S Stock
13. P185/75R14, white wall
Bid Price Unit 28 $34.33 $38.54
Total $961.24 $1,079.12
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT C6T7520 Goodyear Integrity
402-853-436
Stock or Import: S Stock
14. P195/75R14, white wall
Bid Price Unit 20 $35.41 $39.84
Total $708.20 $796.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT G6T7524 Goodyear Integrity
402-645-436
Stock or Import: S Stock
15. P205/75R14
Bid Price Unit 44 $38.09 $39.56
Total $1,675.96 $1,740.64
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7528 Goodyear Integrity
402728436
Stock or Import: S Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
16. P215/75R14
Bid Price Unit 17 NO BID $42.85
Total 16 & 17 $728.45
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Rep. Ensign
356867267
Stock or Import: Stock
17. P215/60R15
Bid Price Unit 22 $46.97
Total $1,033.34
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Rep. Enterprise
353209013
Stock or Import: Stock
18. P205/65R15
Bid Price Unit 14 $46.13 $44.39
Total $645.82 $621.46
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGT6548 Rep. Ensign
356313268
Stock or Import: S Stock
19. P215/65HR15, high speed police tire,
tubeless, special radial ply design, speed
rated at 130 MPH
Bid Price Unit 30 $46.88 $63.44
Total $1,406.40 $1,903.20
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGT6552 Goodyear GT HR
100474200
Stock or Import: S Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
20. P215/65R15
Bid Price Unit 2 $46.88 $44.58
Total $93.76 $89.16
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T6552 Rep. Ensign
356410268
Stock or Import: S Stock
21. P205/70R15
Bid Price Unit 50 $45.60 $43.27
Total $2,280.00 $2,163.50
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T7060 Rep. Ensign
356099268
Stock or Import: S Stock
22. P215/70R15
Bid Price Unit 20 $47.21 $41.05
Total $944.20 $821.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T7064 Goodyear Integrity
402020047
Stock or Import: S Stock
23. P215/70R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 20 NO BID $46.65
Total 238&24 $933.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear Integrity
402431436
Stock or Import: Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
24. P225/70HR15, high speed police tire,
tubeless, special radial ply design, speed
rated at 130 MPH, "Goodyear Eagle GT,
GT+4, or RS-A", "B.F. Goodrich EuroT/A"
or "General Tire SP2000H or SP2000ASH".
NO SUBSTITUTE. Conractor must stock
at least 20 tires for Honolulu Police
Department (HPD) emergency purchase
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 240 $71.27
Total $17,104.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear Eagle
RSA102V
732478500
Stock or Import: Stock
25. P225/70R15
Bid Price Unit 114 $60.08 $56.25
Total $6,849.12 $6,412.50
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: S/F Fliteline 35512 Goodyear Integrity
402392436
Stock or Import: S Stock
26. P235/70R15
Bid Price Unit 24 NO BID $61.68
Total 26 & 27 $1,480.32
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear GT |l
116969011
Stock or Import: Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
27. P235/70HR15, high speed police tire,
tubeless, special radial ply design, speed
rated at 130 MPH, "Goodyear Eagle GT,
GT+4, or RS-A" "B.F. Goodrich Euro T/A"
or "General Tire SP2000H or TP2000ASH".
NO SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock
at least 10 tires for Honolulu Police
Department (HPD) emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 25 $73.45
Total $1,836.25
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear Eagle
RSA102V
732807500
Stock or Import: Stock
28. P205/75R15
Bid Price Unit 68 $40.77 $38.00
Total $2,772.36 $2,584.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7540 Rep. Super Ride
356099265
Stock or Import: S Stock
29. P205/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 67 $40.77 $38.00
Total $2,731.59 $2,546.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7540 Rep. Super Ride
356099265
Stock or Import: S Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
30. P215/75R15
Bid Price Unit 24 $42.39 $49.49
Total $1,017.36 $1,187.76
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7544 Goodyear Integrity
402391436
Stock or Import: S Stock
31. P215/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 32 $42.39 $49.49
Total $1,356.48 $1,583.68
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7544 Goodyear Integrity
402391436
Stock or Import: S Stock
32. P225/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 82 $45.06 $39.01
Total $3,694.92 $3,198.82
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7548 Rep. Supe Ride A/S
356637265
Stock or Import: S Stock
33. P235/75R15
Bid Price Unit 18 $48.82 $724.68
Total $878.76 $13,044.24
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT LGT7552 Rep. Super Ride A/S
356770265
Stock or Import: S Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
34. P235/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 61 $48.82 $40.26
Total $2,978.02 $2,455.86
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7552 Rep. Super Ride A/S
356770265
Stock or Import: S Stock
35. P245/50ZR16, high speed police tire,
tubeless, radial ply design, speed rated
to 160 mph, "Goodyear Eagle ZR50" or
"BF Goodrich Comp ZR50". NO
SUBSTITUTE.
Bid Price Unit 40 NO BID $123.82
Total 35 & 36 $4,952.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear EA GSC
R 728333521
L 728333522
Stock or Import: Stock
36. P215/60R16
Bid Price Unit 51 $64.96
Total $3,312.96
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear Regatta 2
187009016
Stock or Import: Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
37. P225/60HR16, high speed police tire,
tubeless, special radial ply design, speed
rated at 130 MPH, "Goodyear Eagle GT,
GT+4, or RS-A", "B.F. Goodrich Euro T/A"
or "General Tire XP2000H or TP2000ASH".
NO SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock
at least 10 tires for Honolulu Police
Department (HPD) emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 600 $50.43 $68.66
Total $30,258.00 $41,196.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGTX6064 Goodyear Eagle
RSA 732366500
Stock or Import: S Stock
38. P225/60R16
Bid Price Unit 2 $50.43 $60.94
Total $100.86 $121.88
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FT I16TX6064 Goodyear Integrity
402013477
Stock or Import: S Stock
39. P235/70R17-XL
Bid Price Unit 8 NO BID NO BID
Total 39-43

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO. TRUCK TIRES
40. 9.00 X 20, 10 PR, Tube or Tubeless
Bid Price Unit 6 $116.11
Total $696.66
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 179-809
Stock or Import: I
41. 10.00 X 20, 12 PR, Tube or Tubeless
Bid Price Unit 12 $138.95
Total $1,667.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 179-922
Stock or Import: I
42. 11.00 X 20, 14 PR, Tube or Tubeless
Bid Price Unit 30 $207.48
Total $6,224.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 179-884
Stock or Import: I
43. 8 X14.5,12PR
Bid Price Unit 43 $78.32
Total $3,367.76

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Duro 375011409
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
44. LT235-75R15, 6 PR, SBR, All Terrain
Bid Price Unit 18 $69.74 $81.97
Total $1,255.32 $1,475.46

45.

46.

47.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

235-70R16, 10 PR, SBR

Bid Price Unit 18
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

7.50 X 16, 10 PR

Bid Price Unit 36
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

LT225/75R16, 8 PR, SBR

Bid Price Unit 181
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

GT A629 16T9024

NO BID

$69.74
$2,510.64
Duro 36-50616-11

S
$73.50

$13,303.50
FT 16T9036

Rep. Trailmark
APR "C" 357838170

Stock

NO BID

$89.18

$3,210.48

Goodyear Workhorse
312000908

Stock

$78.64
$14,233.84

Rep. Trailmark RD
AP D 357943033

Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
48. LT225-75R16, 8 PR, SBR, All Terrain
Bid Price Unit 20 $73.50 $98.52
Total $1,470.00 $1,970.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 16T9036 Rep. Trailmark
APR E 357072170
Stock or Import: S Stock
49. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 291 $79.94 $94 .43
Total $23,262.54 $27,479.13
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CSV9340 Rep. Trailmark
APE 357046071
Stock or Import: S Stock
50. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial R187
All Steel, or equivalent. Contractor must
stock at least 10 tires for Oahu Transit
Services emergency purchases during the
first 11 months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 74 NO BID $157.23
Total $11,635.02
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G647 RSS
139068080
Stock or Import: Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
51. LT265/75R16, 6 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 31 $88.52 $83.52
Total $2,744.12 $2,589.12
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CSV9344 Rep. Trailmark AP
C 357846072
Stock or Import: S Stock
52. LT215/85R16, 8 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 156 $76.18 $78.55
Total $11,884.08 $12,253.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT C6T9048 Rep. Trailmark AP
D 357268033
Stock or Import: S Stock
53. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, black wall on
both sides of tire.
Bid Price Unit 71 NO BID $87.29
Total 53-55 $6,197.59

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Rep. Trailmark AP
E 357458071

Stock
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ITEM
NO.
54.

55.

LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial R187
All Steel, or equivalent. Contractor must
stock at least 60 tires for Oahu Transit
emergency purchases during the first 11
months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 870

Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
LT235-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial R187
All Steel, or equivalent. Contractor must
stock at least 10 tires for Honolulu
Emergency Services Department
emergency purchases during the first 11
months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 60

Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

EAST BAY
TIRE
COMPANY

GOODYEAR
TIRE AND
RUBBER
COMPANY

SOUTH SEAS
CYCLE
EXCHANGE INC.

$152.87
$132,996.90
Goodyear G149
139069907

Stock

$150.11
$9,006.60
Goodyear G159
139825359

Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
56. LT235-85R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 112 $87.45 $81.62
Total $9,794.40 $9,141.44
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT9352 Rep. Trailmark AP
"E" 357045071
Stock or Import: S Stock
57. LT235-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, All Terrain
Bid Price Unit 8 $87.45 $92.87
Total $699.60 $742.96
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT9352 Rep. Trailmark APR
E 367433126
Stock or Import: S Stock
58. 8.75X16.5, 10 PR

Bid Price Unit 8 $77.25 $90.81
Total $618.00 $726.48

59.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

8.75R16.5, 10 PR, SBR, All Terrain

Bid Price Unit 8
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Duro 36-50616-56

NO BID
59 & 60

Goodyear Workhorse
E 312175090

Stock

NO BID
59 - 61
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ITEM
NO.

60. 9.50R16.5, 10 PR, SBR

61.

62.

Bid Price Unit 8
Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

12 X 1635LT, 12 PR

Bid Price Unit 8
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

LT245/75R17, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on

both sides of tire), all-position, highway,

light truck, Contractor must stock at least

10 tires for Honolulu Emergency Services

Department emergency purchases during

the first 11 months of the contract

regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or

"Import"

Bid Price Unit 60
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

EAST BAY
TIRE
COMPANY

GOODYEAR
TIRE AND
RUBBER
COMPANY

SOUTH SEAS
CYCLE
EXCHANGE INC.

$150.47
$1,203.76
STA LC3EL

$155.57
$9,334.20
Conti 0456645

$149.53

$8,971.80
Goodyear Wrangler
SRA 179136436

Stock




PROPOSAL NO. 14791

Page 19
EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
63. 215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G114 or comparable, SBR, Trailer service.
Bid Price Unit 17 $140.91 $164.55
Total $2,395.47 $2,797.35
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGTTBR1906 Goodyear G114
756246567
Stock or Import: S Stock
64. 225/70R19.5, 12 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 24 $143.17 $178.35
Total $3,436.08 $4,280.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGTTBR2408 Goodyear G670 RV
139418050
Stock or Import: S Stock
65. 255/70R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G159 or comparable, SBR, all position rib
tire.
Bid Price Unit 53 $218.86 $243.97
Total $11,599.58 $12,930.41
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGTTBR2450 Goodyear G169 RSA
756780519
Stock or Import: S Stock
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ITEM
NO.
66.

67.

68.

315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile.

Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for

the Division of Automotive Equipment

Service for emergency purchases during

the first 11 months of the contract

regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or

"Import".

Bid Price Unit 800
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile, Goodyear

Unisteel G287, all position, SBR, servere

service application, on/off highway, resistant

to chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire

Department).

Bid Price Unit 65
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
385/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G286 or comparable, on/off highway, SBR,
all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price Unit 15

Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

EAST BAY
TIRE
COMPANY

GOODYEAR
TIRE AND
RUBBER
COMPANY

SOUTH SEAS
CYCLE
EXCHANGE INC.

Stock or Import:

$317.58
$254,064.00
RL RL3158022.5-1

NO BID
67 - 71

$448.50

$358,800.00
Goodyear G287 MSA
756141662

Stock

$448.50

$29,152.50
Gooyear G287 MSA
756141662

Stock

$426.87
$6,403.05
Goodyear G286
759315200

Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
69. 385/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G287, all position, on/off highway, SBR,
severe service application, resistant to
chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire
Department).
Bid Price Unit 20 $426.87
Total $8,537.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G286
759315200
Stock or Import: Stock
70. 425/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G286 on/off highway, SBR, all position,
severe service application, resistant to
chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire
Department).
Bid Price Unit 10 $468.77
Total $4,687.70
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G286
759313200
Stock or Import: Stock
71. 425/65R22.5, 20 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G286 or comparable, on/off highway,
SBR, all position, severe service application
resistant to chunking and rib rear.
Bid Price Unit 10 $468.77
Total $4,687.70
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G286
759313200
Stock or Import: Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
72. 10R22.5, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 20 $256.97 $273.68
Total $5,139.40 $5,473.60
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GEN S36 0568374 Goodyear G149 RSA
138947125
Stock or Import: S Stock
73. 11R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159
or comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Contractor must stock at least 40 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 1,000 $211.36 $290.96
Total $211,360.00 $290,960.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL11R2256RB2 Goodyear G149 RSA
138179125
Stock or Import: S Stock
74. 11R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G167
or comparable, SBR, drive wheel tire.
Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for
the Division of Refuse Collection and
Disposal for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 10 NO BID $295.86
Total 74-78 $2,958.60
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G182 H
138803185
Stock or Import: Stock
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EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
COMPANY RUBBER EXCHANGE INC.
COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
75. 12R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286
or comparable. SBR, all position, severe
service application, on/off highway, resistant
to chunking and reb tear.
Bid Price Unit 32 $374.94
Total $11,998.08
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G287
138864662
Stock or Import: Stock
76. 12R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G287,
SBR, all position, severe service application
resistant to chunking and rib tear (for
Honolulu Fire Department).
Bid Price Unit 55 $374.94
Total $20,621.70
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G287
138864662
Stock or Import: Stock
77. 12R24.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286
or comparable. SBR, all position, severe
service application, on/off highway,
resistant to chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price Unit 16 $383.95
Total $6,143.20
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G287
138869662
Stock or Import: Stock




PROPOSAL NO. 14791

Page 24
EAST BAY GOODYEAR SOUTH SEAS
TIRE TIRE AND CYCLE
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COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
78. 445/65R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G286, on/off highway, SBR, all position,
severe service highway, resistant to
chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire
Department).
Bid Price Unit 16 $529.56
Total $8,472.96
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G286
759314200
Stock or Import: Stock
FARM TRACTOR TIRES
79. 7.50 X 16(F2), 6 PR, Tube or Tubeless,
Rib Traction
Bid Price Unit 19 $74.03 NO BID
Total $1,406.57 79 -130
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carl F-2
Stock or Import: I
80. 11.00 X 16, 12 PR, Tube or Tubeless, F3,
Rib
Bid Price Unit 2 $190.98
Total $381.96
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 340537

Stock or Import:
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COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
81. 11L X 16, (TU F3), Tube or Tubeless,
12 PR
Bid Price Unit 14 $91.20
Total $1,276.80

82.

83.

84.

85.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
16.9 X 24, AT UTIL, 8PR, Tube or Tubeless
(without disosal)
Bid Price Unit 2
Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 2
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE

17.5L X 24, 10 PR, Tube or Tubeless

(without disposal)

Bid Price Unit 4
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 4
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE

SD 10311160

$363.72
$727.44
SD 10411215
I

$40.00
$80.00

$807.44
$352.99
$1,411.96

SD 10411240
|

$40.00
$160.00

$1,571.96
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COMPANY
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NO.
86. 16.9 X 28, Grip Tread, 10 PR, Tube or
Tubeless, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 2 $407.71
Total $815.42

87.

88.

90.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 2
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE
ROAD GRADER TIRES

12.5/80 X 18-E, Sure Grip, 10 PR, (without
disposal)
Bid Price Unit 8

Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 8
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE
LOADER - DOZER, LOADER, PAVER
10 X 16.5NHS-C, 6 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 18
Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

SD 10411275

$40.00
$80.00

$895.42

$341.19
$2,729.52

DGY 170604113
I

$10.00
$80.00

$2,809.52
$88.52
$1,593.36
SD 10X11144
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COMPANY
ITEM
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91. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price Unit 18 $6.00
Total $108.00
TOTAL BID PRICE $1,701.36
92. 17.5 X 25-F, L2, Directional, 12 PR, (withouf
disposal)
Bid Price Unit 4 $402.34
Total $1,609.36

93.

94.

95.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 4
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE

17.5 X 25, L3, Non Directional, 12 PR,

(without disposal)

Bid Price Unit 4
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 4
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE

SD 10411410L

$50.00
$200.00

$1,809.36
$525.73
$2,102.92

SD 10411410R
I

$50.00
$200.00

$2,302.92
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COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
96. 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 14 $2,241.53
Total $31,381.42

97.

98.

99.

100.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 14
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE
18.4 X 28, R-4 Industrial Sure Grip, 12 PR
(without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 2
Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 2
Total

TOTAL BID PRICE

LAWN AND GARDEN TIRES

480/400-8, Tube Type Only, Stud Tread,

designed for long wearing traction, 4 PR

Bid Price Unit 12
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

F/S L-4 416193

$80.00
$1,120.00

$32,501.42

NO BID
98 & 99

$20.39
$244.68
GDY 202075085
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COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
101. 11 X 4.00-5 Terra, Tubeless, Lawn Mower,
Softrac, Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar type tread;
designed to minimize turf damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 12 $12.87
Total $154.44
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GDY 303332582
Stock or Import: I
102. 16 X 750-8, Terra, Tubeless, Lawn Mower,
Softrac, Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar type tread;
designed to minimize turf damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 18 $34.33
Total $617.94
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carl 574349
Stock or Import: I
103. 18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-
Trac, or Turf Bar type tread, designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 36 $24.68
Total $888.48

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Duro 37-29308-21
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COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
104. 18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-
Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread, designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 6 PR
Bid Price Unit 47 $24.68
Total $1,159.96

105.

106.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
18 X 950-8, Terra Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-
Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 8

Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
20 X 800-10, Industrial, Terra, Tubeless,
Softrac, Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread;
Designed to Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 15

Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

Duro 37-29308-21

$42.92
$343.36
Carl 574332

$39.70
$595.50
Carl 574318
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COMPANY
ITEM
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107. 23 X 8.50-12, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multj-
Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 38 $53.65
Total $2,038.70
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carl 574301
Stock or Import: I
108. 23 X 10.50-12, Terra, Tubeless, Softract, Multi-
Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 3 $60.08
Total $180.24
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carl 574367
Stock or Import: I
109. 31 X 13.50 X 15NHS-B, Softrac, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 7 NO BID
Total 109 & 110

110.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
INDUSTRIAL TIRES

480/400-8, Industrial, Tubeless, Rib Tread,
4 PR
Bid Price Unit 8
Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
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COMPANY
ITEM
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111. 6.50 X 9, Industrial, Tube or Tubeless, Lug
Tread, 10 PR
Bid Price Unit 12 $45.06
Total $540.72

112.

113.

114.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

6.50 X 10, Industrial (Forklift), Tube or

Tubeless, Lug Tread, 10 PR

Bid Price Unit 12
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

750 X 10, Industrial (Forklift), Tube or

Tubeless, Lug Tread, 12 PR

Bid Price Unit 10
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

700 X 12, Industrial (Forklift), Tube or

Tubeless, Lug Tread, 12 PR

Bid Price Unit 12
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

SD 10211010

$55.79
$669.48
SD 10211014

$88.52
$885.20
SD 10211020

$80.47
$965.64
SD 10211022
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COMPANY
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115. 250 X 15, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type
Only, 16 PR
Bid Price Unit 10 $223.17
Total $2,231.70

116.

117.

118.

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
8.25 X 15-F, Industiral, (Forklift), Lug Tread,
12 PR
Bid Price Unit 4
Total
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

10.5 X 20-E, Industrial, Multi-Purpose,

Traction, 10 PR

Bid Price Unit 2
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
HIGHWAY RIB OR TRAILER TIRES

5.70 X 8, Tubeless, Highway Rib or

Highway Trailer, 6 PR

Bid Price Unit 10
Total

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:

SD SD25015-1

$123.38
$493.52
SD 10211044

$252.13
$504.26
SD MPT 10911325

$21.46
$214.60
Duro 352320856
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NO. TUBES, PLAIN INNER, PNEUMATIC
TRUCK AND BUS TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY
119. 7.50 X 15, Long Rubber Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 2 $10.20
Total $20.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 552003
Stock or Import: I
120. 7.50 X 16, Long Rubber Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 2 $10.20
Total $20.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 552062
Stock or Import: I
121. 10.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 6 $14.49
Total $86.94
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 540234
Stock or Import: I
122. 11.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 20 $22.00
Total $440.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 540242

Stock or Import:
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NO. FARM, INDUSTRIAL, TRACTOR TUBES
123. 4.10/350 - 6
Bid Price Unit 2 $4.83
Total $9.66
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 533246
Stock or Import: I
124. 4.80/4.00 X 8
Bid Price Unit 26 $4.29
Total $111.54
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 533149
Stock or Import: I
125. 5.70/500 X 8
Bid Price Unit 5 $6.98
Total $34.90
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 542814
Stock or Import: I
126. 6.50 X 10
Bid Price Unit 16 $9.66
Total $154.56
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 543098

Stock or Import:
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127. 7.50 X 10
Bid Price Unit 14 $9.66
Total $135.24
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 543098
Stock or Import: I
128. 7.00 X 12
Bid Price Unit 18 $9.66
Total $173.88
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 533343
Stock or Import: I
129. 8.15 X 15, Long Metal Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 10 $10.73
Total $107.30
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 540625
Stock or Import: I
LOADER TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY
130. 16.9/18.4 X 28, Metal Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 2 $44.73
Total $89.46
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 532622

Stock or Import:




