
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14775 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  DECEMBER 14, 2005

For the furnishing of READY-MIX
CONCRETE for the twelve-month period AMERON INTERNATIONAL CORP.
beginning January 1, 2006 and ending dba
December 31, 2006, to the City and County AMERON HAWAII
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

A-1 Price Per Cubic Yard At Plant AA A B C
District I: Honolulu and Outlying Areas:

1. Sand Island/Pahounui Drive $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

District II:  Kailua-Waimanalo Areas:
1. Kapaa Quarry/Kailua $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

District III:  Kaneohe-Kahuku Areas:
1. Kapaa Quarry/Kailua $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

District IV:  Wahiawa-Waialua Areas:
1. Sand Island/Pahounui Drive $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

District V:  Aiea-Waipahu Areas:
1. Sand Island/Pahounui Drive $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

District VI:  Ewa Area:
1. Sand Island/Pahounui Drive $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

District VII:  Waianae Area:
1. Sand Island/Pahounui Drive $130.94 $124.06 $121.56 $119.37
2.

A-2 Additional payment for fine aggregates
For 3/4" Aggregate Per Cubic Yard: $1.56 $1.56 $1.56 $1.56
For 3/8" Aggregate Per Cubic Yard: $15.21 $11.46 $11.46 $9.90

A-3 Additional payment of $_____ per cubic N/A
yard to f.o.b. plant price (all plants) for
pickup by City truck other than a mixer truck

A-4 Additional payment of $_____ per cubic No Bid
yard for overtime pickup by City truck after
4:00 p.m., Mondays through Fridays and on
Saturdays
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A-5 Additional payment of $_____ per cubic No Bid 
yard for pickup by City truck on Sundays
and legal holidays

A-6 Additional payment of $_____ per cubic No Bid 
yard for sewer mixes (sewage resistant)

B-1 Delivery Charge Per Cubic Yard From Plant
District I - Honolulu and Outlying Areas
Honolulu Proper - Zone 1 $21.09

       Zone 2 $22.66
       Zone 3 $24.22
       Zone 4 $25.78
       Zone 5 $27.34
       Zone 6 $28.91

Outlying Areas - Hawaii Kai (7) $30.47
   Kuliouou to Koko Head (7) $30.47
   Sandy Beach (8) $32.03
   Tantalus - Lower (7) $30.47
Average Delivery Cost for District I: $27.34
District II - Kailua - Waimanalo Areas
   Kailua (3) $24.22
   Kaneohe MCAS (5) $27.34
   Keolu Hills (5) $27.34
   Lanikai (5) $27.34
   Maunawili (3) $25.78
   Waimanalo (6) $28.91
Average Delivery Cost for District II: $26.82
District III - Kaneohe - Kahuku Areas:
   Haiku (5) $27.34
   Haiku Radio Station (5) $27.34
   Hauula (15) $42.97
   Heeia-Lower (5) $27.34
   Heeia-Upper (5) $27.34
   Kaaawa (12) $38.28
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   Kahaluu (7) $30.47
   Kahana Bay (14) $41.41
   Kahuku (17) $46.09
   Kaneohe (3) $24.22
   Kawela Bay (18) $47.66
   Kokokahi (3) $24.22
   Kualoa (11) $36.72
   Laie (16) $44.53
   Pohakupu (3) $24.22
   Punaluu (14) $41.41
   Sunset Beach-Lower (19) $49.22
   Sunset Beach-Upper (20) $50.78
   Waiahole (7) $30.47
   Waialee (18) $47.66
   Waikane (8) $32.03
Average Delivery Cost for District III: $36.27
District IV - Wahiawa-Waialua Areas:
   Haleiwa (11) $36.72
   Helemano Radio Station (10) $35.16
   Kawaihapai (14) $41.41
   Kawailoa-Lower (15) $42.97
   Kawailoa-Upper (17) $46.09
   Kipapa-Lower (5) $27.34
   Kipapa-Upper (5) $27.34
   Mililani (4) $25.78
   Mililani Mauka (5) $27.34
   Mokuleia (15) $42.97
   Schofield-Lower (5) $28.91
   Schofield-Upper (6) $30.47
   Wahiawa (5) $27.34
   Wahiawa Heights (Kellog to Kalie) (5) $27.34
   Wahiawa Uplands (Above Kalie) (6) $28.91
   Wahiawa Radio Station (8) $32.03
   Waialua (11) $36.72
   Waimea Bay (20) $50.78
   Waipio Acres (4) $25.78
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   Wheeler Field (6) $28.91
   Whitmore (8) $32.03
Average Delivery Cost for District IV: $33.75
District V - Aiea-Waipahu Areas:
   Aiea Heights (Above Ulune) (3) $24.22
   Halawa Heights (3) $24.22
   Pacific Palisades (5) $27.34
   Pearl City (3) $24.22
   Pearl City Heights (Above Hoomalu) (4) $25.78
   Pearl City Peninsula (3) $24.22
   Waiau (3) $24.22
   Waiawa Gulch (4) $25.78
   Waikele (4) $25.78
   Waimalu (3) $24.22
   Waipahu (4) $25.78
   Waipio Point (4) $25.78
Average Delivery Cost for District V: $25.13
District VI - Ewa Area:
   Barbers Point (5) $27.34
   Barbers Point NAS (5) $27.34
   Ewa and Ewa Beach (4) $25.78
   Iroquois Point (5) $27.34
   West Loch (4) $25.78
Average Delivery Cost for District VI: $26.72
District VII - Waianae Area:
   Lualualei (11) $33.59
   Maili (9) $33.59
   Makaha (12) $38.28
   Makua (15) $42.97
   Nanakuli (8) $32.03
   Waianae (11) $36.72
Average Delivery Cost for District VII: $36.20
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B-2 Additional payment of $_____ per minute $2.08
for excess unloading time

B-3 Additional payment of $_____ per cubic No Bid 
yard for overtime deliveries after 4:00 p.m.,
Mondays through Fridays and on Saturdays

B-4 Additional payment of $_____ per cubic No Bid 
yard for deliveries on Sundays and legal
holidays


