
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14768 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  DECEMBER 16, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of
COOLANT for the six-month period BACON GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLES PENNZOIL
beginning February 1, 2006 and ending UNIVERSAL PETROLEUM, INC. PETROLEUM, LLC DISTRIBUTORS OF
July 31, 2006 to the City and County of CO. INC. HAWAII, INC.
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii.

ITEM
1. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,

1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 860 containers $13.32 $11.50 NO BID $8.71

Total $11,455.20 $9,890.00 $7,490.60
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2820 Chevron Supreme Anti Service Pro Compete

Freeze Coolant #227800 Antifreeze/Coolant (SPE16705)
manufactured by Prestone

2. Ethylene Glycol Phosphate-Free, Heavy for AIOD
Duty Coolant, Concentrate, 55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 69 drums $666.21 $651.75 $586.66 NO BID

Total $45,968.49 $44,970.75 $40,479.54 ITEMS 2 - 5
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2741 Texaco Heavy Duty Old World Industries, 

Coolant #227023 Mobile Heavy Duty Pre-
Charged Antifreeze

3. Propylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,
1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 735 containers $15.40 NO BID NO BID

Total $11,319.00 ITEMS 3 - 5
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2830

4. Prestone 5/150 Extended Life Coolant
1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 372 containers NO BID $10.80

Total $4,017.60
Manufacturer and Part Number: Chevron Dex-Cool Extended

Life Anti-Freeze, Coolant
5. Fleetguard DCA 75L, 5-gallon Container 50/50 Prediluted #227803

Bid Price Unit 36 containers $76.13 NO BID
Total $2,740.68

Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard DCA 75L


