PROPOSAL NO. 14767
OPENED: DECEMBER 7, 2005

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
POLICE EQUIPMENT AND
ACCESSORIES for the twelve-month period

beginning December 15, 2005 and ending

December 14, 2006 to the Honolulu Police

Deparmtent, City and County of Honolulu,

Honolulu, Hawaii

NO. GROUP |

1.

Handcuffs

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

GROUP I
Holsters; for the right hand
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:

Holsters; for the left hand

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

100 each

100 each

100 each

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II:

GROUP I

Magazines

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

100 each

AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
FIREARMS
NO BID NO BID $19.69 $19.59 NO BID
1-31 1-4 $1,969.00 $1,959.00 1-8
Peerless| Peerless Standard
M700 Model M700
$97.00 $119.00
$9,700.00 $11,900.00
Safariland Safariland
070-418-161 #070-418-161
$97.00 $119.00
$9,700.00 $11,900.00
Safariland Safariland
070-418-162 #070-418-162
$19,400.00 $23,800.00
$34.50 $25.89
$3,450.00 $2,589.00
Smith & Wesson Smith & Wesson
190590000 [15 rounds magazine

#19350
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO. GROUP IV
5. Sam Browne Waist Belts; nickel
Bid Price Unit 300 each $30.00 $28.25 $28.44
Total $9,000.00 $8,475.00 $8,532.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker| Aker BO3-HPD-BP
B03-HPD-BP #201 | with Nickel Chrome
Buckle
Weight of Leather: Belt - 11 0z. bends| - 11 ounce bends
Lining - 4-50z., - 4-5 ounces
6. Sam Browne Waist Belts; brass
Bid Price Unit 10 each $30.00 $28.25 $28.44
Total $300.00 $282.50 $284.40
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker| Aker BO3-HPD-BP
B03-HPD-BP #201| with Brass Buckle
Weight of Leather: Belt - 11 0z. bends| - 11 ounce bends
Lining - 4-50z., - 4-5 ounces
7. Sally Brown Waist Belts; nickel
Bid Price Unit 100 each $36.25 $28.25 $34.33
Total $3,625.00 $2,825.00 $3,433.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker | Aker Model BO3-W-
B03-W-HPD-BP #201C | HPD-BP with nickel
chrome buckle
Weight of Leather: Belt - 11 0z. bends| - 11 ounce bends
Lining - 4-50z., - 4-5 ounces
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO.
8. Sally Brown Waist Belts; brass
Bid Price Unit 10 each $36.25 $28.25 $34.33
Total $362.50 $282.50 $343.30
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker | Aker Model BO3-W-
B03-W-HPD-BP #201C | HPD BP with Brass
Buckle
Weight of Leather: Belt - 11 0z. bends| - 11 ounce bends
Lining - 4-50z.| - 4-5 ounces
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP |V: $13,287.50 $11,865.00 $12,592.70
GROUP V
Police Caps for Male Officers
Standard Type
9. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 300 each $60.25 NO BID NO BID $57.91
Total $18,075.00 9-20 9-17 $17,373.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster Uniform
57 Solid 57 style
With One Row of Gold Braid
10. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 10 each $106.50 $103.74
Total $1,065.00 $1,037.40
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster 57 style
57 (1R) w/1 row gold braid
With Two Rows of Gold Braid
11. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 10 each $113.10 $116.12
Total $1,131.00 $1,161.20
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster 57 style
57 (2R) w/2 rows gold braid
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO.
Police Cap Bands
12. Chrome band
Bid Price Unit 100 each $7.95 $6.24
Total $795.00 $624.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster Snake
CsC chrome cap band
13. Gold band
Bid Price Unit 50 each $7.95 $6.24
Total $397.50 $312.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster Gold cap
CSG band
14. Police Cap Covers
Bid Price Unit 100 each $3.50 $3.12
Total $350.00 $312.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster RC
RC
Police Caps for Female Offices
Standard Type
15. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 100 each $68.05 $64.02
Total $6,805.00 $6,402.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster 700
700 Tanner Style
With One Row of Gold Braid
16. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 10 each $106.50 $98.86
Total $1,065.00 $988.60
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster 700
700 (1R) Tanner Style w/1

row gold braid
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO.
With Two Rows of Gold Braid
17. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 10 each $116.65 $107.20
Total $1,166.50 $1,072.00
Brand Name and Number: Lancaster Lancaster 700
700 (2R) Tanner style w/2
rows gold braid
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $30,850.00 $29,282.20
GROUP VI
18. Baton
Bid Price Unit 100 each NO BID $55.54 NO BID
Total 18 -24 $5,554.00 18 - 38
Brand Name and Number: Armament Systems &
Procedures Tactical Baton
Model F26E
19. Case Holder
Bid Price Unit 100 each $21.99
Total $2,199.00
Brand Name and Number: Armament Systems/
Procedures SideBreak
Scabbard #2632
20. Retaining Cap
Bid Price Unit 10 each $1.89
Total $18.90

Brand Name and Number:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VI:

Armament Systems &
Procedures Retaining Cap
#F26-6E

$7,771.90
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO. GROUP VII
21. Flashlight Kit
Bid Price Unit 100 each $75.00 $78.58
Total $7,500.00 $7,858.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight Streamlight
76475| Polystinger Model
76475
Battery Recharges: up to 1000 1000 times
Continuous Use Between Charges: 60 min 1 hour
Bulb Candlepower: 15,000 peak 15,000
Demensions: as specified 7.4" long 74"
Weight: 8.7 0z 8.7
22. Flashlight Battery
Bid Price Unit 200 each $12.00 $12.39
Total $2,400.00 $2,478.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight Streamlight
75175 Rechargeable
Battery #75175
Battery Recharges: up to 1000 times 1000 times
Voltage: 3.6 3.6V
Amp Hour: 1.8 25
23. Flashlight Bulb
Bid Price Unit 10 each $3.60 $3.99
Total $36.00 $39.90
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight Streamlight
75914 Bulb #75914
Bulb Candlepower: 15,000 xenon 15,000
Voltage: 3.7 3.7V
Wattage: 6 6 watts
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII: $9,936.00 $10,375.90
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO. GROUP VI
24. Pepper Spray
Bid Price Unit 500 each NO BID NO BID
Total
Brand Name and Number:
GROUP IX
Handcuff Pouches
25. Regular size; nickel type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $16.35 $13.77 $15.67
Total $1,635.00 $1,377.00 $1,567.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker Aker
500-BP (nickel) 204 500-BP, Nickel
26. Regular size; brass type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $16.35 $13.77 $15.67
Total $1,635.00 $1,377.00 $1,567.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker Aker
500-BP (brass) 204 500-BP, Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV A: $3,270.00 $2,754.00 $3,134.00
Magazine Pouches
27. Nickel/chrome type snhap
Bid Price Unit 200 each $19.70 $20.47 $18.99
Total $3,940.00 $4,094.00 $3,798.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker Aker
A510-BP-2 (nickel) DCC| Model A510-BP-2

Nickel/Chrome
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO.
28. Brass type snap
Bid Price Unit 100 each $19.70 $20.47 $18.99
Total $1,970.00 $2,047.00 $1,899.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker Aker
A510-BP-2 (brass) DCC| Model A510-BP-2
Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV B: $5.910.00 $6,141.00 $5,697.00
Flashlight Pouches
29. Nickel type
Bid Price Unit 200 each $15.80 $14.12 $15.15
Total $3,160.00 $2,824.00 $3,030.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker Aker
A556X7-BP (nickel) 76SFF4S | Model A556X7-BP-
Nickel
30. Brass type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $15.80 $14.12 $15.15
Total $1,580.00 $1,412.00 $1,515.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Tex Shoemaker Aker
A556RT-BP (brass) 76SFF4S | Model A556RT-BP-
Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IX C: $4.740.00 $4,236.00 $4,545.00
Pepper Spray Pouch
31. Pouch for Peper Spray
Bid Price Unit 100 each $17.40 $20.00 $16.69
Total $1,740.00 $2,000.00 $1,669.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Bianchi Aker
575A-BP-V 36A| Model 575A-BP-V
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AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
ITEM FIREARMS
NO. GROUP X
32. Pocket Mask with One-Way Valve
Bid Price Unit 100 each $11.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $1,120.00 32-38 32-35 32-35
Brand Name and Number: Laerdal 82-00-11
33. One-Way Valves
Bid Price Unit 100 each $4.30
Total $430.00

34.

35.

Brand Name and Number:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP X:

GROUP XI

Face Shield

Bid Price Unit 10 each
Total

Brand Name and Number:

Face Shield

Bid Price Unit 10 each

Total
Brand Name and Number:

Make and Model No. of Gloves:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI:

82-04-00 Laerdal

$1,550.00

NO BID
34 & 35
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ITEM
NO. GROUP XlI
36. Gloves
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

37. Measuring Wheels
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

38. Tire Crayon
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

500 pairs

100 each

10 packs

AIRGAS ELITE THUNDER SECURITY UNIFORMS
GASPRO UNIFORMS BUG INC. EQUIPMENT HAWAII
INC. INC. dba CORP. CORPORATION
MAGNUM
FIREARMS
$1.33 $2.00 $2.25
$665.00 $1,000.00 $1,125.00
PIP 130-100WM Hatch WG100 Hatch
(#100WM old no.) Model WG1000
NO BID NO BID $26.50
37 & 38 37 & 38 $2,650.00
Rolatape
Model #MM12
NO BID




