PROPOSAL NO. 14756

OPENED: NOVEMBER 29,2005 December 2, 2005 pp

Reqgn. Nos. G50079,G42501,G42497

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of Various
Motor Vehicles, to the Collection System
Maintenance Division and Wastewater
Treatment and Disposal Division,
Department of Environmental Services, City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

CUTTER FORD, INC.

HONOLULU FORD INC.

RAINBOW
CHEVROLET

ITEM
1. Two (2) Only, 5,000 Ib. GVWR Pickup Truck
with Crew Cab, 4 x 2 (Collection System)
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

Manuals: One (1) Set

Subtotal for Item No. 1:

Additive Options - Bid Prices:

a. 6th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

b. 12th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

c. 18th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

d. 24th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

e. 30th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

f. 36th Month Maintnenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

g. 42nd Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units
Total

NO BID

NO BID

Chevrolet Colorado
Crew Cab Model CS15643

2006
$27,160.00
$54,320.00

$550.00
$54,870.00

$280.00
$560.00

$280.00
$560.00

$280.00
$560.00

$280.00
$560.00

$1,000.00
$2,000.00

$280.00
$560.00

$280.00
$560.00
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h. 48th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units $280.00
Total $560.00

i. 54th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units $280.00
Total $560.00

j.- 60th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price: Unit 2 Units $1,000.00
Total $2,000.00

k. 66th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $280.00
Total $560.00

I. 72nd Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Units 2 Units $280.00
Total $560.00

Total Sum Bid for Additive Options: $9,600.00

Total Sum Bid for Vehicles & Additive Options $64,470.00

Total Contract Pice

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000 Miles X $3.00 = $18,947.37
City EPA MPG 19

X2

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $83,417.37

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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2. One (1) Only, 6,350 Ib. GVWR Truck Cab

and Chassis with 8 ft. Pickup Body, 4 x 2
(Collection System Maintenance Division)
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of Production model:

Bid Price:

Additive Options - Bid Prices:

a. Furnish Pneumatic Tools

b. Furnish Gas Monitor:

c. Furnish Metal Detector:

d. Maintenance Services:

(1) 6th Month Maintenance Service
(2) 12th Month Maintenance Service:
(3) 18th Month Maintenance Service:
(4) 24th Month Maintenance Service:
(5) 30th Month Maintenance Service:
(6) 36th Month Maintenance Service:
(7) 42nd Month Maintenance Service:
(
(
(
(1
(

8) 48th Month Maintenance Service:
9) 54th Month Maintenance Service:
10) 60th Month Maintenance Service:
1) 66th Month Maintenance Service:
12) 72nd Month Maintenance Service:

Total Sum Bid for Additive Options:
Total Sum Bid for vehicle & Additive Options

Total Contract Price:

Ford F12

2006
$33,721.75

$6,187.46
$2,994.77
$1,135.41

$157.00
$175.00
$252.00
$175.00
$740.00
$175.00
$157.00
$252.00
$157.00
$740.00
$157.00
$175.00

$13,629.64

$47,351.39

NO BID

Chevrolet Silverado
CC15903

2006
$44,465.00

$6,218.40
$2,901.34
$1,141.09

$280.00
$280.00
$280.00
$280.00
$1,000.00
$280.00
$280.00
$280.00
$280.00
$1,000.00
$280.00
$280.00

$15,060.83

$59,525.83
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BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
60,000 Miles X $3.00 = $12,857.14 $11,250.00
City EPA MPG 14 16

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $60,208.53 $70,775.83
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

3. One (1) Only, 8,200 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab &
Chassis with 6' pickup Body and Camper
Top, 4 x 2 (Collection System Maintenance)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford X12 NO BID Chevrolet Silverado

CC25953HD Ext Cab

Year of production model: 2006 2006
Bid Price $49,789.56 $50,450.00
Additive Options - Bid Prices:
a. Furnish Pneumatic Tools $6,187.46 $6,219.00
b. Furnish and install Bumper Crane: $6,109.00 $6,936.00
c. Maintenance Services;
(1) 6th Month Maintenance Service $157.00 $280.00
(2) 12th Month Maintenance Service: $175.00 $280.00
(3) 18th Month Maintenance Service: $252.00 $280.00
(4) 24th Month Maintenance Service: $175.00 $280.00
(5) 30th Month Maintenance Service: $740.00 $1,000.00
(6) 36th Month Maintenance Service: $175.00 $280.00
(7) 42nd Month Maintenance Service: $157.00 $280.00
(8) 48th Month Maintenance Service: $252.00 $280.00
(9) 54th Month Maintenance Service: $157.00 $280.00
(10) 60th Month Maintenance Service: $740.00 $1,000.00
(11) 66th Month Maintenance Service: $157.00 $280.00
(12) 72nd Month Maintenance Service: $175.00 $280.00
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Total Sum Bid for Additive Options: $15,608.46 $17,955.00
Total Sum Bid for vehicle & Additive Options $65,398.02 $68,405.00
Total Contract Price:
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
60,000 Miles X $3.00 = $12,857.14 N/A
City EPA MPG 14
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $78,255.16
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
4. Two (2) Only, 6,600 Ib. GVWR Truck Cab &
Chassis with Crew Cab, 4 x 2 (Collection
System Maintenance Division)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford W12 NO BID Chevrolet Silverado
CC15543 Crew Cab

Year of production model: 2006 2006
Bid Price: Unit 2 units $34,367.28 $48,815.00

Total $68,734.56 $97,630.00
Manuals: One (1) Set $338.54 $550.00
Subtotal for Item No. 4: $69,073.10 $98,180.00
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Additive Options - Bid Prices:

a. Furnish Pneumatic Tools

Bid Price:  Unit 2 units $6,187.46 $6,219.00
Total $12,374.92 $12,438.00

b. Furnish Gas Monitor:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 units $2,994.77 $3,010.00
Total $5,989.54 $6,020.00

c. Furnish Metal Detector:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 units $1,135.41 $1,142.00
Total $2,270.82 $2,284.00

d. Maintenance Services:

(1) 6th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $157.00 $280.00
Total $314.00 $560.00

(2) 12th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $175.00 $280.00
Total $350.00 $560.00

(3) 18th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $252.00 $280.00
Total $504.00 $560.00

(4) 24th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $175.00 $280.00
Total $350.00 $560.00

(5) 30th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $740.00 $1,000.00
Total $1,480.00 $2,000.00

(6) 36th Month Maintnenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $175.00 $280.00
Total $350.00 $560.00

(7) 42nd Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $157.00 $280.00
Total $314.00 $560.00

(8) 48th Month Maintenance Service:

Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $252.00 $280.00
Total $504.00 $560.00
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(9) 54th Month Maintenance Service:
Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $157.00 $280.00
Total $314.00 $560.00
(10) 60th Month Maintenance Service:
Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $740.00 $1,000.00
Total $1,480.00 $2,000.00
(11) 66th Month Maintenance Service:
Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $157.00 $280.00
Total $314.00 $560.00
(12) 72nd Month Maintenance Service:
Bid Price:  Units 2 Units $175.00 $280.00
Total $350.00 $560.00
Total Sum Bid for Additive Options: $27,259.28 $30,342.00
Total Sum Bid for Vehicles & Additive Options $96,332.38 $128,522.00

Total Contract Pice

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000 Miles X $3.00 = $11,250.00
City EPA MPG 16
X2 $22,500.00

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $151,022.00
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5. Two (2) Only, 8,800 Ib. GVWR Truck Cab &

Chassis with 8 Ft. Pickup Body (Wastewater
Treatment and Disposal Division)

Manufacturer's make and model no.:
Year of production model:

Bid Price: Vehicle: Unit
Total

2 unit

Manuals (One set of Five (5) Manuals)

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 5
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

One (1) Only, 9,500 Ib. GVWR Van
Manufacturer's make and model no.:
Year of production model:

Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Ford F20

2006
$28,790.61
$57,581.22

$338.54

$57,919.76

Ford E34

2006

$24,953.49

Ford F250 F20

2006
$27,941.21
$55,882.42

500

56,382.42

Ford E350 E34

2006

$25,412.40

Chevrolet Silverado
CC25903HD

2006
$31,450.00
$62,900.00

$550.00

$63,450.00

Chevrolet Express Van
CG33405

2006

$28,525.00




