
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14753 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  NOVEMBER 22, 2005  DECEMBER 6, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of OFFICE
SUPPIES for the twelve-month period CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
beginning January 1, 2006 and ending ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
December 31, 2006 to the City and County INC. CO., LTD.
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I

1/2" Ring Size:
1. Standard Round Ring

Bid Price Unit 300 each $1.35 $0.76 $0.81
Total $405.00 $228.00 $243.00

Brand and No.: Avery Avery Officemax 
AVE-K31105-XX 03201, 03203, L20M97139(be), L20M97140(bk) 

03205, 03210 L20M97142(rd), L20M97141(gn) 

Available Colors: BK,BE, GY, RD black, blue, grey, blue, black, red, 
red green 

1" Ring Size:
2. Standard Round Ring

Bid Price Unit 1,000 each $1.30 $0.76 $0.78
Total $1,300.00 $760.00 $780.00

Brand and No.: Avery Avery Officemax 
AVE-K3110-XX 03301, 03300, L20M97149(be), L20M97151(bk) 

0305, 03310 L20M97154(rd), L20M97153(gn) 

Available Colors: BK,BE, GY, RD black, blue, grey, blue, black, red, 
red green 

3. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 100 each $3.65 $2.47 $2.28

Total $365.00 $247.00 $228.00
Brand and No.: Avery Avery Avery 

AVE-SR1110-XX 07301, 07300, L2SR11-10 color code 
79459, 07305 L279789(gn) 

Available Colors: BK, BE, RD black, blue, grey, be=blue, bk=black, 
Green red rd=red, green 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. 1-1/2" Ring Size:
4. Standard Round Ring

Bid Price Unit 500 each $2.25 $1.29 $1.36
Total $1,125.00 $645.00 $680.00

Brand and No.: Avery Avery Officemax 
AVE-K3115-XX 03401, 03400, L20M97143(be), L20M97145(bk) 

03405, 03410 L20M97148(rd), L20M97147(gn) 

Available Colors: BK, BE, GY, RD black, blue, grey, blue, black, red, 
red green 

5. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 100 each $4.55 $3.30 $3.31

Total $455.00 $330.00 $331.00
Brand and No.: Avery Avery Avery 

AVE-SR115-XX 07401, 07400, L2SR11-15-color code 
79495, 07405 L279785(gn) 

Available Colors: BK, BE, RD black, blue, grey, be=blue, bk=black, 
Green red red=rd, green 

2" Ring Size:
6. Standard Round Ring

Bid Price Unit 800 each $2.60 $1.51 $1.58
Total $2,080.00 $1,208.00 $1,264.00

Brand and No.: Avery Avery Officemax 
AVE-K31120-XX 03501, 03500, L20M97155(be), L20M97157(bk), 

03505, 03510 L20M97160(rd), L20M97159(gn) 

Available Colors: BK, BE, GY, RD black, blue, grey, blue, black, red, 
red green 

7. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 200 each $5.35 $3.66 $3.69

Total $1,070.00 $732.00 $738.00
Brand and No.: Avery Avery Avery 

AVE-SR1120-XX 07501, 07500, L2-SR11-20 color=code 
79492, 07505 L279782 (gn) 

Available Colors: BK, BE, RD black, blue, grey, be=blue, bk=black, 
Green red rd=red, green 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. 3" Ring Size:
8. Standard Round Ring

Bid Price Unit 500 each $4.50 $2.53 $2.73
Total $2,250.00 $1,265.00 $1,365.00

Brand and No.: Avery Avery Officemax 
AVE-K31125XX 03602, 03601, L20M97161(be), L20M97163(bk), 

03606, 03608 L20M97166(rd), L20M97165(gn) 

Available Colors: BK, BE, GY, RD black, blue, grey, blue, black, red, 
red green 

9. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 300 each $8.00 $4.99 $5.00

Total $2,400.00 $1,497.00 $1,500.00
Brand and No.: Avery Avery Avery 

AVE-SR1130-XX 07701, 07700, L2SR11-30 color code, 
079493, 07705 L279783gn 

Available Colors: BK, BE, RD black, blue, grey, blue, black, red, 
Green red green 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I: $11,450.00 $6,912.00 $7,129.00

GROUP II
CARD, INDEX:

a. UNRULED; COLOR (Blue, canary,
cherry and green):

10. 3" x 5"; 10 pkg. (1M)/box
Bid Price Unit 50 box $7.80 NO BID $4.82

Total $390.00 10 - 20 $241.00
Brand and No.: Esselte ESS-30 Esselte 

(BL, CA, CH, GR) F3-7320 (blu, can, 
che, gre) 



PROPOSAL NO. 14753
Page 4

CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. b. UNRULED; WHITE
11. 3" x 5"; 10 pkg. (1M)/box

Bid Price Unit 50 box $4.30 $3.59
Total $215.00 $179.50

Brand and No.: Esselte ESS30 Officemax 
F3 OM97204 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $605.00 $420.50

GROUP III
A. CLIP, METAL, BINDER:

12. Medium size; 2" wide; 9/16" capacity
Bid Price Unit 25 box NO BID $8.47

Total 12 & 13 $211.75
Brand and No.: Gem H411220 

13. Large size: 3" wide; 15/16" capacity
Bid Price Unit 25 box $14.00

Total $350.00
Brand and No.: Officemax 

H40M97379 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III, A: $561.75

B. CLIP, METAL, PAPER
14. Size 3; small; 15/16" long; .032 wire

Bid Price Unit 75 pk $1.51 NO BID
Total $113.25 14 - 17

Brand and No.: Charles Leonard 
LEO-501 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
15. Size 1; large; 1-5/16" long; .036 wire

Bid Price Unit 500 pk $1.03
Total $515.00

Brand and No.: Charles Leonard 
LEO-201E 

16. Giant; 2" long; .05 wire
Bid Price Unit 400 pk $3.08

Total $1,232.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard 

LEO-301E 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III, B: $1,860.25

C. CLIP, VINYL COATED:
17. Size 2; regular; 1-1/8" long

Bid Price Unit 50 pk $0.55
Total $27.50

Brand and No.: Acco 
Acc-72522 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III, C: $27.50

D. CLIP, BINDER:
18. 3/4" width, 3/8" capacity

Bid Price Unit 2,500 pk $0.20 $0.19
Total $500.00 $475.00

Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Officemax 
LEO-BC02 H40M97413 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
19. 1-1/4" width, 5/8" capacity

Bid Price Unit 1,500 pk $0.40 $0.42
Total $600.00 $630.00

Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Officemax 
LEO-BC05 H40M97008 

20. 2" width, 1" capacity
Bid Price Unit 400 box $0.97 $1.16

Total $388.00 $464.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Officemax 

LEO-BC10 H40M97414 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III, D: $1,488.00 $1,569.00

GROUP IV
FASTENER, METAL FILE PAPER:

21. 1" capacity
Bid Price Unit 200 box $1.12 $1.72 $1.58

Total $224.00 $344.00 $316.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard Officemax 

LEO-R10 R10 H40M97437 

22. 2" capacity
Bid Price Unit 500 box $1.34 $1.48 $1.27

Total $670.00 $740.00 $635.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard Officemax 

LEO-R20 R20 H40M97440 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. BASE ONLY WITH PRONGS:
23. 1" capacity

Bid Price Unit 100 box $1.42 $1.55 $1.83
Total $142.00 $155.00 $183.00

Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard Officemax 
LEO-B11 B11 H40M97438 

24. 2" capacity
Bid Price Unit 200 box $1.65 $1.80 $1.91

Total $330.00 $360.00 $382.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard Officemax 

LEO-B21 B21 H4OM97441 

COMPRESSOR ONLY:
25. Compressor, 2-3/4" center to center

Bid Price Unit 50 box $1.60 $1.80 $1.91
Total $80.00 $90.00 $95.50

Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard Officemax 
LEO-C-1 C1 H4OM97439 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $1,446.00 $1,689.00 $1,611.50

GROUP V
FOLDER, FILE, MANILA:

a. 1/3 cut position:
26. 9-1/2" high x 11-3/4" wide; letter

Bid Price Unit 200 box $12.00 NO BID $9.92
Total $2,400.00 26 - 29 $1,984.00

Brand and No.: Smead SMD-203L Esselte 
F17721/3 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
27. 9-1/2" high x 14-3/4" wide; legal

Bid Price Unit 200 box $13.75 $11.85
Total $2,750.00 $2,370.00

Brand and No.: Smead SMD-203C Esselte 
F17731/3 

b. 1/2 cut position:
28. 9-1/2" high x 11-3/4" wide; letter

Bid Price Unit 500 box $11.60 $9.92
Total $5,800.00 $4,960.00

Brand and No.: Smead SMD-202L Esselte 
F17721/2 

29. 9-1/2" high x 14-3/4" wide; legal
Bid Price Unit 100 box $13.40 $11.97

Total $1,340.00 $1,197.00
Brand and No.: Smead SMD-202C Esselte 

F17731/2 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V a & b: $12,290.00 $10,511.00

GROUP VI
30. Memo Books

Bid Price Unit 6,000 each $1.26 $1.16 NO BID
Total $7,560.00 $6,960.00

Brand and No.: Esselte Esselte 60962 
ESS-6096-1/2 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VI: $7,560.00 $6,960.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. GROUP VII
31. Notebook, Stenographer

Bid Price Unit 700 pkg $8.60 $9.36 $10.13
Total $6,020.00 $6,552.00 $7,091.00

Brand and No.: Everett Tops 74688 Officemax 
EPP-78-308 P3OM97326 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII: $6,020.00 $6,552.00 $7,091.00

GROUP VIII
A. "POST IT" NOTES

32. 1-3/8" x 1-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 800 pack $4.00 $3.94 $3.51

Total $3,200.00 $3,152.00 $2,808.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-653YW 653RPYW A2653YW 

33. 1-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 400 pack $7.20 $0.59 $6.25

Total $2,880.00 $236.00 $2,500.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-656YW 656RPYW A2656YW 

34. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 4,000 pack $0.78 $0.79 $0.69

Total $3,120.00 $3,160.00 $2,760.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-654YW 654RPYW A2654YW 

35. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8", ruled blue lines
Bid Price Unit 50 pack $4.85 $4.69 $4.31

Total $242.50 $234.50 $215.50
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-630-6PK 6306PK A26306PK 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
36. 2-7/8" x 3-7/8"

Bid Price Unit 200 pack $0.93 $0.88 $0.81
Total $186.00 $176.00 $162.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 657 3M 
MMM-657YW A2657YW 

37. 2-7/8" x 4-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 3,000 pack $1.00 $1.04 $0.91

Total $3,000.00 $3,120.00 $2,730.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-655YW 655RPYW A2655YW 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII, A: $12,628.50 $10,078.50 $11,175.50

B. POST IT" NOTES
38. 1/2" x 2"

Bid Price Unit 100 pack $3.40 $3.21 $2.97
Total $340.00 $321.00 $297.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 6705AF2, 3M A26705AN 
MMM-670-5AN 6705AN, 6705AU (neon) A26705AU 

(ultra) 
Available Colors: Asst. Neon asst fluorescent, asst neon, asst ultra neon or ultra 

assortments 
39. 1" x 3"

Bid Price Unit 100 pack $1.55 $1.47 $1.35
Total $155.00 $147.00 $135.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 6714AN, 3M A2 671-4AN 
MMM-670-4AN 6714AU (neon) A671-4AU 

(ultra) 
Available Colors: Asst. Neon asst neon, asst ultra neon or ultra 

assortments 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
40. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8"

Bid Price Unit 100 pack $4.75 $4.46 $4.13
Total $475.00 $446.00 $413.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 6545AQ, 3M A2 671-4AN 
MMM-654-5PK 6545CL, 6545PK, (neon) A2654-5AQ 

6545SB, 6545AC (aquatic) 
Available Colors: Asst. Neon asst aquatic, asst classic, asst neon, A2 654-5UC (ultra) 

asst sunbrite, asst ultra neon, aquatic or 
ultra assortments 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII, B: $970.00 $914.00 $845.00

C. POST IT" NOTES (RECYCLED)
41. 1-3/8" x 1-7/8"

Bid Price Unit 100 pack $4.20 $3.94 $3.65
Total $420.00 $394.00 $365.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MM-653RP 653RPYW A2 653RPYW 

42. 1-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 200 pack $7.45 $0.59 $0.54

Total $1,490.00 $118.00 $108.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-656RP 656RPYW A2 656RPYW 

43. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 200 pack $0.85 $0.79 $0.70

Total $170.00 $158.00 $140.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-654RP 654RPYW A2 654RPYW 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
44. 3-7/8" x 5-7/8"

Bid Price Unit 100 pack $1.70 $1.04 $0.96
Total $170.00 $104.00 $96.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-660RP 655RPYW A2 655RPYW 

45. 2-7/8" x 4-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 100 pad $1.10 $1.60 $1.46

Total $110.00 $160.00 $146.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-655RP 660RPYW A2 660RPYW 

46. 3-7/8" x 5-7/8", ruled blue lines
Bid Price Unit 100 pad $1.70 $8.11 $7.50

Total $170.00 $811.00 $750.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 660RPA 3M 

MMM-660RP A2 660RPA 

Available Colors: yellow yellow, pink, green, blue asst'd contains be, 
cy, gn, pk 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII, C: $2,530.00 $1,745.00 $1,605.00

GROUP IX
PAPER ROLL, ADDING MACHINE

47. 2-9/32" (2-1/4") width; not less than 200'
length
Bid Price Unit 1,000 roll $0.80 NO BID NO BID

Total $800.00 47 - 50 47 - 50
Brand and No.: Everett 

EPP-53-160 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
48. 2-9/32" (2-1/4") width; not less than 165'

length
Bid Price Unit 500 roll $0.56

Total $280.00
Brand and No.: Everett 

EPP-53-900 

49. 2-3/4" width; not less than 165' length
Bid Price Unit 50 roll $0.75

Total $37.50
Brand and No.: Everett 

EPP-53-107 

50. 3" width; not less than 200' length
Bid Price Unit 400 roll $1.00

Total $400.00
Brand and No.: Everett 

EPP-53-168 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IX: $1,517.50

GROUP X
PENCIL, GENERAL WRITING
Degree of hardness:

51. No. 2; medium soft lead
Bid Price Unit 800 doz $1.05 $1.02 $0.97

Total $840.00 $816.00 $776.00
Brand and No.: General Pencil Dixon Ticonderoga Berol 

GEN-498-2 13882 N5 02097 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP X: $840.00 $816.00 $776.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
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INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. GROUP XI

A. PEN, BALL POINT
a. Fine point

52. Black
Bid Price Unit 300 doz $4.18 $4.44 $4.08

Total $1,254.00 $1,332.00 $1,224.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK90A Pentel 

PEN-BK90A N1 BK90A 

53. Blue
Bid Price Unit 50 doz $4.18 $4.44 $4.08

Total $209.00 $222.00 $204.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK90C Pentel 

PEN-BK90C N1 BK90C 

54. Red
Bid Price Unit 50 doz $4.18 $4.44 $4.08

Total $209.00 $222.00 $204.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK90B Pentel 

PEN-BK90B N1 BK90B 

b. Medium point
55. Black

Bid Price Unit 1,500 doz $4.18 $4.44 $4.08
Total $6,270.00 $6,660.00 $6,120.00

Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK91A Pentel 
PEN-BK91A N1-BK91A 

56. Blue
Bid Price Unit 50 doz $4.18 $4.44 $4.08

Total $209.00 $222.00 $204.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK91C Pentel 

PEN-BK91C N1-BK91C 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
57. Red

Bid Price Unit 200 doz $4.18 $4.44 $4.08
Total $836.00 $888.00 $816.00

Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK91B Pentel 
PEN-BK91B N1-BK91B 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI, A a & b: $8,987.00 $9,546.00 $8,772.00

B. PEN, BALL POINT:
a. Fine point

58. Black
Bid Price Unit 500 doz $6.75 $6.72 $6.13

Total $3,375.00 $3,360.00 $3,065.00
Brand and No.: Pilot Pilot 32210 Pilot 

PIL-32210 N1-32210 

59. Red
Bid Price Unit 200 doz $6.75 $6.72 $6.13

Total $1,350.00 $1,344.00 $1,226.00
Brand and No.: Pilot Pilot 32212 Pilot 

PIL-32212 N1-32212 

b. Medium point
60. Black

Bid Price Unit 1,500 doz $5.50 $6.72 $6.13
Total $8,250.00 $10,080.00 $9,195.00

Brand and No.: Pentel Pilot 32220 Pilot 
PEN-BK92A N1-3220 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
61. Red

Bid Price Unit 200 doz $5.50 $6.72 $6.13
Total $1,100.00 $1,344.00 $1,226.00

Brand and No.: Pentel Pilot 32222 Pilot 
PEN-BK92B N1-32222 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI, B a & b: $14,075.00 $16,128.00 $14,712.00

C. PEN, GEL INK:
Fine point

62. Black
Bid Price Unit 500 doz $10.35 $10.32 $9.50

Total $5,175.00 $5,160.00 $4,750.00
Brand and No.: Pilot Pilot 31020 Pilot 

PIL-31020 N1 31020 

63. Red
Bid Price Unit 200 doz $10.35 $10.32 $9.50

Total $2,070.00 $2,064.00 $1,900.00
Brand and No.: Pilot Pilot 31022 Pilot 

PIL-31022 N1 31022 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI, C: $7,245.00 $7,224.00 $6,650.00

GROUP XII
RIBBON, TYPEWRITER

64. Correctable Ribbon Cassette
Bid Price Unit 150 box $17.10 $17.58 $16.25

Total $2,565.00 $2,637.00 $2,437.50
Brand and No.: Nukote Nukote B192 Nukote 

NUK-B192 S2 B192 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
65. Lift-off Tap Cassette

Bid Price Unit 150 box $12.60 $12.96 $11.94
Total $1,890.00 $1,944.00 $1,791.00

Brand and No.: Nukote Nukote 192LT Nukote 
NUK-192LT S2 192LT 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XII: $4,455.00 $4,581.00 $4,228.50

GROUP XIII
A. STAPLE:

66. Staple, Paper Fastening
Bid Price Unit 1,500 box $1.70 $1.93 $1.87

Total $2,550.00 $2,895.00 $2,805.00
Brand and No.: Ace Swingline 35450 Swingline 

ACE-72025 H135450 

B. STAPLER:
67. Stapler, Paper Fastening

Bid Price Unit 300 each $11.40 $9.52 $9.26
Total $3,420.00 $2,856.00 $2,778.00

Brand and No.: Swingline Swingline Swingline 
SWI-747XX black-74701, blue-74702, grey-74705, H1 74701 

slate-74716, burgundy-74718 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XIII: $5,970.00 $5,751.00 $5,583.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. GROUP XIV

TABLET, WRITING:
68. 8-1/2" x 11", letter

Bid Price Unit 200 pkg $8.70 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,740.00 68 & 69 68 & 69

Brand and No.: Tops 
TOP-75-381 

69. 8" x 12-1/2", legal
Bid Price Unit 300 pkg $10.10

Total $3,030.00
Brand and No.: Everett 

EPP-74-220 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XIV: $4,770.00

GROUP XV
A. TAPE, BOX SEALING:

70. 48mm x 50m (2"x60 yds.); 3" core; tan
Bid Price Unit 150 roll $5.85 $5.99 $5.54

Total $877.50 $898.50 $831.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-355-2-TN 35548MMTN A8-355-48MMTN 

71. 48mm x 50m (2"x60 yds.); 3" core;
transparent
Bid Price Unit 200 roll $5.85 $5.99 $5.54

Total $1,170.00 $1,198.00 $1,108.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-355-2-CR 35548MMCL A8-355-48MMCR 
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ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
72. 72mm x 50m (3"x60 yds.); 3" core;

transparent
Bid Price Unit 50 roll $8.70 $8.95 $8.31

Total $435.00 $447.50 $415.50
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-355-3-CR 35572MMCL A8-355-72MMCR 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, A: $2,482.50 $2,544.00 $2,354.50

B. TAPE, TRANSPARENT
73. 1/2" x 1296"; 1" core

Bid Price Unit 200 roll $1.11 $1.15 $1.06
Total $222.00 $230.00 $212.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-600-121296 60012x1296 A8-60012961/2 

74. 3/4" x 1296", 1" core
Bid Price Unit 1,000 roll $1.55 $1.58 $1.46

Total $1,550.00 $1,580.00 $1,460.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-600-341296 60034x1296 A8-60012963/4 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, B: $1,772.00 $1,810.00 $1,672.00

C. TAPE, DOUBLE-COATED
75. 1/2" x 1296"; 3" core

Bid Price Unit 400 roll $3.85 $3.97 $3.67
Total $1,540.00 $1,588.00 $1,468.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-655-121296 66512x1296 A8-655 1/2 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, C: $1,540.00 $1,588.00 $1,468.00
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ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. D. TAPE, GLASS FILAMENT:
76. 24mm x 50m (1" x 60 yds.); 3" core

Bid Price Unit 100 roll $7.45 $7.78 $7.20
Total $745.00 $778.00 $720.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-898-1-BX 89824MM A8-898-1 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, D: $745.00 $778.00 $720.00

E. TAPE, MASKING:
77. 1/2" x 60 yds.

Bid Price Unit 100 roll $1.30 NO BID NO BID
Total $130.00 77 - 81 77 - 81

Brand and No.: Intertape 
INT-519-1/2 

78. 3/4" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 50 roll $1.75

Total $87.50
Brand and No.: Intertape 

INT-519-3/4 

79. 1" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 800 roll $2.10

Total $1,680.00
Brand and No.: Intertape 

INT-519-1 

80. 1-1/2" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 200 roll $3.30

Total $660.00
Brand and No.: Intertape 

INT-519-1.5 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
81. 2" x 60 yds.

Bid Price Unit 1,500 roll $4.50
Total $6,750.00

Brand and No.: Intertape 
INT-519-2 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, E: $9,307.50

F. TAPE, MASKING:
82. 3/4" x 60 yds.

Bid Price Unit 25 roll $3.35 $3.17 $2.93
Total $83.75 $79.25 $73.25

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-232-3/4 23218mm A8-232-3/4 

83. 2" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 25 roll $7.25 $7.50 $6.95

Total $181.25 $187.50 $173.75
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-232-2 23248mm A8-232-2 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, F: $265.00 $266.75 $247.00

G. TAPE, MENDING:
84. 3/4" x 1296"; 1" core

Bid Price Unit 2,000 roll $1.78 $1.82 $1.69
Total $3,560.00 $3,640.00 $3,380.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-810-341296 81034x1296 A8-810-1296-3/4 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, G: $3,560.00 $3,640.00 $3,380.00



PROPOSAL NO. 14753
Page 22

CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO. H. TAPE, MENDING:
85. 1/2" x 1296"; 1" core

Bid Price Unit 50 roll $1.55 $1.58 $1.46
Total $77.50 $79.00 $73.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-811-1296 81112x1296 A8-81112961/2 

86. 3/4" x 1296"; 1" core
Bid Price Unit 50 roll $2.05 $2.06 $1.91

Total $102.50 $103.00 $95.50
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 

MMM-811-341296 81134x1296 A8-81112963/4 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, H: $180.00 $182.00 $168.50

I. "POST IT" TAPE FLAGS
87. 1" x 1.7"

Bid Price Unit 500 disp $1.35 $1.37 $1.26
Total $675.00 $685.00 $630.00

Brand and No.: 3M 3M 3M 
MMM-680-XX 6801, 6802, 6803, 6804, 6805, 6806, A2 680-color code 

6808, 68021, 68022, 68023 

Available Colors: 1=red, 2=blue, 3=green, 4=orange, 5=red, blue, green orange, yellow, white, 1=red, 2=blue, 3=green, 4=orange, 

yellow, 6=white, 8=purple, 21=bright purple, pink brite green, brite blue 5=yellow, 6=white, 8=purple, 21=brite 

88. .39 x 1.7" pink, 22=bright green, 23=bright blue pk, 22=brite gn, 23=brite be 

Bid Price Unit 100 disp $2.70 $2.77 $2.56
Total $270.00 $277.00 $256.00

Brand and No.: 3M MMM-683-4/ 3M 3M A2683-4 
MMM-683-4AB 6834, 6834AB A26834AB 

Available Colors: red, blue, yellow, green/fluorescent red, blue, yellow, green/ (red blue yellow grn) 
yellow, purple, pink, blue yellow, purple, pink, blue (brite blue, yw, grn, 

pink) 
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY

INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
89. Arrow Flag, 1/2" x 1-3/4"

Bid Price Unit 100 disp $2.05 $2.08 $1.92
Total $205.00 $208.00 $192.00

Brand and No.: 3M MMM684-ARR3/ 3M 3M A2 684ARR3 
MMM-684-ARR4 684ARR3, 684ARR4 A2 684ARR4 

Available Colors: red, blue, yellow, green/bright yellow, red, blue, yellow, green/ (red blue yellow grn) 
bright blue, bright pink, bright green pink, green yellow, blue fluorescents (brite blue, yw, grn, 

90. "Sign Here", .47" x 1.7" pink) 
Bid Price Unit 100 disp $3.10 $3.17 $2.93

Total $310.00 $317.00 $293.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 684SH 3M 

MMM-684-SH A2 684SH 

91. "Sign Here", 1" x 1.7"
Bid Price Unit 400 disp $1.55 $1.58 $1.46

Total $620.00 $632.00 $584.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 6809 3M 

MMM-680-9 50 flags/dispenser A2 680-9 

92. "Note", 1" x 1.7"
Bid Price Unit 200 disp $1.55 $1.58 $1.46

Total $310.00 $316.00 $292.00
Brand and No.: 3M 3M 68010 3M 

MMM-680-10 50 flags/dispenser A2 68010 
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INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
93. Index Tabs

Bid Price Unit 50 disp $3.40 3.49 3.23
Total $170.00 $174.50 $161.50

Brand and No.: 3M MMM-686-PGO/ 3M 3M A2 686RYB 
MMM-686-RYB 686RYB, 686P60 A2 686PGO 

Available Colors: red, yellow, blue/pink, green, orange red, yellow blue/ (red, yellow, blue) 
pink,green, orange (pink, green, orange) 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV, I: $2,560.00 $2,609.50 $2,408.50

GROUP XVI
94. Calendar Pad

Bid Price Unit 1,000 each $0.55 $0.49 $0.45
Total $550.00 $490.00 $450.00

Brand and No.: At-A-Glance At a Glance AAG B1 E717R50 
AAG-E717-R50-07 E717R50 

95. Calendar Pad Stand
Bid Price Unit 50 each $6.20 $1.69 $1.52

Total $310.00 $84.50 $76.00
Brand and No.: At-A-Glance At a Glance AAG K3 R1700 

AAG-E17-00-07 R17 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XVI: $860.00 $574.50 $526.00


