
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14750 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  NOVEMBER 29, 2005  December 2, 2005 pp
Reqn. Nos. G57338  & G57339

For the furnishing and delivery of Various
Motor Vehicles to the Division of Road CUMMINS WEST, HT&T TRUCK CENTER HONOLULU FORD INC. PACIFIC TRUCK CENTER
Maintenance, Department of Facility INC.
Maintenance, City and County of Honolulu.

ITEM

1. One (1) Only, 12,400 lb. GVWR Truck 
Cab & Chassis w/Service Body & Elecric
Hydraulic Liftgate
Manufacturer's make & model no. of truck cab Ford F350 4x2 Chassis Cab
and chassis NO BID NO BID F34 NO BID

Year of production model: 2006
Bid Price: Unit 1 unit $43,935.37
Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 days

2. One (1) Only, 39,000 lb. GVWR Truck ITEMS 2 - 5
Cab & Chassis w/20' Stake Body, 5-Ton NO BID
Crance & 3,000 lb. Capacity Liftgate
Manufacturer's make & model no. of truck cab
and chassis International 7500 Peterbilt Model 335 Freightliner M2 106

Year of production model: 2006 2006 2007
Bid Price: Unit 1 unit
Vehicle: $175,328.00 $169,356.56 $156,395.00
Diagnostic equipment: $3,800.00 $6,146.16 $5,000.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 2: $179,128.00 $175,502.72 $161,395.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 days
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3. Two (2) Only, 37,000 lb. GVWR Truck Cab &
Chassis w/6 Cubic Yard Aluminum Dump Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Peterbilt Model 335 Freightliner M2 106

Year of production model: 2006 2007
Bid Price:  Vehicle: Unit: 2 Units $120,684.59 $123,106.00

Total $241,369.18 $246,212.00
Diagnostic equipment Not Applicable $5,000.00
Manuals:  (One Set of Five Manuals) No Charge $750.00
Total Sum bid for Item No. 3 $241,369.18 $251,962.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days

4. Two (2) Only, 74,000 lb. GVWR Truck Cab &
Chassis w/13.5 Cubic Yard Dump Steel Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: International Model 5600 Peterbilt Model 378 Sterling LT9500

Year of production model: 2006 2006 2007
Bid Price:  Vehicle: Unit: 2 Units $167,519.83 $159,292.00 $155,503.00

Total $335,039.66 $318,584.00 $311,006.00
Diagnostic equipment $3,800.00 Not Applicable $5,000.00
Manuals:  (One Set of Five Manuals) $1,050.00 No Charge $750.00
Total Sum bid for Item No. 4 $339,889.66 $318,584.00 $316,756.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

5. One (1) Only, 87,000 GCW Truck Tractor
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Peterbilt Model 357 NO BID

Year of production model: 2006
Bid Price:  Vehicle: 1 Unit $161,858.35
Diagnostic equipment $5,793.65
Total Sum bid for Item No. 5 $167,652.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days


