PROPOSAL NO. 14744
OPENED: NOVEMBER 16, 2005

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of SUPPLEMENTAL

MEDICAL SUPPLIES for a six-month period

DOUGLAS R. DAUTERMAN

MEDTRONIC EMERGENCY

RESCUE SAFETY

LAERDAL MEDICAL

December 1, 2005 to May 31, 2006 to the CO., INC. RESPONSE SYSTEMS PACIFIC iNC. CORPORATION
Department of Emergency Services, Emergency
Medical Services Division - Ambulance Section.
ITEM
DEFIBRILLATOR AND ACCESSORIES ALL NO BID
1. Monitor Defibrillator *
Bid Price: Unit 80 each ITEMS1-4 $20,938.008 $24,072.50
Total NO BID $1,675,040.64 $1,925,800.00
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Medtronic LIFEPAK Medtronic #99400-002505
12 #99400-002505
Length of Cable (in Ft.): 4 ft. As specified
2. Battery Support System **
Bid Price: Unit 10 each $1,299.48 $1,806.27
Total $12,994.80 $18,062.70
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: #99407-000002 BSS2 Medtronic #99407-000002
120 VAC
Length of Cable (in Ft.):
3. Upgrade Monitor Defibrillator ook
Bid Price: Unit 20 each $7,334.08 $10,675.93
Total $146,681.60 $213,518.60
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: UPG12SP02M Sp02 Option Medtronic #UPG12SPOZM
***x* Field Service #UPG12C02; #UPG12NIBP
Length of Cable (in Ft): 4 ft. As specified
TOTAL SUM BID (Items 1 - 3) $1,834,717.04 $2,157,381.30
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT
4. Respirator
Bid Price: Unit 3,000 each ITEMS 4 -8 ITEMS 4 & 5
Total NO BID NO BID

Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:

*Please see quote #1-60183365
for part#'s, terms & descriptions
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ITEM
5. Gown
Bid Price: Unit 750 each $1.09
Total $817.50
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:
MISCELLANEQOUS EQUIPMENT
6. Chair Cot
Bid Price: Unit 50 each ITEMS 6 - 8 $2,934.00
Total NO BID $146,700.00
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Ferno #28-0000401
No. of Height Positions: As spec.
No. of semi-reclining chair angles: As spec.
7. Cuff Monitor ITEMS 7 & 8
Bid Price: Unit 25 units NO BID
Total **Please see quote #1-60317091
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: for part#'s, terms & description
***Please see quote #1-60318504
8. Filters for part#'s, terms & descriptions
Bid Price: Unit 300 units

Total
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:

****Pplease refer to quote #'s
1-60183365, #1-60317091 &
#1-60318504
*rk*xUPG12C02 ETCO2 Option Field

Service; UPG12NIBP Option
Field Service




