PROPOSAL NO. 14734
OPENED: NOVEMBER 2, 2005

Reqgn. No. G32726, G42478, G42479, G50084, G50089

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of Various

Motor Vehicles to the Department of CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD, INC. | HONOLULU FORD INC. | RAINBOW CHEVROLET | SODERHOLM SALES
Environmental Services and Department of AND LEASING, INC.
Parks and Recreation, City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
1. Two (2) Only, Compact, Sport Utility Vehicle
4-Door, 4 x 2
(Department of Environmental Services)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Jeep Liberty Sport 4x2 Ford Escape XLT FWD |Ford Escape XLT V03 NO BID NO BID
KJTH74 (UD3)
Year of production model: 2006 2006 2006
Bid Price: VehiclesUnit 2 each $23,409.23 $24,440.47 $25,109.36
Total $46,818.46 $48,880.94 $50,218.72

Manuals (one set of Five (5) Manuals) $375.00 $350.00 $675.00
Subtotal for Item No. 1: $47,193.46 $49,230.94 $50,893.72
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES.
60,000 Miles X $2.25 = $7,941.18 $6,750.00 $6,750.00
X2= $15,882.36 $13,500.00 $13,500.00

City EPA MPG 17 20 20
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $63,075.82 $62,730.94 $64,393.72

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
2. One (1) Only, Subcompact, 7-Passenger Van

(Department of Environmental Services)
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
Applicable information available.
Applicable information not available.

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES.

60,000 Miles X $2.25 =

City EPA MPG
Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Dodge Grand Caravan SE
(RSKL53)

2006
$24,445.68

X

$7,105.26

19
$31,550.94

Ford Freestar SE Wagon
(A51)

2006
$24,086.10

X

$7,499.99

18
$31,586.09

Ford Freestar
2006
$24,021.71

X

$7,500.00

18
$31,521.71

NO BID

NO BID
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ITEM
3. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Cargo Van with

Full Windows
(Department of Environmental Services)
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price: Unit

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
Applicable information available.
Applicable information not available.

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES.

60,000 Miles X $2.25 =
City EPA MPG
Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Dodge Grand Caravan
C/V (RSKL13)

2006
$22,927.98

X

$7,105.26
19

$30,033.24

Ford Freestar Van (A54)
2006
$20,628.83

X

$7,499.99
18

$28,128.82

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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ITEM
4. Two (2) Only, 5,000 Ib. GVWR Pickup Truck

with Crew Cab, 4 x 2
(Department of Environmental Services)
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price: Vehicle: Unit

Total
Manuals (One set of Five (5) Manuals)
Subtotal for Item No. 4:

2 each

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES.

60,000 Miles X $2.25 =
X 2
City EPA MPG

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

One (1) Only, 9,600 Ib. GVWR 14-Passenge
Type Il, School Bus

(Department of Parks and Recreation)
Manufacturer's make and model no.

Year of production model:
Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

Dakota Quad Cab 4x2
ND1284

2006
$24,302.97
$48,605.94

$375.00
$48,980.94

$8,437.50
$16,875.00
16

$65,855.94

o

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Chevrolet Colorado
CS15643 Crew Cab

2006
$24,250.00
$48,500.00

$650.00
$49,150.00

$7,105.25
$14,210.50
19

$63,360.50

NO BID

NO BID

Collins Bantam CLB4-9G
on a Chevy SRW 9,600 Ib
gas cutaway chassis

2006
$51,417.00




