ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14712 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED OCTOBER 7, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of
SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS, for the ALL POOL & SPA, INC. BEI HAWAII ISLAND POOL & SPA SUPPLY
twelve-month period beginning November 1,
2005 and ending October 31, 2006 to the
City and County of Honolulu.

ITEM
NO.
1. Calcium Hypochlorite, 100 Ib. drum
Bid Price Unit 50 drums $125.00 $139.55 $131.25
Total $6,250.00 $6,977.50 $6,562.50
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 1258-1069 9363.33
2. Sodium Hypochlorite, 15 gallon carboy
Bid Price Unit 200 carboys NO BID $47.10 NO BID
Total $9,420.00
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9430.86
3. Sodium Hypochlorite, 53 gallon drum
Bid Price Unit 1,200 drums NO BID $113.55 NO BID
Total $136,260.00
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9430.86
4. Sodum Hypochlorite, 330 gallon tote
Bid Price Unit 300 totes NO BID $642.00 NO BID
Total $192,600.00
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9430.86
5. Algaecide, 1 gal. or 1 qgt. container 204 203 203
Bid Price Unit gallon $35.00 $38.80 $34.79
Total $7,140.00 $7,876.40 $7,062.37

16 0z./10,000 gal. every 3 mos. = 51 gal.

51 gal. X4 =204 gal.

Bid Price Unit quart
Total

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 58412-1-72083 8134.1 8134.1
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NO.
6. Calcium Chloride, 50 Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 25 bags $40.00 $24.30 $21.09
Total $1,000.00 $607.50 $527.25
7. Chlorine Sticks for Widget Chemical
Feeder, 8 oz. size, 100 sticks per container
Bid Price Unit 30 cont. $125.00 $144.45 $171.87
Total $3,750.00 $4,333.50 $5,156.10
8. Muriatic Acid, 1 gal. container
Bid Price Unit 250 gal. $6.50 $5.80 $7.76
Total $1,625.00 $1,450.00 $1,940.00




