
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14694 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  SEPTEMBER 27, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD, INC. HT&T TRUCK CENTER ORCHID ISLE PACIFIC TRUCK
MOTOR VEHICLES to the City and County AUTO CENTER CENTER
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii.

ITEM

1. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck
(PROSECUTING ATTORNEY)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dakota Club Cab 4 x 2 ST Ford Ranger 4x2 XL Ford Ranger (R14) NO BID

(ND1L33) Regular Cab R10
Year of production model 2006 2006 2006

Bid Price $19,933.21 $20,125.19 $18,980.00

LESS TRADE-IN
1991 Ford Escort Station Wagon, C&C4995 ($400.00) ($400.00) ($400.00)

Net  Bid Price $20,333.21 $20,525.19 $19,380.00

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

       Applicable information available X X     (2005) X
       Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles x $2.25 = $7,941.18 $7,941.18 $7,941.18

             City EPA MPG 17 17 17

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $28,274.39 $28,466.37 $27,321.18

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM

2. Two (2) Only, Subcompact, Station Wagon
(DTS - PUBLIC TRANSIT DIVISION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford Focus ZXWSE Ford Focus ZxW (P36) NO BID

4-Door Wagon P36

Year of production model 2006 2006

Bid Prices

Vehicles:  Unit 2 units $17,937.38 $16,731.00

Total $35,874.76 $33,462.00

Manuals (one set of five (5) manuals) $625.00 $0.00

Subtotal for Item No. 2 $35,249.76 $33,462.00

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000 Miles X $2.25 = 2 units $5,192.31 $5,192.31
Total $10,384.62 $10,384.62

_____  City EPA MPG 26 26

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $45,634.38 $43,846.62

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM

3. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with 8 Ft. Pickup Body and
Electric Hydraulic Tailgate
(DTS - TRAFFIC SIGNAL & TECHNOLOGY)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford F250 4x2 SD RC F20 Ford F-250 (F20) NO BID

Year of production model 2006 2006

Bid Price $32,931.82 $32,119.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

4. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck
with Extended Cab
(ENV - SAND ISLAND WWTP)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Dakota Club Cab Ford Ranger 4x2 XL Ford Fanger (R 14)

4 x 2 ST (ND1L33) Super Cab R14
Year of production model 2006 2006 2006

Bid Price $25,313.38 $25,766.81 $22,470.00

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles x $2.25 = $7,941.18 $7,941.18 $7,941.18

_____ City EPA MPG 17 17 17

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $33,254.56 $33,707.99 $30,411.18
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
5. One (1) Only, 8,550 Lb. GVWR 

5-Passenger Cargo Van
(ENV - SAND ISLAND WWTP)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford E250 Super Cargo Ford E-250 (S24) NO BID

Van S24
Year of production model 2006 2006
Bid Price $29,589.39 $27,425.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

6. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck
with Extended Cab
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dakota Club Cab 4 x 2 ST Ford Ranger 4x2 XL Ford Ranger (R14)

(ND1L33) Super Cab R14
Year of production model 2006 2006 2006
Bid Price $21,052.99 $20,974.14 $19,401.00
LESS TRADE-INS
a.  1990 Dodge Omni, C&C5300 ($300.00) ($300.00) ($300.00)

b.  1990 Dodge Omni, Sedan, C&C5570 ($300.00) ($300.00) ($300.00)
Total Sum of Trade-Ins ($600.00) ($600.00) ($600.00)
Net Total Sum Bid $20,452.99 $20,374.14 $18,801.00
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

_____ Applicable information available X X X X
_____ Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles x $2.25 = $7,941.18 $7,941.18 $7,941.18

_____ City EPA MPG 17 17 17

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $28,394.17 $28,315.32 $26,742.18
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days



Proposal No. 14694 CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD, INC. HT&T TRUCK CENTER ORCHID ISLE PACIFIC TRUCK
Page 5 AUTO CENTER CENTER

ITEM

7. One (1) Only, 6,400 Lbs. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with 8' Pickup Body with Hoist
and Electric Hydraulic Tailgate
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford F150 4x2 RC F12 Ford F-150 (F12)

Year of production model 2006 2006

Bid Price $32,094.90 $27,677.00

LESS TRADE-IN
1986 GMC 1500 Pickup Truck, C&C6766 ($400.00) ($400.00)

Net  Bid Price $32,494.90 $27,277.00

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles x $2.25 = $9,642.86 $9,642.86

_____City EPA MPG 14 14

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $42,137.76 $36,919.86
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

8. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with Service Body and Electric
Hydraulic Tailgate
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford F250 4x2 RC F20 NO BID

Year of production model 2006

Bid Price $43,264.05
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days
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ITEM

9. One (1) Only, 9,200 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with 8' Stake Body
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram Reg Cab 2500 Ford F250 4x2 RC F20 NO BID

4x2 ST (DH2L62)
Year of production model 2006 2006

Bid Price $32,049.79 $34,248.48
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

10. Two (2) Only, 8,600 Lb. GVWR 5-Passenger
Cargo Van
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford E250 Cargo Van f24 Ford E-350 (E34)

Year of production model 2006 2006

Bid Prices
Vehicles:  Unit $28,955.02 $29,593.00

 2 units $57,910.04 $59,186.00

Manuals (One set of five (5) manuals) $650.00 0

Total Bid Price for Item No. 10 $58,560.04 $59,186.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

11. One (1) Only, 9,600 Lb. GVWR 
14-Passenger, Type II, School Bus
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Year of production model

Bid Price
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days
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ITEM

12. One (1) Only, 25,950 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with 37 Ft., Insulated
Articulating Telescopic Aerial Bucket and
Service Body
(DEPT. OF PARKS AND RECREATION)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID NO BID GMC C-Series Model NO BID Sterling Acterra

C7500 w/Altec AT37-G &
Service Body

Year of production model 2006 2006

Bid Price $153,409.69 $151,246.00
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

13. One (1) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door,
4-Wheel Drive
(DEPT. OF PLANNING AND PERMITING)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Jeep Grand Cherokee Ford Explorer 4x4 4-Door NO BID Ford Explorer (U72) NO BID

Caredd 4x4 (WKJH74) XLS U72
Year of production model 2006 2006 2006

Bid Price $26,689.41 $29,806.69 $27,823.00

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles x $2.25 = $9,000.00 $8,437.50 $9,642.86

_____ City EPA MPG 15 16 14

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $35,689.41 $38,244.19 $37,465.86
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days


