ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14673 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: -AUGUST22,2005 AUGUST 29, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of
SERVICES TO INSPECT, TEST AND PHOENIX SimplexGrinnell
MAINTAIN FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS AT PACIFIC INC. LP
VARIOUS CITY PARK FACILITIES for the
twelve month period beginning October 1,
2005 and ending September 30, 2006 to

the City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,

Hawaii
ITEM
NO. GROUP | - EDWARDS SYSTEMS
TECHNOLOGY
1. Hanauma Bay Nature Preserve, Education
Center

8102 Kalanianaole Highway, Honolulu
System: Edwards EST2

Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00 NO BID
Total $760.00 1-14
2. Hanauma Bay Nature Preserve, Food
Concession

8102 Kalanianaole Highway, Honolulu
System: Edwards EST2
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
3. Kilauea District Park, Recreation Center
4109 Kilauea Ave., Honolulu
System: Edwards EST2
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
4. Kilauea District Park, Gym
4109 Kilauea Ave., Honolulu
System: Edwards EST2
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
5. Palolo Valley District Park, Gym
207 Palolo Ave., Honolulu
System: Edwards EsT 1RC-3
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00




PROPOSAL NO. 14673

Page 2
PHOENIX SimplexGrinnell
PACIFIC INC. LP
ITEM
NO.
6. Aiea District Park, Gym
99-350 Aiea Heights Rd., Aiea
System: Edwards MD 11503-9
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
7. Ala Moana Regional Park, McCoy Pavilion
1201 Ala Moana Blvd., Honolulu
System: Edwards EST 1RC-3
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
8. Booth District Park, Multipurpose Room
2341 Kanealii Ave., Honolulu
System: Edwards EST 1RC-3
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
9. Booth District Park, Gym
2341 Kanealii Ave., Honolulu
System: Edwards EST 1RC-3
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
10. Makiki District Park, Arts & Crafts Room
1527 Keeaumoku St., Honolulu
System: Edwards 5700
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
11. McCully District Park, Gym
831 Pumehana St., Honolulu
System: Edwards EST LSS4/12
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
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ITEM
NO.
12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

Whitmore Neighborhood Park, Gym

1277 E. Nani lhi Ave., Wahiawa

System: Edwards 1268

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Additional Charge for emergency repair

calls during regular working hours, Monday

through Friday, excluding City holidays,

from 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.

Bid Price Unit 2 hours
Total

Additional Charge for emergecy repair

calls for hours other than regular working

hours (overtime) specified under item 6 of

the Minimum Specifications.

Bid Price Unit 2 hours
Total

TOTAL SUM BID GROURP I:

GROUP 1l - SIMPLEX SYSTEMS

Kaimuki Community Park, Gym

3521 Waialae Ave., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4002 and 4003

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Koko Head District Park, Gym

423 Kaumakani St., Honolulu

System Simplex 4020 and 4003

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

PHOENIX
PACIFIC INC.

SimplexGrinnell
LP

$380.00
$760.00

$95.00
$190.00

$142.50
$285.00

$9,595.00

NO BID
15 - 41

$703.12
$1,406.24

$1,588.53
$3,177.06
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ITEM
NO.
17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

Manoa Valley District Park, Gym

2721 Kaaipu Ave., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4020 and 4003

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Manoa Valley District Park, Pool

2721 Kaaipu Ave., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4020 and 4003

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Beretania Community Park, Recreation

Center

1290 Aala St., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4005 and 4003

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Kalihi Valley District Park, Gym

2329 Kalihi St., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4020

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Lanakila District Park, Gym

1701 Lanakila Ave., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4208-AX

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

McCully District Park, Multipurpose Room

831 Pumehana St., Honolulu

System: Simplex 6207 (4208-AX)

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

PHOENIX
PACIFIC INC.

SimplexGrinnell
LP

$1,588.53
$3,177.06

$703.12
$1,406.24

$703.12
$1,406.24

$1,536.45
$3,072.90

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08
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NO.
23.

24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

Pauahi Recreation Center

171 N. Pauahi St., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4001

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Salt Lake District Park (makai),

Multipurpose Room

1159 Ala Lilikoi PI., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4005

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Salt Lake District Park (makai), Gym

1159 Ala Lilikoi PI., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4005

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Salt Lake District Park (makai), Pool

Complex

1159 Ala Lilikoi PI., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4004

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Salt lake District Park (mauka),

Multipurpose Bldg.

1159 Ala Lilikoi PI., Honolulu

System: Simplex 4005

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Lililani District Park, Recreation Center

94-1150 Lanikuhana Ave., Mililani

System: Simplex 2001

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

PHOENIX
PACIFIC INC.

SimplexGrinnell
LP

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$1,692.70
$3,385.40




PROPOSAL NO. 14673

Page

6

ITEM
NO.
29.

30.

31.

32.

33.

34.

Mililani District Park, Gym

94-1150 Lanikuhana Ave., Mililani

System: Simplex 2001

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Pearl City District Park, Gym

2282 Auhuhu St., Pearl City

System: Simplex 4246

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Waianae District Park, Recreation Center

85-601 Farrington Highway, Waianae

System: Simplex 4002

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Waianae District Park, Gym

85-601 Farrington Highway, Waianae

System: Simplex 4002

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Waianae District Park, Senior Center

85-601 Farrington Highway, Waianae

System: Simplex 4002

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Waiau District Park, Recreation Center

98-1650 Kaahumanu St., Pearl City

System: Simplex 4001

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

PHOENIX
PACIFIC INC.

SimplexGrinnell
LP

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08
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35. Waipahu District Park, Gym

PHOENIX
PACIFIC INC.

SimplexGrinnell
LP

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

94-230 Paiwa St., Waipahu

System: Simplex 4005

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Kaneohe District Park, Gym

45-660 Keaahala Rd., Kaneohe

System: Simplex 4246

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Kaneohe District Park, 2nd floor

45-660 Keaahala Rd., Kaneohe

System: Simplex 4246

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Waimanalo District Park, Recreation Center

41-415 Hihimanu St., Waimanalo

System: Simplex 2001

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Waimanalo District Park, Gym

41-415 Hihimanu St., Waimanalo

System: Simplex 2001

Bid Price Unit 2 each
Total

Additional Charge for emergency repair

calls during regular working hours, Monday

through Friday, excluding City holidays,

from 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.

Bid Price Unit 2 hours
Total

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$651.04
$1,302.08

$158.33
$316.66
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NO.
41. Additional Charge for emergecy repair
calls for hours other than regular working
hours (overtime) specified under item 6 of
the Minimum Specifications.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours $237.50
Total $475.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP lI: $41,260.24
GROUP lll - GAMEWELL SYSTEMS
42. Halawa District Park, Gym
99-795 Iwaiwa St., Aiea
System: Gamewll Zans 200
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00 NO BID
Total $760.00 42 - 52
43. Kailua District Park, Gym
21 S. Kainalu Dr., Kailua
System: Gamewll Zans 200
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
44. Additional Charge for emergency repair
calls during regular working hours, Monday
through Friday, excluding City holidays,
from 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours $95.00
Total $190.00
45. Additional Charge for emergecy repair
calls for hours other than regular working
hours (overtime) specified under item 6 of
the Minimum Specifications.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours $142.50
Total $285.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP llI:

$1,995.00
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ITEM
NO. GROUP IV - NOTIFIER SYSTEM
46. Paki Hale, Multipurpose Room
3503 Leahi Ave., Honolulu
System: Notifier 4885
Bid Price Unit 2 each NO BID
Total 46 - 48
47. Additional Charge for emergency repair
calls during regular working hours, Monday
through Friday, excluding City holidays,
from 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours
Total
48. Additional Charge for emergecy repair
calls for hours other than regular working
hours (overtime) specified under item 6 of
the Minimum Specifications.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours
Total
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP |V:
GROUP V - FIRE CONTROL
INSTRUMENTS SYSTEM
49. Kalakaua District Park, Gym
720 McNeil St., Honolulu
System: FC-72
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
50. Kalakaua District Park, Multipurpose Room
720 McNeil St., Honolulu
System: FC-72
Bid Price Unit 2 each $380.00
Total $760.00
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NO.
51. Additional Charge for emergency repair
calls during regular working hours, Monday
through Friday, excluding City holidays,
from 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours $95.00
Total $190.00
52. Additional Charge for emergecy repair
calls for hours other than regular working
hours (overtime) specified under item 6 of
the Minimum Specifications.
Bid Price Unit 2 hours $142.50
Total $285.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V:

$1,995.00




