
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14645 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 20, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of
AUTOMOTIVE FILTER ELEMENTS, for the ALOHA CUMMINS HT&T TRUCK MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
twelve-month period beginning July 1, 2005 AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. CENTER TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
and ending June 30, 2006, to the City and DISTRIBUTING REPAIR INC. COMPANY
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. Donaldson P551670

Bid Price Unit 400 each NO BID NO BID $15.67 NO BID $9.92
Total 1 - 8 1 - 24 $6,268.00 1 - 10 $3,968.00

2. Donaldson P552100
Bid Price Unit 2,000 each $11.57 $9.96

Total $23,140.00 $19,920.00
3. Donaldson P142100

Bid Price Unit 100 each $73.29 $63.01
Total $7,329.00 $6,301.00

4. Donaldson P550548
Bid Price Unit 24 each $32.74 $19.92

Total $785.76 $478.08
5. Donaldson P129396

Bid Price Unit 500 each $57.75 $49.66
Total $28,875.00 $24,830.00

6. Donaldson P551000
Bid Price Unit 500 each $15.11 $9.56

Total $7,555.00 $4,780.00
7. Donaldson P181099

Bid Price Unit 150 each $46.43 $39.92
Total $6,964.50 $5,988.00

8. Donaldson P822686
Bid Price Unit 25 each $14.70 $9.30

Total $367.50 $232.50
9. Ford FT114

Bid Price Unit 500 each $12.76 NO BID NO BID
Total $6,380.00 9 & 10 9 - 12

10. Ford FD4596
Bid Price Unit 500 each $22.50

Total $11,250.00
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ALOHA CUMMINS HT&T TRUCK MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. CENTER TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
DISTRIBUTING REPAIR INC. COMPANY

ITEM
NO.
11. Baldwin BD7309

Bid Price Unit 400 each NO BID $43.90 $21.52
Total 11 - 31 $17,560.00 $8,608.00

12. Baldwin BD7154
Bid Price Unit 400 each $47.19 $23.36

Total $18,876.00 $9,344.00
13. Allison 29539579

Bid Price Unit 25 each $17.02 $6.65 $6.52
Total $425.50 $166.25 $163.00

14. Allison 29540494
Bid Price Unit 50 each NO BID $58.00 $58.82

Total $2,900.00 $2,941.00
15. GM 97214983

Bid Price Unit 50 each $13.56 NO BID NO BID
Total $678.00 15 - 31 15 - 24

16. GM 89016324
Bid Price Unit 50 each $29.11

Total $1,455.50
17. GM 88937527

Bid Price Unit 50 each $58.01
Total $2,900.50

18. GM 88892858
Bid Price Unit 50 each $23.95

Total $1,197.50
19. Caterpillar 1R1808

Bid Price Unit 24 each NO BID
Total 19 - 24

20. Caterpillar 1R0751
Bid Price Unit 24 each

Total
21. Caterpillar 9N6123

Bid Price Unit 12 each
Total
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ALOHA CUMMINS HT&T TRUCK MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. CENTER TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
DISTRIBUTING REPAIR INC. COMPANY

ITEM
NO.
22. Caterpillar P553000

Bid Price Unit 1,500 each
Total

23. Caterpillar P556915
Bid Price Unit 500 each

Total
24. Caterpillar P556919

Bid Price Unit 500 each
Total

25. Fleetguard FS1003
Bid Price Unit 50 each $15.14 $39.00 $23.20

Total $757.00 $1,950.00 $1,160.00
26. Fleetguard FS1022

Bid Price Unit 125 each $11.58 $29.85 $16.65
Total $1,447.50 $3,731.25 $2,081.25

27. NAPA 3518
Bid Price Unit 500 each NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total 27 - 31 27 - 31
28. Recor R90P

Bid Price Unit 25 each $22.92
Total $573.00

29. Onan 0149-2106
Bid Price Unit 25 each $23.71

Total $592.75
30. ATP B96

Bid Price Unit 25 each NO BID
Total 30 & 31

31. ATP B67
Bid Price Unit 12 each

Total
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ALOHA CUMMINS HT&T TRUCK MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. CENTER TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
DISTRIBUTING REPAIR INC. COMPANY

ITEM
NO. GROUP II

Total Discount Rate Bid: 42% off Jobber Fleet Less 55% 45% off blue pricing Jobber List Minus 50.25% 
Manufacturer's Brand Name: Wix Fleetguard Baldwin Filters FRAM 

Price List Number and Date: 1201-5/05 3U0105, 4U0105 July 2005 Form F2067B 
May 5, 2005 1/3/2005 12/1/2004 

Air Filters
32. Fram CA160

Part No. Offered: 240 AF311 CA160 
Price List: $4.99 $8.48 $5.57
Amount Discounted: $2.10 $4.67 $2.80
Bid Price Unit 100 each $2.89 $3.81 NO BID NO BID $2.77

Total $289.00 $381.00 32 - 58 32 - 58 $277.00
33. Fram CA7614

Part No. Offered: 46390 AF25423 CA7614 
Price List: $9.84 $15.16 $7.01
Amount Discounted: $4.13 $8.34 $3.53
Bid Price Unit 2,800 each $5.71 $6.82 $3.48

Total $15,988.00 $19,096.00 $9,744.00
34. Fram CA326

Part No. Offered: 201 AF400 CA326 
Price List: $5.19 $7.29 $5.57
Amount Discounted: $2.18 $4.01 $2.80
Bid Price Unit 150 each $3.01 $3.28 $2.77

Total $451.50 $492.00 $415.50
35. Fram CA329

Part No. Offered: 42714 AF329 CA329 
Price List: $4.39 $14.50 $4.26
Amount Discounted: $1.84 $7.98 $2.14
Bid Price Unit 100 each $2.55 $6.52 $2.12

Total $255.00 $652.00 $212.00
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AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. CENTER TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
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ITEM
NO.
36. Fram CA5056

Part No. Offered: 232 AF4619 CA5056 
Price List: $5.99 $10.05 $6.09
Amount Discounted: $2.51 $5.53 $3.06
Bid Price Unit 300 each $3.48 $4.52 $3.03

Total $1,044.00 $1,356.00 $909.00
37. Fram CA8925

Part No. Offered: 46648 AF25629 CA8925 
Price List: $13.94 $14.95 $9.04
Amount Discounted: $5.85 $8.23 $4.54
Bid Price Unit 100 each $8.09 $6.72 $4.50

Total $809.00 $672.00 $450.00
Coolant Filters

38. Fram PR3383
Part No. Offered: 24070 WF2051 PR3383 
Price List: $9.18 $11.41 $9.90
Amount Discounted: $3.85 $6.28 $4.98
Bid Price Unit 100 each $5.33 $5.13 $4.92

Total $533.00 $513.00 $492.00
Transmission Filters

39. Fram FT1134
Part No. Offered: 58917 TF15010 FT1134 
Price List: $19.26 $26.07 $19.88
Amount Discounted: $8.08 $14.34 $9.99
Bid Price Unit 100 each $11.18 $11.73 $9.89

Total $1,118.00 $1,173.00 $989.00
40. Fram FT1167

Part No. Offered: 58955 FT1167 FT1167 
Price List: $17.75 $46.51 $18.65
Amount Discounted: $5.32 $25.58 $9.37
Bid Price Unit 200 each $12.43 $20.93 $9.28

Total $2,486.00 $4,186.00 $1,856.00
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ALOHA CUMMINS HT&T TRUCK MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
AUTOMOTIVE WEST INC. CENTER TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
DISTRIBUTING REPAIR INC. COMPANY

ITEM
NO. Fuel Filters
41. Fram G3727

Part No. Offered: 514 FF5026 G3727 
Price List: $8.39 $12.73 $10.61
Amount Discounted: $3.52 $7.01 $5.33
Bid Price Unit 180 each $4.87 $5.72 $5.28

Total $876.60 $1,029.60 $950.40
42. Fram G3802A

Part No. Offered: 510 FF5097 G3802A 
Price List: $10.39 $11.70 $8.43
Amount Discounted: $4.36 $6.44 $4.24
Bid Price Unit 100 each $6.03 $5.26 $4.19

Total $603.00 $526.00 $419.00
43. Fram G8018

Part No. Offered: 534 FF5455 G8018 
Price List: $12.19 $12.20 $6.77
Amount Discounted: $5.12 $6.71 $3.40
Bid Price Unit 150 each $7.07 $5.49 $3.37

Total $1,060.50 $823.50 $505.50
44. Fram PS3712

Part No. Offered: 33405 FS1212 PS3712 
Price List: $13.37 $13.29 $13.06
Amount Discounted: $5.61 $7.31 $6.56
Bid Price Unit 100 each $7.76 $5.98 $6.50

Total $776.00 $598.00 $650.00
45. Fram PS8048

Part No. Offered: 33406 FS1000 PS8048 
Price List: $16.45 $15.93 $22.39
Amount Discounted: $6.90 $8.77 $11.25
Bid Price Unit 100 each $9.55 $7.16 $11.14

Total $955.00 $716.00 $1,114.00
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ITEM
NO.
46. Fram P1121

Part No. Offered: 33336 FF182 P1121 
Price List: $10.09 $13.09 $9.74
Amount Discounted: $4.23 $7.20 $4.89
Bid Price Unit 100 each $5.86 $5.89 $4.85

Total $586.00 $589.00 $485.00
47. Fram CS7715

Part No. Offered: 33517 FS1298 CS7715 
Price List: $25.26 $29.06 $24.19
Amount Discounted: $10.60 $15.99 $12.16
Bid Price Unit 60 each $14.66 $13.07 $12.03

Total $879.60 $784.20 $721.80
Oil Filters

48. Fram PH13
Part No. Offered: 162MP LF653 PH13 
Price List: $3.09 $6.26 $4.77
Amount Discounted: $1.30 $3.45 $2.40
Bid Price Unit 120 each $1.79 $2.81 $2.37

Total $214.80 $337.20 $284.40
49. Fram PH2

Part No. Offered: 159MP LF3681 PH2 
Price List: $3.09 $6.82 $5.20
Amount Discounted: $1.30 $3.76 $2.61
Bid Price Unit 1,000 each $1.79 $3.06 $2.59

Total $1,790.00 $3,060.00 $2,590.00
50. Fram PH3387A

Part No. Offered: 107MP LF780 PH3387A 
Price List: $3.09 $5.85 $4.77
Amount Discounted: $1.30 $3.22 $2.40
Bid Price Unit 100 each $1.79 $2.63 $2.37

Total $179.00 $263.00 $237.00
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ITEM
NO.
51. Fram PH3612

Part No. Offered: 130MP LF3325 PH3612 
Price List: $3.09 $21.97 $16.22
Amount Discounted: $1.30 $12.09 $8.15
Bid Price Unit 80 each $1.79 $9.88 $8.07

Total $143.20 $790.40 $645.60
52. Fram PH6349A

Part No. Offered: 51748 LF9009 PH6349A 
Price List: $34.95 $40.51 $36.39
Amount Discounted: $14.67 $22.29 $18.29
Bid Price Unit 200 each $20.28 $18.22 $18.10

Total $4,056.00 $3,644.00 $3,620.00
53. Fram PH3786

Part No. Offered: 172 LF3630 PH3786 
Price List: $16.99 $14.48 $13.61
Amount Discounted: $7.14 $7.97 $6.84
Bid Price Unit 1,200 each $9.85 $6.51 $6.77

Total $11,820.00 $7,812.00 $8,124.00
54. Fram PH39

Part No. Offered: 51784 LF3316 PH39 
Price List: $7.48 $8.75 $7.79
Amount Discounted: $3.14 $4.82 $3.91
Bid Price Unit 120 each $4.34 $3.93 $3.88

Total $520.80 $471.60 $465.60
55. Fram PH3980

Part No. Offered: 120MP LF782 PH3980 
Price List: $3.09 $5.89 $4.77
Amount Discounted: $1.30 $3.24 $2.40
Bid Price Unit 200 each $1.79 $2.65 $2.37

Total $358.00 $530.00 $474.00
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ITEM
NO.
56. Fram PH43

Part No. Offered: 104 LF689 PH43 
Price List: $3.39 $5.90 $4.77
Amount Discounted: $1.42 $3.25 $2.40
Bid Price Unit 100 each $1.97 $2.65 $2.37

Total $197.00 $265.00 $237.00
57. Fram PH5

Part No. Offered: 162MP LF581 PH5 
Price List: $3.09 $7.72 $4.77
Amount Discounted: $1.30 $4.25 $2.40
Bid Price Unit 300 each $1.79 $3.47 $2.37

Total $537.00 $1,041.00 $711.00
58. Fram P3613

Part No. Offered: 51623 HF6243 P3613 
Price List: $18.23 $19.73 $17.38
Amount Discounted: $7.65 $10.86 $8.73
Bid Price Unit 270 each $10.58 $8.87 $8.65

Total $2,856.60 $2,394.90 $2,335.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $51,382.60 $54,196.40 $39,914.30
+4.166% tax

$56,454.22


