
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14634 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MAY 27, 2005

To furnish JANITORIAL SERVICES at the
Satellite City Halls for the twelve-month A&AF DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FAMILY GANIR & CO. EMPICO DAVID
period beginning July 1, 2005 and ending JANITORIAL JANITORIAL SONS INC. CLEANING dba JANI-KING KAMALU dba
June 30, 2006 for the Department of SERVICES SERVICES, INC. SERVICE INC. HAWAII Y2KLEENING
Customer Services, City and County of

: Honolulu.
ITEM
NO. Janitorial Serivces
1. Ala Moana Satellite City Hall

Bid Price Unit 12 Months $525.00 NO BID NO BID $400.00 $955.59 NO BID $655.00
Total $6,300.00 $4,800.00 $11,467.08 $7,860.00

2. Fort Street Satellite City Hall
Bid Price Unit 12 Months $608.00 NO BID $550.00 $500.00 NO BID NO BID $750.00

Total $7,296.00 $6,600.00 $6,000.00 $9,000.00
3. Hawaii Kai Satellite City Hall

Bid Price Unit 12 Months NO BID NO BID NO BID $400.00 $752.27 $406.00 $585.50
Total $4,800.00 $9,027.24 $4,872.00 $7,026.00

4. Kailua Satellite City Hall
Bid Price Unit 12 Months $450.00 NO BID $875.00 $350.00 NO BID $400.00 $485.00

Total $5,400.00 $10,500.00 $4,200.00 $4,800.00 $5,820.00
5. Kalihi-Kapalama Satellite City Hall

Bid Price Unit 12 Months $600.00 $800.00 $880.00 $500.00 $1,110.98 NO BID NO BID
Total $7,200.00 $9,600.00 $10,560.00 $6,000.00 $13,331.76

6. Pearlridge Satellite City Hall
Bid Price Unit 12 Months $650.00 $775.00 NO BID $400.00 $1,331.72 $710.00 $675.00

Total $7,800.00 $9,300.00 $4,800.00 $15,980.64 $8,520.00 $8,100.00
7. Windward Mall Satellite City Hall

Bid Price Unit 12 Months $495.00 NO BID $960.00 $450.00 NO BID NO BID $530.00
Total $5,940.00 $11,520.00 $5,400.00 $6,360.00

Surety Bond --- --- --- --
Certified Check $2,000.00
Cashier's Check $1,996.80 $2,208.30
Legal Tender
Certificate of Deposit
Share Certificate


