
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14617 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  APRIL 27, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of
FUNGICIDES, HERBICIDES AND BEI HAWAII PACIFIC VERDICOM
INSECTICIDES, for the twelve-month AGRICULTURAL
period beginning May 15, 2005 and ending SALES &
May 14, 2006, to the City and County of SERVICES, INC.
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I - FUNGICIDES
1. Pentathlon LF or equal;

Acceptable size:  From 1.25 gallon to
2.5 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 50 gallons NO BID $18.18 $18.50

Total $909.00 $925.00
Package Size Offered: 2.5 gal 2.5 gallon 

Brand Name and Number: Griffin - Pentathlon Griffin 
LF 

2. Daconil Weather Stik or equal;
In 2.5 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 50 containers $174.80 $18.457 $180.46

Total $8,740.00 $922.85 $9,023.00
Brand Name and Number: Daconil Syngenta - Daconil Syngenta 

Weatherstik Weatherstik 

3. Insignia or equal;
In 2.4 lb. container
Bid Price Unit 20 containers $325.00 $342.36 $325.00

Total $6,500.00 $6,847.20 $6,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Insignia BASF - Insignia BASF 
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BEI HAWAII PACIFIC VERDICOM
AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP II - HERBICIDES
4. Sencor 75 Turf or equal;

In 5-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 70 bags $186.38 $189.95 $194.00

Total $13,046.60 $13,296.50 $13,580.00
Brand Name and Number: Sencor T&O 75 Bayer - Sencor Bayer 

75 Turf 

5. MSMA-6 Plus Surfactant or equal;
Acceptable size:  From 1 gallon to 2-1/2
gallon container
Bid Price Unit 300 gallons $17.66 $16.76 $16.80

Total $5,298.00 $5,028.00 $5,040.00
Package Size Offered: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gal 2.5 gallon 

Brand Name and Number: Drexel MSMA 6+ Drexel - MSMA Drexel 
6 Plus 

6. Rodeo or AquaMaster;
In 2-1/2 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 400 containers $99.10 $87.15 $93.00

Total $39,640.00 $34,860.00 $37,200.00
Brand Name and Number: Aquamaster Dow Agro Aquamaster 

Sciences - Rodeo 

7. Roundup Pro;
In 2-1/2 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 150 containers $105.43 $103.89 $99.80

Total $15,814.50 $15,583.50 $14,970.00
Brand Name and Number: Roundup Pro Mansanto - Monsanto 

Roundup Pro 
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BEI HAWAII PACIFIC VERDICOM
AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
8. Glyphosae Plus  (generic Roudup Pro)

In 2-1/2 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 250 containers $48.84 $55.25 $54.00

Total $12,210.00 $13,812.50 $13,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Honcho Plus Mansanto - Verdicon 

Ranger Pro Kleenup Pro 

9. Roundup ProDry or equal;
In 23.25 lb. box
Bid Price Unit 30 boxes $192.48 $193.29 $181.35

Total $5,774.40 $5,798.70 $5,440.50
Brand Name and Number: Roundup Pro Dry Monsanto - Monsanto 

Roundup Pro Dry 

10. Dimension 0.15% Plus
Fertilizer 19-0-19 or equal;
In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 350 bags $36.86 NO BID $29.75

Total $12,901.00 $10,412.50
Brand Name and Number: Lebanon 20-0-25 + Lesco 

.13% Dimension 

11. Chipco Ronstar G or equal;
In 50-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 50 bags $68.60 $69.00 $68.75

Total $3,430.00 $3,450.00 $3,437.50
Brand Name and Number: Ronstar G Bayer - Chipco Bayer 

Ronstar G 
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BEI HAWAII PACIFIC VERDICOM
AGRICULTURAL

SALES &
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
12. ProTurf or equal;

In 28.87-lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 75 bags NO BID $85.00 NO BID

Total $6,375.00
Brand Name and Number: Andersons - 

Pro Turf 

13. Revolver or equal;
In quart container
Bid Price Unit 100 containers $174.37 $174.37 $174.37

Total $17,437.00 $17,437.00 $17,437.00
Brand Name and Number: Revolver Bayer - Revolver Bayer 

GROUP III - INSCTICIDES
14. Dursban Pro or equal;

In 2-gallon container
Bid Price Unit 5 containers $109.15 $93.52 $99.95

Total $545.75 $467.60 $499.75
Brand Name and Number: Dursban Pro Dow Agro Dow 

Sciences - Dursban 
Pro 

GROUP IV - MISCELLANEOUS
15. Turf Mark or equal

In 2.5 gallon container
Bid Price Unit 150 containers $60.79 $57.89 NO BID

Total $9,118.50 $8,683.50
Brand Name and Number: Turf Mark - Blue Becker Underwood - 

Turf Mark 


