
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14601 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MARCH 29, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
PAPER PRODUCTS for the twelve-month CICO CONRAD GRAINGER/ HOPACO MALOLO PAPERSOURCE TRIPLE F
period beginning April 1, 2005 and ending ENTERPRISE ENTERPRISES WW GRAINGER BEVERAGES & HAWAII INC. DISTRIBUTING
March 31, 2006, to the City and County of LTD. INC. INC. SUPPLIES LTD. INC.
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. Multi-fold type

Bid Price Unit 8,000 cases $17.00 $17.97 NO BID $16.64 $18.29 $17.44 $15.98
Total $136,000.00 $143,760.00 1 - 3 $133,120.00 $146,320.00 $139,520.00 $127,840.00

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Kimberly-Clark Georgia Pacific Kimbery-Clark Kimberly Clark SCA-MB530 
20205 KIM-01804 Acclaim W5-20205 #1804 #1804 

Price Per Sheet of Paper Hand Towel: .004242 .0045 .004152 $0.004573 0.00436 $0.003995 
Sheets/package and packages/case: 334 shts/12 pkgs/ 250/package 334 sh/pk  12 pk/ct 250 Shts/Pkg. 250 sh/pkg 250 sheets/pkg 

4008 16 packages/case 16 Pkg./Case 16 pkg/cs 16 pkg/cs 
GROUP II

2. Roll type
Bid Price Unit 750 cases $38.70 $39.83 NO BID $40.48 $38.78 $17.33

Total $29,025.00 $29,872.50 2 & 3 $30,360.00 $29,085.00 $12,997.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: KC-04142 Kimberly-Clark Kimberly-Clark Kimberly Clark SCA-RK800E 

KIM-04142 #04142 #4142 

Price Per Sheet of Paper Hand Towel: ----- 3.3192 $0.004217 0.00404 $0.003610 per foot 
Sheets/package and packages/case: 800'x8" 12 rolls/cs 800'/roll 800 Ft/Roll 800'/roll 6 rolls/cs 

12 rolls/case 12 Rolls/Case 12 rolls/case 800 ft per roll 
3. Dispenser

Bid Price Unit 80 each $45.70 $48.05 $51.13 $48.12 $25.19
Total $3,656.00 $3,844.00 $4,090.40 $3,849.60 $2,015.20

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: KC-09073 Kimberly-Clark Kmimberly-Clark Kimberly Clark SCA-84T 
KIM-09073 #09073 #9073 

Material Construction: as specified Durable plastic ----- High Density Rigid Vinyl Plastic, 
Plastic ABS Plastic Black 

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $32,681.00 $33,716.50 $34,450.40 $32,934.60 $15,012.70



PROPOSAL NO. 14601
Page 2

CICO CONRAD GRAINGER/ HOPACO MALOLO PAPERSOURCE TRIPLE F
ENTERPRISE ENTERPRISES WW GRAINGER BEVERAGES & HAWAII INC. DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC. SUPPLIES LTD. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP III
4. Roll type

Bid Price Unit 1,000 cases $40.34 $45.62 $51.41 $39.53 $46.28 $44.43 $37.65
Total $40,340.00 $45,620.00 $51,410.00 $39,530.00 $46,280.00 $44,430.00 $37,650.00

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia-Pacific Kimberly-Clark Georgia Pacific Georgia Pacific Kimberly-Clark Kimberly Clark SCA-TS1630 
14580 KIM-05102 14580 (4TE16) Acclaim W5-14580 #5102 #5102 

Price Per Sheet of Toilet Tissue: 0.000417 .000471 .0005310951 .000409 $0.00478 0.00046 $0.000392 
Sheets/roll and rolls/case: 1210/80 rolls 1210 sheets/roll 1210 sheets/roll 1210 sh/roll 1210 Shts/Roll 1210 shts/roll 1000 sheets/roll 

80 rolls/case 80 rolls/case 80 rl/ct 80 Rolls/Case 80 rolls/case 96 rolls/cs 
5. Inter-fold type

Bid Price Unit 500 cases $46.30 NO BID $58.97 $45.95 NO BID $16.59 NO BID
Total $23,150.00 $29,485.00 $22,975.00 5 - 7 $8,295.00

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Gerogia Pacific Georgia Pacific Kimberly Clark 
10101 10101 (1CF52) Acclaim W5-10101 #48280 

Price Per Sheet of Toilet Tissue: 0.000965 .0024570834 .01915 0.00184 
Sheets/Package and Packages/Case: 800 shts/60 pkgs 400 sheets/pk 400 sh/pk  60 pk/ct 250 sh/pkg 

60 pks/case 36 pkg/cs 
GROUP IV

6. Half-fold type
Bid Price Unit 425 cases $28.19 $25.80 $35.91 $27.70 NO BID $39.54

Total $11,980.75 $10,965.00 $15,261.75 $11,772.50 6 & 7 $16,804.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Continental Western Gerogia Pacific Gerogia Pacific Rochester Midland 

47046 CW-520100 47046 (1MM38) Renaissance 50RAI 
W5-47046 

Price Per Sheet of Toilet Seat Cover: 0.005638 .00516 .007182 .005540 $0.000791 
Sheets/Package and Packages/Case: 250/20/5000 250/pack 250/pack 250 sh/pk  20 pk/ct 250 sheets/pkg 

20 packs/case 20 packs/case 20 pkg/cs 
5.000 total 
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CICO CONRAD GRAINGER/ HOPACO MALOLO PAPERSOURCE TRIPLE F
ENTERPRISE ENTERPRISES WW GRAINGER BEVERAGES & HAWAII INC. DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. INC. SUPPLIES LTD. INC.

ITEM
NO. GROUP V
7. For personal hygiene sanitary napkin

disposal
Bid Price Unit 10 cartons $13.62 $16.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $136.20 $166.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Papercon R75 Westland Papercon 

PLS-R75 

Price Per Sheet of Bag: 0.013620 .0166 
Packages/Carton: 1000/cs 1,000 


