
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14592 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MARCH 29, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of
JANITORIAL CHEMICALS for a twelve- CICO WW MALOLO NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F
month period beginning April 1, 2005 ENTERPRISE GRAINGER BEVERAGES & DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING
and ending March 31, 2006 to the City LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
GROUP I

1. Detergent, Dishwashing; liquid Items 1 & 2
Bid Price Unit 11,520 fl. oz. $0.0842 NO BID $0.0987 NO BID $0.08328 $0.0835

Total $969.98 $1,137.02 $959.39 $961.92
Brand Name and Number: Colgate Colgate Palmolive Colgate Palmolive 

Palmolive 47430 Palmolive Ultra 47430 47430 Ultra 47430 

Percent of Surfactants: 38% --- 38% 27.85%
ph: 6.5-7.3 --- 6.5-7.3 ---
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 64oz/6/case 64 fl. oz  - 6/case 64 oz/bottle 6/64 oz 

6 bottles/cs 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: $32.32/case case $37.91 1 bottle/$5.33 $32.08 per case

2. Detergent, Dishwashing; liquid; gallon size
Bid Price Unit 340 gal. $10.21 $11.57 $8.89 $10.9525 $9.8133

Total $3,471.40 $3,933.80 $3,022.60 $3,723.85 $3,336.52
Brand Name and Number: Colgate Colgate Flo Kem 1024 Palmolive Colgate Palmolive 

Palmolive 14942 Palmolive #04910 04910 04910 

Percent of Surfactants: 26.4% --- 28% 26.24 27.85%
ph: 6.5-7.3 --- ph of 1% solution 6.0 - 8.0 7.3 ± 0.2 ---
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 4 gals/case 4 gals/case 4/case 4 gal/cs 4/1 gal 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $40.81/case $46.28/case $35.56/case 1 gallon/$10.9525 $39.25 per case 
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ENTERPRISE GRAINGER BEVERAGES & DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING
LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.

ITEM
NO.

GROUP II
3. Cleaner/Polish, Furniture Items 3 - 6 Items 3 - 9 Items 3 - 8

Bid Price Unit 2,400 oz. NO BID $0.1040 NO BID NO BID $0.14355 NO BID
Total $249.60 3 & 4 $344.52

Brand Name and Number: Ball 3U021 Afflab Lemosheen
Lemon Up 1082

ph Range: not applicable 10.5
Oz./Can and Cans/Case: 20 oz/can 19 oz/can 

each $2.08 per can 12 can/cs 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 1 case/$32.73 

4. Cleaner, Stainless Steel
Bid Price Unit 4,800 oz. $0.1345 $0.171875

Total $645.60 $825.00
Brand Name and Number: Ball-Luster Afflab Glimmer

Sheen (3U035) 1071 

USDA Approved: yes yes 
Class C: 1 no 
Water Based: yes yes 
ph Range: 7.5
Oz./Can and Cans/Case: 20 oz/can 16 oz/can 

12 cans/case 12 cans/cs 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: $2.69 per can 1 can/$2.75 

5. Cleaner, Oven
Bid Price Unit 14,400 oz. $0.1375 $0.27 NO BID

Total $1,980.00 $3,888.00
Brand Name and Number: Ball-Hot Shot Easy Off Oven 

& Grill Cleaner 

Ounces/Can and Cans/Case: 20 oz/can 24 oz/can 
12 cans/case 6 cans/case

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $2.75 per can $38.88/case
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ENTERPRISE GRAINGER BEVERAGES & DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING
LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.

ITEM
NO.

6. Polish, Metal; cream type
Bid Price Unit 2,280 oz. NO BID NO BID $0.1766

Total $402.65
Brand Name and Number: Carroll Brite Boy 1118

ph Range: 9.5
Ounces/Container and Containers/Case: 32 oz/cont.

12 cont./cs
Unit of Purchase/Cost: 1 case/$67.84

7. Sealer/Finisher, Floor; liquid
Bid Price Unit 40 gal. $8.23 $9.75 $10.24 $10.17

Total $329.20 $390.00 $409.60 $406.80
Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem FL140-04 Ball Time off 2U044 Flo Kem #140 Butchers 

Mainstay 4014110

ph Range: 8.0 - 10.0 8.5 to 9 8.0 - 10.0 8.8
Gallons/Case: 4 gal/case 4 4 /case 4 gal/cs

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $32.92/case $9.75 per gallon $40.96/case 1 case/$40.68

GROUP III
8. Cleaner, Glass; liquid

Bid Price Unit 44,160 fl. oz. $0.0510 $0.0453125 $0.06 $0.0882
Total $2,252.16 $2,001.00 $2,649.60 $3,894.91

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem FL-358 + Ball Sun Up 2U099 Flo Kem #358 Butcher
922HL sprayers Speedball 4287320

ph Range: 10.0 - 12.0 6.0 - 7.0 10.0 - 12.0 10.5 - 11.5
Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 32 oz - 12/case 32oz  12/case 32 oz/quart 32 oz/bottle 

12 quarts/case 12 bottles/cs 
Unit of Purchase/Cost: $19.57 each $1.45 $23.04/case 1 case/$33.87 

No. of Sprayers/Filters in Each Case: 6 1 6 ---
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LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.
ITEM
NO.

GROUP IV
9. Cleaner, General Purpose; liquid

Bid Price Unit 19,200 fl. oz. $0.0416 $0.04375 $0.05 $0.0882 $0.0893
Total $798.72 $840.00 $960.00 $1,693.44 $1,714.56

Brand Name and Number: Flo kem FL-3052 + Ball Bounty Hunter Flo Kem #3052 Butcher Speedball Colgate Palmolive
922HL sprayers 2U010 4287320 #4164 

Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: --- 32oz 32oz /quart 32 oz/bottle 12/30 oz 
12 quarts/case 12 bottles/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $15.96 each $1.40 $19.20/case 1 case/$33.87 $32.15 per case

No. of Sprayers/Filters in Each Case: --- 1 6 --- 12 

GROUP V
10. Powder, Scouring

Bid Price Unit 63,000 oz. $0.0403 $0.062 $0.0404 NO BID $0.0361 $0.0379
Total $2,538.90 $3,906.00 $2,545.20 $2,274.30 $2,387.70

Brand Name and Number: Colgate Palmolive Comet 3U557 Ajax Chlorine Ajax with Colgate Ajax Chlorine
4283 Cleanser #4283 Chlorine 04283 Cleanser 4283 

Oz./Can and Cans/Case: 21 oz 21 oz 21 oz /can - 30/case 21 oz/can 30/21 oz 
30/case 24 can per case 30 cans/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $25.38 $31.25 per case case $25.43 1 case/$22.77 $23.89 per case

11. Cleanser, Disinfectant Creme
Bid Price Unit 67,200 oz. $0.0832 $0.0740625 $0.0765 $0.08 $0.0759 $0.0788

Total $5,591.04 $4,977.00 $5,140.80 $5,376.00 $5,100.48 $5,295.36
Brand Name and Number: Colgate Palmolive Ball Double Time Husky #430 D. C. Scrub Butchers Double Colgate Ajax

14942 3U052 Play 4102320 Disinfectant 
Crem Cleanser 14942 

Oz/Bottle and Bottles/Case: 35 oz - 9/case 32 oz   12 per bottle 32 oz/bottle  - 12/case 32oz/bottle  32 oz/bottle 9/35 oz 
12 bottles/case 12 bottles/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $26.21 each $2.37 case $29.41 $30.72/case 1 case/$29.16 $24.82 per case

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: not applicable 9983.3 --- 8155-8-51215 --- ----- 
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LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.
ITEM
NO.

GROUP VI
12. Bleach, Chlorine; liquid Items 12 - 14 Items 12 - 22

Bid Price Unit 387,840 fl. oz. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.0163 NO BID
Total $6,321.79

Brand Name and Number: Pure Bright Bleach6

Oz./Container and Containers/Case: 128 oz/cont.
6 containers/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: 1 case/$12.51

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: ----- 

GROUP VII
13. Cleaner, Toilet Bowl; liquid

Bid Price Unit 240 qt. $1.78 $1.86 $1.99 $2.1875
Total $427.20 $446.40 $477.60 $525.00

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem FL-362 Ball Anytime Flo Kem #362 Butchers Depth 
3U045 Charge 4314320 

Percent of Hydrogen Chloride: 9.5 9.5% 9.5 % 15% 

Quarts/Case: 12/case 12  per case 12 /case 12 quarts/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $21.36 $1.86 $23.88/case 1 case/$26.25 



PROPOSAL NO. 14592 CICO WW MALOLO NOVA PREMIUM TRIPLE F
Page 6 ENTERPRISE GRAINGER BEVERAGES & DISTRIBUTORS INCORPORATED DISTRIBUTING

LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.
ITEM
NO.
14. Remover, Toilet Ring

Bid Price Unit 60 qt. $3.31 $2.01 $3.05 $1.7025
Total $198.60 $120.60 $183.00 $102.15

Brand Name and Number: Mission Labs 1456 Ball Shape Up Flo Kem #6328 Buytcher Bathmate
3U049 4305320

ph: 5.0 11.5 to 12.5 4.0 - 6.0 8.34

Quarts/Case: 12/case 12 12/case 12 qt/cs

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $39.68 $2.01 $36.60/case 1 case/$20.43

GROUP VIII
15. Digetant, Enzyme Items 15 - 20

Bid Price Unit 44,160 fl. oz. $0.0766 $0.2234375 $0.1015 NO BID $0.1205
Total $3,382.66 $9,867.00 $4,482.24 $5,321.28

Brand Name and Number: Cico Schubert Ramsey-Kil Oder Husky #400 Afflab LLMO 1235
Attack II 4WT52 Tropical

Fluid Oz./Bottle and Bottles/Case: 16 oz   12/case 32oz   12 botles/case 32 fl. oz/bottle 32 oz/bottle 
12/case 12 bottles/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $29.39 each  $7.15 case/ $38.96 1 case/$46.30 
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LTD. INC. SUPPLIES, LTD. INC.

ITEM
NO.

GROUP IX
16. Deodorant, Disinfectant Items 16 & 17 Items 16 - 22

Bid Price Unit 20,700 oz. NO BID $0.111 NO BID $0.1835
Total $2,297.70 $3,798.45

Brand Name and Number: Ball Ruthless Afflab Lemonene 
3U022 1056 

Oz. Net Weight/Can and Cans/Case: 20 oz can 15 oz/can 
12cans/case 12 cans/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: each $2.22 1 case/$33.03 

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9983.17 ----- 

17. Freshener, Air and Odor Eliminator
Bid Price Unit 1,200 oz. $0.1225 $0.1841

Total $147.00 $220.92
Brand Name and Number: Ball-New Apsco Lemon 

Blossom Air Freshener
5MP26 2020 

Oz. Net Weight/Can and Cans/Case: 20 oz can   15 oz/can 
12 cans/case 12 cans/cs 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: each $2.45 1 case/$33.15 
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ITEM
NO.
18. Sanitizer, Air Items 18 - 21

Bid Price Unit 2,520 oz. $0.5194 Items 18 - 22 NO BID
Total $1,308.89 NO BID

Brand Name and Number: Ozium 7000 

Oz. Net Weight/Can and Cans/Case: 14.5 oz   12/case 

Description of Scent: specified 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $90.37

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: Not applicable 

GROUP X
19. Block, Urinal Deodorant

Bid Price Unit 2,160 oz. $0.2384
Total $514.94

Brand Name and Number: Big D 36800 

Oz./Block Cake and Cakes Blocks//Case: 4 oz   12/case 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $11.44
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ITEM
NO.
20. Screen, Urinal with Deodorant Block

Bid Price Unit 480 each $1.41
Total $676.80

Brand Name and Number: Continental 
CM-165

Dimensions: per spec. 

Screens/Case: 12/case 

Fragrances Available: cherry 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $16.94

GROUP XI
21. Pine Oil; liquid

Bid Price Unit 520 gal. $11.18 $15.07
Total $5,813.60 $7,836.40

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem #70 Flo Kem #210Pine 
(FL-210) 

Gal./Container and Containers/Case: 4 gal/case 4 gallon/case 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $44.72 case/$60.28
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ITEM
NO.

GROUP XII
22. Disinfectant

Bid Price Unit 314,880 fl. oz. $0.05 $0.06 $0.0537
Total $14,295.55 $18,892.80 $16,909.06

Brand Name and Number: Flo Kem Triple 2 Flo Kem #222 Apsco Lemon 
Q 1055 

Fl. Oz./Container and Containers/Case: 4 gal/case 128 oz/gallon 128 oz/cont.
(128 oz/gal) 4 gallons/case 4 cont/cs

Dilution Ratio: 2 oz/gal 64 to 1 2 oz per gallon 1:64 

Unit of Purchase/Cost: $23.22 case/$30.72 1 case/$27.5

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 1839-95-10693 9589-19 ---


