
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
PROPOSAL NO. 14590
OPENED:  MARCH 15, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of UNITIZED
FIRST AID, SPORTS FIRST AID AND BODILY
FLUID SPILLS CLEANUP KITS AND REFILLS for AIRGAS BLUE WATER DOUGLAS R. LIFERAFT & SAFETY SUN
the twelve-month period beginning April 1, GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
2005 and ending March 31, 2006 to the City INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.
and County of Honolulu

ITEM
Group I-First Aid Kits, with Printed Lid and Kits are white
Filled with Standard Supplies                  w/colored logo

  1. 10-Item Unitized First Aid Kit ITEMS 1 - 65 ITEMS 1 - 39
Bid Price: Unit 100 kits $26.55 NO BID NO BID $29.33 $19.15 $30.28

Total $2,655.00 $2,933.00 $1,915.00 $3,028.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6810 HFAK Certified PacKit SOHI Swift 6810HFAK

K299-990 Yellow
Background Logo

  2. 16-Item Unitized First Aid Kit
Bid Price: Unit 25 kits $33.25 $41.40 $25.95 $39.09

Total $831.25 $1,035.00 $648.75 $977.25
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6816 HFAK Certified PacKit 52HI Swift 6816HFAK

K 299-991 Yellow K 299-991
Background Logo

  3. 24-Item Unitized First Aid Kit
Bid Price: Unit 25 kits $35.65 $45.07 $28.95 $41.57

Total $891.25 $1,126.75 $723.75 $1,039.25
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6824 HFAK Certified K299-992 PacKit 53HI Swift 6824HFAK

Yellow
Background Logo

Sub-Total for Group I, Items 1 - 3: $4,377.50 $5,094.75 $3,287.50 $5,044.50



PROPOSAL NO. 14590
PAGE 2

AIRGAS BLUE WATER DOUGLAS R. LIFERAFT & SAFETY SUN
GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES

ITEM INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.
Group II-Sports Unitized First Aid Kits, with 
Printed Lid and Filled with Standard Supplies

  4. 16-Item Sports Unitized First Aid Kit
Bid Price: Unit 5 kits $28.75 $40.95 $27.20 $31.45

Total $143.75 $204.75 $136.00 $157.25
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6816 HSK Certified K299-993 PacKit 52HIS Swift 6816 HSK

White Case

  5. 24-Item Sports Unitized First Aid Kit
Bid Price: Unit 10 kits $30.85 $44.70 $29.85 $33.76

Total $308.50 $447.00 $298.50 $337.60
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6824 HSK K299-994 PacKit S3HIS Swift 6824 HSK

White Case

Sub-Total for Group II, Items 4 & 5: $452.25 $651.75 $434.50 $494.85

Total Sum Bid for Group I & II, Items 1 - 5: $4,829.75 $5,746.50 $3,722.00 $5,539.35

Group III-Bodily Fluid Spills Cleanup Kits, with
Printed Lid and Filled with Standard Supplies 

  6. 16-Item Bodily Fluid Spill Cleanup Kit
Bid Price: Unit 10 kits $29.80 Items 6 & 7 $25.45 $36.79

Total $298.00 NO BID $254.50 $367.90
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6816 HBFK PacKit S2HBF Swift 6816 HBFK

Red Background
Logo

  7. 24-Item Bodily Fluid Spills Cleanup Kit
Bid Price: Unit 100 kits $32.00 $28.10 $36.36

Total $3,200.00 $2,810.00 $3,636.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 6824 HBFK PacKit 53HBF Swift 6824 HBFK

Red Background
Logo

Sub-Total for Group III, Items 6 & 7: $3,498.00 $3,064.50 $4,003.90



PROPOSAL NO. 14590
PAGE 3

AIRGAS BLUE WATER DOUGLAS R. LIFERAFT & SAFETY SUN
GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES

ITEM INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.
Group IV-Kit Containers Only, with Printed Lid
(Empty-No Supplies)                                   

  8. 10-Item Unitized First Aid Kit Container
Bid Price: Unit 10 kits $13.25 $14.93 $13.45 $13.89

Total $132.50 $149.30 $134.50 $138.90
Brand Name and No.: Swift 90Y10 Certified R209-024 PacKit 5000 Swift 351- EF

HFAK White Only HFAK

  9. 16-Item Unitized First Aid Kit Container
Bid Price: Unit 10 kits $15.40 $19.13 $14.25 $16.38

Total $154.00 $191.30 $142.50 $163.80
Brand Name and No.: Swift 90Y16 Certified R209-025 PacKit 5200 Swift 3516 EF

HFAK White Only

 10. 16-Item Sports Unitized First Aid Kit Container
Bid Price: Unit 5 kits $11.35 $19.13 $14.25 $12.21

Total $56.75 $95.65 $71.25 $61.05
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R209-025 5200 PacKit Swift 3516 EF

White Only

 11. 16-Item Bodily Fluid Spills Kit Container
Bid Price: Unit 5 kits $15.25 $19.13 $14.25 $16.38

Total $76.25 $95.65 $71.25 $81.90
Brand Name and No.: Swift 90R16 Certified R209-025 5200 PacKit Swift 3516 EF

HBFK White Only

 12. 24-Item Unitized First Aid Kit Container
Bid Price: Unit 10 kits $17.40 $22.50 $17.95 $18.39

Total $174.00 $225.00 $179.50 $183.90
Brand Name and No.: Swift 90Y24 Certified R209-026 PacKit 5300 Swift 3524 EF

HFAK White Only
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 13. 24-Item Sports Unitized First Aid Kit Container

Bid Price: Unit 5 kits $13.25 $22.50 $17.95 $14.25
Total $66.25 $112.50 $89.75 $71.25

Brand Name and No.: 9024 HSK Certified R209-026 PacKit 5300 Swift 3524 EF
Swift White Only

 14. 24-Item Bodily Fluid Spills Cleanup Kit Container
Bid Price: Unit 5 kits $17.40 $22.50 $17.95 $21.65

Total $87.00 $112.50 $89.75 $108.25
Brand Name and No.: Swift 90B24 Certified R209-026 PacKit 5300 Swift 3524 EF

HBFK White Only

Total Sum Bid for Group IV, Item Nos. 8 - 14 $746.75 $981.90 $778.50 $809.05

Group V - Standard Unitized Refills for 
Unitized First Aid, Sports Unitized First Aid and
Bodily Fluids Spills Cleanup Kits

 15. Bandage, Plastic Adhesive with Telfa Pad
Bid Price: Unit 800 unit boxes $0.50 $0.59 $0.65 $0.63

Total $400.00 $472.00 $520.00 $504.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35-100CX Certified R210-006 PacKikt 1-003 Swift 35-100CX

Packaging - Bandages/Box 16 16 16 16
Size of Box S --- single unit 4" x 2" x 5/8"

 16. Cold Pack, Instant
Bid Price: Unit 500 unit boxes $0.60 $0.77 $0.75 $0.70

Total $300.00 $385.00 $375.00 $350.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35-185MK Certified R216-033 PacKit 21-004 Swift 35185MK

Dimensions of Cold Pack 35-185MK 4x5 5" x 7" 4" x 5" 4" x 4"
Packaging - Pack/Box 1 1 1 1
Size of Box DBL --- double unit 4" x 2-1/8" x 1-1/4"



PROPOSAL NO. 14590
PAGE 5 AIRGAS BLUE WATER DOUGLAS R. LIFERAFT & SAFETY SUN

GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 17. Compress, Bandages; regular

Bid Price: Unit 500 unit boxes $0.90 $1.38 $1.45 $1.27
Total $450.00 $690.00 $725.00 $635.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift 35144TC Certified R211-008 PacKit #2-004 Swift 35144TC

Dimensions of Compress 4 x 32 4" x 32" 4" - 32 4" x 4"
Packaging - Compress/Box 1 1 1 1
Size of Box S --- single 4" x 2" x 5/8"

 18. Compress, Gauge Bandage; absorbent
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $1.06 $1.58 NO BID $1.26

Total $106.00 $158.00 $126.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 351629C Certified R211-017 Swift 35162GC

Dimensions of Compress 36 x 36 36" x 36" 36" x 36"
Packaging - Compress/Box 1 1 1
Size of Box S --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 19. Compress, Gauge Bandage; absorbent regular
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $1.25 $1.73 $1.45 $1.46

Total $125.00 $173.00 $145.00 $146.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35163GC Certified R211-021 PacKit 3-005 Swift 35-163GC

Dimensions of Compress 24 x 72 24" x 72" 24 x 72 24" x 72"
Packaging - Compress/Box 1 1 1 1
Size of Box S --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 20. Gloves, Disposable

Bid Price: Unit 600 unit boxes $1.35 $0.90 $0.98 $1.56
Total $810.00 $540.00 $588.00 $936.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift Certified R216-082 PacKit 21-026 Swift
35620NG

Thickness of Gloves (in mil) 4 mil --- 4 7 mil
Packaging - No. of Gloves/Box 2 pr 2 2 pr 4

Size of Box: S --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 1-1/4"
 21. Povidone Iodine (PVP) Swabs

Bid Price: Unit 500 unit boxes $1.65 $2.25 $1.95 $1.61
Total $825.00 $1,125.00 $975.00 $805.00

Brand Name and No. Swift 132PV Certified R213-004 PacKit 10-004 Swift 35132 PV
Packaging - Swabs/Box 10 10 10 10

Size of Box S --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
 22. Rescue Breather with One-Way Valve

Bid Price: Unit 125 unit boxes $4.75 $3.98 $3.40 $6.49
Total $593.75 $497.50 $425.00 $811.25

Brand Name and No.: Swift 400M Certified R216-068 PacKit 21-008 Swift 35-400M

Brand Name and No. of Clear Mouth Barrier MDI --- --- MDI Microshield
Packaging Breather/Box 1 1 --- 1

Size of Box DBL --- --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
 23. Tape Rolls, Adhesive

Bid Price: Unit 300 unit boxes $0.66 $0.78 $0.85 $0.79
Total $198.00 $234.00 $255.00 $237.00

Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R216-003 PacKit 8-001 Swift 35-102A

Length of Roll --- 1/2" x 2-1/2 yds. 2.5 Y 1/2" x 5 yds
Packaging - Rolls/Box --- 2 2 2

Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
Group V - Additional Standard Utilized Refills for
Sports Unitized First Aid and Bodily Fluids Spills
Cleanup Kits

 24. Bandage, Triangular
Bid Price: Unit 200 unit boxes $1.10 $1.10 $1.20 $1.26

Total $220.00 $220.00 $240.00 $252.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R211-033 PacKit 4-006 Swift 35170TB

Dimensions of Bandage --- 40" 40 x 56 40" x 40" x 56"
Packaging - Bandage/Box --- 3 1 1

Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 25. Bandage, Combo Fingertip and Knuckle Woven or
Elasticized cloth Adhesive
Bid Price: Unit 50 unit boxes $0.70 $1.02 $0.99 $0.80

Total $35.00 $51.00 $49.50 $40.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R210-019 PacKit 1-014 Swift 35104KF

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 9 9 9
Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 26. Eye Dressing Pads ---
Bid Price: Unit 75 unit boxes $0.80 $1.20 $1.20 $1.25

Total $60.00 $90.00 $90.00 $93.75
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R214-008 PacKit 7-002 Swift 35-192EP

Packaging - Set/Box --- 4 4 4
Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 27. Forceps Tweezers

Bid Price: Unit 75 each $0.40 $1.65 $0.70 $0.55
Total $30.00 $123.75 $52.50 $41.25

Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R242-009 PacKit 17-030 Swift 32-49319

Size --- 4-1/2" 3" 3"
 28. Scissors ---

Bid Price: Unit 75 each $0.27 $0.51 $0.70 $0.55
Total $20.25 $38.25 $52.50 $41.25

Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R237-010 PacKit 17-008 Swift 322009S

Size --- 4" 4 4-1/2"

 29. Wrap, Elastic Bandage ---
Bid Price: Unit 125 each $0.75 $0.98 $1.05 $1.05

Total $93.75 $122.50 $131.25 $131.25
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R228-104 PacKit 5-902 Swift 105030

Length of Roll --- 3" x 5 yds. 3" x 5 y 3" x 5 yds.

Packaging --- single 1/package
 30. Bag, Biohazard Waste which contains one each Item Nos. 30 & 31

biohazardbag with twist tie & one each, scraper NO BID NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 75 unit boxes $0.60 $0.50

Total $45.00 $37.50
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R216-123-1

Dimension of Bag --- 24" x 24"

Packaging --- ---
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 31. Absorbent, Body Fluid Clean-Up

Bid Price: Unit 75 unit boxes $1.60 $1.80 $3.25
Total $120.00 $135.00 $243.75

Brand Name and No.: Swift 35520LTS Certified R216-079 Swift 35520LTS

Amount of Chlorine 10,000 ppm --- 10,000
Size of Container --- --- .75 oz.
Packaging: Pouches/Box --- 3 1

Size of Box --- --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 1-1/4"
 32. Face Mask with Eye Shield

Bid Price: Unit 75 unit boxes $1.63 $2.48 $2.95 $2.95
Total $122.25 $186.00 $221.25 $221.25

Brand Name and No.: Swift Certified R216-078 PacKit 21-024 Swift
35510F

Size of Container --- --- --- N/A
Packaging: Pouches/Box 1 --- 1 1

Size of Box DBL --- double 4" x 2-1/8" x 1-1/4"
 33. Germicidal Cleaner Disinfectant Item Nos. 33 - 36

Bid Price: Unit 150 unit boxes $0.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $75.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift (PD1U87295)

Dimensions as spec

Packaging: Cloths/Box 1
Size of Box S
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 34. Gown, large, one (1) size

Bid Price: Unit 50 unit boxes $1.85 $2.63 $2.20
Total $92.50 $131.50 $110.00

Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R216-084 Swift 35590G

Packaging: Gown(s)/Box --- --- 1
Size of Box --- --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 35. Hand Wipes, Antimicrobial Cleaner
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $0.84 $1.25 $1.05

Total $84.00 $125.00 $105.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R213-006 Swift 35386AW

Packaging: Wipes/Box --- 10 10 box
Size of Box --- --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 36. Shoe Covers
Bid Price: Unit 150 unit boxes $0.55 $0.75 $2.25

Total $82.50 $112.50 $337.50
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R216-066 Swift 381901

Packaging: Covers/Box --- 1 pair 2
Size of Box --- --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
Group VI - Other Optional Unitized Unit Boxes and 
Bulk Box Package Refills for Unitized First Aid
Sports Unitized First Aid and Bodily Fluid
Spills Cleanup Kits

 37. Alcohol Prep Pad Wipes
Bid Price: Unit 50 unit boxes $0.44 $0.57 $0.60 $0.63

Total $22.00 $28.50 $30.00 $31.50
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35-224AS Certified R213-040 PacKit 12-011 Swift 35-224AS

Dimension of Wipe --- 1" x 2" 1.25 x 1.50 1-1/4" x 1-1/2"
Packaging - Wipes/Box 10 10 10 10

Size of Box S --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
 38. Alcohol Prep Pad Wipes

Bid Price: Unit 75 boxes $1.45 $1.95 $1.95 $1.55
Total $108.75 $146.25 $146.25 $116.25

Brand Name and No.: Swift 154818 Certified R221 007 PacKit 12-110 Cintas 050422

Dimensions of Wip As specified 1" x 2" 1.25 x 1.5 1-1/4" x 1-1/2"
Packaging - Wipes/Box: 100 100 100 50/box

 39. Bandage, Plastic Adhesive w/Telfa Pad; 3/4" x 3"
Bid Price: Unit 20 unit boxes $0.55 $0.57 $0.60 $1.00

Total $11.00 $11.40 $12.00 $20.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35-103C Certified R210 005 PacKit 1-001 Swift 35-103C

Packaging - Bandages/Box 16 16 16 16
Size of Box S --- ---- 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 40. Bandage, Plastic Adhesive w/Telfa Pad; 1" x 3" NO BID

Bid Price: Unit 150 boxes $1.85 $2.85 $2.85 $3.25
Total $277.50 $427.50 $427.50 $487.50

Brand Name and No.: Swift 01-0050 Medline Certified R220-103 Swift 01-0050
ML-HON25600

9.2"Lx7.3"Wx9.7"H
Packaging - Bandages/Box: 100 100/bx 100 100

 41. Bandage, Plastic Adhesive w/Telfa Pad; 2" x 3" Items 41 - 43
Bid Price: Unit 75 boxes $0.79 NO BID $0.77 $0.99 $0.96

Total $59.25 $57.75 $74.25 $72.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R210-009 PacKit 6-001 Swift 35103K

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 6 6 6
Size of Box --- ---- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 42. Bandage, Plastic Adhesive w/Telfa Pad; 2" x 3"
Bid Price: Unit 10 unit boxes $3.10 $5.70 $6.85 $3.95

Total $31.00 $57.00 $68.50 $39.50
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R220-018 PacKit 1-470 Swift 010115

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 50 50 50
Size of Box --- --- Bulk 4" x 2-1/8" x 3-1/2

 43. Bandage, Woven or Elasticized Cloth Adhesive; 
1" x 3"
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $0.68 $0.89 $0.85 $0.82

Total $68.00 $89.00 $85.00 $82.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R210-007 PacKit 1-008 Swift 35100E

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 16 16 16
Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 44. Bandage, Woven or Elasticized Cloth Adhesive; 

1" x 3"
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $2.50 $4.94 $4.13 $4.15 $2.50

Total $250.00 $494.00 $413.00 $415.00 $250.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Medline Certified R220-205 PacKit 1-400 Cintas 044252

ML-NON29660

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 100/bx 100 100 50
Size of Box --- 9.5"Lx7.25"Wx9.75"H --- Bulk 4" x 4" x 1-5/8"

 45. Bandage, Fingertip Woven or Elasticized Cloth Items 45 - 63
Adhesive NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 50 unit boxes $0.68 $1.25 $0.99 $0.85

Total $34.00 $62.50 $49.50 $42.50
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R210-015 PacKit 1-010 Swift 35103FC

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 10 10 8
Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 46. Bandage, Knuckle Woven or Elasticized Cloth
Adhesive
Bid Price: Unit 50 unit boxes $0.55 $0.93 $0.85 $0.80

Total $27.50 $46.50 $42.50 $40.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R210-020 PacKit 1-009 Swift 35101K

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 8 8 8
Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 47. Bandage, Combo Fingertip, Knuckle & Regular NO BID

Size Woven or Elasticized Cloth Adhesive; 1" x 3"
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $1.20 $3.08 $1.90

Total $120.00 $308.00 $190.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift Certified R210-123 PacKit 1-099

Packaging - Bandages/Box --- 34 10/8/16
Size of Box S --- single

 48. Bandage, Gauze; 1" x 6 yds. NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 10 unit boxes $2.43 $1.35 $2.80

Total $24.30 $13.50 $28.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35152GB Certified R211-022 Swift 35-152GB

Size of Gauze Bandages 1 x 6 1" x 6 yds. 1" x 6 YDS
Packaging - Bandages/Box ea 2 4

Size of Box S --- 4" X 2-1/8" X 5/8"
 49. Bandage, Gauge; 2" x 6 yds.

Bid Price: Unit 50 unit boxes $1.35 $1.65 $1.75 $1.64
Total $67.50 $82.50 $87.50 $82.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift 35-153GB Certified R211-024 PacKit 5-003 Swift 35 153 GB

Size of Gauze Bandages 2 x 6 2" x 6 yds. 2" x 64 2" x 6 YDS.
Packaging - Bandages/Box ea 2 2 2

Size of Box S --- single 4" X 2-1/8" X 5/8"
 50. Bandage, Gauze; 4" x 6 yds.

Bid Price: Unit 5 unit boxes $1.21 $1.47 $1.45 $1.95
Total $6.05 $7.35 $7.25 $9.75

Brand Name and No.: Swift Certified R211-027 PacKit 5-004 Swift
35 154 GB

Size of Gauze Bandages 4 x 6 4" x 6 yds. 4" x 6y 4" x 6 yds.
Packaging - Bandages/Box 1 1 1 1

Size of Box S --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 51. Blanket, Rescue; 56" x 84"

Bid Price: Unit 10 unit boxes $1.85 $2.70 $2.25 $3.50
Total $18.50 $27.00 $22.50 $35.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift 264RB Certified R216-036 PacKit 21-005 Swift 264RB

Dimensions of Blanket --- 52" x 84" 56" x 84" 52" x 84"
Packaging - Blankets/Box --- 1 1 1

Size of Box --- --- double 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
 52. Cold Pack, Instant; 4" x 5" Item Nos. 52 & 53

Bid Price: Unit 5 cases $30.65 $38.25 $37.95
Total $153.25 $191.25 $189.75

Brand Name and No.: --- Certified Cintas 091012
R216-033-50

Size of Cold Pack --- 5" x 7" 4" x 5"

Packaging - Cold Packs/Case --- 50 48
 53. Cold Pack, Instant; disposable single use type

4" x 5"
Bid Price: Unit 10 cases $35.95 $52.50 $44.43

Total $359.50 $525.00 $444.30
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified Swift 

R216-002-100 30 185MK125CS

Size of Cold Pack --- 5" x 7" 4" x 5"
Packaging - Cold Packs/Case --- 100 125
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 54. Compress, Gauze; unfolds to 18" x 36" size

Bid Price: Unit 20 unit boxes $1.25 $2.18 $1.75 $1.50
Total $25.00 $43.60 $35.00 $30.00

Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R211 014 PacKit 3-003 Swift 35-161GC

Size of Compress --- 18" x 35" 18" x 36" 18" x 36"

Packaging - Compress/Box --- 2 2 2
Size of Box --- --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"

 55. Dressing, Multi-Trauma; 10" x 30" size
Bid Price: Unit 100 each $1.95 $2.25 $2.65 $2.25

Total $195.00 $225.00 $265.00 $225.00
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified PacKit 3-700 Swift 06-9564

R231-422

Size of Dressing --- 10" x 30" 10" x 30" 10" x 30"
Packaging --- --- single 1/package

 56. Dressing, Multi-Trauma; 10" x 30" size
Bid Price: Unit 10 case $95.00 $101.25 $132.50 $112.50

Total $950.00 $1,012.50 $1,325.00 $1,125.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 06-9564 Certified PacKit 3-700 Swift 06-9564

R231-422-50

Size of Dressing 10 x 30 10" x 30" 10" x 30" 10" x 30"
Packaging - Dressings/Case 50 50 50
Eye Wash Solution

 57. Minimum 1 fl. oz bottle or two, 1/2 fl. oz NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 75 unit boxes $1.50 $1.88 $1.45

Total $112.50 $141.00 $108.75
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R214-005 Swift 24-0801

Size of Bottle --- 20 ml 1 oz.
Packaging - Bottles/Box --- 2 1

Size of Box --- --- 4" x 2-1/8" x 1-1/4"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 58. Minimum 4 fl. oz. bottle or approved size

Bid Price: Unit 75 each $1.15 $2.10 $4.45 $1.65
Total $86.25 $157.50 $333.75 $123.75

Brand Name and No.: Swift 24-0803 Certified R229-060 PacKit 7-006 Cintas 130442

Size of Botle 4 oz 4 oz 4 4 oz
Packaging: Bottles/Box ea 1 --- 1

Size of Box --- --- N/A
 59. Gauze; 2" x 10 yds. Item Nos. 59 & 60

Bid Price: Unit 10 cases $0.77 $0.80 NO BID $0.90
Total $7.70 $8.00 $9.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift 043171 Certified R230-092 Cintas 072020

Length of Roll 2 x 5 2" x 6" 2" x 5 yds.
Packaging: ea ---- 1/package

 60. Gauze; 2" x 18 yds.
Bid Price: Unit 5 cases $9.25 $8.40 $10.80

Total $46.25 $42.00 $54.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 043171 Certified Cintas 072020

R505-115-12

Length of Roll 2 x 5 2: x 6 yds. 2" x 5 yds
Packaging - Rolls/Case ea 12 12

 61. Gauze Pads; 3" x 3"; 4 pads per unit box
Bid Price: Unit 100 unit boxes $0.50 $0.56 $0.70 $0.65

Total $50.00 $56.00 $70.00 $65.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift 35160GC Certified R211-011 PacKit 3-001 Swift 35 160GC

Size of Pad 3 x 3 3" x 3" 3" x 3" 3" x 3"
Packaging: Pads/Box 4 4 4 4

Size of Box S --- single 4" x 2-1/8" x 5/8"
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 62. Gauze Pads; 3" x 3"; 100 pads per bulk box pkg

Bid Price: Unit 10 unit boxes $5.55 $7.73 $7.45 $2.26
Total $55.50 $773.00 $74.50 $22.60

Brand Name and No.: Swift 067633 Certified R231-205 PacKit 3-202 Cintas 070822

Size of Pad 3 x 3 3" x 3" 3" x 3" 3" x 3"
Packaging: Pads/Box 100 100 100 25

 63. Guide, Firest Aid; small instructional book
that fits first aid kit
Bid Price: Unit 5 each $0.49 $0.60 $0.60 $5.00

Total $2.45 $3.00 $3.00 $25.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift/North 042115 Certified R234-010 PacKit 21-009 Cintas 151622
Sanitizer

 64. Minimum 4 oz. size container Item Nos. 64 - 67 Item Nos. 64 - 67
Bid Price: Unit 2 cases $65.00 $50.00 $86.85 NO BID NO BID

Total $130.00 $100.00 $173.70
Brand Name and No.: --- Sween, CO-1644 Certified

R213-041-36

Minimum Percentage and Type of Alcohol: --- 60% ethanol ---
Size of Bottle --- 4 oz. ---
Packaging - Bottles/Case --- 36/cs. 36

 65. Minimum 21 oz. size container Items 65 - 67
Bid Price: Unit 2 cases NO BID $73.26 Item Nos. 65 - 67

Total $146.52 NO BID
Brand Name and No.: Sween, CO-1645

Minimum Percentage and Type of Alcohol: 60% ethanol
Size of Bottle 21 oz.
Packaging - Bottles/Case 12/cs.
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
Sun Block Lotion

 66. 6 oz. tube size Items 66 - 79
Bid Price: Unit 25 pkgs. $94.14 NO BID

Total (total of 300 tubes) $2,353.50
Brand Name and No.: Saurus Pro Sport/

Ironman Triathlon
Actual SPF: 44/30+
Size of Tube 6 oz
Packaging - Tubes/Package 12/package

 67. 32 quart size
Bid Price: Unit 5 cases $170.83

Total $854.15
Brand Name and No.: Saurus Pro Sport/

Ironman Triathlon

Actual SPF: 44/30+
Size of Dispenser 32 oz/quart
Packaging - Dispensers/Case 4/case

 68. Tape, Adhesive; 1/2 in. x 5 yds. Items 68 - 79
Bid Price: Unit 25 each $0.85 NO BID $1.20 $1.35 $1.30

Total $21.25 $30.00 $33.75 $32.50
Brand Name and No.: Swift 023143 Certified PacKit 8-050 Cintas 080060

R240-008

Length of Roll 1/2 x 5 1/2" x 5 yds 1/2" x 5 1/2" x 5 yds.
Packaging each ---- single 1/spool

 69. Tape, Adhesive; 1 in. x 5 yds.
Bid Price: Unit 10 each $1.10 $2.18 $1.90 $1.71

Total $11.00 $21.80 $19.00 $17.10
Brand Name and No.: Swift 023145 Certified R240-008 PacKit 8-150 Cintas 080102

Length of Roll 1 x 5 1" x 5 yds 1" x 5 y 1" x 5 yds.
Packaging ea --- single 1/spool
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 70. Wrap, Elastic Bandage; 2" x 5 yds.

Bid Price: Unit 5 each $0.55 $0.75 $0.70 $1.00
Total $2.75 $3.75 $3.50 $5.00

Brand Name and No.: Swift 105020 Certified R228-102 PacKit 5-401 Cintas 082620

Length of Wrap 2 x 5 2" x 5 yds 2" x 5 y 2" x 5 yds.
Packaging each --- single 1/package

 71. Wrap, Bandage; Medi-Rip; 2" x 5 yds.
Bid Price: Unit 50 each $1.70 $1.88 $1.75 $1.92

Total $85.00 $94.00 $87.50 $96.00
Brand Name and No.: Swift Medi Rip Certified PacKit 5-991 Cintas 082420

10-0520

Length of Wrap 2 x 5 2" x 5 yds 2" x 5 y 2" x 5 yds.
Packaging 12/bx 96/cs --- single 1/package

 72. Wrap, Bandage; Medi-Rip; 3" x 5 yds.
Bid Price: Unit 5 each $2.20 $2.63 $2.25 $2.50

Total $11.00 $13.15 $11.25 $12.50
Brand Name and No.: Swift Medi Rip Certified R228-347 PacKit 5-912 Cintas 082430

10-0530

Length of Wrap 3 x 5 3" x 5 yds 3" x 5 y 3" x 5 yds.
Packaging 12/bx 96/cs --- single 1/package

 73. Wrap, Self-Adherent; 2" x 5 yds. Item Nos. 73 - 79
Bid Price: Unit 5 each $1.35 $0.83 NO BID $1.95

Total $6.75 $4.15 $9.75
Brand Name and No.: --- Certified R230-220 Cintas 082420

Length of Wrap --- 2" x 4.1 yd 2" x 5 yds.
Packaging --- --- 1/package
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 74. Wrap, Self-Adherent; 3" x 5 yds.

Bid Price: Unit 5 each NO BID $1.07 $2.50
Total $5.35 $12.50

Brand Name and No.: Certified R230-223 Cintas 082430

Length of Wrap 3" x 4.1 yd 3" x 5 yds.
Packaging 1 1/package
Group VII-Optional Unitized and Bulk Refills for
Bodily Fluids Cleanup Kits                             

 75. Bag, Biohazard Waste; 10 gal. size
Bid Price: Unit 5 cases $21.45 $34.25 $24.95

Total $107.25 $171.25 $124.75
Brand Name and No.: Swift 41-8653C Certified Swift 41-8653C

R216-122-250

Dimension of Bag 24 x 24 24" x 24" 24" x 24"
Packaging - Bags/Case --- 250 250

 76. Bag, Biohazard Waste; 33 gal. size
Bid Price: Unit 5 cases $62.00 NO BID $72.50

Total $310.00 $362.50
Brand Name and No.: Swift 41-8656C Swift 41-8656C

Dimension of Bag 31 x 40 33" x 40" 
Packaging - Bags/Case 250 250
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GASPRO SPORT SUPPLY, DAUTERMAN MARINE SAFETY SYSTEMS INDUSTRIES
INC. CO., INC. EQUIP. INC. HAWAII, INC. INC.

ITEM
 77. Absorbent, Body Fluid Clean-Up Item Nos. 77 & 78

Bid Price: Unit 5 each $5.95 $2.55 NO BID
Total $29.75 $12.75

Brand Name and No.: North 12-70-01 Certified R270-050

Amount of Chlorine (ppm) 10,000 ppm ---
Size of Container 8 oz. ---

 78. Germicidal Cleaner Disinfectant
Bid Price: Unit 5 unit boxes $24.00 NO BID

Total $120.00
Brand Name and No.: PDI U87295

Dimensions as spec.
Packaging: Cloths/Box ---

Size of Box ---
 79. Hand Wipes, Antimicrobial Cleaner

Bid Price: Unit 3,000 unit boxes $6.00 $8.25 $5.47
Total $18,000.00 $24,750.00 $16,410.00

Brand Name and No.: PDI D35400 Certified R221-026 PDI SANI-DEX
D35400

Packaging: Towelettes/Box 100 100 100
Size of Box --- ---- ----


