ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14589 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: MARCH 14, 2005
For the furnishing and delivery of
RECYCLED OFFICE PAPER SUPPLIES HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
for the twelve-month period beginning STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
May 1, 2005 and ending April 30, 2006 to CO. LTD.
the City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,
Hawaii
ITEM
NO. GROUP | - PAPER, BOND
1. 25% Rag; white; Substance 20; 8-1/2 in. x
11 in.
Bid Price Unit 250 reams $9.70 NO BID NO BID
Total $2,425.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Mead
MEA39706
Packaging for Group | - Sheets/Ream: 500 shts/rm
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I: $2,425.00
GROUP Il - PAPER, OTHER BOND
A. 8-1/2in.x11in.
2. Blue
Bid Price Unit 1,925 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $6,814.50 $5,601.75 $5,948.25
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32521 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BBE P1-MP2201BE #09585/190117
3. Buff
Bid Price Unit 350 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $1,239.00 $1,018.50 $1,081.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32531 Boise Boise MP Colors
ASC1120BBF P1-MP2201BF #01318/190094
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Goldenrod

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

625 reams

Green

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

1,050 reams

Pink

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

1,350 reams

White

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

29,800 reams

Yellow

Bid Price Unit
Total

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

1,400 reams

Packaging for Group IIA - Sheets/Ream:

SUB-TOTAL FOR GROURP lIA:

HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
$3.54 $2.91 $3.09
$2,212.50 $1,818.75 $1,931.25
Wausau 32551 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BGD P1-MP2201GD #01325/190104
$3.54 $2.91 $3.09
$3,717.00 $3,055.50 $3,244.50
Wausau 32561 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BGN P1-MP2201GN #09581/190113
$3.54 $2.91 $3.09
$4,779.00 $3,928.50 $4,171.50
Wausau 32571 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BPK P1-MP2201PK #01348/190124
$2.64 $2.57 $2.69
$78,672.00 $76,586.00 $80,162.00
Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise MP Colors
Eureka 30 P1-054901 #054901
FRJ061171

$3.54 $2.91 $3.09
$4,956.00 $4,074.00 $4,326.00
Wausau 32541 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BCA P1-MP2201CY #01321/190099
500 shts/rm 500 sh/rm 500
$102,390.00 $96,083.00 $100,865.00
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO. B. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
9. Blue
Bid Price Unit 475 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $2,104.25 $1,762.25 $1,866.75
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32522 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BBE P1-MP2204BE #09586/190119
10. Goldenrod
Bid Price Unit 725 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $3,211.75 $2,689.75 $2,849.25
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32552 P1-MP2204GD Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BGD #01326/190105
11. Green
Bid Price Unit 650 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $2,879.50 $2,411.50 $2,554.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32562 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BGN P1-MP2204GN #09582/190115
12. Pink
Bid Price Unit 500 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $2,215.00 $1,855.00 $1,965.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32572 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BPK P1-MP2204PK #01349/190126
13. White
Bid Price Unit 1,200 reams $3.34 $3.27 $3.41
Total $4,008.00 $3,924.00 $4,092.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise Aspen
Eureka 30 P1-054904 #054904

FRJ061371
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO.
14. Yellow
Bid Price Unit 700 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $3,101.00 $2,597.00 $2,751.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32542 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BCA P1-MP2204CY #01322/190103
Packaging for Group 1B - Sheets/Ream: 500 shts/ream 500 sh/rm 500
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP IIB: $17,519.50 $15,239.50 $16,078.50
C. 11in.x17in.
15. White
Bid Price Unit 950 reams $5.28 $5.14 $5.37
Total $5,016.00 $4,883.00 $5,101.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise Aspen
Eureka 30 P1-054907 #054907
FRJ061571
Packaging for Group IIC - Sheets/Ream: 500 sht/rm| 500 sh/rm 5 rm/ct| 500 sheets/ream &
10 reams/carton
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP IIC: $5,016.00 $4,883.00 $5,101.50
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP II: $124,925.50 $116,205.50 $122,045.00
GROUP Il - PAPER, MIMEOGRAPH
A. 8-1/2in.x11in.
16. Blue
Bid Price Unit 25 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $88.50 $72.75 $77.25
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32521 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BBE P1-MP2201BE #09585/190117
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO.
17. Goldenrod
Bid Price Unit 75 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $265.50 $218.25 $231.75
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32551 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BGD P1-MP2201GD #01325/190104
18. Green
Bid Price Unit 85 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $300.90 $247.35 $262.65
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32561 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BGN P1-MP2201GN #09581/190113
19. Pink
Bid Price Unit 75 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $265.50 $218.25 $231.75
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32571 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BPK P1-MP2201PK| #013481/190124
20. White
Bid Price Unit 2,900 reams $2.64 $2.57 $2.69
Total $7,656.00 $7,453.00 $7,801.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise Aspen
Eureka 30 P1-054901 #054901
FRJ061171
21. Yellow
Bid Price Unit 10 reams $3.54 $2.91 $3.09
Total $35.40 $29.10 $30.90
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32541 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1120BCA P1-MP2201CY #01321/190099
Packaging for Group IlIA - Sheets/Ream: 500 sht/rm 500 sh/rm 500
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP llIA: $8,611.80 $8,238.70 $8,635.30
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO. B. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
22. Blue
Bid Price Unit 15 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $66.45 $55.65 $58.95
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32522 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BBE P1-MP2204BE #09586/190119
23. Goldenrod
Bid Price Unit 5 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $22.15 $18.55 $19.65
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32552 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BGD P1-MP2204GD #01326/190105
24. Green
Bid Price Unit 5 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $22.15 $18.55 $19.65
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32562 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BGN P1-MP2204GN #09582/190115
25. Pink
Bid Price Unit 5 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $22.15 $18.55 $19.65
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32572 Boise Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BPK P1-MP2204PK #01349/190126
26. White
Bid Price Unit 300 reams $3.34 $3.27 $3.41
Total $1,002.00 $981.00 $1,023.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise Aspen
Eureka 30 P1-054904 #054904

FRJ061371
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO.
27. Yellow
Bid Price Unit 125 reams $4.43 $3.71 $3.93
Total $553.75 $463.75 $491.25
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Wausau 32542 P1-MP2204CY Boise MP Colors
HSC1420BCA #01322/190103
Packaging for Group IlIB - Sheets/Ream: 500 sht/rm 500 sh/rm 500
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP llIB: $1,688.65 $1,556.05 $1,632.15
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP llI: $10,300.45 $9,794.75 $10,267.45
GROUP |V - FOR XEROX EQUIPMENT
28. 8-1/2inx11in.
Bid Price Unit 8,500 ctns. $26.40 $25.72 $26.90
Total $224,400.00 $218,620.00 $228,650.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise Aspen
Eureka 30 P1-054901 #054901
FRJ061171
29. 8-1/2inx 14 in.
Bid Price Unit 415 ctns. $33.40 $32.65 $34.10
Total $13,861.00 $13,549.75 $14,151.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Georgia Pacific Boise Aspen Boise Aspen
Eureka 30 P1-054904 #054904
FRJ061371
Packaging for Group IV - Sheets/Ream: 500 shts/rm| 500 sh/rm 10 rm/ct 500 shets/rm &
10 rm/ctn 10 rm/ctn
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP 1V: $238,261.00 $232,169.75 $242,801.50
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP V - PAPER SET, CARBONLESS
A. 2 Part: 250 sets/package
30. 8-1/2in.x111in.
Bid Price Unit 400 pkgs. NO BID NO BID $10.19
Total 30 - 37 30 - 37 $4,076.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Recover 4711
31. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price Unit 300 pkgs. $12.98
Total $3,894.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Recover 4714
Packaging for Group VA - Sets/Package: 250
SUB-TOTAL FOR GROUP VA: $7,970.00
B. 3 Part: 167 sets/package
32. 8-1/2in.x11in.
Bid Price Unit 1,100 pkgs. $11.40
Total $12,540.00
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Recover 4712
Packaging for Group VB - Sets/Package: 167
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO. C. 4 Part: 125 sets/package:
33. 8-1/2in.x111in.
Bid Price Unit 550 pkgs. $12.43
Total $6,836.50
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number: Recover 6183
Packaging for Group VC - Sets/Package: 125
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $27,346.50
GROUP VI
A. 3 Part: 167 sets/package
34. 8-1/2in.x 14 in.
Bid Price Unit 100 pkgs. $13.73
Total $1,373.00

35.

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Packaging for Group VIA - Sets/Package:

B. 4 Part: 125 sets/package
8-1/2in. x 14 in.
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Packaging for Group VIB - Sets/Package:

100 pkgs.

Superior 1916

167

$14.63
$1,463.00
Superior 1931

125
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HAWAII HOPACO PAPERSOURCE
STATIONERY HAWAII INC.
CO. LTD.
ITEM
NO. C. 5 Part: 100 sets/package
36. 8-1/2in.x111in.
Bid Price Unit 100 pkgs. $11.81
Total $1,181.00

37.

Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Packaging for Group VIC - Sets/Package:
8-1/2"in. x 14 in.
Bid Price Unit

Total
Manufacturer's Brand Name and Number:

Packaging for Group VIC - Sets/Package:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V:

100 pkgs.

Superior 1942

100

$15.04
$1,504.00
Superior 1943

100

$5,521.00




