
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14580 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  FEBRUARY 28, 2005

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE CHARLES W. CUTTER PACIFIC
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS, for the twelve- AUTOMOTIVE WAREHOUSE CARTER CO. FORD INC. JOBBERS
month period beginning April 1, 2005 and DISTRIBUTING, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE
ending March 31, 2006 to the Honolulu INC. INC.
Police Department, City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. Idler Arm, Moog D8283

Bid Price Unit 120 each $18.09 $37.66 $31.25 $25.80 $43.00
Total $2,170.80 $4,519.20 $3,750.00 $3,096.00 $5,160.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8283 Carquest Moog K8283 Parts Master by Moog Ford OE Moog K8283
K8283 lWlZ3355AA

2. Pitman Arm, Moog K8688
Bid Price Unit 60 each $17.00 $23.80 $22.21 $42.19 $28.00

Total $1,020.00 $1,428.00 $1,332.60 $2,531.40 $1,680.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8688 Carquest Moog K8688 Parts Master by Moog Ford OE Moog K8688

F8AZ3590AA

3. Upper Ball Joint, Moog K8678
Bid Price Unit 120 each $18.00 $32.24 $27.01 $51.20 $38.00

Total $2,160.00 $3,868.80 $3,241.20 $6,144.00 $4,560.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8678 Carquest Moog K8678 Parts Master by Moog Ford OE Moog K8678

K8678 F7AZ3049AA

4. Lower Ball Joint, Moog K8685
Bid Price Unit 120 each $16.00 $29.68 $25.05 $91.63 $34.00

Total $1,920.00 $3,561.60 $3,006.00 $10,995.60 $4,080.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8685 Carquest Moog K8685 Parts Master by Moog Ford OE Moog K8685

K8685 2W7Z3050AA

5. Sway Bar Link Kit, Moog K8853
Bid Price Unit 80 each $17.00 $28.43 $30.46 $38.62 $330.00

Total $1,360.00 $2,274.40 $2,436.80 $3,089.60 $26,400.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8853 Carquest Moog K8853 Moog K8853 Ford OE Moog K8853

F8AZ5K484AA
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NO.

6. Upper Control Arm Bushings, Moog K8703
Bid Price Unit 120 each $7.50 $9.75 $9.83 $101.08 $12.00

Total $900.00 $1,170.00 $1,179.60 $12,129.60 $1,440.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8703 Carquest Moog K8703 Parts Master by Moog (R/S) F6AZ 3085 BA Moog K8703

K8703 (L/S) F7AZ 3084 BA
c/arm assy.

7. Lower Control Arm Bushings, Moog K8297
Bid Price Unit 120 each $11.50 $14.45 $13.89 $147.49 $17.00

Total $1,380.00 $1,734.00 $1,666.80 $17,698.80 $2,040.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K8297 Carquest Moog K8297 Parts Master by Moog (R/S) XWIZ 3078 BA Moog K8297

K8297 (L/S) XWlZ 3079 BA
c/arm assy.

8. Lower Control Arm Bushings, Moog K80029
Bid Price Unit 65 each $17.00 $23.25 $24.90 NO BID $27.00

Total $1,105.00 $1,511.25 $1,618.50 $1,755.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto K80029 Carquest Moog K80029 Moog K80029 Moog K80029

9. Inner Tie Rod End, Moog ES3495
Bid Price Unit 60 each $12.50 $16.94 $14.41 $21.82 $20.00

Total $750.00 $1,016.40 $864.60 $1,309.20 $1,200.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto ES3495 Carquest Moog ES3495 Parts Master by Moog Ford OE Moog ES3495

ES3495 2W7Z3A130AA

10. Outer Tie Rod End, Moog ES3494
Bid Price Unit 60 each $12.00 $16.94 $13.95 $21.82 $20.00

Total $720.00 $1,016.40 $837.00 $1,309.20 $1,200.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Pronto ES3454 Carquest Moog ES3494 Parts Master by Moog Ford OE Moog ES3494

ES3494 2W7Z3A131AA
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NO
11. Starter, Bosch SR7533X; NEW ONLY

Bid Price Unit 40 each $80.87 $74.12 $151.76 ITEMS 11 - 14 $140.00
Core Charge $0.00 new $0.00 NO BID $0.00
Total $80.87 $74.12 $151.76 $140.00
Net Bid Price $3,234.80 $2,964.80 $6,070.40 $5,600.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Vapex 3267 OCA 3267SN Bosch Bosch SR7533N
SR7533N

12. Water Pump, Air Tex AW5033;  NEW ONLY
Bid Price Unit 30 each $34.07 $21.77 $36.69 $48.00

Total $1,022.10 $653.10 $1,100.70 $1,440.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Airtex AW4066 Airtex 4066 ASC IND WP836 Carter FP1877

13. Alternator, Bosch AL7537N; NEW ONLY
Bid Price Unit 150 each $91.12 $107.83 $196.30 $180.00

Core Charge $0.00 new $0.00 $0.00
Total $91.12 $107.83 $196.30 $180.00
Net Bid Price $13,668.00 $16,174.50 $29,445.00 $27,000.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Vapex 7776 OCA 7776N Bosch Bosch AL7537N
AL7537N

14. Alternator, Bosch AL7554N; NEW ONLY
Bid Price Unit 150 each $137.38 $179.27 $168.81 $165.00

Core Charge $0.00 new $0.00 $0.00
Total $137.38 $179.27 $168.81 $165.00
Net Bid Price $20,607.00 $26,890.50 $25,321.50 $24,750.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: --- OCA 7795N Bosch Bosch
AL7554N AL7554N

15. Power Steering Pump, A Cardone 20-260
Unit 20 each 93.05 $45.89 50.25 $223.19
Core Charge $35.00 $50.00 $50.00 $41.66 NO BID
Total $58.05 $95.89 $100.25 $181.53
Net Bid Price $1,161.00 $1,917.80 $2,005.00 $3,630.60

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 50-6391 A Cardone 20-260 Cardone Ford OE
20-260 F85Z3A674ABRM
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16. Brake Pads, Wagner SX748
Bid Price Unit 100 each $25.59 $21.27 $35.19 $41.51 $27.00

Total $2,559.00 $2,127.00 $3,519.00 $4,151.00 $2,700.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 64D748 Carquest/Raybestos Wagner SX748 Ford OE Centric Brakes

BMD748 XU2Z2V001AB 106.074

17. Brake Pads, Wagner SX659
Bid Price Unit 135 each $27.05 $18.62 $32.88 $37.46 $37.00

Total $3,651.75 $2,513.70 $4,438.80 $5,057.10 $4,995.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 64D659 Carquest/Raybestos Wagner SX659 Ford OE Raybestos SSD659

BMD659 2U2Z2V001KA

18. Brake Pads, Wagner MX674A
Bid Price Unit 135 each $17.93 $20.01 $27.81 $37.88 $32.00

Total $2,420.55 $2,701.35 $3,754.35 $5,113.80 $4,320.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 762D674 Carquest/Rayabestos Wagner Ford OE Raybestos

BMD690 MX674A XU2Z2V001VA PGD674AM

19. Brake Pads, Wagner MX674
Bid Price Unit 95 each $12.47 $19.99 $28.97 $32.32 $21.00

Total $1,184.65 $1,899.05 $2,752.15 $3,070.40 $1,995.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 763D674 Carquest/Raybestos Wagner Ford OE Centric Brakes

BMD674 MX674 2U2Z2V001CA 106.06740

20. Parking Brake Shoes, Wagner PS745
Bid Price Unit 60 each NO BID $7.93 $17.76 $89.02 $13.00

Core Charge NCC $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $7.93 $17.76 $89.02 $13.00
Net Bid Price $475.80 $1,065.60 $5,341.20 $780.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Carquest/Raybestos Wagner PAB745 Ford OE Raybestos  745PG
BS745 XL2Z2648AA



Proposal No. 14580 ALOHA AUTOMOTIVE CHARLES W. CUTTER PACIFIC
Page 5 AUTOMOTIVE WAREHOUSE CARTER CO. FORD INC. JOBBERS

DISTRIBUTING, INC. HAWAII WAREHOUSE
INC. INC.

ITEM
NO.

21. Brake Rotor, Wagner BD125514
Bid Price Unit 100 each $23.12 $37.64 $27.77 ITEMS 21 - 23 $42.00

Total $2,312.00 $3,764.00 $2,777.00 NO BID $4,200.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 789-34055 Carquest/Raybestos Parts Master Centric Brakes

54060 125514 120.61055

22. Brake Pads, Wagner MX376
Bid Price Unit 40 each $10.73 $19.83 $29.82 $19.00

Total $429.20 $793.20 $1,192.80 $760.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 762D376 Carquest/Raybestos Wagner MX 376 Centric Brakes

BMD376 106.03760

23. Brake Pads,, Wagner MX749
Bid Price Unit 40 each $17.53 $22.26 $31.97 $24.00

Total $701.20 $890.40 $1,278.80 $960.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 762D749 Carquest/Raybestos Wagner MX749 Centri Brakes 106.07490

BMD749

24. Brake Hub, BCA Federal Mogul Bearings,
513104
Bid Price Unit 30 each $35.25 $28.12 $29.92 $78.65 $35.00

Total $1,057.50 $843.60 $897.60 $2,359.50 $1,050.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: BCA 513104 Federal Mogul 513104 Parts Master PM513104 Ford OE Timken 513104

F7AZ1104AC

25. Front Hub, BCA Federal Mogul Bearings,
51202
Bid Price Unit 30 each $43.57 $48.59 $47.08 $71.79 $44.00

Total $1,307.10 $1,457.70 $1,412.40 $2,153.70 $1,320.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: BCA 513202 Federal Mogul 513202 BCA 513202 Ford OE Timken 513202

F8AZ1104AA
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26. Shocks, Monroe 5967
Bid Price Unit 80 each $20.01 $11.55 $21.84 $24.80 $21.00

Total $1,600.80 $924.00 $1,747.20 $1,984.00 $1,680.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Monroe 5967 Carques Shocks/Gabriel Monroe 5967 Ford OE Monroe

64606 E7PZ8125A 5967

27. Shocks, Monroe 5969
Bid Price Unit 80 each $22.06 $14.85 $24.10 $24.81 $23.00

Total $1,764.80 $1,188.00 $1,928.00 $1,984.80 $1,840.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Monroe 5969 Carquest Shocks/Gabriel Monroe 5969 Ford OE Monroe 5969

50641 3U2Z18124AA

28. Wiper Blades, Anco 31-16
Bid Price Unit 30 each $2.75 $3.20 $4.68 ITEMS 28 - 33 $4.70

Total $82.50 $96.00 $140.40 NO BID $141.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Federal Mogul Rainy Day Carquest Trico 16-51 ANCO 31-16 Trico 16-1

RDB16

29. Wiper Blades, Anco 31-18
Bid Price Unit 30 each $2.75 $3.68 $4.68 $5.05

Total $82.50 $110.40 $140.40 $151.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Federal Mogul Rainy Day Carquest Trico 18-51 ANCO 31-18 Trico 18-1

RDB18

30. Wiper Blades, Anco 31-19
Bid Price Unit 30 each $2.75 $3.68 $5.17 $5.05

Total $82.50 $110.40 $155.10 $151.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Federal Mogul Rainy Day Carquest Trico 19-51 ANCO 31-19 Trico 19-1

RDB19

31. Wiper Blades, Anco 31-20
Bid Price Unit 30 each $2.75 $3.68 $5.76 $5.15

Total $82.50 $110.40 $172.80 $154.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Federal Mogul Rainy Day Carquest Trico 20.51 ANCO 31-20 Trico 20-1

RDB20
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32. Wiper Blades, Anco 31-22
Bid Price Unit 300 each $2.97 $4.58 $6.37 $5.75

Total $891.00 $1,374.00 $1,911.00 $1,725.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Federal Mogul Rainy Day Carquest Trico 22-51 ANCO 31-22 Trico 22-1

RDB22

33. Wiper Blades, Anco 31-24
Bid Price Unit 30 each $2.97 NO BID $6.62 $7.50

Total $89.10 $198.60 $225.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Federal Mogul Rainy Day ANCO 31-24 Trico 24-1

RDB24

34. AC Accumulator, Four Seasons 33093
Bid Price Unit 40 each $34.46 $22.69 $41.83 $59.70 $46.00

Total $1,378.40 $907.60 $1,673.20 $2,388.00 $1,840.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Four Seasons 33093 Carquest/Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons

208415 33093 F7AZ19C836AA 33093

35. AC Air Compressor, Four Seasons 58129;
NEW ONLY
Bid Price Unit 40 each $186.01 $128.68 $208.81 $230.42 $197.00

Core Charge $0.00 new $0.00 $36.45 $0.00
Total $186.01 $128.68 $208.81 $193.97 $197.00
Net Bid Price $7,440.40 $5,147.20 $8,352.40 $7,758.80 $7,880.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Motorcraft YCC176 Carquest/Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons 58129
273147 58129 F34Z19V703

AARM
36. AC Evaporator Core, Four Seasons 54549

Bid Price Unit 40 each $89.01 $108.42 $119.04 $141.25 $112.00
Total $3,560.40 $4,336.80 $4,761.60 $5,650.00 $4,480.00

Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Four Seasons 54549 Carquest/Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons
288173 54549 F1VZ 19860 BA 54549
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37. AC Orifice Tube, Four Seasons 38639
Bid Price Unit 40 each $1.98 $1.41 $3.50 $2.59 $5.00

Total $79.20 $56.40 $140.00 $103.60 $200.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Four Seasons 38639 Carquest/Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons 38639

207319 38639 F5DZ 19D990AB

38. AC Hose, Four Seasons 55719
Bid Price Unit 40 each $17.98 $18.43 $20.23 $23.87 $21.00

Total $719.20 $737.20 $809.20 $954.80 $840.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Four Seasons 55719 Carquest/Four Seasons Four Seasons Ford OE Four Seasons 55719

200925 55719 F5VY19835A

39. Fan Clutch, Ford F6AZ8A616AA ITEMS 39 - 57
Bid Price Unit 6 each $66.69 $48.77 ITEMS 39 - 44 $89.68 NO BID

Total $400.14 $292.62 NO BID $538.08
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Four Seasons 38888 Hayden 77272 ---

40. Brake Master Cyl, Ford F7AZ2140DA
Bid Price Unit 24 each $94.30 $86.11 $199.57

Total $2,263.20 $2,066.64 $4,789.68
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 83-34099 Carquest/Raybestos ---

E 15162

41. Brake Master Cyl, Ford F87AZ2140AAA
Bid Price Unit 24 each $72.92 $67.60 $115.61

Total $1,750.08 $1,622.40 $2,774.64
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ARI 83-34095 Carquest/Raybestos ---

E151561
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42. Blower Resistor, Ford E3AZ19A706A
Bid Price Unit 6 each ITEMS 42 - 44 ITEMS 42 - 44 $14.14

Total NO BID NO BID $84.84
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

43. Bearing, Ford F4DZ3517A
Bid Price Unit 30 each $4.89

Total $146.70
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

44. Bearing, Ford F4DZ3517C
Bid Price Unit 30 each $6.28

Total $188.40
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

45. 02 Sensor, Ford F5MZ9F472B
Bid Price Unit 50 each $33.38 $34.93 $26.32 $48.87

Total $1,669.00 $1,746.50 $1,316.00 $2,443.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Denso 234-4609 Carquest Bosch Standard ---

75-2795 SG177T

46. DPFE Sensor, Ford F6PZ9J460AA
Bid Price Unit 50 each NO BID NO BID NO BID $67.02

Total $3,351.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---
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47. 02 Sensor, Ford F6DZ9G444B
Bid Price Unit 50 each $38.53 $34.11 $37.49 $59.28

Total $1,926.50 $1,705.50 $1,874.50 $2,964.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Denso 234-4127 Carquest/Bosch Standard ---

75-1650 SG145

48. EGR Valve, Ford XL3Z9D475BA
Bid Price Unit 50 each $25.79 ITEMS 48 - 65 $36.77 $37.76

Total $1,289.50 NO BID $1,838.50 $1,888.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Standard EGV464 Standard ---

EGV464

49. EGR Solenoid, Ford F63Z9J459AA
Bid Price Unit 50 each ITEMS 49 - 55 ITEMS 49 - 55 $20.67

Total NO BID NO BID $1,033.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

50. Lug Nut, Ford F8AZ1012AA
Bid Price Unit 250 each $1.87

Total $467.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

51. Wheel Center Cap, Ford F87Z1130GB
Bid Price Unit 60 each $18.62

Total $1,117.20
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---
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52. Hood Support, Ford F8A16C826AA
Bid Price Unit 30 each $30.83

Total $924.90
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

53. Rim, Ford F5AZ1007A
Bid Price Unit 24 each $82.41

Total $1,977.84
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

54. Rim, Ford F8AZ1007EA
Bid Price Unit 24 each $114.81

Total $2,755.44
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

55. Exhaust Insulator, Ford F6VZ5A242AA
Bid Price Unit 20 each $5.01

Total $100.20
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

56. Engine Mount, Ford F4AZ6038A
Bid Price Unit 30 each $18.97 $56.07 $50.02

Total $569.10 $1,682.10 $1,500.60
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Westar EM2860 Anchor PMJ 2806 ---

57. Engine Mount, Ford F4AZ6038B
Bid Price Unit 30 each $18.97 $58.86 $52.89

Total $569.10 $1,765.80 $1,586.70
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Westar EM2860 Anchor PMJ 2807 ---
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58. Thermostat, Carquest 31169
Bid Price Unit 100 each $4.18 $4.98 ITEMS 58 & 59 $5.00

Total $418.00 $498.00 NO BID $500.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Motorad 265-192 Parts Master Thermostat Stant 13399

31169

59. Thermostat Gasket, Carquest C31302
Bid Price Unit 100 each $0.22 $4.14 $4.00

Total $22.00 $414.00 $400.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Motorad M690 Fel-Pro 35489 Fel-Pro 35489

60. Oil Cooler Adapter, Ford F8AZ6881AA
Bid Price Unit 30 each ITEMS 60 - 64 ITEMS 60 & 61 $154.46 ITEMS 60 - 64

Total NO BID NO BID $4,633.80 NO BID
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

61. Oil Cooler Adapter Gasket, Ford
F6AZ6840AA
Bid Price Unit 30 each $9.55

Total $286.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: ---

62. Oil Cooler Hose, Ford 3W7Z6A715AA
Bid Price Unit 30 each $21.32 $93.45

Total $639.60 $2,803.50
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Dorman 625-200 ---

63. Radiator, Koyo A1737 ITEMS 63 - 65
Bid Price Unit 40 each $120.47 NO BID

Total $4,818.80
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Transpro Radiator

43-2410
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64. Radiator, Koyo A2157
Bid Price Unit 20 each $130.35

Total $2,607.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Transpro Radiator

43-1393

65. Tie Rod Sleeve, Moog ES3311S
Bid Price Unit 60 each $0.22 $9.74 $13.00

Total $13.20 $584.40 $780.00
Manufacturer's brand & part no.: Motorad M690 Moog ES3311S Moog ES3311S


