ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14566 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: JANUARY 21, 2005
For the furnishing and delivery of
COOLANT, BRKAE FLUID AND BRAKE BACON HAWAIIAN PACIFIC W.W. GRAINGER
CLEANER for the six-month period UNIVERSAL ISLES DETROIT INC.
beginning February 1, 2005 and ending CO. INC. PETROLEUM DIESEL-ALLISON
July 31, 2005 to the City and County of LLC COMPANY
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO.
1. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,
1-Gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 200 containers $25.84 NO BID $16.27 NO BID
Total $5,168.00 $3,254.00 1-5
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2780 Old World Industries
23512138
2. Ethylene Glycol, Phosphate-Free, Heavy
Duty Coolant, Concentrate, 55-Gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 32 drums $932.70 $499.40 $770.57
Total $29,846.40 $15,980.80 $24,658.24
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2741 Old World |Old World Industries
Industries, Inc. 23512139
98GG57
3. Propylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate,
1-Gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 80 containers $19.18 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,534.40 3-5 3-6

Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2830

4. Brake Fluid, Dot 3 in 12-0z containers
Bid Price Unit 45 containers $1.62
Total $72.90

Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnsens 2212
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BACON HAWAIIAN PACIFIC W.W. GRAINGER
UNIVERSAL ISLES DETROIT INC.
CO. INC. PETROLEUM DIESEL-ALLISON
LLC COMPANY
ITEM
NO.
5. Brake Fluid, Dot 3 in 1-gallon containers
Bid Price Unit 50 gallons $14.69
Total $734.50
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnsens 2234
6. Non-Chlorinated Brake Cleaner
Bid Price Unit 2500 containers $1.99 $2.11 $1.761
Total $4,975.00 $5,275.00 $4,402.50
Manufacturer and Part Number: CRC Industries Berryman CRC Model
5088 Products, Inc. No. 05084(5YK76)
B2421

19 oz container




