
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14548 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: DECEMBER 20, 2004
Reqn. Nos. G42325,35,542298,99,G50042,45,47

For the furnishing and delivery of Various CUTTER CUTTER HT&T TRUCK HAWTHORNE HONOLULU
Motor Vehicles, to the Environmental Quality DODGE INC. FORD, INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP FORD INC.
and Treatment and Disposal Division,
Department of Enviromental Serivces,
City and County of Honolulu.

ITEM
1. Two (2) Only, Compact, Cargo Van with

Full Windows
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Grand Ford Freestar Cargo Ford Freestar A54

Caravan SE Van

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 2 Units $24,621.72 $20,056.12 ITEMS 1 - 6 ITEMS 1 - 6 $20,403.32

Total $49,243.44 $40,112.24 $40,806.64

Manuals (One set of Five (5) Manuals $325.00 $416.66 $500.00

Subtotal for Item No. 1 $49,568.44 $40,528.90 $41,306.64

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $5,684.21 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
             City EPA MPG 19 18 18

2 Units $11,368.42 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $60,936.86 $52,528.90 $53,306.64

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
`2. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck

with Exended Cab
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dakota Club Cab Ford Ranger Ford Ranger R14

4 X 2 Supercab Pickup

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price Unit 1 Unit $18,972.80 $19,547.17 $19,356.04

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $6,352.94 $6,352.94 $6,352.94
             City EPA MPG 17 17 17

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $25,325.74 $25,900.11 $25,708.98

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
3. Two (2) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck

with Extended CAb and Toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dakota Club Cab Ford Ranger Ford Ranger R14

4 X 2 Supercab Pickup

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price:  Unit 2 Units $22,170.69 $22,227.98 $22,539.48

Total $44,341.38 $44,455.96 $45,078.96

Manuals (One et of Five (5) Manuals) $325.00 $416.66
$500.00

Subtotal for Item No. 3 $44,666.38 $44,872.62 $45,578.96

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $6,352.94 $6,352.94 $6,352.94
______City EPA MPG 17 17 17
X 2 Units $12,705.88 $12,705.88 $12,705.88

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $57,372.26 $57,578.50 $58,284.84

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
4. One (1) Only, 5,150 Lbs. GVWR 4-Door 

Crew Cab and Chassis with 5 Ft. Pickup 
Body, 4 x 4
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dakota Quad Cab Ford Explorer Sport Ford Explorer Sport Trac

4 X 4 Trac 50" Pickup Body

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 1 Unit $26,243.58 $23,602.09 $26,862.32

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00
______City EPA MPG 15 14 15
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $33,443.58 $30,802.09 $34,062.32

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days
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ITEM
5 One (1) Only, 6,100 Lbs. GVWR Truck Cab

and Chassis with 6 Ft. Pickup Body and 
Toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 1500 Ford F-150 Ford F150 F12

Reg Cab 4 x 2

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price Unit 1 Unit $25,769.63 $29,435.23 $26,387.85

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $8,307.69 N/A $7,200.00
______City EPA MPG 13 15

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $34,077.32 $33,587.85

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days

6. One (1)  Only, 11,400 Lb. GVWR, 4-Door 
Crew Cab and Chassis with 6 Ft. Pickup 
Body, 4 x 4
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 3500 Ford F-350 SID Crew Ford F350 W31

Quad Cab 4 x 4 SLT Pickup
Dually

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $38,804.96 $39,024.75 $37,467.35

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
7. One (1) Only, Truck Tractor 

Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID NO BID Peterbilt Model International 9400 NO BID
378 SBFA

Year of production model: 2006 2005
Bid Price $116,325.94 $105,676.10

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

8. One (1) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door,
4 x 2
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Durango 4 x 2 Ford Explorer NO BID NO BID Ford Explorer U62

XLS 2WD 4 Dr SUV

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $26,873.79 $25,268.59 $25,132.80
Bid Evaluation
Applicable information available X X X
Applicable informaiton not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $7,714.29 $6,750.00 $6,750.00
______City EPA MPG 14 16 16

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $34,588.08 $32,018.59 $31,882.80

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days


