ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14547 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:BECEMBER-16,20064- DECEMBER 13, 2004
For the furnishing and delivery of OFFICE
SUPPLIES for a the twelve-month period CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
beginning January 1, 2004 and ending ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
December 31, 2005 to the City and County INC. CO., LTD.
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO. GROUP |
1/2" Ring Size: (without sheet lifters)
1. Standard Round Ring
Bid Price Unit 350 each $1.18 $0.75 $0.92
Total $413.00 $262.50 $322.00
Brand and No.: Avery | Avery 03201, 03203, 03205,| Office Max L20M97139(be),
AVE-K31105-XX 03210 L2-OM97140(bk), L2-OM97142

(rd), Avery L2 K31105GY(gy)
Available Colors: black, blue, gray, red black, blue, grey, red

1" Ring Size: (without sheet lifters)
2. Standard Round Ring

Bid Price Unit 1,200 each $1.15 $0.75 $0.85
Total $1,380.00 $900.00 $1,020.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 03300, 03301, 03304, Office Max L20M97149(be),
AVE-K31110-XX 03305, 03307, 03310 L20OM97151(bk), L2-OM97154
(rd), Avery L2-K31110GY
Available Colors: black, blue, gray, red blue, black, green, grey,
maroon, red
3. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 200 each $3.66 $2.90 $2.28
Total $732.00 $580.00 $456.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 79989, 79889, 79499, | Avery L2SR11-10-color code
AVE-79-X89 79589

Available Colors: black, blue, gray, red black, blue, grey, red be=blue, black=bk, red=rd
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. 1-1/2" Ring Size: (without sheet lifters)
4. Standard Round Ring
Bid Price Unit 500 each $1.98 $1.28 $1.53
Total $990.00 $640.00 $765.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 03400, 63401, 03404, | Office Max L2-OM97143(be),
AVE-K31115-XX 03405, 03407, 03410 L20M97145(bk), L2-OM97148
(rd), Avery - L2K31115GY
Available Color: black, blue, gray, red blue, black, green, grey,
maroon, red
5. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 200 each $4.53 $3.61 $3.31
Total $906.00 $722.00 $662.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 79985, 79885, 79495 |Avery - L2 SR1115-color code
AVE-79-X85 79585
Available Color: black, blue, gray, red black, blue, grey, red be=blue, black=bk, red=rd
2" Ring Size: (without sheet lifters)
6. Standard Round Ring
Bid Price Unit 900 each $2.30 $1.51 $1.78
Total $2,070.00 $1,359.00 $1,602.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 03501, 03500, 03505,| Officemax L2-OM97155(be),
AVE-K31120-XX 03510, 03504, 03507 |L2-OM97157(bk), L2-OM97160
(rd), Avery L2-K31120GY
Available Color: black, blue, gray, red| black, blue, grey, red, green,
maroon
7. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 400 each $5.34 $4.25 $3.69
Total $2,136.00 $1,700.00 $1,476.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 79982, 79882, 79492, | Avery L2-SR11-20 color code
AVE-79-X82 79582

Available Color:

black, blue, gray, red

black, blue, grey, red

blue=be, black=bk, red=rd
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. 3" Ring Size: (without sheet lifters)
8. Standard Round Ring
Bid Price Unit 500 each $3.99 $2.55 $3.10
Total $1,995.00 $1,275.00 $1,550.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 03602, 03601, 03606, | Officemax L2-OM97161(be),
AVE-K31125-XX 06308, 03605, 03607 |L20M97163(bk), L20OM97166
(rd), Avery L2K31125GY(gy)
Available Color: black, blue, gray, red | black, blue, grey, red, green,
maroon
9. Slant-D Ring
Bid Price Unit 300 each $7.96 $6.35 $5.00
Total $2,388.00 $1,905.00 $1,500.00
Brand and No.: Avery| Avery 79983, 79883, 79493,| Avery L2-SR1130-color code
AVE-79-X83 79583
Available Color: black, blue, gray, red black, blue, grey, red blue=be, black=bk, red=rd
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP I: $13,010.00 $9,343.50 $9,353.00
GROUP I
a. UNRULED; COLOR (Blue, canary,
cherry, and green):
10. 3" x 5"; 10 pkg. (1M)/box
Bid Price Unit 50 box $7.13 NO BID $4.82
Total $356.50 10 - 20 $241.00
Brand and No.: Esselte ESS-7320BLU, CAN, Esselte F3 7320
CHE, GRE (blue,can,che,gre)
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. b. UNRULED; WHITE:
11. 3" x 5"; 10 pkg. (1M)/box
Bid Price Unit 50 box $4.06 $3.59
Total $203.00 $179.50

12.

13.

14.

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II:

GROUP Il

A. CLIP, METAL, BINDER:

Medium size

Bid Price Unit 50 box
Total

Brand and No.:

Large size

Bid Price Unit 50 box
Total

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP Il A:

B. CLIP, METAL, PAPER

Size 3

Bid Price Unit 100 pk
Total

Brand and No.:

Esselte ESS-30

$559.50

NO BID
12 & 13

$1.43

$143.00
Charles Leonard
LEO-501

Officemax F3 OM97204

$420.50

$8.47
$423.50
Gem H4 11220

$14.00
$700.00
Gem H4 11240

$1,123.50

$1.54
$154.00
Chas. Leonard H4 501
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
15. Size 1
Bid Price Unit 500 pk $0.96 $1.03
Total $480.00 $515.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Chas. Leonard H4 201E
LEO-201E
16. Giant
Bid Price Unit 400 pk $2.85 $3.16
Total $1,140.00 $1,264.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Chas. Leonard H4 301E
LEO-301E
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP Il B: $1,763.00 $1,933.00
C. CLIP, VINYL COATED
17. Size 2
Bid Price Unit 100 pk $0.42 $0.45
Total $42.00 $45.00
Brand and No.: Acco ACC72522 Acco H4 - 72522
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP Il C: $42.00 $45.00
D. CLIP, BINDER
18. 3/4" width, 3/8" capacity
Bid Price Unit 3,000 box $0.20 $0.18
Total $600.00 $540.00

Brand and No.:

Charles Leonard
LEO-BCO02

Officemax H4 OM 97413
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
19. 1-1/4" width, 5/8" capacity
Bid Price Unit 1,500 box $0.39 $0.43
Total $585.00 $645.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Officemax H4 OM 97008
LEO-BC-05
20. 2" width, 1" capacity
Bid Price Unit 500 box $0.97 $1.09
Total $485.00 $545.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Officemax H4 OM 97414
LEO-BC10
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP Il D: $1,670.00 $1,730.00
GROUP IV
21. 1" capacity
Bid Price Unit 200 box $1.09 $1.14 $1.15
Total $218.00 $228.00 $230.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard R10 Chas Leonard L2-R-10
LEO-R-10
22. 2" capacity
Bid Price Unit 500 box $1.30 $1.38 $1.40
Total $650.00 $690.00 $700.00

Brand and No.:

Charles Leonard
LEO-R-20

Charles Leonard R20

Chas Leonard L2-R-20
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. BASE ONLY WITH PRONGS
23. 1" capacity
Bid Price Unit 100 box $1.35 $1.44 $1.46
Total $135.00 $144.00 $146.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard B11 Chas Leoanrd L2-B11
LEO-B11
24. 2" capacity
Bid Price Unit 200 box $1.58 $1.68 $1.70
Total $316.00 $336.00 $340.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard B21 Chas Leonard H4 B21
LEO-B-21
COMPRESSOR ONLY
25. Compressor
Bid Price Unit 50 box $1.59 $1.68 $1.70
Total $79.50 $84.00 $85.00
Brand and No.: Charles Leonard Charles Leonard C1 Officemax H4-OM97439
LEO-C-1
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP |V: $1,398.50 $1,482.00 $1,501.00
GROUP V
a. 1/3 cut position
26. 9-1/2" high x 11-3/4" wide; letter
Bid Price Unit 300 box $12.50 NO BID $9.38
Total $3,750.00 26 - 29 $2,814.00
Brand and No.: Smead Esselte F1 772 1/3

SMD-YSP 17482
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
27. 9-1/2" high x 14-3/4" wide; legal
Bid Price Unit 400 box $13.75 $11.20
Total $5,500.00 $4,480.00
Brand and No.: Smead Esselte F1 773 1/3
SMD-YSP 17483
b. 1/2 cut position
28. 9-1/2" high x 11-3/4" wide; letter
Bid Price Unit 500 box $12.50 $9.38
Total $6,250.00 $4,690.00
Brand and No.: Smead Esselte F1 772 1/2
SMD-YSP-17503
29. 9-1/2" high x 14-3/4" wide; legal
Bid Price Unit 100 box $13.75 $11.20
Total $1,375.00 $1,120.00
Brand and No.: Smead Esselte F1 773 1/2
SMD-YSP-17481
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $16,875.00 $13,104.00
GROUP VI
30. Memo Books
Bid Price Unit 8,000 each $0.85 $0.69 NO BID
Total $6,800.00 $5,520.00
Brand and No.: Ampad Ampad 261500
AMP-261500
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VI: $6,800.00 $5,520.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP VII
31. Notebook
Bid Price Unit 800 pkg $7.85 $6.36 $7.13
Total $6,280.00 $5,088.00 $5,704.00
Brand and No.: Everett Mead MEA43080 Tops P3-74688
EPP-78-908
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII: $6,280.00 $5,088.00 $5,704.00
GROUP VI
A. "POST IT" NOTES
32. 1-3/8" x 1-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 800 pack $3.49 $3.54 $3.34
Total $2,792.00 $2,832.00 $2,672.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-653-YW 3M 653RPYW 3M A2-653YW
3M 653RPA
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
asst: blue, yellow, pink, green
33. 1-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 500 pack $6.24 $6.24 $5.88
Total $3,120.00 $3,120.00 $2,940.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-656-YW 3M 656RPYW 3M A2 656YW
3M 656RPA
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
assorted: blue, yellow, pink,
34. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8" green
Bid Price Unit 5,000 pad $0.68 $0.70 $0.65
Total $3,400.00 $3,500.00 $3,250.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-654-YW 3M 654RPYW 3M A2-654YW
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
35. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8", ruled blue lines
Bid Price Unit 50 pack $4.30 $4.15 $4.13
Total $215.00 $207.50 $206.50
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-630-YW 3M 6306PK 3M A2 6306PK
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
36. 2-7/8" x 3-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 300 pad $0.82 $0.77 $0.76
Total $246.00 $231.00 $228.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-657-YW 3M 657 3M A2 657YW
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
37. 2-7/8" x 4-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 3,000 pad $0.91 $0.93 $0.87
Total $2,730.00 $2,790.00 $2,610.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-655-YW 3M 655RPYW 3M A2-655YW
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII A: $12,503.00 $12,680.50 $11,906.50
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ITEM
NO. B. "POST IT" NOTES
38. 1/2"x 2"
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

39. 1"x 3"
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand and No.:
Available Colors:
40. 2-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

200 pack

100 pack

200 pack

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII B:

CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO,, LTD.
$2.92 $2.82 $2.80
$584.00 $564.00 $560.00
3M MMM-670-5AN 3M 6705AN 3M A2-6705AN
3M A26705AU

asst. neon

$1.34
$134.00
3M MMM-671-4AN

asst. neon

$4.09
$818.00
3M MMM-654-5PK

asst. neon

$1,536.00

assorted per above

$1.70
$170.00
3M 6713AF

assorted

$3.95
$790.00
3M 6545 AQ, CL, PK, SB, UC

asst. aquatic, asst. classic,
asst. neon, asst. subbrite,
asst. ultra
$1,524.00

asst neon colors
asst ultra colors

$1.28

$128.00

3M A2-6714AN
A2-6714AU

asst neon
asst ultra

$3.93

$786.00

3M A2-654-5PK
A2 654-5UC

asst neon
asst ultra

$1,474.00
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ITEM

NO. C. "POSTIT"NOTES

41. 1-3/8"x 1-7/8"
Bid Price

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

42. 1-7/8" x 2-7/8"
Bid Price

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

43. 2-7/8"x 2-7/8"
Bid Price

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

Unit 100 pack
Total
Unit 300 pack
Total
Unit 300 pack
Total

44. 3-7/8" x 5-7/8", ruled blue lines

Bid Price

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

Unit 100 pack
Total

CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
$3.62 $3.54 $3.47
$362.00 $354.00 $347.00
3M MMM-653-RP 3M 653RPYW 3M A2-653RP YW
yellow yellow yellow
$0.56 $0.52 $0.51
$168.00 $156.00 $153.00
3M MMM-656-RP 3M 656RPYW 3M A2-656RP YW
yellow yellow yellow
$0.73 $0.70 $0.69
$219.00 $210.00 $207.00
3M MMM-654-RP 3M 654RPYW 3M A2-654RP YW
yellow yellow yellow
$7.30 $7.07 $7.03
$730.00 $707.00 $703.00
3M MMM-660-RPA 3M 660RPA 3M A2-660RPA

asst.

asst. yellow, green, pink, blue

asst = yw, gn, pk, be
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
45. 2-7/8" x 4-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 150 pack $0.96 $0.93 $0.92
Total $144.00 $139.50 $138.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-655-RP 3M 655RPYW 3M A2-654RPYW
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
46. 3-7/8" x 5-7/8"
Bid Price Unit 200 pack $1.47 $1.42 $1.41
Total $294.00 $284.00 $282.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-660-RP 3M 660RPYW 3M A2-660-RPYW
Available Colors: yellow yellow yellow
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII C: $1,917.00 $1,850.50 $1,830.00
GROUP IX
PAPER ROLL, ADDING MACHINE
47. 2-9/32" (1-1/4") width; not less than 200
Bid Price Unit 1,000 roll $0.65 NO BID NO BID
Total $650.00 47 - 51 47 - 50
Brand and No.: Everett
EPP-53-160
48. 2-9/32" (1-1/4") width; not less than 165'
Bid Price Unit 1,200 roll $0.49
Total $588.00
Brand and No.: Everett

EPP-53-900
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
49. 2-3/4" width; not less than 165
Bid Price Unit 200 roll $0.65
Total $130.00
Brand and No.: Everett
EPP-53-107
50. 2-3/4" width; not less than 200"
Bid Price Unit 400 roll $0.90
Total $360.00
Brand and No.: Everett
EPP-53-168
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IX: $1,728.00
GROUP X
51. No. 2; medium soft lead
Bid Price Unit 1,000 doz $0.96 $1.10
Total $960.00 $1,100.00
Brand and No.: Sanford Berol N5-02097
SAN-02097
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP X: $960.00 $1,100.00
GROUP XI
A. PEN, BALL POINT
a. Fine point
52. Black
Bid Price Unit 400 doz $4.05 $4.08 $4.05
Total $1,620.00 $1,632.00 $1,620.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BKOOA Pentel N1-BK90A

PEN-BK90A
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
53. Blue
Bid Price Unit 100 doz $4.05 $4.08 $4.05
Total $405.00 $408.00 $405.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BKO0OC Pentel N1-BK90C
PEN-BK90C
54. Red
Bid Price Unit 200 doz $4.05 $4.08 $4.05
Total $810.00 $816.00 $810.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BKO0OB Pentel N1-BK90B
PEN-BK90B
b. Medium point
55. Black
Bid Price Unit 1,500 doz $4.04 $4.08 $4.05
Total $6,060.00 $6,120.00 $6,075.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK91A Pentel N1-BK91A
PEN-BK91A
56. Blue
Bid Price Unit 200 doz $4.05 $4.08 $4.05
Total $810.00 $816.00 $810.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pental BK91C Pentel N1-BK91C
PEN-BK91C
57. Red
Bid Price Unit 400 doz $4.05 $4.08 $4.05
Total $1,620.00 $1,632.00 $1,620.00
Brand and No.: Pentel Pentel BK91B Pentel N1-BK91B
PEN-BK91B
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI A: $11,325.00 $11,424.00 $11,340.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. B. PEN, BALL POINT
a. Fine point
58. Black
Bid Price Unit 600 doz $6.57 $6.60 $6.45
Total $3,942.00 $3,960.00 $3,870.00
Brand and No.: Pilot Pilot 32210 Pilot N1-32210
PIL-32210
b. Medium point
59. Black
Bid Price Unit 2,000 doz $6.57 $6.60 $6.45
Total $13,140.00 $13,200.00 $12,900.00
Brand and No.: Pilot Pilot 32220 Pilot N1-32220
PIL-32220
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XI B: $17,082.00 $17,160.00 $16,770.00
GROUP Xl
Ribbon, Typewriter
60. Correctable Ribbon Cassette
Bid Price Unit 300 box $16.50 $13.20 $16.25
Total $4,950.00 $3,960.00 $4,875.00
Brand and No.: Nukote General Ribbon 7344 Nukote 52-B192
NUK-B192
61. Lift-off Tape Cassette
Bid Price Unit 200 box $13.20 $2.10 $11.94
Total $2,640.00 $420.00 $2,388.00
Brand and No.: Nukote General Ribbon 7350L0O Nukote 52-192LT
NUK-192LT
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XII: $7,590.00 $4,380.00 $7,263.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP Xl
A. STAPLE
62. Staple, Paper Fastening
Bid Price Unit 2,000 box $1.27 NO BID NO BID
Total $2,540.00 62 - 65 62 - 65
Brand and No.: Ace
ACE-72025
B. STAPLER
63. Stapler, Paper Fastening
Bid Price Unit 400 each $13.18
Total $5,272.00
Brand and No.: Ace
ACE-05021
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP Xlll: $7,812.00
GROUP XIV
TABLET, WRITING
64. 8-1/2" x 11, letter
Bid Price Unit 300 pkg $7.50
Total $2,250.00
Brand and No.: Tops
TOP 75-381
65. 8" x 12-1/2", legal
Bid Price Unit 300 pkg $8.64
Total $2,592.00
Brand and No.: Everett
EPP 74-8 20

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XIV:

$4,842.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP XV
A. Tape, Box Sealing
66. 48mm x 50m
Bid Price Unit 200 roll $5.33 $5.13 $5.10
Total $1,066.00 $1,026.00 $1,020.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-355-2-TN 3M 355TN48MM 3M A8-355-48MMTN
67. 48mm x 50m
Bid Price Unit 400 roll $5.33 $5.13 $5.10
Total $2,132.00 $2,052.00 $2,040.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-355-2-CR 3M 355CR48MM 3M A8-355-48MMCR
68. 72mm x 50m
Bid Price Unit 100 roll $7.99 $7.70 $7.66
Total $799.00 $770.00 $766.00

69.

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV A:

B. Tape, Transparent Cellophane

1/2" x 1296"

Bid Price Unit 400 roll
Total

Brand and No.:

3M MMM-355-3-CR

$3,997.00

$1.05
$420.00
3M MMM-600-12-1296

3M 355CR72MM

$3,848.00

$1.02
$408.00
3M 60012X1296

3M A8-355-72MMCR

$3,826.00

$1.01
$404.00
3M A8 600-1296 1/2
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.

ITEM
NO.
70. 3/4" x 1296"

Bid Price Unit 2,500 roll $1.46 $1.40 $1.39

Total $3,650.00 $3,500.00 $3,475.00

71.

72.

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV B:

C. Tape, Double-Coated

1/2" X 1296"

Bid Price Unit 400 roll
Total

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV C:

D. Tape, Glass Filament

24mm x 50m

Bid Price Unit 200 roll
Total

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV D:

3M MMM-600-34-1296

$4,070.00

$3.64
$1,456.00
3M MMM-665-12-1296

$1,456.00

$6.81
$1,362.00
3M MMM-898-BX

$1,362.00

3M 60034X1296

$3,908.00

$3.51
$1,404.00
3M 66512X1296

$1,404.00

$6.56
$1,312.00
3M 898BX24

$1,312.00

3M A8-600-1296 3/4

$3,879.00

$3.49
$1,396.00
3M A8 665 1/2

$1,396.00

$6.52
$1,304.00
3M A9-898-1

$1,304.00
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. E. Tape, Masking
73. 1/2" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 100 roll $1.30 NO BID NO BID
Total $130.00 73-77 73-77
Brand and No.: Shuford
SHU-R050
74. 3/4" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 100 roll $1.75
Total $175.00
Brand and No.: Shuford
SHU-R075
75. 1" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 800 roll $2.10
Total $1,680.00
Brand and No.: Shuford
SHU-R100
76. 1-1/2" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 200 roll $3.30
Total $660.00
Brand and No.: Shuford
SHU-R150
77. 2" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 1,500 roll $4.50
Total $6,750.00
Brand and No.: Shuford
SHU-R200

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV E:

$9,395.00
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INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO. F. Tape, Masking
78. 3/4" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 50 roll $2.65 $2.56 $2.54
Total $132.50 $128.00 $127.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-232-3/4 3M 23234 3M A9-232-3/4
79. 2" x 60 yds.
Bid Price Unit 50 roll $6.58 $6.34 $6.30
Total $329.00 $317.00 $315.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-232-2 3M 2322 3M A8-232-2
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV F: $461.50 $445.00 $442.00
G. Tape, Mending
80. 3/4" x 1296"
Bid Price Unit 2,500 roll $1.68 $1.62 $1.60
Total $4,200.00 $4,050.00 $4,000.00

81.

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV G:

H. Tape, Mending

1/2" x 1296"

Bid Price Unit 50 roll
Total

Brand and No.:

3M MMM-810-34-1296

$4,200.00

$1.45
$72.50
3M MMM-811-12-1296

3M 81034X1296

$4,050.00

$1.40
$70.00
3M 81112X1296

3M A8-810-1296-3/4

$4,000.00

$1.39
$69.50
3M A8-811-1296-1/2
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CONRAD HAWAII HOPACO
ENTERPRISES STATIONERY
INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
82. 3/4" x 1296"
Bid Price Unit 100 roll $1.89 $1.83 $1.81
Total $189.00 $183.00 $181.00

83.

84.

85.

Brand and No.:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV H:

I. "Post It" Tape Flags

1" x1.7"

Bid Price Unit 1,000 disp
Total

Brand and No.:

Available Colors:

39x1.7"

Bid Price Unit 400 disp
Total

Brand and No.:

Available Colors

Arrow Flag

Bid Price Unit 70 disp
Total

Brand and No.:

Available Colors

3M MMM-811-34-1296

$261.50

$1.35

$1,350.00

3M MMM-608-1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6,
8,21,22,23

red, blue, green orange,
yellow, white

$2.65

$1,060.00
3M-MMM-683-4
3M MMM-683-4AB

red, blue, yellow, green
fl. yel, purple, pink, blue

$1.95

$136.50

3M MMM-684-ARR3
3M MMM-684-ARR4

red, blue, yellow, green
fl. pink, brt, grn, fl. yel, brt. blue

3M 81134X1296

$253.00

$1.21

$1,210.00

3M 6801, 6802, 6803, 6804,
6805, 6806, 6808, 68021,
68022, 68023

red, blue, green, orange, yellow
wht, purple, brt. pink, brt. green
brt. blue

$2.45

$980.00

3M 6834

3M 6834AB

red, blue, green, yellow
fluorescent yellow, purple,
pink, blue

$1.84

$128.80

3M 684ARR3

684ARR4

red, blue, yellow, green

fluorescent pink, green, yellow, blue

3M A8-811-1296-3/4

$250.50

$1.20
$1,200.00
3M A2 680-color code

1=red, 2=blue, 3=green, 4=
orange, 5=yellow, 6=white, 8=
purple, 21=brite pink

$2.44

$976.00

3M-A2-683-4

3M-A2683-4AB

red, blue, green, yellow
fluorescent yellow, purple, pink
brite blue

$1.83

$128.10

3M A2 684ARR3
3M A2 684ARR4

red, blue, yellow, green
brite blue, yellow, green, pink
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INC. CO., LTD.
ITEM
NO.
86. "Sign Here", 47" x 1.7"
Bid Price Unit 200 disp $2.95 $2.81 $2.79
Total $590.00 $562.00 $558.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-684-SH 3M 6845H 3M A2-684-SH
87. "Sign Here", 1" x 1.7"
Bid Price Unit 700 disp $1.50 $1.40 $1.39
Total $1,050.00 $980.00 $973.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-680-9 3M 6809 3M A2 680-9
88. "Note", 1" x 1.7"
Bid Price Unit 300 disp $1.50 $1.40 $1.39
Total $450.00 $420.00 $417.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-680-10 3M 68010 3M A2 680-10
89. Index Tabs

Bid Price Unit 100 disp $3.25 $3.06 $3.04
Total $325.00 $306.00 $304.00
Brand and No.: 3M MMM-686-RYB 3M 686RYB 3M A2-686RYB
3M MMM-686-PGO 686P60 3M 686PGO

Available Colors:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV I:

red, yellow, blue
fl. pink, green, orange

$4,961.50

red, yellow, blue
pink, green, orange

$4,586.80

red, yellow, blue
pink, green, orange

$4,556.10
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ITEM
NO. GROUP XVI
90. Calendar Pad
Bid Price Unit 1,500 each $0.65 $0.53 $0.55
Total $975.00 $795.00 $825.00
Brand and No.: At-A-Glance At-A-Glance E717R50 AAG E717R50
AAG-E717-50-06 Note: Recycled
91. Calendar Pad Stand
Bid Price Unit 100 each $6.00 $1.51 $1.58
Total $600.00 $151.00 $158.00
Brand and No.: At-A-Glance At-A-Glance R1700 AAG K3-E1700
AAG-E17-00-06 Note: Recycled
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XVI: $1,575.00 $946.00 $983.00




