
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14526 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: NOVEMBER 29, 2004
Reqn. Nos. G32652,54-57,59,64-66

For the furnishing and delivery of Various
Motor Vehicles, CIP - 2004, to the CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD INC. HONOLULU FORD INC.
Department of Parks and Recreation,
City and County of Honolulu.

ITEM
1. One (1) Only, Compact, 7-Passenger Van

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Grand Caravan SEFord Freestar WGN Ford Freestar A50
RSKL53

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 1 Unit $28,891.48 $26,278.56 $24,607.00
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

       Applicable information available X X X
       Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.40 = $4,421.05 $4,666.67 $4,941.18
             City EPA MPG 19 18 17
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $33,312.53 $30,945.23 $29,548.18

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days



PROPOSAL NO. 14526
Page 2 CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD INC. HONOLULU FORD INC.

ITEM

2. One (1) Only, Compact, Sport Utility Vehicle, ITEMS 2-4 - NO BID
2-Door, 4 x 4
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Jeep Wrangler Unlimited 4x4 SUV NO BID

Year of production model: 2005
Bid Price Unit 1 Unit $29,191.48

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

___ Applicable information available X
___ Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.40 = $5,250.00
             City EPA MPG 16

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $34,441.48

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
3. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Dakota Club Cab 4x2 Ford Ranger R10
NDlL33 Truck

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price:  Unit 1 Unit $19,498.00 $19,147.00

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.40 = $4,941.18 $4,941.18
______City EPA MPG 17 17
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $24,439.18 $24,088.18

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days



PROPOSAL NO. 14526
Page 4 CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD INC. HONOLULU FORD INC.

ITEM

4. Three (3) Only, Sub-compact, Pickup Truck
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Dakota Club Cab 4x2 Ford Ranger R10

NDlL33 PU/Truck

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 3 Units $19,337.38 $18,907.80

Total $58,012.14 $56,723.40
Manuals:  (One set of Five (5) Manuals) $325.00 $350.00

Subtotal for Item No. 4 $58,337.14 $57,073.40

BID EVALUATION - Plese check one (1):
___Applicable information available X X
___Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.40 = $4,941.18 $4,941.18
______City EPA MPG 17 17
X 3 Units $14,823.54 $14,823.54
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $73,160.68 $71,896.94

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days
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ITEM

5. One (1) Only, Subcompact, Pickup Truck with
Exended Cab
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Dakota Club Cab 4x2 Ford Ranger Supercab Pickup Ford Ranger R14

NDK33 PU/Truck

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price Unit 1 Unit $20,435.29 $20,852.55 $19,911.40

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.40 = $4,941.18 $4,941.18 $4,941.18
______City EPA MPG 17 17 17
X 1 Unit
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $25,376.47 $25,793.73 $24,852.58

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days
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ITEM

6. One (1)  Only, 6,400 Lb. GVWR Truck
Extended Cab & Chassis with 5-1/2 Feet
Pickup Body & Side Packs
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 1500 Quad Cab 4x2 Ford F-150 Supercab Pickup Ford F150 X12

6650 GVWR 6.3 Body DRlL41

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $26,455.04 $30,433.74 $27,220.52
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.40 = $6,000.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00
______City EPA MPG 14 15 15
X 1 Unit
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $32,455.04 $36,033.74 $32,820.52
Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days
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ITEM

7. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab 
and Chassis with Service Body Electric
Hydraulic Tailgate
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford F-250 S/D Cab & Chassis Ford F250 F20

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price $41,334.42 $40,088.15

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

8. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with Service Body, 100 Gallon
Transfer Tank and Electric Hydraulic Tailgate
Manufacturer's make and model no.: NO BID Ford F-250 S/D Cab & Chassis Ford F250 F20

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price $43,193.79 $42,910.71
Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days


