
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14488 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: OCTOBER 15, 2004
Reqn. Nos. G57312-G57317, G57319,G57321

For the furnishing and delivery of Various CUTTER CUTTER HT&T TRUCK HAWTHORNE HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE
Motor Vehicles, to the Division of Road DODGE INC. FORD INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP FORD INC. AUTO CENTER
Maintenance, Department of Facility
Maintenance, City and County of Honolulu.

ITEM
1. Three (3) Only, Subcompact, 4-Door Sedan

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Neon 4 Dr Ford Focus Ford Focus 134 Ford Focus P34
Sedan SXT PLDP41  4 Door

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 3 Units $15,624.90 $17,538.83 ITEMS 1 - 7 ITEMS 1 - 7 $15,470.00 $16,352.00

Total $46,874.70 $52,616.49 NO BID NO BID $46,410.00 $49,056.00
Manuals:  One (1) Set $1,625.00 $375.00 $675.00 $170.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 1: $48,499.70 $52,991.49 $47,085.00 $49,226.00

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

       Applicable information available X X X X
       Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $4,320.00 $4,153.85 $4,153.85 $3,375.00
             City EPA MPG 25 26 26 32
X 3 Units $12,960.00 $12,461.55 $12,461.55 $10,125.00
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $61,459.70 $65,453.04 $59,546.55 $59,351.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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DODGE INC. FORD INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP FORD INC. AUTO CENTER

ITEM

2. One (1) Only, Compact, Sport Utility Vehicle,
4-Door, 4 x 2
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Jeep Liberty Sport Ford Excape XLT SUV Ford Escape 4 D NO BID

4-DR 4X2 KJTH74 4X2 UO3

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price Unit 1 Unit $22,789.44 $23,666.91 $23,292.88

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

___ Applicable information available X X X
___ Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $6,352.94 $5,400.00 $5,400.00
             City EPA MPG 17 20 20

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $29,142.38 $29,066.91 $28,692.88

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days



PROPOSAL NO. 14488
Page 3 CUTTER CUTTER HT&T TRUCK HAWTHORNE HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE
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ITEM
3. Three (3) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door,

4-Wheel Drive
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Durango Ford Explorer 4 WD Ford Explorer 4D Ford Explorer U72

ST 4X4 HB5M74 4DR SUV 4X4 U72

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price:  Unit 3 Units $27,787.32 $27,800.37 $27,166.00 $29,288.00

Total $83,361.96 $83,401.11 $81,498.00 $87,864.00
Manuals:  One (1) Set $1,625.00 $375.00 $675.00 $170.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 3 $84,986.96 $83,776.11 $82,173.00 $88,034.00

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $7,714.29 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $5,400.00
______City EPA MPG 14 15 15 20
X 3 Units $23,142.87 $21,600.00 $21,600.00 $16,200.00
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $108,129.83 $105,376.11 $103,773.00 $104,234.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days



PROPOSAL NO. 14488
Page 4 CUTTER CUTTER HT&T TRUCK HAWTHORNE HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE

DODGE INC. FORD INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP FORD INC. AUTO CENTER

ITEM

4. Two (2) Only, 6,100 GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis with 6 Ft. Pickup Body ITEMS 4 - 10
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram RFG CAB Ford F-150 4WD Ford F150 4X4 F14 NO BID

4X4 SLT DR6H61

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 2 Units $28,143.57 $29,059.15 $26,937.64

Total $56,287.14 $58,118.30 $53,875.28
Manuals:  One (1) Set $1,625.00 $375.00 $675.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 4 $57,912.14 $58,493.30 $54,550.28

BID EVALUATION - Plese check one (1):
___Applicable information available X X X
___Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $8,307.69 $7,714.29 $9,000.00
______City EPA MPG 13 14 12
X 2 Units $16,615.38 $15,428.58 $18,000.00
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $74,527.52 $73,921.88 $72,550.28

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days
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DODGE INC. FORD INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP FORD INC. AUTO CENTER

ITEM

5 Five (5) Only, 15,000 Lb. GVWR 4-Door, Crew ITEMS 5 - 10
Cab and Chassis with Fiberglass Service NO BID
Body and Pipe Rack
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-450 Sid Crew Ford F450 4D Crew

Cab & Chassis Cab 4X2 W46

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price Unit 5 Units $58,118.57 $58,462.87

Total $290,592.85 $292,314.35
Manuals:  One (1) Set $375.00 $675.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 5: $290,967.85 $292,989.35
Delivery in Calendar Days:  210 Days

6. One (1)  Only, 15,000 Lb. GVWR 4-Door, 
Crew Cab and Chassis with Fiberglass 
Service Body & Canopy
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-450 SID Crew Ford F450 4D Crew

Cab & Chassis Cab 4X2 W46

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price $66,476.66 $65,071.03

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days
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ITEM

7. One (1) Only, 15,000 Lb. GVWR 4-Door, Crew
Cab and Chassis with Service/Dump
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-450 SID Ford F450 4D Crew

Crew Cab & Chassis Cab 4X2 W46

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price $49,463.54 $55,038.15

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

8. One (1) Only, 35,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab ITEMS 8 - 10 ITEMS 8 - 10
and Chassis with 1,500 Gallon Capacity NO BID NO BID
Stainless Steel Water Tank and 300 Gallon
Capacity Stainless Steel Herbicide Tank
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Peterbilt Model 335 International 7400

w/Ochoco Model
PFA3156-HE-BN

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price $130,897.51 $131,515.32
Diagnostic equipment $2,978.92 $2,900.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 8 $133,876.43 $134,415.32
Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

9. One (1) Only, 37,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with 6 Cubic Yard Dump Body
and Bitumuls Tank Peterbilt Model 335 w/
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Willimsen 6 Yd. International 4400

Dump Body & Custom 
Bitumuls Tank

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price $108,123.25 $100,457.13
Diagnostic equipment $2,978.92 $2,900.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 9 $111,102.17 $103,357.13
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
10. One (1) Only, 80,000 Lb. GCW Truck

Tractor
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Peterbilt Model 357 - International 56001

119SBFA

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price: $140,570.79 $137,927.86
Diagnostic equipment $2,680.78 $2,900.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 10 $143,251.57 $140,827.86

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days


