
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14486 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  OCTOBER 1, 2004 pp Adden. No. 1 - October 4, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of
SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS, for the ALL POOL & SPA, INC. BEI HAWAII ISLAND POOL & SPA SUPPLY
twelve-month period beginning November 1,
2004 and ending October 31, 2005 to the
City and County of Honolulu.

ITEM
NO.
1. Calcium Hypochlorite, 100 lb. drum

Bid Price Unit 50 drums $100.00 $123.90 $123.96
Total $5,000.00 $6,195.00 $6,198.00

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9338.262 9363.33 9122.84 

2. Sodium Hypochlorite, 15 gallon carboy
Bid Price Unit 300 carboys NO BID $44.00 NO BID

Total $13,200.00
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9430.86 

3. Sodium Hypochlorite, 53 gallon drum
Bid Price Unit 1,300 drums NO BID $102.70 NO BID

Total $133,510.00
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9430.86 

4. Sodum Hypochlorite, 330 gallon tote
Bid Price Unit 300 totes NO BID $574.00 NO BID

Total $172,200.00
STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: 9430.86 

5. Algaecide, 1 gal. or 1 qt. container 660 203 203
Bid Price Unit gal. $53.00 $34.16 $35.41

Total $34,980.00 $6,934.48 $7,188.23
gallon gallon gallon

Bid Price Unit qt.
Total

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.: --- 8134.1 8134.1 
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6. Calcium Chloride, 50 lb. bag
Bid Price Unit 50 bags $45.00 $22.95 $24.63

Total $2,250.00 $1,147.50 $1,231.50
7. Chlorine Sticks for Widget Chemical

Feeder, 8 oz. size, 100 sticks per container
Bid Price Unit 50 cont. $99.00 $104.60 $116.15

Total $4,950.00 $5,230.00 $5,807.50
8. Muriatic Acid, 1 gal. container

Bid Price Unit 300 gal. $5.25 $4.90 $4.48
Total $1,575.00 $1,470.00 $1,344.00


