
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14476 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  SEPTEMBER 22, 2004
Reqn. Nos. G57306 & G57327

For the furnishing and delivery of Various
Motor Vehicles, to the Public Building and CUTTER DODGE INC. CUTTER FORD, INC. HONOLULU FORD INC. ORCHID ISLE AUTO MAKENA HAWAII
Electrical Maintenance Division, CENTER WINDWARD, INC.
Department of Facility Maintenance, City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
1. Five (5) Only, Mid-Size, 4-Door Sedan

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Stratus Ford P53 Ford Taurus 4 D SE Ford Taurus Sedan SE 
4 Dr Sedan SXT P53

(JRDH41)
Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price: Unit 5 Units $17,550.93 $18,706.56 $18,738.49 $20,354.00 ITEMS 1 - 7 - NO BID

Total $87,754.65 $93,532.80 $93,692.45 $101,770.00
Manuals:  One (1) Set $1,625.00 $677.08 $750.00 -0-
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 1: $89,379.65 $94,209.88 $94,442.45 $101,770.00

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

       Applicable information available X X X X
       Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $5,142.86 $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00
             City EPA MPG 21 20 20 20
X 5 $25,714.30 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $115,093.95 $121,209.88 $121,442.45 $128,770.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM

2. Two (2) Only, Mid-Size, -Door Station Wagon
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford P58 Ford Taurus SE SW P58 Ford Taurus Wagon SE 

P58

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price Unit 2 units NO BID $21,199.63 $20,872.57 $22,625.00

Total $42,399.26 $41,745.14 $45,250.00

Manuals:  One (1) Set $677.08 $750.00 -0-

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 2: $43,076.34 $42,495.14 $45,250.00
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

___ Applicable information available X X X
___ Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $5,684.21 $5,400.00 $5,400.00
             City EPA MPG 19 20 20
X 2 units = $11,368.42 $10,800.00 $10,800.00

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $54,444.76 $53,295.14 $56,050.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
3. One (1) Only, Compact, Sport Utility Vehicle,

4-Door, 4 x 2
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Jeep Liberty Sport SUV Ford U03 Ford Escape 4D 4 X 2 Ford Escape XLT 4 X 4 

4 Dr 4X2 KJTH74 U03 U03

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $22,280.07 $23,586.31 $23,177.44 $24,250.00
BID EVALUATION - Plese check one (1):
___Applicable information available X X X X
___Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $6,352.94 $5,400.00 $5,400.00 $5,400.00
______City EPA MPG 17 20 20 20

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $28,633.01 $28,986.31 $28,577.44 $29,650.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM

4. Two (2) Only, Sport Utility Vehicles, 4-Door,
4 x 2
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Durango4 Dr Ford U15 Ford Expedition 4D 4  X 2

SLT 4 X 2 5.7LV8 HBlH74 U15

Year of production model: 2005 2004 2005
Bid Price: Unit 2 Units $29,271.69 $34,365.56 $34,206.80 ITEMS 4 - 10 - NO BID

Total $58,543.38 $68,731.12 $68,413.60
Manuals:  One (1) Set $1,625.00 $677.08 $750.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 4 $60,168.38 $69,408.20 $69,163.60

BID EVALUATION - Plese check one (1):
___Applicable information available X X X
___Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $7,714.29 $8,307.69 $7,714.29
______City EPA MPG 14 13 14
X 2 Units $15,428.58 $16,615.38 $15,428.58
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $75,596.96 $86,023.58 $84,592.18

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days
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ITEM

5. One (1) Only, 6,000 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab &
Chassis with 6' pickup Body and Toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 1500 4 X 2 Ford F12 Ford F150 4  X 2 F12

Reg Cab 6650 GVW 8' 
Bed DRlL62

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $29,176.90 $25,639.58 $28,688.56
BID EVALUATION - Plese check one (1):
___Applicable information available X X X
___Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $7,714.29 $7,200.00 $7,714.29
______City EPA MPG 14 15 14

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $36,891.19 $32,839.58 $36,402.85

Delivery in Calendar Days:  180 Days

6.  (1)  Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR 4-Door, 6-Man
Crew Cab and Chassis with Pickup Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 2500 QUAD Ford W20 Ford F250 Crew Cab 

Cab St 4 Dr P/Up 4 X2 4 X 2 W20
DH2L42 GVWR 9000

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $36,945.60 $36,047.49 $37,643.64

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM

7. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck
Extended Cab and Chassis with Pickup Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford X20Ford F250 Super Cab X20

Year of production model: 2005 2005
Bid Price NO BID $34,190.21 $36,607.80

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

8. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with Standard-Profile Service
Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Ford F20 Ford F250 F20 Ford F20 Super Duty 

Cab 4 X 2 ST DH2L62 4 X 2 w/Brand FX 
GVWR 9000 Fiberglass Service Body

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $39,277.87 $36,129.57 $38,511.00 $39,573.19

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

9. One (1) Only, 8,800 Lb. GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with Standard-Profile Service
Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Ford F20 Ford F250 F20 Ford F20 Super Duty

Cab 4 X 2 ST DH2L62 4 X 2 w/Brand FX 
GVWR 9000 Fiberglass Service Body

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005
Bid Price $39,277.87 $36,911.02 $38,511.00 $39,573.19

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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ITEM
10. Two (2) Only, 9,600 Lb. GVWR Commercial

Cutaway Van with Utility Van Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: E35

Year of production model: 2005
Bid Price: Unit 2 Units NO BID $35,561.23 NO BID NO BID

Total $71,122.46
Manuals:  One (1) Set $677.08

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 10 $71,799.54

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days


