ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. 14474
OPENED: SEPTEMBER 1, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of WIPING RAGS

for the twelve-month period beginning

AALA SHIP SERVICE

INDUSTRIAL HARDWARE

SOBEL-WESTEX

October-15, 2004 and ending October-14, 2005 HAWAII INC.
to the City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,
Hawaii
ITEM
1. Rags, Wiping; white; soft
Bid Price: Unit 17,000 pounds $0.85 $0.59 $0.59
Total $14,450.00 $10,030.00 $10,030.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: PO322 W60350 USI 202
Type of Packaging (Bale or Box): Bale Bale BOX
Quantity of Rags Per Package (in Lbs.): 50 Ibs 50 Ibs 50 LBS
2. Rags, Wiping; white; high quality
Bid Price: Unit 16,000 pounds NO BID $0.70 $0.60
Total $11,200.00 $9,600.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: S65350 USI 211
Type of Packaging (Bale or Box): Bale BOX
No. of Threads Per Square Inch (Average) 165-180 180
Quantity of Rags Per Package (in Lbs.): 50 Ibs 50 LBS
3. Rags, Wiping; white; 100% cotton
Bid Price: Unit 11,000 pounds $0.85 $0.86 $0.90
Total $9,350.00 $9,460.00 $9,900.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: P0O322 S70350 USI 241
Type of Packaging (Bale or Box): Bale Bale BALE
Quantity of Rags Per Package (in Lbs.) 50 Ibs. 50 Ibs. 50 LBS.
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4.  Rags, Wiping; white; soft
Bid Price: Unit 3,000 pounds NO BID $1.18 $1.17
Total $3,540.00 $3,510.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: L76350X USI 250
Type of Packaging (Bale or Box): Bale BOX
Quantity of Rags Per Package (in Lbs.): 50 Ibs 50 LBS
5. Rags, Wiping; white; soft
Bid Price: Unit 8,000 pounds NO BID $1.40 $1.60
Total $11,200.00 $12,800.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: L75350 USI 271
Type of Packaging (Bale or Box): Bale BOX
Quantity of Rags Per Package (in Lbs.): 50 Ibs 50 LBS
6. Rags, Wiping; various colors
Bid Price: Unit 2,000 pounds NO BID $1.09 $0.90
Total $2,180.00 $1,800.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: S20350 USI 251
Type of Packaging (Bale or Box): Bale BOX
Quantity of Rags Per Package (in Lbs.): 50 Ibs. 50 LBS




