
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14466 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  SEPTEMBER 3, 2004
Reqn. No. G05002

For the furnishing and delivery of
7-PASSENGER VANS to the Land Division CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE SERVCO
of the Department of Design and DODGE, INC. FORD, INC. FORD INC. AUTO CENTER PACIFIC INC.
Construction, City and County of Honolulu,
Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. PRIMARY BID
1. Two (2) Only, Compact, 7-Passenger Vans

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Chevrolet Astro 
CM11006 

Year of production model: 2005 

Bid Price
Vehicles Unit 2 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24,933.00

Total $49,866.00

Manuals $652.00

Total Sum Bid: $50,518.00

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
     Applicable information available.
     Applicable information not available. X

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE FO THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 =
X 2 each = Total
            City EPA MPG

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU ORCHID ISLE SERVCO
DODGE, INC. FORD, INC. FORD INC. AUTO CENTER PACIFIC INC.

ITEM
NO. ALTERNATE BID
2. Two (2) Only, Compact, 7-Passenger Vans

Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Grand Ford Freestar Van Ford Freestar S Ford Freestar S 
Caravan RSKL53 A50 A50 

Year of production model: 2005 2005 2005 2005 

Bid Price
Vehicles Unit 2 Each $24,195.68 $25,632.93 $23,061.04 $24,591.39 NO BID

Total $48,391.36 $51,265.86 $46,122.08 $49,182.78

Manuals $729.16 $338.53 $700.00 $850.00

Total Sum Bid: $49,120.52 $51,604.39 $46,822.08 $50,032.78

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
     Applicable information available. X X X X
     Applicable information not available.

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE FO THE VEHICLES

60,000  Miles X $1.80 = $5,684.21 $6,000.00 $6,352.94 $6,000.00
X 2 each = Total $11,368.42 $12,000.00 $12,705.88 $12,000.00
            City EPA MPG 19 18 17 18

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $60,488.94 $63,604.39 $59,527.96 $62,032.78

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days


