PROPOSAL NO. 14458
OPENED AUGUST 30, 2004

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM

For the furnishing and delivery of LOW SULFUR DIESEL
FUEL for the twenty-four (24) month period beginning
Octoer 1, 2004 and ending September 30, 2006 to the
City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ALOHA PETROLEUM, LTD.

GARLOW PETROLEUM INC.

TESORO HAWAII CORPORATION

3.

A. Bid prices for low sulfur diesel fuel, meeting the ASTM
D975 specifications of less than 500 ppm sulfur content,
for petroleum refiners and distributors, only

Honolulu Lundberg Survey, Inc. Dealer Tank
Wagon (DTW) Wholesale Price

Average dealer price per gallon for the period
from June 16, 2004 through July 15, 2004

Average Dealer Price Per Gallon: $1.287

Discount:

Premium:

Bid Price: Unit 2,906,260 gals
Total

Oil price information services (OPIS) pad 4/5 Seattle Rack

Average dealer price per gallon for the period
from June 16, 2004 through July 15, 2004

Average Dealer Price Per Gallon: $0.910

Discount:

Premium:

Bid Price: Unit 2,906,260 gals
Total

B. Bid prices for low sulfur diesel fuel, meeeting the ASTM
D975 specifications of less than 500 ppm sulfur content,
for petroleum jobbers, only

Bid Price: Unit 2,906,260 gals
Total

$0.028
$1.315
$3,821,731.90

$0.284
$1.194
$3,470,074.44

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$1.605
$4,664,547.30

NO BID

$0.10

$1.187
$3,449,730.62

$0.15
$1.06
$3,080,635.60




