PROPOSAL NO. 14436
OPENED JULY 27, 2004
Reqgn. No. G60812

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of MOTORIZED

MANLIFT AND WIRE ROPE HOIST to the AMERICAN COMMERCIAL CRANE PRO HAWAII E VEHICLES OF ENGINEERED STARR AND
Division of Automotive Equipment Services, MACHINERY SHELVING, INC. HAWAII LLC SYSTEMS, INC. COMPANY, INC.
Department of Facility Maintenance, City and
County of Honolulu.
Two (2) Only, Motorized Manlift
Manufacturer's make and model no.: JLG Model 2030ES Genie #GS-2032 JLG Industries, Inc. Genie Industries
Model 2030ES GS-2032
Current
Year of production model: 2004 |Latest production 2004 2004
Bid Prices: Unit 2 each $12,040.55 $15,641.82 $15,625.00 $14,270.88 NO BID NO BID
Total $24,081.10 $31,283.64 $31,250.00 $28,541.76
Delivery in Calendar Days: 120 days 30 days; ARO
Two (2) Only, Wire Rope Hoist
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Shaw-Box Shaw-Box 800 Series Acco Shaw-box
80M02-025D14-V Model 80M02-025D #C2W03D036 Model 80M02-025D
14-V 15M2DO 14-V
Year of production model no.: Latest Current Model 2004 2004 2004
Bid Price: Unit 2 each NO BID $12,494.00 $11,893.00 NO BID $19,360.00 $12,362.75
Total $24,988.00 $23,786.00 $38,720.00 $24,725.50

Delivery in Calendar DAys: 120 days

60 days




