
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14389 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 4, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of
AUTOMOTIVE FILTER ELEMENTS, for the CHARLES W. CUTTER FORD, HT&T TRUCK HAWTHORNE MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
twelve-month period beginning July 1, 2004 CARTER CO. INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP. TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
and ending June 30, 2005 to the City and REPAIR INC. COMPANY
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. Donaldson P551670 GROUP I - NO BID ITEM NOS. 1 - 9 ITEM NOS. 1 - 10

Bid Price Unit 600 each NO BID $10.45 $7.18 NO BID $9.54
Total $6,270.00 $4,308.00 $5,724.00

2. Donaldson P552100
Bid Price Unit 2,000 each $10.50 $7.21 $9.57

Total $21,000.00 $14,420.00 $19,140.00
3. Donaldson P556915

Bid Price Unit 1,500 each $5.10 $3.50 $4.65
Total $7,650.00 $5,250.00 $6,975.00

4. Donaldson P556916
Bid Price Unit 1,500 each $5.10 $3.48 $4.63

Total $7,650.00 $5,220.00 $6,945.00
5. Donaldson P126396

Bid Price Unit 600 each $52.75 $35.94 $47.74
Total $31,650.00 $21,564.00 $28,644.00

6. Donaldson P553000
Bid Price Unit 400 each $24.00 $16.55 $21.99

Total $9,600.00 $6,620.00 $8,796.00
7. Donaldson P551000

Bid Price Unit 400 each $9.00 $6.92 $9.19
Total $3,600.00 $2,768.00 $3,676.00

8. Donaldson P181099
Bid Price Unit 300 each $39.90 $28.90 $38.38

Total $11,970.00 $8,670.00 $11,514.00
9. Donaldson P822686

Bid Price Unit 40 each $10.00 $7.01 $9.31
Total $400.00 $280.40 $372.40

10. Ford YC3Z-7A098-8A YC3Z7A098 BA ITEM NOS. 10 - 16 
Bid Price Unit 1,500 each $17.84 $26.00 NO BID NO BID

Total $26,760.00 $39,000.00



PROPOSAL NO. 14389
Page 2 CHARLES W. CUTTER FORD, HT&T TRUCK HAWTHORNE MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT

CARTER CO. INC. CENTER PACIFIC CORP. TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
REPAIR INC. COMPANY

ITEM
NO.
11. Baldwin BD309

Bid Price Unit 400 each ITEM NOS. 11 - 17 $31.00 $20.74 NO BID
Total NO BID $12,400.00 $8,296.00

12. Allison 29540494
Bid Price Unit 100 each $80.00 $58.00 $58.82

Total $8,000.00 $5,800.00 $5,882.00
13. GM972148983 ITEM NOS. 13 - 16

Bid Price Unit 50 each $11.05 NO BID ITEM NOS. 13 - 16
Total $552.50 NO BID

14. GM89016324
Bid Price Unit 25 each $25.90

Total $647.50
15. GM88937527

Bid Price Unit 25 each $48.10
Total $1,202.50

16. GM88892858
Bid Price Unit 25 each $19.55

Total $488.75
GROUP II GROUP II 
Total Discount Rate Bid: 49.5% --- ALL NO BID 45% off blue pricing Jobber Price Less 50%

Manufacturer's Brand Name: Fram Fleet Gaurd Filter Baldwin Filters Fram

Price List Number and Date: F204B           6/1/04 Not aval at this time April 2004 F1080B         1/1/02
(SEPT 2004)
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ITEM
NO.
17. Fram CA592

Part No. Offered: CA592 AF872 PA2333 CA592
Price List: $53.70 $53.55 $53.70
Amount Discounted: $26.58 $24.10 $26.85
Unit Price Unit 300 each $27.12 $42.40 $29.45 $26.85

Total $8,136.00 $12,720.00 $8,835.00 $8,055.00
18. Fram CA7614

Part No. Offered: CA7614 F5UZ9601A AF25423 PA2237 CA7614
Price List: $6.68 $17.67 $11.01 $6.68
Amount Discounted: $3.31 $8.15 $4.95 $3.34
Unit Price Unit 2,800 each $3.37 $9.52 $10.70 $6.06 $3.34

Total $9,436.00 $26,656.00 $29,960.00 $16,968.00 $9,352.00
19. Fram CA326

Part No. Offered: CA326 NO BID AF400 PA2008 CA326
Price List: $5.30 $6.26 $5.30
Amount Discounted: $2.62 $2.82 $2.65
Unit Price Unit 150 each $2.68 $5.00 $3.44 $2.65

Total $402.00 $750.00 $516.00 $397.50
20. Fram CA329

Part No. Offered: CA329 NO BID AF364 PA1704 CA329
Price List: $4.06 $4.05 $4.06
Amount Discounted: $2.01 $1.82 $2.03
Unit Price Unit 100 each $2.05 $3.45 $2.23 $2.03

Total $205.00 $345.00 $223.00 $203.00
21. Fram CA5056

Part No. Offered: CA5056 E5TZ9601B AF4619 PA2152 CA5056
Price List: $5.80 $11.04 $7.26 $5.80
Amount Discounted: $2.87 $5.08 $3.27 $2.90
Unit Price Unit 400 each $2.93 $5.96 $6.75 $3.99 $2.90

Total $1,172.00 $2,384.00 $2,700.00 $1,596.00 $1,160.00
22. Fram CA7230

Part No. Offered: CA7230 NO BID AH1105 PA2722 CA7230
Price List: $116.09 $122.66 $116.09
Amount Discounted: $57.46 $55.20 $58.05
Unit Price Unit 120 each $58.63 $94.45 $67.46 $58.04

Total $7,035.60 $11,334.00 $8,095.20 $6,964.80
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ITEM
NO.
23. Fram CA8039

Part No. Offered: CA8039 F50Z9601BA AF25590 PA4075 CA8039
Price List: $11.01 $25.73 $14.04 $11.01
Amount Discounted: $5.45 $11.86 $6.32 $5.51
Unit Price Unit 75 each $5.56 $13.87 $14.75 $7.72 $5.50

Total $417.00 $1,040.25 $1,106.25 $579.00 $412.50
24. Fram CS7715

Part No. Offered: CS7715 F4TZ9N184A FS1298 PF7678 CS7715
Price List: $23.04 $40.76 $23.53 $22.37
Amount Discounted: $11.40 $18.79 $10.59 $11.19
Unit Price Unit 225 each $11.64 $21.97 $20.40 $12.94 $11.18

Total $2,619.00 $4,943.25 $4,590.00 $2,911.50 $2,515.50
25. Fram CS8629

Part No. Offered: CS8629 F81Z9N184AA FF5418 PF7698 CS8629
Price List: $29.83 $54.41 $22.86 $28.96
Amount Discounted: $14.77 $24.43 $10.29 $14.48
Unit Price Unit 1,000 each $15.06 $29.98 $22.45 $12.57 $14.48

Total $15,060.00 $29,980.00 $22,450.00 $12,570.00 $14,480.00
26. Fram FT1130

Part No. Offered: FT1130 YC3Z7A098BA TF15001 18265 FT1130
Price List: $24.59 $41.39 $29.58 $24.59
Amount Discounted: $12.17 $24.18 $13.31 $12.30
Unit Price Unit 150 each $12.42 $17.84 $23.50 $16.27 $12.29

Total $1,863.00 $2,676.00 $3,525.00 $2,440.50 $1,843.50
27. Fram FT1167

Part No. Offered: FT1167 F6AZ7A0098A FT1167 18029 FT1167
Price List: $17.76 $33.00 $19.45 $17.76
Amount Discounted: $8.79 $18.64 $8.75 $8.88
Unit Price Unit 400 each $8.97 $14.36 $17.80 $10.70 $8.88

Total $3,588.00 $5,744.00 $7,120.00 $4,280.00 $3,552.00
28. Fram G3727

Part No. Offered: G3727 NO BID FF5026 BF853 G3727
Price List: $10.10 $10.20 $10.10
Amount Discounted: $5.00 $4.59 $5.05
Unit Price Unit 190 each $5.10 $8.65 $5.61 $5.05

Total $969.00 $1,643.50 $1,065.90 $959.50
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ITEM
NO.
29. Fram G3802A

Part No. Offered: G3802A E7DZ9155A FF5097 BF966 G3802A
Price List: $8.03 $17.51 $9.18 $8.03
Amount Discounted: $3.97 $8.07 $4.13 $4.02
Unit Price Unit 300 each $4.06 $9.44 $8.55 $5.05 $4.01

Total $1,218.00 $2,832.00 $2,565.00 $1,515.00 $1,203.00
30. Fram G8018

Part No. Offered: G8018 F89Z9155A FF5455 BF7668 G8018
Price List: $6.45 $16.04 $8.24 $6.45
Amount Discounted: $3.19 $7.39 $3.71 $3.23
Unit Price Unit 300 each $3.26 $8.65 $7.90 $4.53 $3.22

Total $978.00 $2,595.00 $2,370.00 $1,359.00 $966.00
31. Fram HPH6349A

Part No. Offered: HPH6349A ITEM NOS. 31 - 36 LF3000 NO BID HPH6349A
Price List: $32.45 NO BID $31.50
Amount Discounted: $16.06 $15.75
Unit Price Unit 120 each $16.39 $26.00 $15.75

Total $1,966.80 $3,120.00 $1,890.00
32. Fram P1101A

Part No. Offered: P1101A FF104 BF948 P1101A
Price List: $4.74 $4.47 $4.53
Amount Discounted: $2.35 $2.01 $2.27
Unit Price Unit 110 each $2.39 $3.25 $2.46 $2.26

Total $262.90 $357.50 $270.60 $248.60
33. Fram P1121

Part No. Offered: P1121 FF182 BF588 P1121
Price List: $9.28 $8.91 $9.01
Amount Discounted: $4.59 $4.01 $4.51
Unit Price Unit 100 each $4.69 $8.50 $4.90 $4.50

Total $469.00 $850.00 $490.00 $450.00
34. Fram P1146G

Part No. Offered: P11466 FF5207 BF5800 P1146G
Price List: $7.30 $6.88 $7.09
Amount Discounted: $3.61 $3.10 $3.55
Unit Price Unit 60 each $3.69 $5.70 $3.78 $3.54

Total $221.40 $342.00 $226.80 $212.40
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ITEM
NO.
35. Fram P1147G

Part No. Offered: P1147G FF5206 BF5810 P1147G
Price List: $7.30 $6.88 $7.09
Amount Discounted: $3.61 $3.10 $3.55
Unit Price Unit 120 each $3.69 $5.70 $3.78 $3.54

Total $442.80 $684.00 $453.60 $424.80
36. Fram PH13

Part No. Offered: PH13 LF653 B6 PH13
Price List: $4.54 $4.63 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.08 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 180 each $2.29 $4.10 $2.55 $2.20

Total $412.20 $738.00 $459.00 $396.00
37. Fram PH2

Part No. Offered: PH2 F1AZ6731BD LF3681 B329 PH2
Price List: $4.95 $6.89 $5.17 $4.81
Amount Discounted: $2.45 $3.17 $2.33 $2.41
Unit Price Unit 780 each $2.50 $3.72 $4.25 $2.84 $2.40

Total $1,950.00 $2,901.60 $3,315.00 $2,215.20 $1,872.00
38. Fram PH30

Part No. Offered: PH30 ITEM NOS. 38 - 41 LF651 B27 PH30
Price List: $4.54 NO BID $4.93 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.22 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 100 each $2.29 $3.90 $2.71 $2.20

Total $229.00 $390.00 $271.00 $220.00
39. Fram PH3387A

Part No. Offered: PH3387A LF780 B43-S PH3387A
Price List: $4.54 $4.59 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.07 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 140 each $2.29 $3.75 $2.52 $2.20

Total $320.60 $525.00 $352.80 $308.00
40. Fram PH3612

Part No. Offered: PH3612 LF670 B96 PH3612
Price List: $15.45 $14.88 $15.00
Amount Discounted: $7.65 $6.70 $7.50
Unit Price Unit 660 each $7.80 $12.25 $8.18 $7.50

Total $5,148.00 $8,085.00 $5,398.80 $4,950.00
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ITEM
NO.
41. Fram PH3614

Part No. Offered: PH3614 LF3335 BT223 PH3614
Price List: $4.54 $4.70 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.11 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 100 each $2.29 $3.70 $2.59 $2.20

Total $229.00 $370.00 $259.00 $220.00
42. Fram PH3786

Part No. Offered: PH3786 F4TZ6731A LF3630 B7039 PH3786
Price List: $12.96 $19.60 $12.63 $12.58
Amount Discounted: $6.42 $9.04 $5.68 $6.29
Unit Price Unit 2,900 each $6.54 $10.56 $10.65 $6.95 $6.29

Total $18,966.00 $30,624.00 $30,885.00 $20,155.00 $18,241.00
43. Fram PH30

Part No. Offered: PH39 ITEM NOS. 43 - 46 LF3420 BT261 PH39
Price List: $7.42 NO BID $7.09 $6.48
Amount Discounted: $3.67 $3.19 $3.24
Unit Price Unit 130 each $3.75 $5.85 $3.90 $3.24

Total $487.50 $760.50 $507.00 $421.20
44. Fram PH3980

Part No. Offered: PH3980 LF782 B35-S PH3980
Price List: $4.54 $4.61 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.07 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 160 each $2.29 $4.00 $2.54 $2.20

Total $366.40 $640.00 $406.40 $352.00
45. Fram PR43

Part No. Offered: PH43 LF689 B233 PH43
Price List: $4.54 $4.49 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.02 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 110 each $2.29 $3.60 $2.47 $2.20

Total $251.90 $396.00 $271.70 $242.00
46. Fram PH5

Part No. Offered: PH5 LF3679 B9 PH5
Price List: $4.54 $5.62 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.53 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 220 each $2.29 $4.55 $3.09 $2.20

Total $503.80 $1,001.00 $679.80 $484.00
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ITEM
NO.
47. Fram PH8A

Part No. Offered: PH8A D9AZ6731A LF3313 B2 PH8A
Price List: $4.54 $6.11 $4.20 $4.41
Amount Discounted: $2.25 $2.82 $1.89 $2.21
Unit Price Unit 260 each $2.29 $3.29 $3.90 $2.31 $2.20

Total $595.40 $855.40 $1,014.00 $600.60 $572.00
48. Fram PH8691

Part No. Offered: PH8691 ITEM NOS. 48 - 50 LF9001 B07154 PH8691
Price List: $51.53 NO BID $40.50 $50.03
Amount Discounted: $25.51 $18.22 $25.02
Unit Price Unit 80 each $26.02 $33.30 $22.28 $25.01

Total $2,081.60 $2,664.00 $1,782.40 $2,000.80
49. Fram PS3712

Part No. Offered: PS3712 FS1212 BF1212 PS3712
Price List: $12.44 $11.67 $12.08
Amount Discounted: $6.16 $5.25 $6.04
Unit Price Unit 130 each $6.28 $9.65 $6.42 $6.04

Total $816.40 $1,254.50 $834.60 $785.20
50. Fram P3613

Part No. Offered: P3613 HF6243 BT359 PS3613
Price List: $16.55 $17.20 $16.07
Amount Discounted: $8.19 --- $8.04
Unit Price Unit 500 each $8.36 $13.35 $9.46 $8.03

Total $4,180.00 $6,675.00 $4,730.00 $4,015.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II $92,999.30 --- $167,245.25 $103,318.40 $90,369.30


