
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14385 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 9, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS for a twenty- ALOHA DIAMOND GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLES MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT
four month period beginning July 1, 2004 PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
and ending June 30, 2006 to the City and PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii INC.

ITEM
NO. Hawaii General Excise Tax Rate: 4.166% 4% 4.16% 4.166% 4.166% 4.166% 

THINNER, ACRYLIC LACQUER
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No

1. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in ITEMS 1 - 5 ITEMS 1 - 8 ITEMS 1 & 2 ITEMS 1 - 5 ITEMS 1 - 80 ITEMS 1 - 80
non-returnable 5-gal. pails. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 180 gals.

Total
2. Bid price shall be based on deliveries in

non-returnable 1-gal. pails.
Bid Price: Unit 25 gals.

Total

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 1 AND 2

SOLVENTS,  Chevron #51L, Touene 
Solvent, Union Solvent A-100, East Bay Oil
Co. 510L or Ashland Hi-SOL15.
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: East Bay 51-L 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X

3. Bid Price Unit 55 gals $5.75
Total $316.25
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

SOLVENTS, Chevron #325, Varsol Solvent,
or equal.
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Gold Sheild #325 

Solvent 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X

4. Bid price Unit 165 gals $5.36
Total $884.40

OIL, Motor API Service Classification SL, 
SAE 30
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Supreme 30 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X

5. Bid Price Unit 45 gals $5.15
Total $231.75

OIL, Transmission Gear, SAE 85-2-140
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Premium Gear Chevron Mobil Lube HD 

MP 85W/40 RPM Universal Gear Plus 85W-140 
85w-140 

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

6. Bid Price Unit 28,000 lbs $0.715 $0.68 $0.69
Total $20,020.00 $19,040.00 $19,320.00

7. Bid Price Unit 12,000 lbs $0.735 $0.68 $0.75
Total $8,820.00 $8,160.00 $9,000.00
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.
8. Bid Price Unit 1,800 lbs $0.773 $0.79 $0.95

Total $1,391.40 $1,422.00 $1,710.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 6 - 8 $30,231.40 $28,622.00 $30,030.00

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity Grade, 5W-20,
5W-30, 10W-30, 10W-40 and 20W-50

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X X

SAE 5W-20
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Supergard Kendall GT1 HP Chevron Supreme Exxon Superflo 

5W-20 5W-20 5w-20 SAE 5W-20 

9. Bid Price Unit 2,475 gals $5.70 $5.90 $5.12 $5.71
Total $14,107.50 $14,602.50 $12,672.00 $14,132.25

SAE 5W-30 Chevron Supreme Exxon Superflo 
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Supergard 76 Lubricants Super 5w-30 SAE 5w-30 

5W-30 5W-30 

10. Bid Price Unit 2,475 gals $5.50 $5.80 $4.12 $5.05
Total $13,612.50 $14,355.00 $10,197.00 $12,498.75

11. Bid Price Unit 195 gals $5.80 $5.90 $5.75 $5.30
Total $1,131.00 $1,150.50 $1,121.25 $1,033.50

SAE 10W-30
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Supergard 76 Lubricants Super Chevron Supreme Exxon Superflo 

10W-30 10W-30 10w-30 SAE 10W-30 

12. Bid Price Unt 220 gals $5.28 $4.70 $4.10 $4.10
Total $1,161.60 $1,034.00 $902.00 $902.00

13. Bid Price Unit 228 gals $5.50 $5.00 $5.75 $5.10
Total $1,254.00 $1,140.00 $1,311.00 $1,162.80
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

SAE 10W - 40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Supergard 76 Lubricants Super Chevron Supreme Exxon Superflo 

10W-40 10W-40 10w-40 10W-40 

14. Bid Price Unit 1,800 gals $5.26 $4.90 $5.17 $4.70
Total $9,468.00 $8,820.00 $9,306.00 $8,460.00

15. Bid Price Unit 54 gals $5.40 $5.10 $5.75 $5.30
Total $291.60 $275.40 $310.50 $286.20

SAE 20W-50
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Supergard 76 Lubricants 76 Lubri- Chevron Supreme Exxon Superflo 

20W-50 cants Super 20W-50 20w-50 20W-50 

16. Bid Price Unit 110 gals. $5.40 $5.00 $6.02 $4.90
Total $594.00 $550.00 $662.20 $539.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 9 - 16 $41,620.20 $41,927.40 $36,481.95 $39,014.50

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity Grade, SAE
5W-20, 5W-30, synthetic blend.

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Supergard Ford Motorcraft 
5W-20 5W-20, 5W-30 

Motor Oil 
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X

17. Bid Price Unit 1,650 gals $5.80 NO BID NO BID $6.00
Total $9,570.00 $9,900.00
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity Grade, SAE
10W-30 and 1W-40.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X X

SAE 10W-30 Mobil Delvac 1300 
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard 600 76 Lubricants Chevron RPM HDMO 10W-30; Exxon XD-3 

10W-30 Guardol 10W-30 10W-30 Drums * 10W-30, SF 10W-30 

18. Bid Price Unit 660 gals $5.74 $5.00 $4.72 $5.23
Total $3,788.40 $3,300.00 $3,115.20 $3,451.80

19. Bid Price Unit 72 gals $5.90 $7.00 $6.85 $5.30
Total $424.80 $504.00 $493.20 $381.60

SAE 15W-40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard 500 76 Lubricants T5X Chevron RPM HDMO Exxon XD-3 15W-40 

15W-40 Heavy Duty 15W-40 15w-40 

20. Bid Price Unit 5,940 gals $5.09 $4.60 $3.95 $4.56
Total $30,234.60 $27,324.00 $23,463.00 $27,086.40

21. Bid Price Unit 72 gals $5.39 $5.50 7.26 $6.44
Total $388.08 $396.00 $522.72 $463.68

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 18 - 21 $34,835.88 $31,524.00 $27,594.12 $31,383.48
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO

OIL, Motor, Grade 1, Multi-Viscosity SAE 
10W-30 and 15W-40.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

SAE 10W-30 Mobil Delvac 1300 
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard 600 Chevron RPM HDMO 10W-30; Exxon XD-3 

10W-30 10w-30 Drums BLK* 10W-30, SF 10W-30 

22. Bid Price Unit 660 gals $5.43 ITEMS 22 - 28 $4.72 $5.23
Total $3,583.80 NO BID $3,115.20 $3,451.80

23. Bid Price Unit 330 gals $5.43 $4.72 $5.23
Total $1,791.90 $1,557.60 $1,725.90

24. Bid Price Unit 520 gals $5.90 $6.85 $5.30
Total $3,068.00 $3,562.00 $2,756.00

SAE 15W-40
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard 500 Chevron RPM HDMO ** Exxon XD-3 15W-40 

15W-40 15w-40 BLK/Drums/qrt Extra 15W-40 

25. Bid Price Unit 54,450 gals $4.35 $3.90 $3.80
Total $236,857.50 $212,355.00 $206,910.00

26. Bid Price Unit 15,620 gals $5.00 $3.90 $4.36
Total $78,100.00 $60,918.00 $68,103.20

27. Bid Price Unit 55 gals $5.60 $7.15 $4.62
Total $308.00 $393.25 $254.10

28. Bid Price Unit 663 gals $5.60 $7.26 $6.44
Total $3,712.80 $4,813.38 $4,269.72

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 22 - 28 $327,422.00 $286,714.43 $287,470.72
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Motor, Multi-Viscosity, Grade 2, 15W-40. **Chevron Delco 400 
Recycled product(s) being offered? 15W-40 pails 
         Yes
         No X X X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard 500 76 Lubricants T5X Chevron RPM HDMO Exxon XD-3 SAE 
15W-40 Heavy Duty 15W-40 15w-40 15W-40 

29. Bid Price Unit 4,345 gals $5.00 $4.60 $3.95 $4.36
Total $21,725.00 $19,987.00 $17,162.75 $18,944.20

30. Bid Price Unit 120 gals $5.60 $5.50 $7.26 $6.44
Total $672.00 $660.00 $871.20 $772.80

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 29 AND 30 $22,397.00 $20,647.00 $18,033.95 $19,717.00

OIL, Motor, Single-Viscosity Grade, SAE 10,
30 and 40.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X

SAE 10
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard 500 Chevron Delo 

10W 400-10, 30, 40 

31. Bid Price Unit 110 gals $4.94 ITEMS 31 - 36 $5.95 ITEMS 31 - 36
Total $543.40 NO BID $654.50 NO BID

32. Bid Price Unit 330 gals $4.94 $5.95
Total $1,630.20 $1,963.50

33. Bid Price Unit 120 gals $5.25 $7.04
Total $630.00 $844.80

34. Bid Price Unit 48 gals $5.60 $7.20
Total $268.80 $345.60
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

SAE-30
35. Bid Price Unit 162 gals $5.60 $6.89

Total $907.20 $1,116.18

SAE-40
36. Bid Price Unit 52 gals $5.60 $6.89

Total $291.20 $358.28

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 31 - 36 $4,270.80 $5,282.86

OIL Motor, SAE 40.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X x

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Citgard Transit 76 Lubricants T5X Chevron Delo Exxon XD3 SAE 40 
Low Ash 40W Heavy Duty 40 100-40 

37. Bid Price Unit 8,000 gals $4.50 $4.10 $4.35 $3.80
Total $36,000.00 $32,800.00 $34,800.00 $30,400.00

38. Bid Price Unit 165 gals $4.50 $4.60 $4.40 $4.10
Total $742.50 $759.00 $726.00 $676.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 37 AND 38 $36,742.50 $33,559.00 $35,526.00 $31,076.50
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, All synthetic gear oil, SAE 80W-140
API GL-5 Hypoid Gear Oil, must be in the oil
Quality designation, either by itself or 
combined w/other designation such as 
API GL-5 and MIL PRF-2105E
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Synthetic Gear Chevron Tegra Mobil Lube SHC 
Lubricant 80W-140 Synthetic Gear 80W-140 

Lube sae 80w-140 
39. Bid Price Unit 165 gals $20.50 NO BID $3.15 $21.76

Total $3,382.50 $3,780.00 $3,590.40
3 drums = 165 gallons 

1,200 lb. 
OIL, Hydraulic SAE 10; Viscosity = 150 SSU @
100 degree F; Viscosity Index = 85 in.; Pour
Pt. = -20 degree F; w/anti-wear, rust, oxidation
and defoament inhibitors.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo AW Hydraulic Chevron Rykon AW 
Oil 32 Hydraulic 32 

40. Bid Price Unit 115 gals $4.49 NO BID $3.75 NO BID
Total $516.35 $431.25
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Hydraulic (high pressure and speed
application), Grades ISO 32, 46, 68 & 150.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo AW Hydraulic 76 Lubricants Chevron Rykon AW Hyd. Exxon Humble 
Oil 32, 46, 68, 150 Unax AW 32,46,68; Chevron Hydraulic Oil; Mobil AW

Machine Oil AW 150 Hydraulic Oil 
SAE 32

41. Bid Price Unit 275 gals $4.49 $4.50 $3.70 $4.01
Total $1,234.75 $1,237.50 $1,017.50 $1,102.75

42.. Bid Price Unit 200 gals $4.90 $5.50 $5.62 $5.60
Total $980.00 $1,100.00 $1,124.00 $1,120.00

ISO 46
43. Bid Price Unit 440 gals $4.49 $4.50 $3.30 $3.71

Total $1,975.60 $1,980.00 $1,452.00 $1,632.40

44. Bid Price Unit 20 gals $4.90 $5.50 $5.62 $5.60
Total $98.00 $110.00 $112.40 $112.00

ISO 68
45. Bid Price Unit 605 gals $4.49 $4.50 $3.30 $3.71

Total $2,716.45 $2,722.50 $1,996.50 $2,244.55

46. Bid Price Unit 25 gals $4.90 $5.50 $5.62 $5.60
Total $122.50 $137.50 $140.50 $140.00

iS0-150
47. Bid Price Unit 110 gals $5.00 $4.80 $5.75 $5.84

Total $550.00 $528.00 $632.50 $642.40

TOTAL SUM FOR ITEM NOS. 41 - 47 $7,677.30 $7,815.50 $6,475.40 $6,994.10



PROPOSAL NO. 14385
Page 11 ALOHA DIAMOND GARLOW HAWAIIAN ISLES MATT'S PACIFIC DETROIT

PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

GREASE, NLGI #2, heavy duty, severe Service
grease for chassis, disc brakes, wheel
bearings, throwout bearings, Universal joints,
tie rods, king pins, Fifth wheel and boat
trailer bearings.
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

48. Bid Price Unit 910 lbs ITEMS 48 - 54 ITEMS 48 - 54 ITEMS 48 - 52 ITEMS 48 - 64
Total NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

49. Bid Price Unit 3 cases
Total

TOTAL SUM FOR ITEM NOS. 48 AND 49:

GREASE, NLGI #2, Triple EP Protection,
Dropping point 385 degrees.
Brand Name and No. of Products Offered:

50. Bid Price Unit 2,280 lbs
Total

51. Bid Price Unit 18 cases
Total

TOTAL SUM FOR ITEM NOS. 50 AND 51:
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

GREASE, NLGI 00, semi-fluid, multi-
Functional grease for automatic, Lubricating
devices.

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered:

52. Bid Price Unit 200 lbs
Total

Lubriplate 1200-2:  NLGI No. 2 grade grease.
Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Chevron Duralith EP2 

53. Bid Price Unit 2,000 lbs $1.05
Total $2,100.00

54. Bid Price Unit 360 lbs $1.23
Total $442.80

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 53 AND 54 $2,542.80

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, Union Unoba EP2
Green NGLI 0 or 00, or Chevron Ultra-Duty
Grease EP NGLI 0 or Chevron Dura-Lith
Grease EP NGLI 0 or 00.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Premium 76 Lubricants Unoba Chevron Duralith 
Lithium EP Semi Fluid EP2 EP 0, 00 

55. Bid Price Unit 2,180 lbs $1.25 $1.05 $1.21
Total $2,725.00 $2,289.00 $2,637.80
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, EP #2 with Lithum 
Base.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes X X
         No X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Citgo Lithoplex MP #2 76 Lubricants Unoba Chevron Duralith 
EP2 EP 2 

56. Bid Price Unit 10 cases $64.00 $42.00 $54.60
Total $640.00 $420.00 $546.00

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, lithium complex soap,
base oil and fortified with additive, NLGI Grade
2, penetration @ 25 degreeC ADTM worked -
325, texture - smooth; Timken OK load - 80 lbs.
dropping point 0 271 degree C

Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Citgo Lithoplex RT #2 76 Lubricants Chevron Delo 
Multiplex Red #2 Grease EP 2 

57. Bid Price Unit 2,800 lbs $1.30 $1.41 $1.66
Total $3,640.00 $3,948.00 $4,648.00

58. Bid Price Unit 720 lbs $1.40 $1.50 $1.75
Total $1,008.00 $1,080.00 $1,260.00

59. Bid Price Unit 90 cases $64.00 $57.75 $78.74
Total $5,760.00 $5,197.50 $7,086.60

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 57 - 59 $10,408.00 $10,225.50 $12,994.60
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, Lithium complex
soap, base oil and fortified with additives, NGLI
Grade 2, Penetration @ 25 degree C ADTM
worked - 280, texture - smooth, Timken OK 
Load - 80 lbs., dropping point - 260 degree C,
flash point - 242 degree C, Viscosity Index - 75.
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: 76 Lubricants 

Multiplex Red #2 

60. Bid Price Unit 3000 lbs ITEMS 60 - 64 $1.50 ITEMS 60 - 64
Total NO BID $4,500.00 NO BID

61. Bid Price Unit 135 cases $57.75
Total $7,796.25

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 60 AND 61 $12,296.25

GREASE, Multi-Purpose, Lithium complex 
soap, base oil and fortified with additives,
NLGI Grade 1, Penetration @25 degree C
ADTM worked - 325, texture - smooth,
Timken OK Load - 80 lbs., dropping point -
271 degree C, flash point - 242 degree C,
Viscosity Index - 75.
Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: 76 Lubricants 

Multiplex Red #2 

62. Bid Price Unit 6,000 lbs $1.41
Total $8,460.00

63. Bid Price Unit 50 gals $11.55
Total $577.50

TOTAL SUM FOR ITEMS NOS. 62 & 63: $9,037.50
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

GREASE, Wheel Bearing Type, NLGI No. 2
grade.  Lithium soap base, 5% wt. min. 
compounded with molybdenum disulfide for
reduced wear at high loads and polyethylene
or equivalent polymers additives for control
leakage from bearings.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No
Brand Name and No. of Products Offered:

64. Bid Price Unit 420 lbs ITEMS 64 - 68
Total NO BID

OIL, Automatic Transmision, shall function as
a universal transmission fluid.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Citgo Transgard ATF Chevron ATF Exxon Superflo ATF 
Dexron III/Mercon Dexron III Mercon 

65. Bid Price Unit 13,800 gals $4.46 $3.78 $3.96
Total $61,548.00 $52,164.00 $54,648.00

66. Bid Price Unit 9,990 gals $5.08 $3.78 $4.50
Total $50,749.20 $37,762.20 $44,955.00

67. Bid Price Unit 936 gals $5.42 $5.46 $5.60
Total $5,073.12 $5,110.56 $5,241.60

TOTAL SUM FOR ITEM NOS. 65 - 67 $117,370.32 $95,036.76 $104,844.60
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Automatic Transmission, fluid
specifications and meeting the latest
performance requireemtns specified by GM
Dextron III, ford Mercon, Allison Transmission
C3 & C4, Sundstrand Hydrostatic
Transmission, Ford M2C138-CJ, M2C166-H,
Caterpillar TO-2, Vickers M2950-S, 1-286-S.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Citgo Transgard ATF Chevron ATF Mobil Multipurpose 
Dexron III/Mercon Dexron III Mercon ATF 

68. Bid Price Unit 23,000 gals $4.46 $3.78 $4.65
Total $102,580.00 $86,940.00 $106,950.00

OIL, Automatic Transmission, fluid
specifications and meeting the latest
performance requirements specified by
Ford Mercon V
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Transgard ATF Kendall Mercon V Chevron ATF Ford Motorcraft 
Dexron 5 Mercon V Mercon V 

69. Bid Price Unit 2,500 gals $9.03 $9.30 $8.95 $8.76
Total $22,575.00 $23,250.00 $22,375.00 $21,900.00

70. Bid Price Unit 33 gals $9.50 $10.00 $10.60 $9.72
Total $313.50 $330.00 $349.80 $320.76

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 69 AND 70 $22,888.50 $23,580.00 $22,724.80 $22,220.76
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PETROLEUM, LTD. HEAD PETROLEUM PETROLEUM, LLC TRANSMISSION DIESEL-ALLISON
PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Automatic Transmission, fluid specifi-
cations and meeting the latest performance
requirements specified by Mopar ATF+3,
ATF+2 or ATF-Plus or.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Citgo Transgard Chevron ATF +3 Pennzoil Multi-Vehicle 
ATF +3 ATF 

71. Bid Price Unit 75 gals $9.00 NO BID $9.53 $9.97
Total $675.00 $714.75 $747.75

OIL, Universal Tractor Fluid.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X X X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Citgo Transgard 76 Lubricants Chevron 1000 THF Exxon Hydraul 560 
Tractor Hydraulic Hydraulic Tractor 

Fluid Fluid 
72. Bid Price Unit 440 gals $5.25 $4.63 $5.90 $5.06

Total $2,310.00 $2,037.20 $2,596.00 $2,226.40

73. Bid Price Unit 200 gals $5.66 $5.40 $7.20 $5.82
Total $1,132.00 $1,080.00 $1,440.00 $1,164.00

74. Bid Price Unit 480 gals $5.86 $5.60 $7.20 $6.50
Total $2,812.80 $2,688.00 $3,456.00 $3,120.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 72 - 74 $6,254.80 $5,805.20 $7,492.00 $6,510.40
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PETROLEUM INC. REPAIR, INC. COMPANY

INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Turbine, OC 658, 150 or equal.
OC 68
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Pacemaker Chevron GST 68 
T 68 AW Machine Oil 150 

75. Bid Price Unit 220 gals $5.15 ITEMS 75 - 83 $4.25 ITEMS 75 - 78
Total $1,133.00 NO BID $935.00 NO BID

76. Bid Price Unit 290 gals $5.95 $7.13
Total $1,725.50 $2,067.70

OC 150
Brand Name and No. of Product Offered: Citgo Pacemakaer Chevron AW 

T 68 Machine Oil 150 

77. Bid Price Unit 150 gals $6.28 $6.86
Total $942.00 $1,029.00

TOTAL SUM FOR ITEM NOS. 75 - 77: $3,800.50 $4,031.70

OIL, Power Steering, GMC #1052884 or equal.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered:

78. Bid Price Unit 8 cases ITEMS 78 - 83 ITEMS 78 & 79
Total NO BID NO BID
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INC.
ITEM
NO.

OIL, Power Steering, meetings service auto
manufacturer's power steering requirements,
be compatible and can be mixed with GM
#1050017, Chrylser Spec 591, Ford Spec
M2C128 C & D, AMC Spec 4060 power
steering fluids.
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Berryman Power- 
steering Fluid 

79. Bid Price Unit 190 cases $11.26
Total $2,139.40

HYDRAULIC FLUID, AG@, MIL Spec
H-5606G, Lift-U-Oil, CPS No. 247710, MSDS
No. 6387, API Gravity 29.9, Viscosity Index
300+, Flash Point 06 degree C, Four Point
-77 degree C, Recycled product(s) being
offered?
         Yes
         No X X

Brand Name and No. of Product Ofered Chevron Aviation Mobil Aero HF 
Hydraulic G 

80. Bid Price Unit 2,500 gals $11.40 $17.84
Total $28,500.00 $44,600.00

SYNTHETIC TRANSFLUID, TRANSYND
Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Castrol CA-27101 27101-55 

Castrol Transynd 

81. Bid Price Unit 6210 gals NO BID ITEMS 81 - 83 $26.36 $1,277.00
Total NO BID $163,695.60 $7,930,170.00
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INC.
ITEM
NO.

SYNTHETIC TRANSFLUID, TRANSYND, or
equal that meets Allison Transmission spec
for severe duty and exended craw intervals
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No X X

Brand Name and No. of Products Offered: Chevron Synthetis Castrol CA-27101 
ATF HD 

82. Bid Price Unit 1,100 gals $17.40 $26.36 NO BID
Total $19,140.00 $28,996.00

83. JELLY, Petroleu, pure white, Medalist Brand NO BID NO BID NO BID
or equal
Recycled product(s) being offered?
         Yes
         No
Brand Name and No. of Products Offered:

Bid Price Unit 12 blts.
Total


