
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING 

PROPOSAL NO. 14384
OPENED:  JUNE 7, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of LEAD STORAGE CUTTER FORD ISUZU INC. EXIDE TECHNOLOGIES, INC. IBS OF HAWAII, INC.
BATTERIES for the twenty-four month period
beginning July·1, 2004 and ending June·30, 2006
the City and County of Honolulu

ITEM
BCI Group (U-1)

  1. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 4 ITEM NOS. 1 - 7 - NO BID $23.06 $37.45

Total $92.24 $149.80
Battery I.D. No.: GT-X SP-40
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 24 42
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 300 340
Reserve Capacity: 34 41
BCI Group 4

  2. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 10 NO BID $37.88

Total $378.80
Battery I.D. No.: V4-5
Battery Brand Name: POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 42
Voltage: 12
CCA: 1,000
Reserve Capacity: 280
BCI Group 21

  3. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 5 NO BID

Total
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
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ITEM
BCI Group 22F

  4. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 8 NO BID $41.61

Total $332.88
Battery I.D. No.: MT-22F
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 75
Voltage: 12
CCA: 450
Reserve Capacity: 77
BCI Group 22NF

  5. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 30 NO BID $37.45

Total $1,123.50
Battery I.D. No.: SP-22NF
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 48
Voltage: 12
CCA: 390
Reserve Capacity: 62
BCI Group 24

  6. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 17 $38.27 $37.16

Total $650.59 $631.72
Battery I.D. No.: 24 - COMM. V-24-7
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 24 84
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 675 700
Reserve Capacity: 120 130
BCI Group 24

  7. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 123 NO BID $59.32

Total $7,296.36
Battery I.D. No.: MTP-24
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 85
Voltage: 12
CCA: 800
Reserve Capacity: 125
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BCI Group 24F
  8. Charge and Wet NO BID

Bid Price: Unit 12 $83.28 NO BID
Total $999.36

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed: ---
Battery I.D. No.: BXT 24 F
Battery Brand Name: Motorcraft
Warranty - Months: 100 mos. pro-rata (36 mos.free replace.)
Voltage: 12
CCA: 600 @ 0 degree F/750 @ 32 degree F
Reserve Capacity: 120
BCI Group 24F

  9. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 23 $83.28 $38.27 $37.16

Total $1,915.44 $880.21 $854.68
Battery I.D. No.: BXT24F 24F-COMM. V24F-7
Battery Brand Name: Motorcraft EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 100 mos. pro-rata (36 mos. free replace.) 24 84
Voltage: 12 12 12
CCA: 600 @ 0 degree F/750 @ 32 degree F 675 700
Reserve Capacity: 120 120 130
BCI Group 26

 10. Charge and Wet ITEM NOS. 10 - 16 - NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 24 $23.17 $47.86

Total $556.08 $1,148.64
Battery I.D. No.: 26-COMM. MT-26
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 24 75
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 525 500
Reserve Capacity: 80 85
BCI Group 27

 11. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 31 $41.50 $39.34

Total $1,286.50 $1,219.54
Battery I.D. No.: 27 COMM. V27-7
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 24 84
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 700 700
Reserve Capacity: 120 135
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ITEM
BCI Group 27F

 12. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 6 $41.50 $39.34

Total $249.00 $236.04
Specifications for battery being offered:
Battery I.D. No.: 27F COMM. V27F-7
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 24 84
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 700 700
Reserve Capacity: 120 135
BCI Group 34

 13. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 4 NO BID

Total
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
BCI Group 34

 14. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 72 $43.94

Total $3,163.68
Battery I.D. No.: 34-COMM.
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE
Warranty - Months: 24
Voltage: 12
CCA: 770
Reserve Capacity: 120
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ITEM
BCI Group 34

 15. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 50 $96.48 $110.36

Total $4,824.00 $5,518.00
Battery I.D. No.: ORB34OC-36 SC34DU
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE OPTIMA (AGM)
Warranty - Months: 36 36
Length: 10-1/8 10-1/8"
Width: 7 7"
Weight: 38 lbs. 44#'s
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 750 750
Reserve Capacity: 100 120
Height: 8 8"
BCI Group 34

 16. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 198 NO BID $87.45

Total $17,315.10
Battery I.D. No.: SC34U/800U
Battery Brand Name: OPTIMA
Warranty - Months: 72
Length: 10
Width: 6-7/8
Weight: 39#'s
Voltage: 12
CCA: 800
Reserve Capacity: 120
Height: 7-13/16
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ITEM
BCI Group 35

 17. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 10 $83.28 $39.45 $37.46

Total $832.80 $394.50 $374.60
Battery I.D. No.: BXT35 35 COMM. V35-6
Battery Brand Name: Motorcraft EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 100 mos. pro-rata (36 mos. free replace.) 24 84
Voltage: 12 12 12
CCA: 550 @ 0 degree F/685 @ 32 degree F 570 570
Reserve Capacity: 100 100 100
BCI Group 50

 18. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 12 NO BID NO BID $71.82

Total $861.84
Battery I.D. No.: C50-XHD
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 30
Voltage: 12
CCA: 600
BCI Group 65

 19. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 34 $83.28 NO BID

Total $2,831.52
Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed: Yes
Battery I.D. No.: BXT58
Battery Brand Name: Motorcraft
Warranty - Months: 100 mos. pro-rata (36 mos. free replace.)
Length 1003"
Width: 7.19"
Height: 6.86"
Voltage: 12
CCA: 540 @ 0 degree F/675 @ 32 degree F
Reserve Capacity: 92
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BCI Group 62
 20. Charge and Wet NO BID

Bid Price: Unit 3 NO BID NO BID
Total

Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
BCI Group 65

 21. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 489 $83.28 $55.06 $63.48

Total $40,723.92 $26,924.34 $31,041.72
Battery I.D. No.: BXT 65-850 65 COMM. MTP-65
Battery Brand Name: Motorcraft EXIDE INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 100 mos. pro-rata (36 mos. free replace.) 24 85
Voltage: 12 12 12
CCA: 875 @ 0 degree F/1090 @ 32 degree F 12 875
Reserve Capacity: 165 160 165
BCI Group 65

 22. Charge and Wet ITEM NOS. 22 - 25 - NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 50 $83.28 NO BID

Total $4,164.00
Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed: yes
Battery I.D. No.: BXT 65-850
Battery Brand Name: Motorcraft
Warranty - Months: 100 mos. pro-rata (36 mos. free replace.)
Voltage: 12
CCA: 875 @0 degree F/1090 @32 degree F
Reserve Capacity: ---
BCI Group 70

23. Charge and Wet ITEM NOS. 23 - 36 - NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 3 NO BID

Total
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
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ITEM
BCI Group 74 with Side Mounted Terminals

 24. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 7 NO BID

Total
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
BCI Group 74 with Side Mounted Terminals

 25. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 7 NO BID

Total
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
BCI Group 75

 26. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 113 $46.68 $36.42

Total $5,274.84 $4,115.46
Battery I.D. No.: 75 COMM. V75-7
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 24 72
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 730 650
Reserve Capacity: 100 95
BCI Group 4D

27. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 37 $88.29

Total $3,266.73
Battery I.D. No.: COM-40-P
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE
Warranty - Months: 24
Voltage: 12
CCA: 1000
Reserve Capacity: 320
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ITEM
BCI Group 8D - For RTS 08 and Gillig Buses

 28. Charge and Wet ITEM NOS. 28 - 32 - NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 300 $134.32

Total $40,296.00
Battery I.D. No.: USRM-8DL
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 48
Deep Cycling Battery: YES
Length: 20.75
Width: 11.12
Weight - Wet 127
Terminal Studs with Hex Nuts: 3/8
Voltage: 12
CCA: 1,200
Reserve Capacity: 455
No. of Plates: 31
Height with Caps: 9-3/4
Weight - Dry 104
BCI Group 8D

 29. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 8 $109.32

Total $874.56
Battery I.D. No.: 8DMHD
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 48
No. of Plates: 31
Width: 11
Height: 9-5/8
Voltage: 12
CCA: 1,400
Reserve Capacity: 450
Length: 20.75
Weight - Dry: 104
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ITEM
BCI Group 8D - For Fire Apparatus

30. Charge and Dry
Bid Price: Unit 120 $120.78

Total $14,493.60
31. Charge and Wet

Bid Price: Unit 232 $109.32
Total $25,362.24

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NOS. 30 AND 31 $39,855.84

Battery I.D. No.: 8D-MHD
Battery Brand Name: INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 48
No. of Plates: 31
Weight - Wet 132
Width: 11
Height: 9-5/8
Voltage: 12
CCA: 1,400
Reserve Capacity: 450
Length 20-3/4
Weigth - Dry 104
BCI Group 31

 32. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 400

Total
Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed:
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
Threaded terminals, Centrally Located, 
      Approx. Inch From End:
Length:
Width:
Height:
Weight:
Built-In Hydrometer:
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ITEM
BCI GROUP 31

33. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 355 $52.71 $125.98

Total $18,712.05 $44,722.90
Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed: NO YES
Battery I.D. No.: HC-31E SC31PM
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE OPTIMA-AGM
Warranty - Months: 24 36
Post terminals? YES AUTO POST SCREW POST
Length: 13 12-13/16
Width: 6-13/16 6-1/2
Height: 9-5/16 9-3/8
Voltage: 12 900
CCA: 700 155
Reserve Capacity: 700 ---
BCI Group 31

34. Charge and Wet NO BID
Bid Price: Unit 30 NO BID

Total
Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed:
Battery I.D. No.:
Battery Brand Name:
Warranty - Months:
Voltage:
CCA:
Reserve Capacity:
Threaded Terminals, Centrally Located, 
            Approx. Inch From End?
Length:
Width:
Height:
Built-In Hydrometer:
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ITEM
BCI Group 31

 35. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 770 $56.82 $47.36

Total $43,751.40 $36,467.20
Battery I.D. No.: HP-310 VMF31S-7
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE POWERVOLT
Warranty - Months: 24 42
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 925 925
Reserve Capacity: 160 175
Threaded Terminals, Centrally Located, 
   Approx. Inch From End? 1-9/16 1-3/4
Length: 12-3/4 12-5/8
Width: 6-9/16 6-1/2
Height: 8-5/8 8-1/2
BCI Group 78

 36. Charge and Wet
Bid Price: Unit 424 $49.38 $62.44

Total $20,937.12 $26,474.56
Battery I.D. No.: 78 COMM MTP-78
Battery Brand Name: EXIDE INTERSTATE
Warranty - Months: 24 85
Voltage: 12 12
CCA: 770 800
Reserve Capacity: 120 110


