
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14376 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MAY 25, 2004

For the FURNISHING, DELIVERY AND
UNLOADING OF WATER WORKS CONSTRUCTION FERGUSON FLUID HAWAII IRRIGATION
MATERIALS AND SUPPLIES, 2003-04, MATERIALS ENTERPRISES, SYSTEMS IRRIGATION SYSTEMS,
to the Board of Water Supply, City INC. HAWAII, INC. SUPPLY INC.
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, COMPANY, INC.
Hawaii

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART I PARTS I - XVII - NO BID $89,892.00 $79,000.00 $93,200.00 PARTS I - V - NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART II $119,480.52 $112,353.50 $99,065.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART III $11,108.15 $11,991.00 $12,430.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART IV $125,880.00 $43,350.00 $46,500.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART V $701.90 $413.20 $690.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART VI $102,636.50 $20,829.00 $17,390.00 $98,898.30

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART VII $146,357.00 $142,500.00 $148,900.00 $141,010.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART VIII $27,224.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART IX $127,853.00 $110,130.00 $119,050.00 ---

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART X $9,625.10 $9,066.00 $9,689.00 PARTS X - XV - NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XI $50,909.50 $46,378.00 $43,689.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XII $4,953.63 $4,590.00 $4,709.70

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XIII $28,181.37 $27,555.00 $28,114.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XIV $4,991.26 $4,889.00 $4,970.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XV --- $18,654.00 NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XVI $112,858.00 $102,260.00 $114,720.00 $117,080.00
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MATERIALS ENTERPRISES, SYSTEMS IRRIGATION SYSTEMS,
INC. HAWAII, INC. SUPPLY INC.

COMPANY, INC.

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XVII $24,269.00 $13,594.00 $14,202.50 PARTS XVII - XX - NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XVIII $19,200.00 $9,270.00 $35,100.00 $23,100.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XIX PARTS XIX & XX - NO BID $17,080.00 $10,200.00 $17,320.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR PART XX $1,525.00 NO BID NO BID


