PROPOSAL NO. 14370
OPENED: -MAY 11,2004 MAY 17, 2004
Regn. No. G32437

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing of BUS SERVICES FOR

GOMES SCHOOL

KAILUA LOCAL

ROBERT'S HAWAII

THE SUMMER FUN PROGRAM for the BUS SERVICE, LTD. CAB, INC. SCHOOL BUS, INC.
Department of Parks and Recreation, City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
1.  AINA HAINA COMMUNITY PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 1: NO BID ITEMS1 -8 $2,924.00
2. KAHALA COMMUNITY PARK NO BID
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 2: $2,691.50 $2,506.00
3.  KAIMUKI COMMUNITY PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 3: $2,631.00 $2,346.00
4. KAMILO IKI COMMUNITY PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 4: NO BID $5,129.00
5. KANEWAI COMMUNITY PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 5: $3,420.50 $2,514.00
6. KAPAOLONO COMMUNITY PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 6: NO BID $1,859.00
7.  KILAUEA DISTRICT PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 7: $762.00 $484.00
8. KOKO HEAD DISTRICT PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 8: $3,496.00 $4,219.00
9. MANOA VALLEY DISTRICT PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 9: $5,707.00 $4,789.00 $5,715.00
10. MCCULLY DISTRICT PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 10: $4,030.00 ITEMS 10 - 13 $3,992.00
11. PAKI COMMUNITY PARK NO BID
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 11: $2,004.00 $2,012.00
12. PALOLO VALLEY DISTRICT PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 12: $1,676.00 $1,736.00
13.  WILSON COMMUNITY PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 13: $1,308.00 $1,452.00
14. AIEA DISTRICT PARK
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 14: $4,638.00 $3,768.00 $4,762.00
15. AIEA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 15: $1,163.00 $1,050.00 $1,085.00
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16. BERETANIA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 16: $2,044.00 ITEMS 16 - 20 $2,008.00
17. BOOTH DISTRICT PARK NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 17: $5,060.00 $4,690.00
18. BOOTH COMPLEX (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 18: $780.00 $590.00
19. FERN COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 19: $1,455.00 $1,341.00
20. FERN COMMUNITY PARK (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 20: $280.00 $227.00
21. HALAWA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 21: $3,950.00 $2,700.00 $3,819.00
22.  HALAWA COMPLEX (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 22: $1,830.00 $1,166.00 $1,355.00
23. KALAKAUA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 23: $1,872.00 ITEMS 23 - 28 $1,812.00
24. KALAKAUA COMPLEX (TEEN) NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 24: $1,245.00 $926.00
25. KALIHI UKA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 25: $1,848.00 $1,752.00
26. KALIHI VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 26: $1,996.00 $2,004.00
27. KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 27: $1,530.00 $1,571.00
28. KAMEHAMEHA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 28: $1,944.00 $1,776.00
29. LANAKILA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 29: $2,280.00 $1,872.00 $2,236.00
30. MAKIKI DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 30: $938.00 NO BID $938.00
31. MOANALUA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 31: $3,158.00 NO BID $2,884.00
32.  PU'UNUI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 32: $2,388.00 $1,500.00 $1,936.00
33. SALT LAKE DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 33: $2,436.00 $1,992.00 $2,394.00
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34. SHERIDAN COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 34: $852.00 ITEMS 34 - 36 $906.00
35. STEVENSON RECREATION CENTER NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 35: $1,003.00 $905.00
36. STEVENSON RECREATION CENTER (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 36: $525.00 $386.00
37. ASING COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 37: ITEMS 37 - 45 $2,043.00 $3,771.00
38. CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 38: $2,496.00 $4,392.00
39. EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 39: $2,567.00 $5,243.00
40. EWA COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 40: $668.00 $1,081.00
41. EWA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 41: $2,443.00 $4,633.00
42, HO'AE'AE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 42: NO BID $2,382.00
43. MAILI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 43: $1,176.00 $1,725.00
44, MAKAHA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 44: ITEMS 44 - 46 $2,164.00
45. MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 45: $5,734.00
46. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 46: $3,840.00 $3,952.00
47. NANAKULI BEACH PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 47: NO BID $1,920.00 $3,126.00
48. PACIFIC PALISADES COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 48: $2,505.00 NO BID $3,204.00
49, PEARL CITY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 49: $4,004.00 $2,984.00 $4,848.00
50. PEARL CITY COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 50: $1,960.00 $1,346.00 $2,039.00
51. PILILAAU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 51: ITEMS 51 - 55 - NO BID $1,845.00 $3,318.00
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52. PROJECT HOOMANA at Waipahu Intermediate

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 52: NO BID $333.00
53. WAHIAWA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 53: NO BID $4,610.00
54. WAIANAE DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 54: $3,036.00 $5,600.00
55. WAIANAE COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 55: $1,276.00 $2,097.00
56. WAIAU DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 56: $3,315.00 $2,553.00 $4,089.00
57. WAIKELE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 57: $1,290.00 $1,056.00 $1,712.00
58. WAIPAHU DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 58: $2,550.00 ITEMS 58 - 81 $3,435.00
59. WAIPAHU COMPLEX TEENS NO BID

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 59: $1,170.00 $1,215.00
60. WHITMORE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 60: NO BID $1,327.00
61. MILILANI COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 61: NO BID $575.00
62. AHUIMANU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 62: $2,270.00 $3,389.00
63. AIKAHI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 63: $1,140.00 $1,746.00
64. HAUULA SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 64: $1,170.00 $2,742.00
65. HEEIA SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 65: $2,670.00 $4,081.00
66. KAHALUU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 66: $2,130.00 $3,630.00
67. KAHUKU DISTRICT PART

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 67: $1,380.00 $2,406.00
68. KAILUA SUMMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 68: $1,120.00 $1,880.00
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69. KAPUNAHALA SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 69: $2,700.00 $3,870.00
70. KEOLU HILLS SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 70: $2,230.00 $3,585.00
71. LAIE SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 71: $1,840.00 $3,400.00
72.  SUNSET BEACH NEIGHBORHOOD PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 72: $1,860.00 $2,160.00
73. WAIALUA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 73: NO BID $3,424.00
74. WAIMANALO BEACH PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 74: $1,365.00 $2,344.00
75. KAHALUU COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 75: $1,725.00 $2,402.00
76. KAILUA COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 76: $590.00 $806.00
77. KANEOHE COMPLEX (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 77: $1,210.00 $1,459.00
78.  WAIALUA COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 78: NO BID $695.00
79. WAIMANALO DISTRICT PARK (TEEN)

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 79: $995.00 $1,429.00
80. TO/FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 80: $1,285.00 $1,428.00
81. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 81: $1,090.00 $1,182.00
82. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 82: $800.00 $600.00 $870.00
83. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 83: $1,400.00 $1,050.00 $1,552.00
84. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 84: NO BID NO BID $1,598.00
85. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 85: NO BID NO BID $1,292.00
86. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 86: $660.00 $450.00 $736.00
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87. TO CAMP KUALOA
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 87: $1,070.00 NO BID $1,552.00




