PROPOSAL NO. 14368
OPENED: MAY 7, 2004

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM

1.

For the furnishing and delivery of
FERTILIZERS, for a twelve-month period

PACIFIC AGRICULTURAL

PHOENIX V LLC

VERDICON INCORPORATED

beginning May 15, 2004 and ending SALES & SERVICE, INC. DBA BEI HAWAII

May 14, 2005 to the City and County of

Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

NO. Controlled-Release Fertilizer

Lesco 21-4-11 + S, Fe & Mn or equal; In

50-Ib. bag

Bid Price Unit 200 bags NO BID NO BID $24.95
Total 1-3 $4,990.00

Brand Name and Number: As specified

Contec 8384, 18-9-18 + Fe + Mn or equal;

In 50-Ib. bag

Bid Price Unit 200 bags $42.56 ITEMS2-5
Total $8,512.00 NO BID

Brand Name and Number: Andersons 8348 18-9-18

Wil-Gro 28-3-10 Mini or equal; In 50-Ib. bag

Bid Price Unit 170 bags $20.55
Total $3,493.50

Brand Name and Number: Wil Gro 28-3-10 Mini

Short-Kut 18-6-12 with Polyon or equal; In

50-Ib. bag

Bid Price Unit 250 bags $22.08 $22.45
Total $5,520.00 $5,612.50

Brand Name and Number:

Simplot 18-6-12

J. R. Simplot Short-Kut 18-6-12
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5. 30-1-9 Minim with Polyon or equal; In
50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 500 bags $34.62 NO BID
Total $17,310.00
Brand Name and Number: Simplot 30-1-9
6. 24-4-16 + Fe or equal; In 50-Ib. bag
50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 1,900 bags $19.35 $17.53 $16.45
Total $36,765.00 $33,307.00 $31,255.00
Brand Name and Number: Wil Gro 24-4-16 + Fe Gaviota 24-4-16 + Fe As specified
7. 22-5-12 or equal; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 300 bags NO BID $19.45 ITEMS 7 - 14
Total $5,835.00 NO BID
Brand Name and Number: Lebanon 22-5-12
8. 19-3-19 or equal; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $32.00 $33.84
Total $9,600.00 $10,152.00
Brand Name and Number: Simplot 19-3-19 J. R. Simplot 19-3-19
Controlled-Release Fertilizer with
Pre-Emergent Herbicide Unit
9. 21-0-20 + 1.5% Ronstar or equal; In 50-Ib.
bag
Bid Price Unit 3,000 bags $50.75 NO BID
Total $152,250.00

Brand Name and Number:

Andersons 21-0-20 + 1.5% Ronstar
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10. 20-4-10- + 1.0% Ronstar or equal; In 50-Ib.
bag
Bid Price Unit 100 bags $36.35 $36.78
Total $3,635.00 $3,678.00
Brand Name and Number: Lebanon Proscape 20-4-10 + 1% Lebanon 20-4-10 w/1% Ronstar
Ronstar
11. 22-0-10 + 1.0% Ronstar or equal; In 50-Ib.
bag
Bid Price Unit 250 bags $38.82 NO BID
Total $9,705.00
Brand Name and Number: Andersons 22-0-10 + 1% Ronstarn
12. 19-0-23 with 1.5% Ronstar or equal; In 50-Ib.
bag
Bid Price Unit 2,000 bags $55.04 $56.61
Total $110,080.00 $113,220.00
Brand Name and Number Lebanon Proscape Expo 19-0-23 + |Lebanon 19-0-23 with 1.5% Ronstar
1.5% Ronstar
Lawn Fertilizer
13. Mini Turf 16-8-8 or equal; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $12.85 $12.26
Total $2,570.00 $2,452.00
Brand Name and Number: Simplot 16-8-8 J. R. Simplot Mini Turf 16-8-8
14. Turf Gold 22-5-5 or equal; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 200 bags NO BID $16.31
Total $3,262.00

Brand Name and Number:

J. R. Simplot Turf Gold 22-5-5
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15. Di-Ammonium Phosphate 18-46-0 or equal;
In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $11.84 $12.14 $10.60
Total $2,368.00 $2,428.00 $2,120.00
Brand Name and Number: Simplot 18-46-0 |Gaviota 18-46-0 As specified
Organic Fertilizer
16. Gro-Power 5-3-1 or equal; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $18.20 NO BID $15.65
Total $5,460.00 $4,695.00
Brand Name and Number: Gro Power 5-3-1 UHS 5-3-1 w/Humate #926370
17. Gro-Power Premium Green 6-2-10 or
equal; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 900 bags $24.00 NO BID NO BID
Total $21,600.00
Brand Name and Number: Gro Power Prem Grn 6-2-10
Starter Fertilizer
18. Analysis: 10-30-10; In 50-Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 100 bags $12.00 $10.76 $9.45
Total $1,200.00 $1,076.00 $945.00
Brand Name and Number: Wilbur Ellis 10-30-10 Gaviota 10-30-10 UAP 10-30-10
Organic Soil Conditioner & Growth
Promoter
19. Kel-Plex Liquid Concentrate or equal; In
55-gallon drum
Bid Price Unit 3 drums $596.35 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,789.05

Brand Name and Number:

Kel Plex




