

**ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING**

PROPOSAL NO. 14355
OPENED: APRIL 30, 2004

For the furnishing and delivery of SUPPLEMENTAL MEDICAL SUPPLIES for a twelve-month period beginning June 1, 2004 and ending May 31, 2005 to the Department of Emergency Services, Emergency Medical Services - Ambulance Division, City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
<p>ITEM NO. <u>GROUP I - Adhesive Tapes</u></p> <p>1. Adhesive Tape; waterproof, cloth, 1"x10 yds. Bid Price Unit 144 rolls Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:</p> <p>Dimensions (in. x yds.):</p> <p>No. of Rolls/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:</p> <p>Unit of Purchase - Packaging:</p> <p>2. Adhesive Tape; waterproof, cloth, 2"x10 yds. Bid Price Unit 720 rolls Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:</p> <p>Dimensions (in. x yds.):</p> <p>No. of Rolls/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:</p> <p>Unit of Purchase - Packaging:</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 119 NO BID</p>	<p>\$1.7812 \$256.49 Kendall Wet Pruf #KE 3142</p>	<p>\$2.85 \$410.40 Tape-0 WP100-12</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 89 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 62 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 30 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 3 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 89 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 40 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 45 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 95 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 156 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 45 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 37 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 5 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 60 NO BID</p>	<p>ITEMS 1 - 62 NO BID</p>

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
<u>GROUP II - AIRWAYS, NASOPHARYNGEAL</u>																	
6.		ITEMS 6 - 20 NO BID	\$0.33 \$3.30				ITEMS 6 - 17 NO BID								\$1.92 \$19.20		
			Sunmed 1-5076-20												Sunmed 1-5076-20		
			10/bx												10		
			10/bx												box		
7.			\$0.33 \$3.30												\$1.92 \$19.20		
			Sunmed 1-5076-22												Sunmed 1-5076-22		
			10/bx												10		
			10/bx												box		
8.			\$0.33 \$3.30												\$1.92 \$19.20		
			Sunmed 1-5076-24												Sunmed 1-5076-24		
			10/bx												10		
			10/bx												box		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
9. Size 26 Fr.																		
Bid Price			\$0.33												\$1.92			
Unit Total			\$3.30												\$19.20			
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed 1-5076-26												Sunmed 1-5076-26			
No. of Airways/Box:			10/bx												10			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx												box			
10. Size 28 Fr.																		
Bid Price			\$0.33												\$1.92			
Unit Total			\$3.30												\$19.20			
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed 1-5076-28												Sunmed 1-5076-28			
No. of Airways/Box:			10/bx												10			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx												box			
11. Size 30 Fr.																		
Bid Price			\$0.33												\$1.92			
Unit Total			\$3.30												\$19.20			
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed 1-5076-30												Sunmed 1-5076-30			
No. of Airways/Box:			10/bx												10			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx												box			

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTERMAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
12.																		
Size 32 Fr.																		
Bid Price			\$0.33												\$1.92			
Unit			\$3.30												\$19.20			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed												Sunmed			
			1-5076-32												1-5076-32			
No. of Airways/Box:			10/bx												10			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx												box			
13.																		
Size 34 Fr.																		
Bid Price			\$0.33												\$1.92			
Unit			\$3.30												\$19.20			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed												Sunmed			
			1-5076-34												1-5076-34			
No. of Airways/Box:			10/bx												10			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx												box			
14.																		
Size 36 Fr.																		
Bid Price			\$0.33												\$1.92			
Unit			\$3.30												\$19.20			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed												Sunmed			
			1-5076-36												1-5076-36			
No. of Airways/Box:			10/bx												10			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx												box			
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II			<u>\$29.70</u>												<u>\$172.80</u>			

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
18																		
80mm; #3																		
Bid Price			\$0.70				\$0.54											
Unit			\$35.00				\$27.00											
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed 1-1505-80				Rusch 1225-80											
No. of Airways/Box:			50/bx				50/bx											
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			50/bx				bx											
19.																		
80mm; #4																		
Bid Price			\$0.70				\$0.54											
Unit			\$525.00				\$405.00											
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed 1-1505-90				Rusch 1225-90											
No. of Airways/Box:			50/bx				50/bx											
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			50/bx				bx											
20.																		
100mm; #5																		
Bid Price			\$0.70				\$0.54											
Unit			\$525.00				\$405.00											
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed 1-1505-99				Rusch 1225-100											
No. of Airways/Box:			50/bx				50bx											
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			50/bx				bx											
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III			<u>\$1,190.00</u>				<u>\$864.00</u>											<u>\$1,054.00</u>

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
<u>GROUP IV - ANESTHESIA MASKS</u>																	
21. Neonatal Size							ITEMS 21 - 30 NO BID										
Bid Price		\$1.4868	\$2.60												\$2.17		
Unit Total	30 each	\$44.60	\$78.00												\$65.10		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Rusch #RU 158000	Rusch RU1580000												Rusch 15800 as spec. 30		
No. of Masks/Case:		30/cs	30/cs												30		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		case	30/cs												box		
22. Infant Size																	
Bid Price		\$1.4868	\$2.60												\$2.17		
Unit Total	30 each	\$44.60	\$78.00												\$65.10		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Rusch #RU 158100	Rusch RU158100												as spec.		
No. of Masks/Case:		30/cs	30/cs												30		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		case	30/cs												box		
23. Toddler Size																	
Bid Price		\$1.4868	\$2.60												2.17		
Unit Total	30 each	\$44.60	\$78.00												\$65.10		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Rusch #RU 158200	Rusch RU158200												as spec.		
No. of Masks/Case:		30/cs	30/cs												30		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		case	30/cs												box		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
24. Child Size																	
Bid Price		\$1.4868	\$2.60												\$2.17		
Unit		\$44.60	\$78.00												\$65.10		
Total																	
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Rusch #RU 158200	Rusch RU158200												as spec.		
No. of Masks/Case:		30/cs	30/cs												30		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		case	30/cs												box		
25. Adult Size; small size																	
Bid Price		\$1.4868	\$2.60												\$2.17		
Unit		\$44.60	\$78.00												\$65.10		
Total																	
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Rusch #RU 158300	Rusch RU158300												as spec.		
No. of Masks/Case:		30/cs	30/cs												30		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		case	30/cs												box		
26. Adult Size; standard size																	
Bid Price		\$1.4868	\$2.60												\$2.17		
Unit		\$44.60	\$78.00												\$65.10		
Total																	
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Rusch #RU 158400	Rusch RU158400												as spec.		
No. of Masks/Case:		30/cs	30/cs												30		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		case	30/cs												box		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
36. 6" x 5 yds.																	
Bid Price		\$1.0763	\$5.40			\$1.10	\$2.02								\$0.76		
Unit																	
Total	1,920 pieces	\$2,066.50	\$10,368.00			\$2,112.00	\$3,878.40								\$1,459.20		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Medline ML-00 NON25499	Dynarex 3136			Kentex	NON 25499								Medline Non 25499		
No. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:		6/bx	12/bx			6/bx	12 pcs/bx								48/cs		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		8 bx/cs	4/cs			8 boxes/case	4 bx/cs								case		
		box	12/bx			one case	case										
37. 4-1/2" x 4.1 yds.																	
Bid Price		\$0.99	\$0.85			\$0.90	\$0.88								\$0.94		
Unit																	
Total	200 pieces	\$198.00	\$170.00			\$180.00	\$176.00								\$188.00		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Medline #ML-00 NON25865	Hermitage 2009			Dynarex 3161	NON 25865								Medline Non 258655		
Dimensions:		4-1/2" x 4 yd.	4-1/2 x 4.1			4-1/2"x4.1 yd	4.5 in x 4.1 yds								as spec.		
No. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:		100/cs	1/bx			one/pouch.	100/cs								100/cs		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		each	1/bx			100 pouch/cs	case								case		
						one case											
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII		<u>\$4,306.63</u>	<u>\$21,885.20</u>			<u>\$3,897.12</u>	<u>\$5,576.96</u>								<u>\$3,408.80</u>		
<u>GROUP VIII - BLOOD PRESSURE SUPPLIES</u>																	
<u>General</u>																	
38. Bulb						ITEMS	ITEMS										
Bid Price		\$1.44	\$2.25			38 - 62	38 - 62							\$1.85	\$1.87		
Unit																	
Total	40 pieces	\$57.60	\$90.00			NO BID	NO BID							\$74.00	\$74.80		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Mabis MB 05-288-0201	Mabis 052880201B											Mabis 5288020	Mabis 05-288-020		
No. of Bulbs/Box:			20/bx											20	10/box		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			20/bx											1 bx	box		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTERMAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
48. Wire Limb Assembly																		
Bid Price										\$55.10			\$62.00					
Unit										\$275.50			\$310.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:										MPC #11110-000102			MPC 12 lead ECG cable 4 wire limb attach. #11110-000102					
No. of Assemblies/Package:										1 each			1					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:										1 each			1 package					
49. Wire Precordial Assembly																		
Bid Price										\$85.50			\$95.00					
Unit										\$427.50			\$475.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:										MPC #11110-000103			MPC 12 lead ECG cable 6 wire precordial attach. #11110-000103					
No. of Assemblies/Package:										1 each			1					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:										1 each			1 package					
50. Unilead Precordial Assembly																		
Bid Price										NO BID			\$81.00					
Unit													\$405.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:													MPC uni-lead Precordial lead attach. #21330-000251 replace.					
No. of Assemblies/Package:													1					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:													1 package					
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IX										---			<u>\$4,565.00</u>					

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
57. Sensor, End-Tidal CO2																		
Bid Price										\$13.11			\$13.43					
Unit										\$6,555.00			\$6,715.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:										MPC #11996-000080			MPC filterline H set adult/ped #11996-000080					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:										25 per box			25 sensors/ 1 package					
58. Sensor, Pulse Oximeter																		
Bid Price										\$194.75			\$200.00					
Unit										\$9,737.50			\$10,000.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:										MPC #11996-000019			MPC durasensor adult finger cup sensor #11996-000060					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:										1 each			1 sensor/ 1 package					
59. Shield, Screen																		
Bid Price										\$36.10			\$39.00					
Unit										\$722.00			\$780.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:										MPC #11220-000063			MPC removable acrylic screen shield #11998-000063					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:										1 each			2 screens/ 1 package					
60. Strap, Shoulder																		
Bid Price										\$22.80			\$25.00					
Unit										\$228.00			\$250.00					
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:										MPC #11220-000030			MPC shoulder strap replacement #11260-000010					
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:										1 each			2 straps/ 1 package					
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP X										<u>\$32,623.00</u>			<u>\$33,988.75</u>					

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
79. Size 7.5mm																		
Bid Price			\$6.65											\$1.92		\$1.68		
Unit														\$768.00		\$672.00		
Total			\$2,660.00															
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt											Mallinckrodt 86451		Mallinckrodt 86451		
No. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:			10/bx											10/bx		10/bx		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx											1/bx		box of 10		
80. Size 8.0mm																		
Bid Price			\$6.65											\$1.92		\$1.68		
Unit														\$1,152.00		\$1,008.00		
Total			\$3,990.00															
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt											Mallinckrodt 86452		Mallinckrodt 86452		
No. of pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:			10/bx											10/bx		10/bx		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx											1/bx		box of 10		
81. Size 9.0mm																		
Bid Price			\$6.65											\$1.92		\$1.68		
Unit														\$38.40		\$33.60		
Total			\$133.00															
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt											Mallinckrodt 86454		Mallinckrodt 86454		
No. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:			10/bx											10/bx		10/bx		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx											1/bx		box of 10		
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XV			<u>\$7,049.00</u>											<u>\$2,035.20</u>		<u>\$1,780.80</u>		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
85. Size 3.5mm																		
Bid Price			\$4.84			\$1.24											\$1.25	
Unit			\$96.80			\$24.80											\$25.00	
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt			---											Mallinckrodt 86224	
No. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:			10/bx			10/bx											10/bx	
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx			2 boxes											box of 10	
86. Size 4.0mm																		
Bid Price			\$4.84			\$1.24											\$1.25	
Unit			\$96.80			\$24.80											\$25.00	
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt			---											Mallinckrodt 86225	
No. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:			10/bx			10/bx											10/bx	
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx			2 boxes											box of 10	
87. Size 4.5mm																		
Bid Price			\$4.84			\$1.24											\$1.25	
Unit			\$96.80			\$24.80											\$25.00	
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt			---											Mallinckrodt 86226	
Njo. of Pieces/Box & No. of Boxes/Case:			10/bx			10/bx											10/bx	
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx			2 boxes											box of 10	

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
91. Pediatric size																	
Bid Price			\$7.85	\$4.90				\$445.00							\$4.41		
Unit																	
Total			\$785.00	\$490.00				\$44,500.00							\$441.00		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Laerdal	Laerdal Stifneck #980200				Laerdal Stifneck #980250							as spec.		
No. of Collars/Case:			50/cs	50				50							50		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			50/cs	cs				case							case		
92. "No Neck" style																	
Bid Price			\$7.85	\$4.90				\$445.00							\$4.41		
Unit																	
Total			\$392.50	\$245.00				\$22,250.00							\$220.50		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Laerdal	Laerdal Stifneck #980300				Laerdal Stifneck #980350							as spec.		
No. of Collars/Case:			50/cs	50				50							50		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			50/cs	cs				case							case		
93. Short style																	
Bid Price			\$7.85	\$4.90				\$445.00							\$4.41		
Unit																	
Total			\$392.50	\$245.00				\$22,250.00							\$220.50		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Laerdal	Laerdal Stifneck #980400				Laerdal Stifneck #980450							as spec.		
No. of Collars/Case:			50/cs	50				case							50		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			5/cs	cs											case		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
100. Immobilizer, 16"x5"x5" Bid Price Unit 2,000 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions: No. of Immobilizers/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$6.25 \$12,500.00 Laerdal	\$4.05 \$8,100.00 Laerdal 982000				\$579.00 \$1,158,000.00 Laerdal Headbed II #982001 15.5"x4-5/8"x3/8" when packaged 100 case			ITEMS 100 - 160 NO BID			ITEMS 100 - 172 NO BID	\$6.00 \$12,000.00 as spec.		ITEMS 100 & 101 NO BID
101. Immobilizer, 15-3/4"L x 8"W x 3/8" thick Bid Price Unit 100 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions: No. of Immobilizers/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$5.37 \$537.00 Ferno 455	NO BID				\$579.00 \$57,900.00 Laerdal Headbed II #982001 see attach. 100 case							\$4.08 \$408.00 as spec.		
<u>GROUP XX - INHALAION SUPPLIES</u>																	
102. Nasal Cannula Bid Price Unit 9,600 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Sets/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$0.39 \$3,744.00 Allegiance 1310	\$0.85 \$8,160.00 Hudson 1104				ITEMS 102 - 164 NO BID							\$0.39 \$3,744.00 as spec.		\$0.4195 \$4,027.20 Allegiance #001310

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
103. Nebulize, Mist			ITEMS															
Bid Price			103 - 105	\$2.50											\$0.80			\$0.875
Unit			NO BID	\$5,750.00											\$1,840.00			\$2,012.50
Total															as spec.			Allegiance #002038
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:				Hudson 1724														
No. of Sets/Case:				50											50			50/cs
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				cs											cs			cs
104. Non-Rebreather Oxygen Mask																		
Bid Price				\$2.15											\$1.08			\$1.18
Unit				\$19,350.00											\$9,720.00			\$10,620.00
Total															as spec.			Allegiance #001203
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:				Hudson 1061														
No. of Sets/Case:				50											50			50/cs
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				cs											cs			cs
105. Oxygen Mask																		
Bid Price				\$3.20											\$1.50			\$1.65
Unit				\$2,720.00											\$1,275.00			\$1,402.50
Total															as spec.			Allegiance #001268
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:				Hudson 1058														
No. of Sets/Case:				50											50			50/cs
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				cs											cs			cs
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XX				<u>\$35,980.00</u>											<u>\$16,579.00</u>			<u>\$18,062.20</u>

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
128. Adult Size; 14 Fr. Bid Price Unit 700 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Stylets/Box: Unit of Purchase - Packaging: TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XXII <u>GROUP XXIII - LARYNGOSCOPE BLADES</u> <u>A. 'Macintosh Type</u>			\$6.15 \$4,305.00 Mallinckrodt			\$2.39 \$1,673.00 Shore Medical											\$2.58 \$1,806.00 Mallinckrodt 85865	
			20/bx			10/box 2 boxes/case one case											20/bx	
			20/bx														box of 20	
			<u>\$5,043.00</u>			<u>\$1,959.80</u>											<u>\$2,115.60</u>	
129. Laryngoscope Blades; newborn; Macintosh #0 Bid Price Unit 10 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$19.89 \$198.90 Sunmed	\$18.00 \$180.00 Sunmed 5-5052-00		ITEMS 129 - 142 NO BID									\$14.75 \$147.50 as spec.		ITEMS 129 - 144 NO BID	
			each	ea											ea			
130. Laryngoscope Blades; infant; Macintosh #1 Bid Price Unit 10 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$19.89 \$198.90 Sunmed	\$18.00 \$180.00 Sunmed 5-5052-01											\$14.75 \$147.50 as spec.			
			each	ea											ea			

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
131. Laryngoscope Blades; child size; Macintosh #2 Bid Price Unit 12 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$19.89 \$238.68 Sunmed	\$18.00 \$216.00 Sunmed 5-5052-02											\$14.75 \$177.00 as spec.		
132. Laryngoscope Blades; med, size; Macintosh #3 Bid Price Unit 10 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$19.89 \$198.90 Sunmed	\$18.00 \$180.00 Sunmed 5-5052-03											\$14.75 \$147.50 as spec.		
133. Laryngoscope Blades; large size; Macintosh #4 Bid Price Unit 10 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$19.89 \$198.90 Sunmed	\$18.00 \$180.00 Sunmed 5-5052-04											\$14.75 \$147.50 as spec.		
<u>B. Miller Type</u>																	
134. Laryngoscope Blades; premature; Miller #0 Bid Price Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$19.89 \$99.45 Sunmed	\$18.00 \$90.00 Sunmed 5-5062-00											\$14.75 \$73.75 as spec.		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTERMAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
135. Laryngoscope Blades; infant size; Miller #1																	
Bid Price			\$19.89	\$18.00											\$14.75		
Unit															\$73.75		
Total			\$99.45	\$90.00													
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed	Sunmed											as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			each	ea											ea		
136. Laryngoscope Blades; large size; Miller #2																	
Bid Price			\$19.89	\$18.00											\$14.75		
Unit															\$73.75		
Total			\$99.45	\$90.00													
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed	Sunmed											as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			each	ea											ea		
137. Laryngoscope Blades; large size; Miller #3																	
Bid Price			\$19.89	\$18.00											\$14.75		
Unit															\$73.75		
Total			\$99.45	\$90.00													
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed	Sunmed											as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			each	ea											ea		
138. Laryngoscope Blades; large size; Miller #4																	
Bid Price			\$19.89	\$18.00											\$14.75		
Unit															\$147.50		
Total			\$198.90	\$180.00													
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed	Sunmed											as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			each	ea											ea		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
143. Laryngoscope Bulb; small size																	
Bid Price			\$3.15	\$2.75		\$0.92									\$2.81		
Unit															\$1,011.60		
Total			\$1,134.00	\$990.00		\$331.20											
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Sunmed	Sunmed		Kentron #LB100									Sunmed 5-0234-01		
No. of Bulbs/Case:			60/cs	pk of 10		60/box									10/pk		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			60/cs	60 cs		60/box									pk/10		
144. Laryngoscope Handles																	
Bid Price			\$39.30	\$13.75		\$8.75									\$11.61		
Unit															\$1,451.25		
Total			\$4,912.50	\$1,718.75		\$1,093.75											
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Rusch	Sunmed New #5-0237-03		Kentron LH15000C									Sunmed 5-0237-04		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			each	ea		10/case									each		
145. 28 French				ITEMS											ITEMS		
Bid Price			\$14.16	145 - 156		ITEMS									145 & 146	\$8.45	
Unit				NO BID		145 - 164									NO BID	\$169.00	
Total			\$283.20			NO BID											
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt													Mallinckrodt 85802	
No. of Tubes/Box:			10/bx													10/bx	
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx													box of 10	
146. 32 French																	
Bid Price			\$14.16													\$8.45	
Unit																\$169.00	
Total			\$283.20														
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Mallinckrodt													Mallinckrodt 85803	
No. of Tubes/Box:			10/bx													10/bx	
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			10/bx													box of 10	
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XXV			<u>\$566.40</u>													<u>\$338.00</u>	

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.		
160. <u>Respirator Fit Check Cup</u> Bid Price Unit 200 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:				\$6.10 \$1,220.00 USA 816658								ITEMS 160 & 161 NO BID							
No. of Cups/Case:				20															
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				cs															
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XXVII				<u>\$3,038.00</u>								---							
<u>B. Respirators</u>																			
161. Respirator; single use particulate mask Bid Price Unit 16,800 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:				NO BID								\$0.575 \$9,660.00						\$0.465 \$7,812.00	
No. of Masks/Box and No. of Boxes/Case:												Alpha Protech Magic Arch N95 Respirator Mask (MAS 695) 35 masks/bx 6 bx/cs case (6 bx/case)						Alpha Protech #695 35/bx 6 bx/cs case	
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:																			
162. Respirator; foldable; low profile design Bid Price Unit 400 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:				\$0.52 \$208.00 MSA 10019587								ITEMS 162 - 242 NO BID	\$12.12/box \$242.40					ITEMS 162 - 164 NO BID	
No. of Respirators/Box:				20								20/box							
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				bx								20 boxes							

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
163. Respirator; disposable type; inner lining vertical fold for face seal over top half of mask Bid Price Unit 2,000 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Respirators/Box and Boxes/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				\$0.562 \$1,124.00 Willson N9510S	\$0.71 \$1,420.00 Willson Model No. N9510							ITEMS 163 - 242 NO BID					
200/case 20/box				20/box 10 bx/cs	20 respirators/ box 10 bx/cs												
164. Respirator; disposable type; for protection against oils aerosols Bid Price Unit 2,000 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Respirators/box and Boxes/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				\$1.48 \$2,960.00 Willson P9530M	ITEMS 164 - 242 NO BID												
10/box 10bx/cs 100/case 10/box				10/box 10bx/cs 100/case 10/box													
GROUP XXX - RESUSCITATORS, DISPOSABLE MANUAL																	
165. Infant size Bid Price Unit 30 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Bag Volume - ml: Stroke Volume (in cc): One - Hand: Two -Hand:				ITEMS 165 - 182 NO BID	\$15.50 \$465.00 Kentex 778543			\$139.50 \$4,185.00 Laerdal The Bag #840029						\$16.26 \$487.80 Allegiance as spec.			\$17.18 \$515.40 Allegiance #2K8019
					600 cc			550 ml						as spec.			600
					265-275cc 325-335cc			see attach. see attach.						as spec. as spec.			270 330

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
165. Infant size (continued) FI02 w/Reservoir @ 12 Breaths Per Minute __LP _____ %						---		see attach.							as spec. as spec.		---
P.E.E.P. (cm Range):						0 - 20 cms/ H20		see attach.							as spec.		---
Storage & Operating Temperature (Degree Range in F):						---		operating 0-122 F/storage -40 - 140 F 10							as spec.		---
No. of Resuscitators/Box:						6/case									6/bx-cs		6
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:						(6/CASE) one case		case							case		box
166. Pediatric (Child) size Bid Price Unit 132 each Total						\$15.50 \$2,046.00		\$111.60 \$14,731.20							\$16.26 \$2,146.32		\$17.18 \$2,267.76
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:						Kentex 778533		Laerdal The Bag #840034							as spec.		Allegiance #2K8018
Bag Volume - ml:						1000cc		950 ml							as spec.		1000
Stroke Volume (in cc): One - Hand: Two -Hand:						500cc 650 - 670cc		see attach.							as spec. as spec.		500 660
FI02 w/Reservoir @ 12 Breaths Per Minute __LP _____ %						---		see attach.							as spec. as spec.		---
P.E.E.P. (cm Range):						0 - 20 cms/ H20		see attach.							as spec.		--
Storage & Operating Temperature (Degree Range in F):						---		storage -40 - 140F/ 0 - 122 F 8							as spec.		---
No. of Resuscitators/Box:						6/case									6/bx-cs		6
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:						one case		pkg.							case		bx

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
172. 6 oz. net weight aerosol can Bid Price: Unit 24 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Net Weight o Aerosol Can (Oz.): No. of Cans/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging: TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XXXII <u>GROUP XXXIV - SPHYGMOMANOMETERS</u>			NO BID														
173. Child size Bid Price Unit 20 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Sphygmomanometers/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		\$13.00 \$260.00 Mabis #MB 01-140-015 1 each	\$15.75 \$315.00 Mabis each each											\$15.97 \$319.40 Mabis 01-140-015 10 case	\$13.00 \$260.00 as spec. 20 case		
174. Child size Bid Price Unit 20 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Sphymomanometers/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging		\$3.86 \$77.20 Mabis #MB06-270-195 5/bx box	\$5.70 \$114.00 Mabis 50/cs each											\$4.28 \$85.60 Mabis 06-270-195 10 case	\$4.92 \$98.40 Mabis 06-270-195 20 case		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
GROUP XXXVI - SUCTION SUPPLIES																	
179. Suction Canister; 1000 ml		ITEMS															
Bid Price	Unit	179 - 190	\$18.00					\$180.00									
	24 each	NO BID	\$432.00					\$4,320.00									
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			Dixie					Laerdal Canister #794600									
No. of Canisters/Case:			12/cs					12									
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			12/cs					case									
180. Suction Canister; 1200 ml																	
Bid Price	Unit		NO BID					ITEMS							\$1.77		\$1.95
	80 each							180 - 182							\$141.60		\$156.00
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:								NO BID							Allegiance 65651-212		Baxter 65651-212
No. of Canisters/Case:															40		40/cs
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															case		case
181. Suction Set																	
Bid Price:	Unit		NO BID												\$1.33		\$1.4375
	150 each														\$199.50		\$215.63
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															Allegiance K83A		Baxter K83A
No. of Units/Case:															50		50/cs
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															case		case

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
194. 1" x 5 yds. Bid Price: Unit 1,440 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions: No. of Rolls/Box and No. of Boxes/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging: TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XXXIX GROUP XXXX - TRACTION SPLINTS AND REPLACEMENT PARTS		\$1.08 \$1,555.20 3M #TM 1527-08	\$1.59 \$2,289.60 3M	\$0.85 \$1,224.00 3M 1527-1		\$0.90 \$1,296.00 AMD-Ritmed	\$1.18 \$1,699.20 3M 1527-1								\$1.48 \$2,131.20 3M 1527-1		
195. Traction Splints; adult size Bid Price: Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		ITEMS 195 - 205 NO BID	NO BID	ITEMS 195 - 209 NO BID		ITEMS 195 - 205 NO BID	ITEMS 195 - 205 NO BID								\$208.53 \$1,042.65 as spec.		
196. Traction Splints; pediatric size Bid Price: Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$274.27 \$1,371.35 Ferno 443												\$208.53 \$1,042.65 as spec.		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
197. Leg Strap Replacement Part; adult size Bid Price Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			\$45.54 \$227.70 Ferno 446												\$30.92 \$154.60 as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			each												1 set		
198. Leg Straps Replacement Part; pediatric size Bid Price Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:			ITEMS 198 - 223 NO BID												\$30.92 \$154.60 as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															1 set		
199. Thigh Assembly Replacement Part; adult size Bid Price Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															\$29.42 \$147.10 as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															each		
200. Thigh Assembly Replacement Part; pediatric size Bid Price: Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															\$29.42 \$147.10 as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															each		

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
201. Replacement Carrying Case; adult size																		
Bid Price															\$78.89			
Unit															\$394.45			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															as spec.			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															each			
202. Replacement Carrying Case; pediatric size																		
Bid Price															\$78.89			
Unit															\$394.45			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															as spec.			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															each			
203. Universal Ratchet Reel																		
Bid Price															\$26.74			
Unit															\$133.70			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															as spec.			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															each			
204. Universal Anklet Hitch																		
Bid Price:															\$12.03			
Unit															\$60.15			
Total																		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															as spec.			
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															each			
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP XXXX															<u>\$3,671.45</u>			

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
208. Bandage, Triangular Bid Price: Unit 3,600 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions: No. of Bandages/Pack and Packs/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		\$1.48 \$5,328.00 Kendall #KE6286 40"x40"x57" 1/pk 72 pk/cs case				\$0.36 \$1,296.00 AMD/Kentron 40"x40"x56" 2 safety pins 12/pack 20 packs/cs one case												\$1.44 \$5,184.00 Kendall #6286 40"x40"x51" 72/cs case
209. Belts; 9' length Bid Price Unit 700 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Length - in Ft.: No. of Belts/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		NO BID				NO BID									\$7.35 \$5,145.00 Iron Duck 30910F as spec. 24 case			NO BID
210. Blanket Bid Price: Unit 180 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions (in In.): No. of Blankets/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		NO BID		\$5.05 \$909.00 U.S. Laminating 60 x 90 10 cs		NO BID									\$5.72 \$1,029.60 Banta 980043 as spec. as spec.			\$3.80 \$684.00 Banta 980043 58" X 90" 18/CS case

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
211. Clean-Up Kit Bid Price Unit 48 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Description of Clean Up Kit Conents: No. of Kits/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		\$14.92 \$716.16 Kendall #KE-BB6016K		ITEMS 211 - 222 NO BID		\$5.25 \$252.00 Kentron 201118h									NO BID		NO BID
212. Cotton Rolls Bid Price Unit 100 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Lbs./Roll and Rolls/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		\$6.09 \$609.00 Kendall Lakeside KE6030				\$5.75 \$575.00 Kentex 440030	\$6.45 \$645.00 KE 6030								\$12.03 \$1,203.00 Kendall KE6030		\$6.30 \$630.00 Kendall #6030
213. Cricothotomy Kit Bid Price Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		NO BID				ITEMS 213 - 228 NO BID	NO BID								\$220.63 \$1,103.15 nUTRAKE #b10100		ITEMS 213 & 214 NO BID

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
214. Defibrillator Pads, Littman Bid Price: Unit 200 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Pads/Envelope: No. of Envelopes/Box and Boxes/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		\$3.208 \$641.60 Conmed #CM330-2444 2/pouch 10 pouch/bx 10 bx/cs box					\$2.95 \$590.00 Conmed 330-2444 2 pads 10/bx 10 bx/cs case								\$1.60 \$320.00 Conmed 330-2444 2 enl 10/bx 10 bx/cs case			
215. Disinfectant Bid Price Unit 40 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dilution Ratio: No. of Gallons/Bottle and Bottles/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		ITEMS 215 - 220 NO BID					ITEMS 215 - 220 NO BID								NO BID			\$15.90 \$636.00 Wavecide-01 1:4 4/cs case
216. Double Lumen Airway; packaged in plastic tray Bid Price: Unit 5 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															\$72.64 \$363.20 Kendall Combitube #18541 5/case	\$79.00 \$395.00 Mallinckrodt Combitube 5-18541 case of 4		ITEMS 216 - 219 NO BID

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
221. Dressing; Intravenous Veni-Puncture Site Bid Price Unit 30,000 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		\$0.4583 \$13,749.00 Conmed #CM705-4431					\$0.39 \$11,700.00 Conmed 705-4431								\$0.39 \$11,700.00 Con Med 705-4431			NO BID
No. of Dressings/Box and Boxes/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		100/bx 5 bx/cs box					100/bx 5 bx/cs case								100 bx 5 bx/cs case			
222.. Dressing, Multi-Trauma Bid Price Unit 1,650 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		\$2.5538 \$4,213.77 Kendall KE1967					ITEMS 222 - 242 NO BID								\$2.48 \$4,092.00 Banta 979564			\$1.8875 \$3,114.38 Banta 979564
Dimensions (in In.): No. of Dressings/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		10"x30" 50/cs case													as spec. 50/case case			10" X 30" 50/case case
223. Extrication Collar; in 3 discreet settings Bid Price Unit 200 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		ITEMS 223 - 227 NO BID		\$11.95 \$2,390.00 Laerdal 980020			\$13.80 \$2,760.00 Laerdal Stifneck Pedi-Select #980020								\$7.47 \$1,494.00 Laerdal 980020			ITEMS 223 - 242 NO BID
List No. and Size Ranges of Settings (in In.): Unit of Purchase - Packaging:				3 20/cs cs			See attach. each								as spec. case/50			

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.		
224. Extrication Collars; in 4 discreet settings Bid Price Unit 5,150 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: List No. and Size Ranges of Settings (in In.): Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			\$14.17 \$72,975.50 Laerdal	\$8.05 \$41,457.50 Laerdal 980010				\$13.80 \$71,070.00 Laerdal Stifneck Select #980010							\$7.47 \$38,470.50 Laerdal 980010				
225. Infuser Bid Price Unit 50 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Infusers/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:			ITEMS 225 - 242 NO BID	ITEMS 225 - 242 NO BID				ITEMS 225 - 241 NO BID							NO BID				
226. Intubator Bid Price Unit 40 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Intubators/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															\$2.61 \$104.40 Ambu 000-172-002				

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.	
230. Paper, EKG Recording Bid Price: Unit 500 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions: No. of Rolls/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		NO BID				ITEMS 230 - 234 NO BID			\$3.75 \$1,875.00 Ludlow Model #9677 as stated 100 1 case	\$3.67 \$1,835.00 MPC Lifepak ECG Printer Paper #11240-000013C 50mm x 30 m 30 rolls/case 3 rolls/box					ITEMS 230 & 231 NO BID			
231. Paper, ECG Recording Bid Price Unit 700 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: Dimensions: No. of Rolls/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		NO BID							ITEMS 231 - 242 NO BID	\$5.50 \$3,850.00 MPC #11240 000016C 100mm x 35m 20 rolls/cs 2 rolls/bx								
232. Probe Cover Bid Price: Unit 16,000 each Total Brand and Model (Ordering) No.: No. of Covers/Box and Boxes/Case: Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		\$0.0723 \$1,156.80 Thermoscan #RW-PC800 200/bx 4 bx/cs case								ITEMS 232 - 242 NO BID					\$0.193 \$3,088.00 as spec. #TMS PC-800 200/bx 800/cs case			

ITEM NO.	B. BRAUN MEDICAL INC.	DAUTER-MAN MEDICAL	EVER READY FIRST AID	GASPRO	W. W. GRAINGER, INC.	KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.	KRYSTLE DRUG & MEDICAL SUPPLY	LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP.	LIFE-SCIENCE RESOURCES INC.	MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL CORP.	PAC/RIM MEDICAL TECHNOLOGY SUPPLIES CORP.	PACIFIC ISLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY, LLC	PACIFIC RIM MEDICAL SYSTEMS	PHAR-MANUTRA, INC.	RESCUE SAFETY PACIFIC, INC.	STAT MEDICAL, INC.	R. WEINSTEIN, INC.
233. Restraints																	
Bid Price		\$8.75													\$10.31		
Unit Total	5 each	\$43.75													\$51.55		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:		Medline #ML-OMDT 823062													Medline MDT 823040		
Type of Material:		Cotton													Nylon		
Length of Ties (in In.):		36" (approx.)													as spec.		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:		pair													case/10		
234. Scissors; with curved blades		ITEMS 234 - 236															
Bid Price		NO BID													\$4.13		
Unit Total	5 each														\$20.65		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:															EMI 1555		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:															10/case		
235. Scissors; 7-1/4" length																	
Bid Price						\$1.69									\$1.47		
Unit Total	250 each					\$422.50									\$367.50		
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.:						Kentron KI141-07									EMI 1095		
No. of Scissors/Box:						25/box									10/box		
Unit of Purchase - Packaging:						one case									box		

