ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. 14354
OPENED: APRIL 21, 2004

G38135

For the furnishing and delivery of ATHLETIC
(P.A.L.) to the Honolulu Police Department, Cit
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ROGER HILL LTD.

RIDDELL/ALL AMERICAN

XPRESS DISTRIBUTION

ITEM

1.

Group | - Baseball Equipment

Baseball; top grade full grain leather cover

Bid Price: Unit 100 dozen
Total (1,200 each)

Brand Name and No.:

Weight (in O0z.):

Size (in In.):

Baseball; durable synthetic leather cover;
polyurethane medium/firm center core
Bid Price: Unit 30 dozen

Total (360 each)
Brand Name and No.:

Weight (in 0z.):

Size (in In.):

Baseball; durable syntheti cover; polyurethane

medium/firm center core

Bid Price: Unit 30 dozen
Total (360 each)

Brand Name and No.:

Weight (in 0z.):

Size (in In.):

$32.98
$3,298.00
MacGregor 75

$35.65
$1,069.50
MacGregor MCB5SV05

$35.65
$1,069.50
MacGregor MC5SV01

$28.00
$2,800.00
Riddell/All American 42213

$23.79
$713.70
Riddell/All American 42219

$23.79
$713.70
Riddell/All American 42218

$26.86
$2,686.00
Rawlings RPLB1

$29.76
$892.80
Rawlings SCOR5

$29.76
$892.80
Rawlings SCOR1
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4.

Bases for baseball; Pinto and Mustang League

Bid Price: Unit
Total

Brand Name and No.:

20 sets

Dimensions (in In.):
Set - No. of Bases:
No. of Anchor Spikes:

Length of Anchor Spikes

Bases for baseball; Bronco League

Bid Price: Unit 10 sets
Total

Brand Name and No.:

Dimensions (in In.):

Set - No. of Bases:

No. of Anchor Spikes:
Length of Anchor Spikes

Bat; 2-1/4 in. barrel diameter

a.25 In.; 15 Ozs.

Bid Price: Unit 10 each

Total

b.26 In.; 15 to 20 Ozs.

Bid Price: Unit 10 each

Total

$34.95
$699.00
MacGregor MCBASE 35

$32.00
$320.00
MacGregor MCBASE 55

NO BID

$43.20
$864.00
Riddell/All American RBSBASJR.
14 x 14 x 2
3
6
5"
$52.00
$520.00
Riddell/All American RBSBASSR
15 x 15 ' x3
3
6
5"
NO BID

$26.98
$539.60
Schutt SBB-142
14 x 14 x 2
3
6
12"
$34.42
$344.20
Schutt SBB-153
15 x 15 ' x3
3
6
12"

$18.94
$189.40

$18.94
$189.40




PROPOSAL NO. 14354

ROGER HILL LTD.

RIDDELL/ALL AMERICAN

XPRESS DISTRIBUTION

PAGE 3
ITEM
c.27 In.; 19 to 21 Ozs. 10 each
d.28 In.; 20 to Unit 10 each
e.29 In.; 21 to 23 Ozs. 10 each
f.30 In.; 22 to 24 Ozs. 10 each
Bid Price: Unit 40 each $18.94
Total $757.60
Brand Name and No.: Louisville YB703
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I, ITEMS 6.a.-6.1. $1.136.40
7. Bat; aluminum construction NO BID NO BID
a.31 In.; 25 to 28 Ozs. 10 each
b.32 In.; 25 to 29 Ozs. 10 each
c.331In.; 27 to 29 Ozs. 10 each
d.34 In.; 30 to 31 Ozs. 10 each
Bid Price: Unit 40 each $87.84
Total $3,513.60
Brand Name and No.: Louisville SL604
8. Body Protector for Catcher; canvas back
Bid Price: Unit 24 each $18.10 $15.29 $18.98
Total $434.40 $366.96 $455.52
Brand Name and No.: MacGregor MCB74] Riddell/All American 42172 Rawlings 8PI
Color(s) Available Black, Scarlet, Navy, Royal
9. Body Protector for Catcher; cotton back
Bid Price: Unit 10 each $23.90 $16.14 $20.98
Total $239.00 $161.40 $209.80

Brand Name and No.:

Color(s) Available

MacGregor MCB-73XXX|

Riddell/All American 42175

Black, Scarlet, Navy, Royal

Rawlings LLBPI
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10.

11.

12.

Helmet for Batter; for Pony League

a.Small (6-5/8 to 6-3/4) 10 each
b.Medium (6-7/8 to 7) 10 each
c.Large (7-1/8 to 7-1/4) 10 each

Bid Price: Unit 30 each

Total

Brand Name and No.:

Color(s) Available

Face Guard for Batter's Helmet

Bid Price: Unit 60 each

Total
Brand Name and No.:

Color(s) Available

Helmet for Batter; for Pinto, Mustang & Bronco

a.Small (6-5/8 to 6-3/4) 15 each
b.Medium (6-7/8 to 7) 15 each
c.Large (7-1/8 to 7-1/4) 15 each
d.Extra Large (7-3/8 to 7-1/2 15 each

Bid Price: Unit 60 each

Total
Brand Name and No.:

Color(s) Available

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I, ITEMS 11 & 1

$11.96
$358.80
Schutt 2794

$21.00
$1,260.00
Schutt 2778

Included w/ltem 11

Schutt 2794

$1,260.00

$11.04
$331.20
Riddell/All American 42131

Black, Scarlet, Navy, Royal
$8.49

$509.40
Riddell/All American SS 42156

$11.04

$662.40

Riddell/All American 42133
Black, Scarlet, Navy, Royal

$1,171.80

$11.24
$337.20
Schutt 2794

$8.70
$522.00
Schutt 2778

$11.24
$674.40
Schutt 2794

$1,196.40
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13. Helmet for Catcher
a.Small (6-5/8 to 6-3/4) 10 each
b.Medium (6-7/8 to 7) 10 each
c.Large (7-1/8 to 7-1/4) 10 each
d.Extra Large (7-3/8 to 7-1/2 10 each
Bid Price: Unit 40 each $20.62 $80.00 $29.41
Total $824.80 $3,200.00 $1,176.40
Brand Name and No.: Schutt 2760 Riddell/All American 42119 Schutt 2962
W/RTGA
Color(s) Available Black w/color decals
14. Skull Cap for Catcher
a.Small (6-5/8 to 6-3/4) 10 each
b.Medium (6-7/8 to 7) 10 each
c.Large (7-1/8 to 7-1/4) 10 each
d.Extra Large (7-3/8 to 7-1/2 10 each
Bid Price: Unit 40 each $18.55 NO BID $18.93
Total $742.00 $757.20
Brand Name and No.: Adams CC-67 Rawlings CSC|
Color(s) Available
15. Leg Guards for Catcher; for Pinto League
Bid Price: Unit 20 pairs $21.75 $17.84 $24.74
Total $435.00 $356.80 $494.80

Brand Name and No.:

Color(s) Available:

16. Leg Guards for Catcher; for Mustang & Bronco

Bid Price: Unit
Total
Brand Name and No.:

20 pairs

Color(s) Available:

MacGregor MCB62XXX

$52.00
$1,040.00
Diamond DCP-12

Riddell/All American 42184

Black, Scarlet, Navy. Royal

$17.84
$356.80
Riddell/All American 42184

Black, Scarlet, Navy, Royal

Rawlings 9DCW

$29.49
$589.80
Rawlings 76 DCW
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17. Mask for Catcher
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Brand Name and No.:

40 each

Color(s) Available:

18. Mitt for Catcher; for Pinto and Mustang
Bid Price: Unit 40 each
Total
Brand Name and No.:

19. Mitt for Catcher; for Bronco & Pony League
a. Regular - used by right-hander

for the left hand 10 each
b.Right hand - used by left-
hander for the right hand 5 each
Bid Price: Unit 15 each
Total
Brand Name and No.:
20. Plate for Home
Bid Price: Unit 20 each
Total
Brand Name and No.:
21. Pitching Rubber; 6" x 24"
Bid Price: Unit 15 each

Total
Brand Name and Nos.:

Dimensions (in In.)

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

$49.50

$990.00

As specified

$42.00

$630.00

MacGregor BBPR4AWAY]

$38.24
$1,529.60
Riddell/All American 42168

Black, Scarlet, Navy, Royal

NO BID

NO BID

$14.75
$295.00
Riddell/All American RBSSSHP

$84.00
$1,260.00
Riddell/All American RBSPPWAY

$31.93
$1,277.20
Rawlings LMWXJ

$43.98
$1,759.20
Rawlings RCM45

$49.98
$749.70
Rawlings RCM30

$43.93
$878.60
Schutt 711

$46.49
$697.35
Schutt 8500
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22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

Pitching Rubber; 4" x 18"
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Brand Name and No.:

15 each

Dimensions (in In.)

Scorebook for Baseball

Bid Price: Unit
Total

Brand Name and No.:

100 each

Game Recording Capacity
Umpire Indicator
Bid Price: Unit
Total
Brand Name and No.:

30 each

Tees for Batting

Unit Price:  Unit
Total

Brand Name and No.

10 each

Height Rane (in In.)

Economy Batter's Box Template; 4' x 6'

Unit Price:  Unit 4 each
Total

Brand name and No.

Dimensions (in Ft.)

$35.89
$538.35
MacGregor BBPR4YTH

$4.26
$426.00
C.S. Peterson MSPTRBOK|

$3.10
$93.00
MacGregor BBUMPIN4

$21.39
$213.90
MacGregor BBBATTEE

$192.00
$768.00
TC-383 As Specified

$63.50
$952.50
Riddell/All American RBSPPLL4W
4x18
NO BID
NO BID

$26.00
$260.00
Riddell/All American RBSTERE

22-40

ITEMS 26 - 31 - NO BID

$39.65
$594.75
Schutt 9000

$4.27
$427.00
Peterson

$1.74
$52.20
Schutt SBA-U14

$17.44
$174.40
Schutt SBB-BT|

$249.00
$996.00
Atletic Specialties BBLT
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27. Economy Batter's Box Template' 3' x 6'
Unit Price:  Unit 4 each $192.00 $249.00
Total $768.00 $996.00
Brand Name and No. TC-385 As Specified Athletic Specialties BBLT

Dimensions (in Ft.)

28. Dry Line Marker

Bid Price: Unit 4 each $395.00 $343.61
Total $1,580.00 $1,374.44
Brand Name and No.: As Specified Schutt DMj50

Gauge of Steel - Frame
- Bucket
Capacity of Marker (in Lbs.)

GROUP 11 - Boxing Equipment

29. Headgear ITEMS 29 - 32 - NO BID
a.Medium (6-7/8 to 7-1/8) 12 each
b.Large (7-14/ to 7-1/2) 12 each
Bid Price: Unit 24 each $59.00
Total $1,416.00
Brand Name and No.: Title CTHGT|

Description of Warranty (in Years)

30. Gloves
Bid Price: Unit 24 pairs $76.62
Total $1,838.88

Brand Name and No.: Title TSGV-16 oz.
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31. Wraps
Bid Price: Unit 50 pairs $6.23
Total $311.50
Brand Name and No.: Title HW
Size (in In.)
Packaging - Pairs/Box
32. Mouth Guard
Bid Price: Unit 100 each $1.27 $0.50
Total $127.00 $50.00
Brand Name and No.: Title SMP Riddell/All American 45791
Description of Warranty (in Years)
GROUP 111 - Basketball Equipment
33. Shirts, Referee
a. Medium (M) 15 each
b. Extra Large (XL) 15 each
c.Extra Extra Large (XXL) 10 each
Bid Price: Unit 40 each $33.00 NO BID $29.93
Total $1,320.00 $1,197.20
Brand Name and No.: Cliff Keen K14VN Cliff Keen K14VN
34. Goal
Bid Price: Unit 6 each $499.00 NO BID $489.00
Total $2,994.00 $2,934.00
Brand Name and No.: As specified Bison TR80
Dimensions (in In.)
Height (in Ft.)
Description of Warrranty (No. of Years)
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35. Belt, Flag Football
a. Red 50 dozen
b. Yellow 50 dozen
Bid Price: Unit 100 dozen $19.39 NO BID $17.93
Total $1,939.00 $1,793.00
Brand Name and No.: As specified Martin FFS]]
Color(s) Available
GROUP 1V - Miscellaneous Equipment
36. Time/Clock, Countdown
Bid Price: Unit 48 each $12.99 $1,619.00 $23.44
Total $623.52 $77,712.00 $1,125.12
Brand Name and No.: As specified Riddell/All American RSK960 Martin
37. Whistle; officiating type
Bid Price: Unit 200 each $4.55 NO BID $4.69
Total $910.00 $938.00
Brand Name and No.: Athletic Connection MSWHIFOX Fox 40
38. Lanyard for Whistle
Bid Price: Unit 200 each $0.46 NO BID $0.48
Total $92.00 $96.00
Brand Name and No.: Athletic Connection MSLNYD Martin LI
Total Sum Bid for Group Il1, Items 37 & 38 on $1.002.00 $1.034.00
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39.

40.

Scorekeeper; tabletop model
Bid Price: Unit

Total
Brand Name and No.:

Size of numbers (in In.)
Dimensions of Board (in In.)
Scoring Range:

Scrimmage Vests
a. Royal Blue
b. Gold
c. Black
d. Purple
e. Orange
f. Green

Bid Price: Unit
Total
Brand Name and No.:

Color(s) Available

12 each

5 dozen
5 dozen
5 dozen
5 dozen
5 dozen
5 dozen
30 dozen

$73.30
$879.60
Athletic Connection MSTTSCOR
5-1/2"
13" x 18"
0-99

NO BID

$40.50
$486.00
Riddell/All American SKTT]
7n
24"W x 12" tall

0 - 99 on each side

NO BID

$64.93
$779.16
Getz

$69.00
$2,070.00
Martin SVA




